Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 3:39 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: FW: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SJY3925L & SFM8989E on
01/09/2018

Attachments: TI199247 for SJIY3925L (SMG188422).pdf

Your Ref: CC6/A1G18016185/Akb3 (SFM8989E)
Our Ref: SJY3925L

Dear Khanchna,

We refer to below, we are pleased to accept the offer at $1,738.95.
Please find attached TAX INVOICE for your kind onward action.

Tax Invoice No. T1199247 @ S$1,551.50 (Inclusive of 7% GST) -Agreed
Loss of Use @ $$180.00 (3 Days x $S$60) -Agreed
LTA Search @ $$7.45 -Agreed

Please look into the above claim and let us have your payment of $$1,738.95 soonest.

Provided always that this discharge of my claim for damages relating to the damage to my vehicle
SJY3925L shall not prejudice or affect my further claim for general and special damages for my personal
injuries sustained in the same accident on 01/09/2018.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Tue, Sep 10, 2019 at 3:24 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18016185/Akb3



Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,551.50
2. Loss of Use (3 days x $60.00) $ 180.00
3. LTA Search $7.45
Total $1,738.95

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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