Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
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From: loel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 6:41 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE

15727 (Ol) AND SHA 2459Y (TP) ON 01-09-2018; LKK ref : CC4/EQI18016148/Dfb3;
EQ ref: DM18HO0D2328-1G

Dear Poh Kin
Please proceed to resolve this matter up to 5§519,790.50.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

L2
l"i-u-'rp @ﬁm
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 065110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 656223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
Www eqinsurance.com.sg s

".AMMHCIWH @___—'

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t/

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto: pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, January 25, 2019 10:17 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 15727 (OI) AND SHA 2459Y
(TP) ON 01-09-2018; LKK ref : CC4/EQI18016148/Dfb3; EQ ref: DM18H002328-)G

Importance: High

Your ref : DM18H002328-)G
Our ref : CC4/EQ18016148/Dfb3

Dear Joel,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 1572Z AND SHA 2459Y ON 01/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Liability: OID collided into TP vehicle as per TP video footage. Liability is down against our insured.

https://drive.google.com/open?id=14btflyxRE6ECIy9CxeDEl_yLna9VeRx U




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e e —
From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 10:17 AM
To: ‘loel Goh'
Cc: Admin A
Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 15722

(Ol) AND SHA 2459Y (TP) ON 01-09-2018; LKK ref : CC4/EQI18016148/Dfb3: EQ ref:
DM18HO02328-)G

Attachments: LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK Inspection report.pdf; LKK resurvey photo- after
repair pdf; LKK resurvey photo.pdf; LKK survey photo.pdf: TP LOD_SHA 2459Y pdf

Importance: High

Your ref : DM18HO02328-1G
Our ref : CC4/EQ18016148/Dfb3

Dear Joel,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 15727 AND SHA 2459Y ON 01/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Liability: OID collided into TP vehicle as per TP video footage. Liability is down against our insured.

https://drive.google.com/open ?id=14btfLyxRE6CIyICxeDEl yLna9VeRx U

We did forward the video footage to PIC (Ms Zee) and they agreed to settle and aware NCD (if any) is
affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd" at $ 19,790.50(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair S 33,786.84 $ 17,120.00 (516,000.00 +7% gst)
2. Loss of Rental S 1,768.50 (18 days x $98.25) $  1,768.50 (18 days x $98.25)
3. Loss of Income S 900.00 (18 days x $50.00) S 900.00 (18 days x $50.00)
4. GIA search fee S 2.00 ) _2.00
Total | S 36,457.34 $ 19,790.50

**13 days recommendation for repair + 2 days PRI + 3 weekends = 18 days.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval/instruction please.
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SEUBLAVE L #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX ; (065) 62564315

Consultants

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Company Reglstration No. 199607198R

Date: 31/01/2019

akiciakio. XE 15722 (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMCPHQ18-001741
SHA 2458Y (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC4/EQI18016148/Dfb3s2
Date of Accident 1/9/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost 4 17.120.00 MIG_ST}
Loss of Income 5 900.00 | 18 days
Rental (If any) g~ 1,768.50 | 18 days
Others: b 2.00
:$

19,790.50

Final Settlement Sum ' $ 19,780.00 (GLOBAL SUM)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) [CHUNNI MOTOR WORK PTE LTD

19,790.00

NUR SHAQILAH

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




Your Ref : XE 15727 ' _
Our Ref : SHA 2459Y A L&} &

Lee Geok Sing c/o

CHUNNI MOTOR WORK PTE LTD

Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A

#03-19 AMK AutoPoint Date : 1‘”/ f%ﬂa
Singapore 568047

2 KOV 108

EQ Insurance
Admin Dept. f»
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The Motor Claims Department
E@ Fswoance Cﬁw% Ll WITHOUT PREJUDICE
5 Maxw b&" M
Y1300 Tovinr Block
JND  Granplex

Punprpere " 069//0
Dear Sir/ Madam,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2459Y / XE 1572Z On 01.09.2018

ALONG Pioneer Rd Twds City

[ am the owner/hirer of motor vehicle/taxi, SHA 2459Y ;which was involved in the
above-mentioned accident.

The motor vehicle/taxi was surveyed by your appointed appraiser at the premises of M/S CHUNNI MOTOR
WORK PTE LTD. The accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and or management of his
vehicle. Therefore, | am ¢laiming damages and losses sustained by me against you in connection with the
accident based on the appraiser's recommendation.

Char claim is as follows:

1) Cost of Repair S5 [, %o 00O

2) Loss of Rental S% | 363 -50(4783: '3 gary)
3) Loss of Income S8 IM— G pArs)
4) GIA Report Fee s$

5) LTA Search Fee S% 1 .00

6) Survey Report Fee g%

5% 4, #ie.x0

We enclose herewith the following relevant supporting documents :

a) Authorisation Letter
b) Final repair bill(s)
¢) LTA Search
d) GIA report(s)
¢) Insurance Certificate
I..rr L?H‘:"L ‘-"E {_]
Kindly look into the matter and revert as soon as possible. Thank you, XE\5322

Yours faithfully oy0oa(18

230




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 December 2018 10:41 AM

To: ‘OPS'

Ce: 'Soh'

Subject: RE: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 15727 AND SHA 2459Y

ALONG PIONEER ROAD ON 01.09.2018

Importance: High
1 74 74T
s - Consuitants
M BA =B Pta Lid

51 UBT AVE L, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC4/EQ18016148/Dfb3
Your Veh: XE 15722

KL ENVIRO PTE LTD
Policy Holder

Dear Ms Zee

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 1572Z AND SHA 2459Y ALONG PIONEER ROAD ON
01.09.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the video footage and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

https://drive.google.com/open?id=14btflyxREGCIy9CxeDEl yLna9VeRx U




Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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“ER ST Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in error, please do nat
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: OPS [mailto:ops@klenviro.com]

Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 10:43 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Soh' <soh@klenviro.com>

Subject: RE: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 1572Z AND SHA 2459Y ALONG PIONEER ROAD
ON 01.09.2018

Dear Poh Kin,
| am afraid that we do not have a copy of the footage.

Thank You!
Best Regards,

Foo

Zee (Miss)
Operation Executive
Office: +65 68610332 / Cell: +65 86111983 / Ext: 125

Kl Enviro Pte Ltd

Blue Sky, Green Earth
Our Aspirations

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 8:27 AM

To: OPS <ops@klenviro.com>

Cc: Soh <soh@klenviro.com>

Subject: RE: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. XE 1572Z AND SHA 2459Y ALONG PIONEER ROAD
ON 01.09.2018

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC4/EQ18016148/Dfb3



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To Whom It May Concemn :

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2459Y / XE 1572Z

ALONG Pioneer Rd Twds City ON 01.09.2018

I, Lee Geok Sing , NRIC NO. S 1216482C of

Blk 341 Jurong East Avenue 1 # 12-1514 (5) 600341

Owner/hirer of motor vehicle Registration No SHA 2459Y Jinsured by

Ms First Capital Insurance Ltd under Policy No. D-18088937MFSH

do hereby authorize M/s Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd as my authorized representative to write,
negotiate and settle claim on my behalf in my claim against the owner and/or Motor Vehicle

Registration No. XE 157127 in respect of the above mentioned accident. [ also

hereby authorize that the agreed settlement sum ( cost of repair, loss of use, eamnings and rental,
Survey report fee, LTA fee & GIA report fee ) be made in favour of my representative, M/s
Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd and that the said payment be forwarded to them as full and final

discharge of my claim,

Dated : 01.09.2018

Signature : éi FZ%

( Company's chop if necessary )




CHUNNI MoTor WORK

PTE LTD
LEE GEOK SING WVEHICLE NO DATE
APT BLK 341 JURONG EAST AVENUE 1 |SHA 2459 Y 16.11.2018
#12-1514 MAKE INVOICE MO
SINGAPORE 600341 HYUNDAI 8736
MODEL ACC DATETIME
SOMATA 01.09.2018 @ 08:15 HRS
Cost of Repair % 16,000.00
Sub-total $ 16,000.00
Add : 7 % - GST % 1.,120.00
Total $ 17.120.00

(SINGAPORE DOLLARS: SEVENTEEN THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED AND TWENTY
ONLY)

Bk 10, Ang Mo Kio Industnial Park 24, AMK AutoPoint #03-19, Singapore 568047
GST Repstration No. 2009231100 Company Registration No. 200923 110D
Tel: (65) H542 TIAZ /542 5119 Fax (65) A542 39
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Invaice hups:iwww.giarme.ong.sg/claims/index.cim? fuscbox=MTRsas& fusca...

GENERAL GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

INSURANCE 6 Rafflas Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

ASSDCLATION Prone; +65 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030

Oparating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am lo 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Reglstration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-135012
Date of Reguest: 01/08/2018 Your Refl No: Online Purchase

Zoon Hock Molor Ple Lid

Bik 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#01-05/08 AMK Autopaint

Singapore S6B047

Daar SirMadam,

Enqulry Data D1/09/2018
Enquiry By Chels Lim Gan Koon
TP Vahicle No. XE15722

Accident Date 01/09/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Na. Insurer Feriod of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
XE15727 EQ Insurance Company Lid 3103201 8-30/03/2019 62239433
Thank You.

Tha Images provided 1o you ara lakan lrem tha orginal raporis forwarded o the cantre by the members of the General insurance Assaciation af
Singapare and wa laka na responsiblity for thalr aceuraey of conlenis and shall be under no llabillty whatsoaver far any loss or damaga arising
oul of or In connaction with the rapess of thelr imagas.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

1792018, 1%:33 AM
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GENERAL GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

INSURANCE G Ratffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCLATION

Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday lo Fricay gam lo Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE o Ragictrarion No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref MNo: GR-18-135012
Date of Request: 002018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Soon Hock Melor Ple Lid
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kia Indusirial Park 2A
#01-05/06 AME Autopoint
Singapore 568047
Dear SinMadam,
Enquiry Crate 01/082018
Enguiry By Chnis Lim Gan Koon
TP Vehicle Ma. XE1572Z
Accident Date 01/09/2018
[DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (58)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
G5T Amount 0.13
Tolal Amount Due {GST Inclusivae) £
Thank You.

This is a compuler generaled document and requires no signature,

Far GIARMC Dficial use:
Date:
[¥] GIRQ [] Cash | ] Chegue

()
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1/9/2018, 10:33 AM




Cur Ref: CT18080030

Date: 11 September 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 01/09/2018 @ 08:15hrs
ALONG PIOMER RD TOWARDS CITY
INVOLVING XE15722Z

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHA2459Y (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to LEE GEOK SING IC NO
51216482C a registerad hirer-operalor of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $98.25 per day (inclusive
of GST)

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd cn
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission lo
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. Mo signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Crive Singapore ST5717 Mainline +55 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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