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From: Date:  « ~ |veh o &jﬂ! 3138.2" Yr Regn: J“n IL'!W’
Estimaing Cost: R E Type: @r M.Cycle | Bus | Van! Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |
00/ 1P Truck [ Trailer or o __
To inspect Vehicle Mot 9 aty 7)_[3"&'?" Make: ‘dﬂw'-’ f“t qn TS G ﬁﬁ e
A Workshop mis W Colour EL_JJJ'O i AJC.  Insured ] Std /NI NA
@ 9515 |' &W 0 Sp Reading J'}ﬂik{a | T/Radio: Insured | Ste [N/ NA
Insured: o YO _\_ Eng/No: )
Policy No. - - CMNo: \w ILF' I{}h {.'ﬁll [,n“ 'HP B
Claims Mo. Gen. Cond: Gnudl@l Poor | Burnt
Sum Insured: - _E::;ss - Steering: |fordes | Jammed [ Leaked | Burnt of

(Clients Record) - Brake: IJammueraakedrEurnl of -
Make of Veh: Modi:  Nil / | STD A/Rim or

- - _ Tyre Size: B 3.'58'[S§I?J‘\ .

(Policy Condition) W R —— B

Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | OIS BSIDUNIEKHD"MIG‘HFSJLIZA r@ cu*rsu rpmasumu
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO | YOKO or
Bal or Market Value: Front R__e_aa; -
IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? ; Yes of No o ‘Et R/Bal. mm
GIA | PR Seen: _ Cun&stem‘? Yes or No ._. o L/Bal. ) é - P
Est. Repairs: - |;I_a':p5 Res: Yes or No 1].0..&:3? ‘E‘[L? D.Ol. -_Lnl?!ilg_
Lumm Sum: o 3Val: Yes or No Survey held at WM
GA | REV | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages : Frt J@r | OIS | NIS | UIC | Rooftop or
\ehicle: INJOUT - o
Date: _Person Contacted: | The uIC | Chassis trame | Body Structure affecled due to > collsion.
‘Date/ Time | _ Action / Instruction e o e I
RECEIVED 179 SEP 28 —
DatelTime, File Pass lo7 D: Preli. Report Days Of Repair: P
1 e D: Final Report Resurvey No. nfTr-ip:-_____i _ Survey Fee: _ 150
DiateTime, Filz Return 17 Transporabor %
3 ]qlq_ m\s{ Add Fee: -Gite Insp  ($ - ) __S+RS__S _ ;91‘.
:‘-.mtemiew ($ ) Photos \‘1
Report Format s [ | Tech. Inus ($ _ § Clhars
Lump Suml@: (3 55;{5“_% E \Weekend ($ _ y
TOTAL
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- Fte Lt Company Registration Ne. 1996071981

51 UBIAVE 1, #12-25 PAY A UBLINDUST RIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 405933 [EL : {65 h2563501 FAX ¢ (651 62364315

Your ref: D18006552MFSH
Our Ref: CS/FCIIRO1 6138/R 1vd3 Date :1 3."9?1[‘13

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SJA 31882

We thank you for your instruction on 4/9/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
10/9/2018 at the premises of M/s WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

and have the following to report.-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §$7.229.00

Revised Estimate Amount - §45,320.00

"Check" Items Amount 1 5%

Market Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 5%

Description of Damage: Barsice

The vehicle sustained damages at the raar —— .
rear portion. fron
Comments/Present Status: e
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL

Automotive Assessor



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 12:06 PM
To: ‘Richmond Ho'; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Derek Oh Siong Wee; SUR

Subject: RE: Final Bill For SJA3188Z

Dear Richmond,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirmed amount $5571.89 before GST @ 4 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com=

sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 5:10 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com=; Veron Chen {LKKAuto}{ueronchan@lkkauto.mmb
Cc: Derek Oh Siong Wee <derek.oh@wearnes.coms:

subject: Final Bill For SIAZ188L

Importance: High

Hi Rasul,

Please refer to above attachment for the final bill.

Richmond Ho
Senior Service Consultant
Body & Paint — Insurance Claim

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
244 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935
D (65) 6430 4890 M (63) 9176 B8543
= www wearnesauto.com  fichm nd.ho@wearnes.com
“’I:AFZNES arnesaul richmand. ho@wearmes, com

Thiz email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in emmor, plaase notify us immediately by reply email and then dalete this message from your system.
Plaase do not copy it or usa it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment fo any ather person. Thank you.



1 1 M5 First Capital Insurance Limited toieg No. 1530001060 GST R Ko M2 DOO1676-9
MS ‘FIrStcap]ta| & Raffies Quay #21-00 Singapare (43580

Tel: (65)6222 2311 Fax (63) BEEE 3547

Clalms & Metor Undenwriting Dept 36 Rabinsan Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0gEars
Tel (F5) 6507 3848 Fax: (B3] 507 3849
woeree msfirsteapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number.

Please submit to

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

03-09-2018 Our Ref No. D1B0068552ZMFSH
€ 30-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party

SHD7028J Third Party Vehicle. SJA31 88Z

45 LENG KEE ROAD

DEREK OH

63789336/ 981872717 Fax No. O

DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA, Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

Kindly submit

WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE ]
PTE LTD ron.
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

t WELEANCE DROLT




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Weron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 9:01 AM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’

Cc ElLEENLEE@MSHRSTCAPITAL.CDM.SG: SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006552MFSH/1, SJA 318BZ
Attachments: 5JA 3188Z PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle STA 3 1882
Date of survey: 10/9/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email -sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 4:10 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ ccwsmmurclaims@msﬂrstcapital.mm sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=
Ce: EILEENLEE@MSF'IRSTCAPITAL.CGM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006552MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: aimmmﬂmmgm | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System imai.1to‘.cw5mr::t::-rdaims@msﬂrstcagitai.mm.sg]

sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 2:51 PM

To: g._SS!GNMENTS@LKKAUTD.EDM

Ce: CWSMOTO RCLNMS@MSF!RSTCAPWA L.COM.SG; E1I_EENLEE@MSFIRSTC}E.PITAL.ED i.5G
subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006552MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports aré uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

ps: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

- AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
i WWW.avg.com
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Wearnes Automotive Pte, Lid.
43 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T 465 6430 4330  www. weamesaubo.com

Co reg no. 1993014008 /£ GST reg no. MZH9206ZEX



WEARNES

SERY ICE EST LMéaTE

0 - FOOQOO3 gL: FIRST CAPITAL IHNSURANCE LTD
FIRST CAPITAL IMSURANCE LTD GST Req.No:MZEF20628X
346 ROBINSON ROAD Inv.Ho. . : B&P 0 Page 1
$16-01, CITY HOUSE Inv.date. = 17/0%/2018
SINGAPORE WIP Np. . © 24556
singapore 068877 Veh.In/Out: 10/09/2018 15/09/2018
¥Tel No. .
Reg.Mo. . ¢ 5Ja31681
closed by .... : Richmond Ho Reg.date .: 29/11/2017
gyc Consultant ! Mileage ..: 0
RemarkKs ...... - Mr chin Chung Hwa Chassis No: YYLLF10ACJ1210874
Op.No Description Hech Qty Price Disc: Pkg Amount G
BO2 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER,REAR 0 1200.00 O 1,Euezpﬁ/;

BRACKET ,REAR SENSOR,REAR LOWER

BUMPER ,REAR LOWER SPOLIER,ETC

280 TO CHECK WIRIMG INCLUDE 0 450.00 O 45
RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL
HODULES

SPOLIER,ETC uf//!
800 70 PUTTY SPRAY PAINT ON REAR 0 1400.00 0  1,409200 §
%

PROTECTING PLATE real 1.0 EA  253.00 10 221.70 §
BUMPER BRACRKET LHR %= 1.0 EA 7%.10 19 71.19 3
BUMPER BRACKET RHR X1 1.0 EA 79.10 10 71.19 5
BUMPER INSTALLING MTS) 1.0 EA 83.40 10 75.06 §
BLIND RWEré.can p ® 10.0 EA 3.00 10 27.00 §
BUMPER CLIP 10.0 EA 5.40 10 48.60 §
ADHESIVE TUBE CHEHIE@ 4.0 EA  75.80 10 272.88 §
BUMPER COVER REAR U 1.0 EA 1447.80 10 1,303.02 S
BUMPER SPOILER REAR 1.0 EA 472.50 10 425.25 5 (PO~
Gross Total. 5, 571.89
Labour Texhoa 3,050.00 s 1 A 5.571.89
Parts Total 2.521.89 GsT @ 7.0% 290.03
[ I Wil (o W [ Total 0.00 Totalivvoass 5,961.92
Paidivia s 0.00
Please Pay.. 5,961.92

GST: S=3tdRated; 0=0utOf3cope; I=ZeroRated

Waarnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4530 WL WS ESEUTD. COMm

Co reg no. 1995014008 S GET reg na. M2BE20626X



T P4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Pl 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAM: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref | CS/FCI18016138/R1vd3n2
ssosenesonsord esorcossarr o 2w [N
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 70284 Veh. Inspected SJA 31882
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1B00E552MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN Assign Date C4/0W2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLVO XC30TS c.c 1969
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. YWVILF10ACH1 210874 Colour BLUE
Odometer 135641 Stearing IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/55 R19 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/55R19 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre 235/55 R19 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/55 R18 MICHELIN 6 rmrm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/08/2018 Inspection Date 10/08/2018
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
45 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAFPORE 159103,
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR. 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9807146-R Page No.1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJA 31882
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | pesblan {;ﬂ s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER COVER REAR SE (SN) DEFORMED 1,397.20 1,303.02
1|PROTECTING PLATE REA (SN) DEFORMED 253.00 227.70
1|BUMPER BRACKET LHR X (SN) NMECESSARY 79.10 71.18
1|BUMPER BRACKET RHR X (SN) MECESSARY 79.10 71.19
1|BUMPER INSTALLING MT (SN} NECESSARY 83.40 75.06
10|BLIND RIVET 4.0*21P (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 27.00
10|{BUMPER CLIP [SN) NECESSARY 54.00 48.60
4|ADHESIVE TUBE CHEMIC (SN) NECESSARY 303.20 272.88
1|BUMPER SPOILER REAR (SN)(ADDITIONAL) DEFORMED 42525 425 25
2.704.25 252189
LABOUR
T REPLACE REAR BUMPER REAR BRACKET REAR 2,400.00 1,200.00
SENSOR REAR LOWER SPOILER.ETC.
TO PUTTY SPRAY PAINT ON REAR BUMPER,REAR 2100.00 1,400.00
LOWER SPOILER ETC
TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETTING OF ALL 450.00 450.00
ELECTRICAL MODULES.
4,950.00 3,080.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,654.25 5,571.89
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 5,571.89

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016138/R1vd3n2

M

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solaly for the use and banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repodt.

Wﬂnmmmuwwwmwmuw the Recorn whel
Raper. in whole orin part. does 50 at hie or ber awn sk,




