Vic (LKKAuto)

From; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms>

Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 11:38 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE- <SEEEK MANDATE> RE: Qur Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020875 Accident involving

SLB2274K & SHAG006U on 3/9/18 LKK REF CC4/LPC18016133/K1ha3

Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 2:07 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); MT_Claim_SG

Subject: <SEEEK MANDATE> RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020875 Accident involving SLB2274K & SHAG006U on
3/9/18 LKK REF CC4/LPC18016133/K1ha3

Your Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020875
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18016133/K1ha3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLB 2274K (O1) AND SHA 6006U (TP) ON 03/09/2018 ALONG HOUGANG STREET 91
We rafer to the above matter,

We refer to the assignment dated 4™ September 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a clear-cut case where Insured had rear-ended to the TP vehicle. As such, liability is not to our Insured’s
favour,

We propose to offer to TP repairer “COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" as below:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 2,609.79 S 588.50
Loss of Rental ($113.00 x 3 days) 5 339.00 5 2R2.50 (5113 x 2.5 days)
Loss of Income (580 x 3 days) s 240.00 5 125.00 (550 x 2.5 days)
LTA Search Fee 5 7.49 5 7.49
TOTAL | $ 3,196.28 5 1,003.49




Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 2 days
Downtime 0.5 day
TOTAL 2.5 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FRFES e
SUSRER =W Syve the Eorthe Print only when necessory:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in emor, please do nol
read this e-mall or any attached llems. Please delele the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereal. Thank you

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 6 September, 2018 9:08 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @1k .com

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020875 Accident invalving SLB2274K & SHAG006U on 3/9/18

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) -

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September, 2018 5:23 PM
To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020875 Accident involving SLB2274K & SHAG006U on 3/9/18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

LPC ref: TBA
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18016133/K1ha3



Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SHA 6006U
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
« TP estimated cost of repair
e Preliminary advice
s  Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Hest Regards,

Mel Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 vo35 | email: MeiKwan@ikauto.com | fax: 67414108
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 4 September, 2018 9:58 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; assignments ignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020875 Accident involving SLB2274K & SHABOOGU on 3/9/18
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6843-1972 | email; pesignments@lkkauto.com | fax: G256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mallto: lanpac.co
Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 9:07 AM

ignmentsE ik .com;: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_5G < laim@lonpac.com>
Subject: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020875 Accident involving SLB2274K & SHAG006U on 3/9/18

Dear Nivitha/Catherine

Please refer to the attached and arrange TP survey.

Regards,



Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.

[}
WWw.avg.com




COMFORIDELCRO

Our Ref T 0918/ SHAB006U_/KS(st) ENGINEERING

Your Ref :

Date 12-Sep-18 CDGE Taw Claims Dept ConifortDelGro Enginesring Pis L
58 Loyang Drive 4th Fir ! Ferand '

Lonpac Insurance Bhd Singapore 508969

300 Beach Road

#17-04/ 07, The Concourse

5|ﬂﬂlpﬂl"! 1!9555 Workihops

Attn : Motor Claim Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE Beacdal

Dear Sir o

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHA6006U YOUR INSURED SLB2274K

ﬂND OTHER GH ﬂlﬂg. !§ S5in Ming

We are the authonsed repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No: SHAB008U which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : SLB2274K
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 588.50

2 3 dayslossofRental@ $ 113.00 perday $ 339.00

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) 3 -

4  LTA Search Fees 7.49

& GIA/Police Report Fees 5 =

& Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees ] -
Sub Total: § 934088

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 3 days Loss of Income @ $ B0.00 perdays $ 24000

Total Claims: 5 1,174.89

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs 8 pcs.
b} LTA search slip/s of : SLB22T4K
c) GIlA/ Police report/s of : SHABO0EU

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Witness statement’s ( ) TowingiMedical billireceipts { ) Certificate of Insurance
[ X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scene [ x ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any persanal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully

Kuzali Hj Selahudin

Deputy Manager

CDGE Taxi Claims Department

Tel : 6214 8736 Fax: 6214 1843 Email kazali@cdge com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO . ﬁf—:

A

Pandan

Sanoko



CDG VARS 'V LettofAuthornisation

ACCIDENT INVOLVING

ALONG

I/ We

and/or

Taxi Number

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(NAF / PAF)
i 40 SHAG6006U , SLB2274K

Page 1 of |

ON 03-Sep-18 09:10

T JUNCTION OF HOUGANG ST 91 TO HOUGANG AVE 9

KUA LAM WAH (Hirer) NRIC No.:
SAI SOON YEOW (Relief) NRIC No.:
SHAG006U

hereby authonisa ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lta(CDGE):

51607717H

56947193E

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expensa, Including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compansation amount in respact of my/our claim
against third party (except personal Injuries and medical claims)

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our banaif.

4. To accapt any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the clalm against third party and payment by cheque
shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with COGE's instruction and made \n favour of
“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd”.

Date

MName of Hirer
Hirer NRIC

Address

Contact Mo,

Name of Raljef
Ralisf NRIC

Address

Contact No.

03-S5ep-2018

KUA LAM WAH
S1607717H Signature :

333 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 1 #06-19...
560333

97856341

SAI SOON YEOW
S6947193E Signatura

155 BISHAN 5T 13 #09-74
570155

81235123

€9

(v~

hitp:Vedgek2srv 82Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG VARS V. Lettof . 03/09/2018



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : IB/18/18/VPO5/020875
DATE : 09 NOVEMBER 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SLB 2274K the sum of
Singapore Dollars One Thousand Only ($1,000.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to mefus upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafier to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident o my vehicle, SHA 6006U on 03 SEPTEMBER 2018 along
JUNCTION OF HOUGANG STREET 91 AND HOUGANG AVENUE 9.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (TAN CHOON YONG /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

I/'We hereby scknowledge that this payment 1s made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

i

1\ \

A (VPR AY. T
PR TR ] .I".:i:;z(:.:lhb ....... 35
Signature of vehitle owner/Date

b

\

Name of vehicle owner/Date



COMFOR1DELCIRO ComlortDelGro Engl.nﬂﬂrlng Pia Ltd

E.:NCIINEERINC' '-'\I'l:u.l;‘-.:h
A member of COMFORDELCRD amten &
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 COMPANY KHG. NO.: 199506048W
TAX INVOICE 30604
8010042 ;
VEHCLE NO INV. NO/DATK
LONPAC TNSURANCE BRRHAD .
LONPAC TNSURA SHABOOB 91394801 10.09. 2018
MAKK IR NO.
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07 HYUNDA 30520795
STNGAPORE 86 190585 Wi
MOTIKI ODOMITIR. READTNG
CONTACT NO: 62507388 (40 HER
DATE OF KRG DATE/TIMK TN
17.04.2014 03.09,2018 11:15
CHASSTS (CODR
@ Description : 3P 03.09.18 KMHLBA4 1L MKUID5 3757
S/No  Part No. gty Unit Price  RDisc Nat
PART REQUISTTION
SUR-TOTAL : 0.00
JOB NATURR
0001 1L PANKI, RKATING 100.00 100. 00
0002 I, SPRAY PATNTING CHARGH 200. 00 200. 00
0003  20-05 RINFW ADVERTISMENT KKAR BUMPRR 50. 00 500 00
0004 20-05 RRNKW ADVERTTSMENT REAR PRNDRR RH  100.00 100.00
0005 20-05 RKNEW ADVERTTSMENT RKAR FENDER IH  100.00 100. 00
(@) SUB-TOTAI ; 550. 00

ComforiDelGiro Engineering Pre Lid
A mambar of COMFORICELLag) ACCOUNT No INVOICE Na AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No
Head Office:

203 Braddell Road
Singapore 3T9T01

Kindly note that no receipt shall be ssued unless requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

ComioriDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

A mamber ol COMIORDELCRO
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE picceillo it e
8010042
VEHCTLE WO TNV, NO/DATE
L{EEP.I.C TRNSURANCE BRERHAL SHARDORID 11"143{'11 10.09. 2018
THE CONCOURSE
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07 Hﬁ%u q‘##‘mﬁh
SINGAPORE 53 199555 gl L
J MODKI, ODOMKTER  REAL W
CONTACT NO: 62507388 140 M
IATE OF RRG NATE/TIME IN
17.04.72014 03.09.2018 11:15
CHASEIS

éssund g
ir
Payment é%um

ComforiDel(Gro Englnvering Pte Lid
i mamber of COMPORDLLCEY

Head Office
205 Braddell Ropd
Singapore S79701

Kindly note that no recsipl shall be ssusd unless requested

CUSTOMER'S COPY

S5 CONR
KMHLB41UMEINS3T757

Items total 550,00
Add GBYT' @ 7.000 & 38.50
Tnvoice amamt K88, 50

KATHERINETAN 10.09,7018 11:56:75
CL80/57/57
/Cradit 30 days

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No




QOur Ref: CT18090045
comrort

| g

Date: 10 September 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 03/09/2018 @ 09:10hrs

ALONG T JUNCTION OF HOUGANG ST 81 TO HOUGANG AVE
9

INVOLVING SLB22T4K

We refer to the above-mentioned accidenl and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHAG006U (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to KUA LAM WAH IC NO
S1607717H a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $113.00 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice,

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

seftlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letier. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapare ST5T17 Mainline +85 6555 1188 Facsimile +85 6453 3183
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nsurance Particulars Enquiry By Agents Detuil hintps: vl i gov se/iaivrl/action/insPartDetal By AATFUNCTION

Enguire Vehicle Insurer
Vehicle No.  Incident Date/Time Search Status  Insurance Company Code Insurance Company Mame
SLB22T4K 03 Sep 2018 /05 10-00 Sucpeashul LO& LOMNPAC INSURANCE BHD

Previous oK

Lof 1 D3/09/2018, 134 PM



