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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

. REFAIR ESTIMATE*
VEHICLE 5O : SHA 73167

MAKE

: HYUNDAI SONATA

f‘l'll'}-i‘ # B/ i—

I'I'.?TE 3/9/2018 12:30

[ Ko

- /I‘z.i'_t v
CHINA

Parts Description/ Labour

Bonnet e T

From Bumper Cover

Front Bumper Grille (LH) X~
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH)
From Bumper Protector (LH) "
Headlamp (LH) —

Front Fender (LH) _—

Front Fender Shield (LH) 7

Front Fender Retainer ¢

SUB TOTAL

LESS 20%
DISCOUNTED TOTAL

7z

Front Fender Advertisement Logo (LH)

Labour Charge
Panel Beating
Spray Painting Charge
Wiring Charpe
Tuff Kote
TOTAL LABOUR

ESTIMATE TOTAL

/(,/A 24

,7%7; I'
L/
ple P p

sf1ft prs)

T

L

Unit Price

Amount
1,151.80
538.80
17.60
22.40
2020
T797.90
593.00
56.00
G20

L

32459
64918

1,596.72

100,00 |Nett

100.00

LB

w éﬂr
S(p6

MY

("]

1, 700,00

-1.
| S__4.39.72

T
Thas 1s an mitial estimate based on a visual mspection of the above velucle. The final reparr quantum will

be prepared afier the vehicle is surveved by a motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company

Page 1 of 1



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref No 305207572 i
CamfartDeiln nagring Mo

Date _ Dbaoans & Loyars mms;umm R
Fan: 6546 8156

FINALIZATION FORM

To LKK Fax:

Attn  : Mr KALVIN ANG

Vehicle Reg No SHAT3I1ET CTPL 03.09.18

The survay and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1 The repair job shall bill 1o;

2 The finalized amount shall be

ia)l SpareParis after List discount

(b) Labour Charges

Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost

{c.)  Lumpsum Repair (if applicabia)

Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:

Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3 Estmated nornmal penod for repaes:

CHINA — PC4T202
20% _$2.15000
_$2,150.00
3 warking days.

4, We shall treat the above amount as Carrect and Confirmed If there Is no reply from you within

7 working days
& Thank you for your assistance

Signature

Name : LIM KWOHK ENG
Tel 62148316

Fax 65468156

We confirm the estimates and
finallzad amount

Sigrature : i
Mame ,t‘g‘l

Far Official Use Only

Document
ftem Amourt Attached ?E:;nml E’; Remarks

Yes of No

1. Rental Rate P/Day YES

2 Loss of Income Paid NO

3. Survey Fess

4. LTA Saarch Fes £7.48

5, Madical Fass (on bahall

of driver, if applicabla)
6 Owerrun

Remarks:




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD &a’_’ = _ :
_REPAIR ESTIMATE* (= k_ﬁ_ [n.,’m-—r . —/Swm
VEHICLE NO @ SHA 73161 DATE 3/9/2018 12:30
s L,kf’,e, CHINA
MODEL : HYUNDAI SONATA .
Ly Parts Description/ Labour Tyvpe Unit Price | Amount
Bonnet S e § 1.151.80
Fromt Bumper Cover -~ 5 538.80 4~
Front Bumper Grille (LH) X~ 47 § 1760
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) #:( s 2240
Fromt Bumper Protector (LH) .~ $ 20.20 &~
Headlamp (LH) — """M s 79790 L
Front Fender (LH) _— ﬂ" 5 593.00 4~
Front Fender Shield (LH) X" 5 86.00
Front Fender Retainer Yu** s 9.20
SUB TOTAL § 324590
LESS 20% 5 649.18
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 1596.72
Front Fender Advertisement Logo (LH) 7 A= S 100.00 |Nett —
5 100.00
Labour Charge Lao
Panel Beating 5 }.ﬁﬂ"ﬁﬁ'
Spray Painting Charge ﬁ § 75610 éop
Wiring Charge s 5084 20
Tull Kote s ﬁw&.
TOTAL LABOUR § 1,700.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 5 4.396.72
k. fa 1A
3 / 9 /4 ;!.?J‘A
7 %7:
Lﬁ’
ﬁ é% - F
o
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle 1s surveyed by a motor Survevor appoinred by the msurance company

Page 1 of 1



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

 ——————————————————————————————————— e —

From: Lucas Lee <lucas|ee(@sg cntaiping.com:>

Sent Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 10:57 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LEKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC4720Z (O1: CTI -
SNM18D04310/C02/0) AND SHA7316T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18016101/k1ha3) on
03/09/2018

Attachments: MUCB18117996-PCa720Z pdf

Categories: HMEK

Dear Mel Kwan,

As per requested, kindly refer to the above attachment

Lucas Lee

Claims Departmeant (Mator)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapare 073808
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (65) 6222 7175/6224 T478

Emall: lucas les{@sa.cnlaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNATRSARY
fa Scmpapers vmee {298

Dsclaimer

This message i3 confidenrial; its conrenrs do not constirute a commitment by China Toiping Inswrance {Singapore ) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a wrirten agreement between you and Ching Taiping Insarance (Singapore} Pre. Ld. Any wnauthorized
disclosure, use ar dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou arve nat the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 10:55 AM

To: Lucas Lee

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC47202 (O - CTI - SNM18D04310/C02/0) AND SHA7316T (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CT118016101/K1ha3) on 03/09/2018

Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.



<vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC4720Z (Ol : CT1- TBA) AND SHA7316T (TP : LKK REF -

CC3/CT118016101/K1ha3) on 03/09/2018
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle SHA 7316T at Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang).
Enclosed for your perusal is;
- TP GIA report

- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.




COMFORIDELGRO

Qur Ref . T 0918 / SHA7I16T /WT(sL) ENC“NEERlNG
Your Ref :

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

Dale 12-Sep-18 COGE Taxi Claims Dept 205 Braddell Road Singapors S7TRTO

4th Fir :

5@ Loyang Drive Mainling +55 G383 GldU

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508960 Facsimilia +65 G240 9755

3 ANSON ROAD W T e CTmL Bl

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER sy R o TR

SINGAPORE 079808 Waorkshops

B 1

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE 208 ;,-.-,l.mi;”{iiﬂ..l,'}

Singapore ST8T01

Dear Sir Loyang

53 | pwang Ditve

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHA7316T YOUR INSU RED PC4720Z  ~noe ARt

AND OTHER ON~ 03.09.48 o sininy e

Singapom arsm?

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor i

Vehicle No:  SHAT316T which was involved in the captioned accident with your ingured 45 Pandan FIAE
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to e Sl
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters 320 Ub H;.:fshr'
arising from the damage to the vehicle. - """r““':""“""

SENOKG

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving PC 4720Z s.i:; 3"{!3‘4‘}5‘,"&
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants. n 3

Sungel Kadut
TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM T ?t_g:"-ni'ﬂﬁt:ﬂ_lﬁ b
1 Costof Repair s 230050 o
2 2 dayslossofRental @ _S 10914 perday 5 218, 200 Il ark A
3 Survey Report Fees  (Surveyed by Mis LKK) $ - Singapors TBHTIZ
4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49
5 GlA / Police Report Fees 3 -
6 Towing / Medical | Transporation Fees 5 -
SubTotal: § 252627
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 2 days Loss of Income @ §  B0.00 perdays S 160.00
Total Claims: §  2,686.27
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 6 pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of - PC 47202
¢) GIA/Police reports of - SHA7T316T

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
( ) Traffic Compound { ) Towing/Medical billireceipts { ) Ceriificate of Insurance
{ X )Photograph/s of Accident Scen ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and jet us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully
‘Wallwam ‘lan

Deputy Manager
COGE Claims Department
Tel: 8214 8737 Fax 6214 1843 Emall . williamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

A ot of 0
COMFORIDELGRO %, = 9
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51 UL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 208933 TEL 1 (063) 62563561 FAX : (065 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18016101/K1hal
05 NOVEMBER 2018

M/s TIMESWHEEL BUS SERVICES By Post and By Email
162 WOODLANDS STREET 13

#04-615
SINGAPORE 730162
ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 47207 AND SHA 7316T ON 03/09/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

ce  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)
Smbus88@ygmail com
(Email)



M

From: Vie (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 11:57 AM
To: smbus8s@gmail.com
Ce: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuUto)
Subject: Your Ref PC 47202 _ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 4720Z AND SHA 73167 ON
03/09/2018
y L
Consultants

- --.-
Bedl BA B Ple Lid

e ———

. e ————— e

e ——

21 LI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA LI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (D65 g2563561 FAX : (D65 62564015

Our Ref: €C3/CT118016101/K1ha3
05 NOVEMBER 2018

M/s TIMESWHEEL BUS SERVICES By Post and By Emall
162 WOODLANDS STREET 13

#04-615

SINGAPORE 730162

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 4720Z AND SHA 7316T ON 03/09/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance {Singapore} pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Rased on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. wWe will therefore proceed 1o negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

please call us if you have further queries.

Pest Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fx: G741-4108
ik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

y S
"""{H e ﬁwﬁhﬁrﬁ-%&mmmﬂmy-



This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viglation of law. If you believe that you recaived this e-mail in emor, please do not
raad this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof. and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof, Thank you.



CDG VARS.V LettofAuthorisation page 1ot

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(MAF | PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SONATA SHA7316T , PC4AT720Z ON 03-Sep-18 07:10
ALONG CHANGI SOUTH AVE 3 X CHANGI BUSINESS PARK VISTA
1/ wWe LIM BOON TECK (Hirer) NRIC MO.: S17116021
and/or (Relief) NRIC NoO.:

Tax) Number SHA7316T
hareby authors2 comfortDelGro Engineering Fte Ltd({CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, Costs and expense, Including loss of INCOME, |oss of rantal,
medical fes and legal costs.

3. To have absoiute discretion to agree to any settiement or compensation amaunt In respect of my/our claim
againet third party (except persanal injuries and medical claims).

3, To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behaif.
4, To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
»comfortDelGro Engineering Pte Led”,

Date 03-Sap-2018
Name of Hirer LIM BOON TECK
Hirer NRIC 517116021 Signature : \M\
Address 171 PAYA LEBAR WAY #02-2867
381121
Contact No. 98007874

"“"'”“"H*‘"‘vn-'ﬂ"-'fﬁumirnrJRuntimefRunﬁdeuntimﬁWiﬂwaDG VARS.V Lettof.. 03/09/2018



MOTOR_CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER
galicy Ho pME1sNi0IB221800
Claimant @ COMFORT THANSPORTATION PTE LID
Amount ¢ 5%2,620.00

51NGAPORE POLLARS THO THOUSAND SIX

I/We agres Lo accapt the above ment loned amount to ha paid to
sipal sectlement of all claims, costs &
sustalned by me/aa Ehrough an accident invelving

cilaimant Vehicle Wo. : sHA 73167
tnaurad Vahicle Ho.o S gc 4720%
pate of Loas : 03/09/2018

flace of Accident + CHANGI SOUTH AVEHUE 3

N CONSIDERATION
CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE

(SINGARPORE) PTE.
{SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

: TIMESWHEEL BUS SERVICES
. MUMAMMAD FAIZ BIN KiAMIZ

Insured Hame
Driver Name

som all claims,
sustained by malus &F

prasant oI future in respect of all losa,;
{sing out of the said accident.

claim Ho t4NMIAD04310C02/01 BC4T20E)

HUNDRED TWENTY ONLY

mefus Lin full &

dispursements for injuries [ damajges

of the payment made €2 mpaius aof the aforsmanticoned sum by
LID., 1/We agree abpolutely Lo
and/for

lnjury o©r damae

1 ackrowledge that this payment ls made without admission of 1iability an the

part of CHINA TAIETHG IMSURARNCE {STNGAPORE) PTE,. LID.

{1} Global Sum (ail ip) 55 z,620.00
TEPERL S W e e e w o ow o =S . « 5% Lﬁlﬂ.ﬂﬂ
CLamD DFPARTMIENT
COMFORTDE GRS Eviemtére " 18070
Claimant Wame : :*_ Sl ___ HRIC Mo @
= $iaty
Cignature H ’ 7 l-' ____ Dace :

Ploase fropwand o
COMFORTNELGRO

The conerts o s decarrend agply 10 venicke darméges ol
M W‘ﬁ nes g tamarss JEl heaplrem 2 svediirdan
mwmﬂ l.|_1 AL T : {

e made payable 1o

sAEERING PTE 1™



COMFOR}DELGRD Cl-‘lmfmllDH!Gm Engineering Pte Lid
ENGINEERING i

f Comi U“ﬂl.m‘;l .I_I 'I _'I'-. v I".._ .Ij-.r:l-*:: I 3
COMFANY REG. NO.: 199506048

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Page: 1
8010012 VEHCLE WO HJ{DATE
SHAT7316T 91354299 06.09.2018
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO (S)PTE LTD
SPRINGLEAF TOWER MAEE JOB NO.
HYUNDAI 305207572
3 ANSON ROAD #16-0D0
SINGAPORE 079909 %Th CDOMETER READING
CONTACT NO: 62222366 T
DATE OF REG
30.06.2011
CHASSIS CODE JOB TYFE
, FMHET41VMBAB13551
-~. Description : 3P 03.09.2018
Invoice for Lump Sum Repair
Total L Sum Repair Amt 2,150.00
Add GST € 7.000 % 130, 50
Total Invoice amount 2,300.50

Issued by : 06.09.2018 15:42:43
Repair ! Clﬂﬂfggﬁs?
Payment /Term : /Credit 30 days

wmfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
TiaRTY -||r\r|"mm‘tu_5:|‘_}

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

el Ciffice
3 Broddell Road
papore STHTOI

idly note that no receipt shall be issued uniass reguasted
ISTOMER'S COPY




Our Rel: CT18080029

Date: 06 September 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 03/09/2018 @ 07:10 hrs

ALONG CHANG! SOUTH AVE 3 X CHANGI BUSINESS PARK
INVOLVING ‘;165:;2{}2

We refer lo the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHAT316T (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to LIM BOON TECK IC NO
51711602l a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $109.14 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident,

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his cholce.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

setlement of claims with third party's insurance company In respect of the said
accidenl.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +85 8555 1188 Facsimile +85 8453 3163
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urance Particulars Enquiry By Agents Detail Illipﬁ*.f.l'-.-ﬂ.1u.gnv_igflw'vﬂfuc:iﬁnﬁnsl’nﬂﬂcmiIByﬁﬁ?FUNC’ TION ..

Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time  Search Status Insurance Company Code Insurance Company Name
PCATI0Z 03 5ep 2018/07:10:00 Successtul co CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE]) PTELTD
Previous oK

1all O3092018, 10:28 AM



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6258 3561 FAX 5258 4315

Reg Mo: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-860T188-R

Affilinted to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079908

Raf CCICTNBO016101/K 1 ha3g2

Date: 13-12-2018

Code: CTI
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, PC 47202 Veh. Inspected SHA 7316T
Policy No. DMB1SN3038221800 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D04310C02/0 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 03/08/2018
a. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI c.c 1981
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. KMHET41VMBAB 13551 Colour BLUE
Odometer 347581 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 MAXXIS 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 MAXXIS 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 MAX XIS 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60R18 MAXXIS 7 mm
4 Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/08/2018 Inspection Date 03/08r2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508869
5a. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE® BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




¥

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 7316T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No 19960712BR GST Reg No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1 of 1

Qty Description of Parts Condition | s Bl *" ey
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 1,151.80 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER DEFORMED 538.80 538 80
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE (LH) SERVICEABLE 17.60
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (LH) SERVICEABLE 2240 -
1|FRONT BUMPER PROTECTOR (LH) CuT 29.20 29.20
1|HEADLAMP (LH) GRAZED 787.90 797.80
1|FRONT FENDER (LH) DENTED 583.00 §93.00
1|FRONT FENDER SHIELD (LH) SERVICEABLE B6.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER RETAINER SERVICEABLE 920
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -549.18 -381.78
2,596 72 1,567.12
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH) (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
100.00 100.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF B50.00 400.00
BOMNNET
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 750.00 800.00
WIRING CHARGE 50.00 20.00
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 20.00
1,700.00 1,040.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,396.72 2,707.12
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REFAIRS 2,150.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18016101/K1ha3qg2
i
1l
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessar

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD FARTIES - This Report is made sobaly 104 e use and benelit of the Cllenl named on the Troni page of ihis Repor.




