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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE®

VEHICLE %O : SHA 1542IX

A
AW AL (L)

DATE 8/2/2017 10:36 \.—} “/—-}
.-j

MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDALI i40
Parts Deseription’ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Front Bumper Cover €44 s 1082201
Front Bumper Grille (LH) Jeyen $ 28550
Headlamp (LH) oatA $ 1,388.00 p—
Front Fender (LH) 5 619.00+—
Fromi Fender Shield {i.Hi o M 5 169,80 £
Fromt Fender Retamer A S 920 |>=
Front Wheel Hub Cap (RH) b S 15070 |
SUB TOTAL 3,674.40
LESS 20% 734 88
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 2193952
Labour Charge
Pancl Beating Lo S SAT00
Spray Painting Charge séa §  A8000
Wiring Charge 20 S =500
Tulf Kote > ] 50,00
TOTAL LABOUR 5  L060.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § 399952
Bu paint f
2
(e HY
918 P Yo 2V,
3,2" g ik - = s hancs nobl
\raning:
1 W
§.00 BTV
o T
oo gy A ) T
b 1 firat mpproval 1
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o
 — |
Thas is an mitial estimate based on a visual mspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared afier the vehicle is surveyed by 8 motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company




COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING
VEHICLE NO, : SHA1542X TYPE OF CASE : AIG
JOBCARD NO. 305007237 SURVEY BY +  LKK-HENRY
ACC.DATE 05/02/17 DATE

SUPPLEMENTARY OF PARTS AND LABOUR COSTS
DESCRIPTION ary ESTIMATE REMARKS
FRT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET

TOTAL: $24.60 JUMANI




Our Ral TOANT ! SHA 15428 1 CL (J] V }

Your Ref : COGETam Claims Dept ' /
= f

e e szt~ COMFORIDELCRO .

AlG Asin Pacific Insuronce Mg, Lad Smgapore S08655 ENGINEERING

CHARTIS Buliding Fax B214 1843

#07-16, 78 Shemon W ity el [Im-'l‘f'“ @ Piw Ll

Singupore 079120 ' e

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAX| SHA 1542% YOUR INSURED P g
GBF 3635T OTHERS ON 05.02.17 . Bracues

Wunhmmmmwmhcwrmmmm the owner of motor !

Vehicle No SHA 1542x which was involved in the captioned accident with your M ki o

insured vehicle. Thnvﬁthmmdhmnmmmmww e

authorized us to  assist them i presenting thair claims agains! the party responsible L ity

for all applicatie matlers arising from the damage to the vehicle

As the accident was caused by the negligert act of your insured driving GBF 36357
m“mmmmmmrnwmmmw&hdlm

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair 58 4003 77
2 15 days Loss of Rental m 127 13 par day 55 574 68 Sttt
3 Survey R Fees (Surveyed by LKK) ss . i
4 LTA %ﬁm ss 2 00 I A
§  GIA/Police Repor Fees 0N = Tl
8  Towing [ Medical / Transporation Fees 88 T - e
SubTotal: 8§ ~ 25875 Oty
HIRER'S CLAT™M SEESS eSSy . =795
1 4% days Loss of Income @$ 80 00 _per days §s 360 00 ———
TotalClaims 8§ 403 7d A
We enclosed herewith the following documents 1o support the claims: -
a4}  Original repair bill, pcs
b) LTA search slip/s of GBF 3625T
€]  GIA/Police report's of
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
| 1 Phatocopels of Accidernt Scene Photols |} Trafhe Pobce Result
[ ) Witnéss sialements | ¥ | Renial Aale etle { ) DowntimeMileages recor

Hmwmmuummm-ﬂmummmmuummmmmnumu
500N as possible

Phlummmithnmﬂlﬁmnﬁwuﬁnmtmedmnmlhmmmm;m

to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver This condition shall apply even if medical
expenses are claimed herewith and part of the settlement reached
Mmmmmmmnmmmwmu-mmmm
um:mmwm.mmmﬂmummdmwm
MMMﬁmﬂhﬂwﬁm“Mmemm
mmmhhm-muuhummmummmummmm
mmmmnmﬁwﬂﬂm“uﬁhm%nm
lmmmmmuuhm-umummmnnmumm

scgulesced 1o the sald condition by your conduct

Yours fadnfuny

{ cerdiad Low

Exscutive

CDGE Claims Department

Tel 6214 B354 Fax 8214 1842 Emall ceclalee@sparkcarcare com

'@
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+hsher Snﬂ {l..l(lthutu!

From: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M <Jaclyn-M Kesaval@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 9:28 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuU10)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 55990406625G, ACCIDENT INVOIVING SHA 1542X AND GBF 3635T ON
05/02/2017

Hi Asher,

Please assist to re-open matter in merimen and issue DV accordingly.
Once signed DV returned, we will arrange for payment to be made.
Thank you.

Jaclyn M K

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1953 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Jaclyn-M.Kesaval(@aig.com | www aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Thie infarmation i Hns amail (and &ny attactiments) is confidential f you are nof ihe intended recipient, you must not use or aisseminale the
infarmatian. If you have received this emall in arror. pleass immedistely nolify me by “Reply” command and permanantly delete tha original and any
copies or priniouts thereol Although this email and any aftfechments are beleved fo be free of any virus or ather gefect that might affect any compirter
spstam into wivch § |5 recelved and opanad it is the responsibility of (he recipient io ensure that ! is virus free and no responsibility s sccepled by AIG
for any inss or demage ansing in ary way ffrom its use

From: Cecilla Lee Peng Geok [mallto:cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com]

Sent: Friday, August 31, 2018 11:10 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M

Subject: Re: Your Ref: 55990406625G, ACCIDENT INVOIVING SHA 1542X AND GBF 3635T ON 05/02/2017

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Strictly without admission of any liability and solely for quick amicable settlement, we confirm settlement at $500.00 for
property damage only. Please note that the contents of this email apply to vehicle damages only and should not be cited
or relied on as precedent in any proceeding. It is condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/driver/claimant.

1



‘ Please forward Discharge Voucher for execution and your cheque made payable to : COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING
PTELTD

Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 August 2018 8:54 AM

To: Cecllia Lee Peng Geok

Cc: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 55990406625G, ACCIDENT INVOIVING SHA 1542X AND GBF 3635T ON 05/02/2017

Without Prejudice
Hi Cecilia,
We refer to the above matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, our principal propose the settlement at Global
Sum 55500.00 (all-in).

Please kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Bes! Regards
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consullants Ple Lid

phone: 4841.4051 | emalk mihenng@kkouto.com | fox: 4741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubi Indusirlal Park. Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 1:47 PM

To: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M <laclyn-M.Kesaval@aig.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto,.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: 55990406625G, ACCIDENT INVOIVING SHA 1542X AND GBF 3635T ON 05/02/2017

Without Prejudice
Dear laclyn

Please revert with your offer in quantum.



. Thank you,

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M <Jaclyn-M.Kesaval@aig.com>
Sent; Friday, 3 August 2018 2:08 PM

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: 55990406625G, ACCIDENT INVOIVING SHA 1542X AND GBF 3635T ON 05/02/2017

OPEN EMAIL
Dear Cecllia,
We refer to your correspondence with LKK.

For cases with video footage, BOLA does not apply. As per MAG scenario below, our insured was moving
straight along his lane. It is the duty of your client to ensure that traffic is clear before moving off from a
stationary position and not presume that other drivers will give way to him.

should proceed onl
mmﬂmlsrz

thdl.'. (ii) ht hll llm

[ill]z ufeu:dnm.

Driver ‘l" should keep a

lookout ﬁ veul:h:lr.-i
entering path o
. W ravel and take evasive

on avoid

Vehicle X ~Moving off from |collision.® '
stationary ed
position the
side of the road

Vehicle ¥ - Mwim straight
ahead within s
own lane

Where Driver X moved off 9 |10
without signalling
Where Driver X moved off BO |20
after signalling

In view of the same, we are willing to contribute 10% towards the claim. However, if your client can prove
that he did signal before moving off, we will review the matter.

Thank you.

Jaclyn M K
AIG



. Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +{65) 6419 1853 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Jaclyn-M Kesaval@aig.com | www 3ig.com.sg
IMPORTANT NOTICE

The infarmation in this email (and any aitachments) s confidential f you are nof the mfended recipient. you must not use or dissermnale (he
information . If you have received this emall in eror, ploass immediataly notify me by "Reply® command and permanantly deleto the ariginal and any
copies or printouls thereal. Although this email and any aftachments are beleved 1o be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system info which it is received and opened, It is ihe responsibility of the recipient o ensure that it Is virus free and no responsibifly is accapted by AIG

for any loss or damage ansing in any way from s use

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, August 03, 2018 10:08 AM

To: Kesaval, Jaclyn-M

Subject: Your Ref: 55990406625G, ACCIDENT INVOIVING SHA 1542X AND GBF 3635T ON 05/02/2017

Hi Jacklyn,

We refer to the above matter.

Third party disagreed with our rejection and appeal to settle @ 50/50.

If not agreeable, they seek AlG's consent to escalate the matter to GIA DRM.
Please kindly let us have your instruction.

Thank You.

Best Regorcly

Asher Sng | Cose Handier

LKK Auto Consullants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-60571 | emoil; gshenng@lkkguio.com | lox 4741-4108
Blk 51, Payo Ubd Industrial Pork, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[40B933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you
must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emall in error, please immediately
notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof.
Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect
any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure
that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or
affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
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_received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(NAF [ PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING |40 SHA1542X , GBF 36357 ON 05-Feb-17 13:35
ALONG H!RﬁHHGIJUHECHiGETLlHEIRDIEIBEFOREIJHHH“EZI
1/ Wa SIM BEE LING [SHEN M... [(Hirer} NRIC No.: S72009321
and/or (Redlief) NRIC No.:
Taxl Number SHA1542X

| herehy authorise ComfortDelGre Engingering Ple LLd{CDGE):

1. To submit myfour claims for damages, costs and expense, Including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree te any sattigment or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
agairst third party (except persanal Injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behall.
4. To accept any payment {(c/aim proceads) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall ba forward directly to CDGE In accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Ltd".

| Date 07-Feb-2017
Name of Hirer SIM BEE LING (SHEN MEILING)
Hirar NRIC S7200932) Signature ; I .
| Py
1
Address 114 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 4 #04-363
560114
Contact No. B&704446

httn:/edeek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG.VARS.V Lettof...  07/02/2017



RELEASE VOUCHER
LAIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“Well. COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confinm
that we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific lnsurance

Pre Lid LKK A J S PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the
amoum cluimed for SS300.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SHA 1542X that was damaged
pirsuant 1o the sccident which occurred on 05022017 (date) along MERGING LANE ON
GEYLANG ROAD BEFORE LORONG 21 (location) involving vehicle no/s GBI 3635T.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 08/02/2017 [dute) ot ““the workshop™,

We/l confirm that we/l arefam authorized by the owner COMFORT TRANSPORTATION
PTE LTD (“the third party claimam™) of vehicle no. SHA 1542X make the chum as set oul in
the above paragraph apd wefl have full nuthority to settle the matter on histher behall o
munner Gt wedl deein i, We/T enclose herein the letter of authority given by "he third party
clairmam”

Wesl further confirm thit we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pocific Insurince Pie Lud for all
damuges, loss andfor expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third
party claimont™ afrer the above said agreement lodges o further claim against the former for any
loss nnd expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant
to the dumage 1o SHA 1542X (vehicle no,) as a tesull of the secldent.

We/l confirm tha the agreement reached above 1s in full and final scitlemem of any clmm of
“the third purty cluimont”™ pursuant to the pocident and that Turther this settleiment is reached on o
withoul prejudice and withoul admission of Hability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore lnw and the Singapore Counts liave
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute urising owt of the same.

| 3 SEP 0
Duted Lhis (day) of (rmormth ) 20 (vpar)
CLA
J& COMFORTOHLSY
L
Signed by uppointed surveyor Signed by "

ampges

documant spply 1o wehicle d
ries and gamayes ANEING |her=lrom afe
only &1 personal wju

The contents of this

axcluded from the ambit and application of this document

Mense Mmwnrd 5 bovme mude payable -

COMFORTOELGRU ENGINEERING PTE LTD



)MFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

CHi

L i

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-2 TAX INVOICE

INVOICE Mo AMOUNT BANK/CHO No

ACCOUNT Mo

U wprlort DM oo Fnglavering Ple 1l
Cowara

CUSTOMER'S COPY



_OMFORIDELGRO

CNGINEERING

GST REG. NO. M2-8821817-3 TAX INVOICE

CumibortDelGire Engineering Pre Lud
LD . ACCOUNT No INVOICE Mo AMOUNT BANKACHO No

s I Thgel rep) Pl ahall B cgaesd nless rgdpu eiip

CUSTOMER'S COPY



Our Ret CT17020206 ,\

Comlart
Date 16 February 2017 A —
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear Sir/Madam
ACCIDENT ON ps022017 @ 1335 hrs
ALONG MERGING LANE ON GEYLANG ROAD BEFORE
LORONG 21
INVOLVING GBF 23835T

We refer lo tha above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
TnmpuﬂlﬂMPtlLtd is the registered owner of the taxi beanng vehicle registration
number SHA1542X (the “Taxi"). The Taxi was hired 1o SIM BEE LING (SHEN
MEILING) IC NO S7200932J a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation
Pte Ltd at the time of occurence of the aforementioned accident at a rantal rate
§127.33 per day (inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxl was Insured with India International Insurance Pte
Lhdonathirdpanybammmummﬁal tima of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission o
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator of his authorized workshop directly for

settiement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

yYours faithfully
Christine Tay

Executive, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature |s required.

343 Sin Ming Drive Singapone 575717 Mainling +85 8555 1188 Facsimile +65 B453 3183
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aramr IrwDice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
B Rafes Cuay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax. +85 8224 0030
Operating Hours. Monday to Friday Sam o Spm
GST Registration No: MA00017735

GENERAL

INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ral Na: GR-17-017423
Date of Regquest oriozroT Your Rel Mo. Onfine Purchase
ComforDeiGro Engnesnng Ple Lid
205 Braddall Road
Singapora 5T8701
Daar SirMadam,
Enquiry Daw 0T022017
Enguiry By JANET LIM SIANG GEK
TP Vehicle No., GAFIRAST
=i codent Dabe oso22017
Enguiry Result
TP Vaehicle No. innurar Period of Insurance msurer Tal, No.
GBF3835T AIG Asia Pacific insurance Piwn. Lid 1500/2016-14/082017 §5-6419-3000
Thank You

Tl‘llwwmm;'mtltﬁnffmhmlrmufnm#m Ia tha maymmmﬂuﬂrrﬂmmwd
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Evpriess

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER ‘I'lu.l‘:lllln - ) - '
Case ]Nm-rm | Est Submitted | Ad] Assigred Ad| Rpt | id] Submitied Ing duth’ed | Stabus
08 Feb 2017 | | Pending for Survey
0 Feb 2017 |
N L o iy e |
= | ranAd mp | | . Cancei Case |

Main Referance

Imum: ]m BUILDER PTE LTD, Co. | I.ng No.: 2010255516, Tel: +E6397400484
_mnmm‘rmun PTELTD, Co.Reg. No.! 1993038218

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]

Main
\Claimant:
Vehicle Reg, | T |05/0272017 13:00 - 59

IMa.: SHA1542K Dote of LS8! || 34 Months and 9 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

|Claim Type: | TP / 559904066256 Noteno ™ |2100482357 (Comprehensive)
[venicle Reg -

Palicy No.
GRF3635T |{Chlmlnt‘.|: MCOMO01S

N TE'n:ui
Mﬂﬂﬂﬂh hnlnl-'lng m l.tll {I.wln[] 59 Loyang Drive, 508969 Loyang - Tel: 6214 8300

mm Pacilic Insurance Ple. Lid. (Express) - Tel; &5 64153000 . . [Hardled by Kesaval, Jaclyn-M]
| Jnciyn-M, Kesaval @aig.com -

India International Insurance Pie Lid (HQ) - Tel. 63476100
; LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Te: 6256-3561 . [Handied by HENRY NG KOK HUA] ... |Final Rpt due 14/09/2018]
'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED B view Al | Compose Case mai ||
|+ AIG_SG_EXPRESS (12/09/2018): Report Send Back Alerts - SHALS4X (TP) 1

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ B View All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | Complete |
Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group  Subject  Handler Aszigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
| No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp ... 28/9/2018
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Claim Documents

*SHA1542X (55990406625G)
e
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
Feb 5 2017 1:40PM

[COREFORM BUILDER PTE LTD]
ComfortDelGro Englineering Pte Ltd

Letters/Correspondences a Lomrosge %] B |
Mo Finalzed On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail Print
|1 [(oram) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Greakdown O] Em [
Assessment Reports tperpage  |~] M |
{Mo_[Finalized On | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail| Print |
Accldent Statement

.i MEIE?““ IHME - Beg. e GAFYSIST, C) CIMEFORM BULLDER FTE LTD o l"“"':“'m"'| ]
:Phntnsﬂmqu - 0w = 3 per page ¥] o |
'Pm MJM Immmunumtu{,uq; Thumbnall| Print|
11 |09/02/17 16:48 Iﬂmm 0D  tesawe | &

{2 |09/02/17 16:48 _lumm | @) | teawG | B

& mwnmr 16:48 | General View | @) | Loadiec | A

4 09/02/17 16:48 | General View - B | D | sdwc | B2

5 |09/02/17 1648 | Ganeral View 0  wwwrs | A

|6 |09/02/17 16:48 General View 0O wars | 4

7 |D9/02/17 16:48 General View D tadwc | A

8 090217 16:48 | General View D wedrs | A

9 09017 16:48  General View 0 | wre | &

1o | unmmnua_ General View D adws | A

(11 05/02/17 1648 | General View - O | wedrc | B

[:_2_ |D9/02/17 16:46 | Genaral View 0 | wawrs | A

(13 09/02/17 16:48 | General View 0 wawrs | &

|14 |09/02/17 16:48 | General View - D | edwc | A

15 D9/02/17 16:45 | General View 0 | Losaws B

16 29/05/17 16:22 | RESURVEY PHOTO O | owers B
17 28/05/17 16:22 | RESURVEY PHOTO B 0 adiwc | &
18 |29/05/17 16:22 | RESURVEY PHOTO — — D | weaws | (A

Documentation iperpoge V]| B

No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) - Thumbnall| Print
1 | 10/02/17 09:26 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED 2 Load POF

7 [10/02/17 09:26 | TP GIA REPORT | Losa POF

3 |26/D5/17 14:29 EMAIL INFORMED TO CDGE | Load POF

4 |26/05/17 14:29 | EMAIL APPROVAL FROM JACKLYN | Load FOF

5 |D3/0B/16 10:08 | EMAIL TO AIG DO 010818 O tesdror [
& |D8/OS/18 14:28 TP LOD | Losa POF

7 _|I009/1814:21 |WORNENOP INVOICE ———— — —| Q9 | LasaPOF |
B | I8/09/18 14:21 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM | Lond POF

9 28/09/18 14:21 Relesse Voucher - |_ ) | Load PDF |
30 IRROWIRIEZ] |MENTAL RECEIPT — - -  Lang TR

11 | 28/05/18 14:2] GIA SEARCH | Load POF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...

28/9/2018
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Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

ocums Reset | Save | Print |
[There are no document checklists configured. I

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HG)

Show Remarks To:! D Handling InSurer
NEa BEars oW SHVETE uRlEan yed ches @ D Ootteer parTEs

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 28/9/2018
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
['d'ihiﬂu No: GBF3635T (Insd veh) Model: HYUNDAI 140 1.7 D CRDI (A)
SHA1542X (TP veh)

| Date of Accident: | 05/02/2017

Global Sum Settlement | | [X] Yes | [ ] No

Repair Estimate '8 4,300.54

Final Repair Cosl - 500.00

Loss of Use :$ 4.50 days at $50.00 per day
Rental (if any) ' 5 450 days

LTA | GlA Search Fes 4

Others: 4

'3

Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) '8 500.00

is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X] YES [ ] NO (Kindlyindicate
balow)

A) For Nen GlA Registered Workshop: Agread Liability (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop: B(I:I;A’ﬁpplmﬁa: Yes/ Mo BOLA Scenarno No:

BOLA Liability 10 (%) Assessed Liability (*): {%)
* Assessed Lisbility to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Hemarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd ‘9 500.00
2) - 1

3 ' §

4) '3

JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN oo
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Pleasa attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair 8ill; Rental Invoice; Releass Voucher: Authorisation to Act: Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 28/9/2018
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregne 1sss071ssm)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@likkauto.com;assignmentsi@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/AIG17002688/H1EA3Q2-1

Date: 28/08/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Lid.  Palicy No 2100482357
Claimant Vehlcle shatsazx Insured Vehicle No:  GBF3835T
Date of Loss: Dso2rzo7 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 559904086256
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SHA1542X
Make & Modal: HYUNDAI 140, 1.7 D CRDi {A) Engine No: D4FDDUAS3223
Reg. Date 271032014 (Man. Year. 2014) Chassis No: KMHLB41UMEUDS2782
Colour: Blue Odomeler. 351048 km
Engine Capacity: 1885 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Prica: N/&
Sum Insured (5§) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Front Left Side West Lake 4 mm Rear Left Side: West Lake 4 mm
Front Right Side; West Lake 4 mm Rear Right Side: VWesl Lake 4 mm
Tha above walues represent ihe remaring fyre freads dopth
COSTOFCLAMS Repairer's Adjuster's _Difference  Diff %
Parts 285920 285184 7.36 0.25
Miscellanecus ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.060.00 780.00 270.00 2547
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S5) 4,019.20 3,741.84 2TT.36 6.90
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5%5) 28134 261.93 19.41 6.90
Nett Amount (5$) 4,300.54 4,003.77 296.77 6.90
+ Loss of Use (4.5 x $§50.00/day) (5§) 225.00
+ Car Rental (4.5 x 5$127.33/day) (55) 57299
(55) 4 801.76
Liable Amount (10.00%) (S§) 480.18
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 2.00
Nett Liability (S$) 482.18
Global Sum Settlement (55) 500.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 08/02/2017

https://singapore.merimen.comv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 28/9/2018
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Date Inspected: DBM2/2017 Inspected Al ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
(Loyang)
58 Loyang Drive
Singapore 508969

Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

Adjuster: HENRY NG KOK HUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE This report represents our findings of the time and place of inspection stated hersin. Such inspection has been carmed oul lo the bast of owr
knawledge and abitty but any other fabdity undar any other circumstances W hemby expressly excluded

https:/singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 28/9/2018
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 ‘FRONT BUMPER COVER Cracked 1.052 20FL *1.052 20FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER GRILLE {LH) Cracked 285 50FL *285.50FL
31 *HEADLAMP (LH) Cracked 138B00FL  *13BB.00FL
4 1 *FRONT FENDER (LH) Dented §19.00FL *819.00 FL
5 1 *FRONT FENDER SHIELD (LH) Torn 169,80 FL *169.80FL
6 1 *FRONT FENDER RETAINER Nol Necessary 9.20FL *-FL
71 *FRONT WHEEL HUB CAP (LH) Cul 150, 70FL *150.70FL
g8 1 *FRT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET Cracked 24 BOFL “24 60OFL
F=Franchise pant L=LslitemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 3,699.00 3,689.80
- List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S$) 739.80 737.96
Total Parts (S%) 2,959.20 29851.84
Repori was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 28/9/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no now miscellaneous ilems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING Mew 560.00 400.00
2 SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE New 400.00 360.00
3 WIRING CHARGE New 50.00 30.00
4 TUFF KOTE New 50,00 0.00

Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,060.00 790.00

Repon was unsubmitted during this print-out.
=< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.comV/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 28/9/2018



