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31 URLAVE 1, #12-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PFARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL - (D651 62563561 FAX {063 H2S0AE

Your ref: D1a006444MESH
Our Ref: CS/FCIR016071/R1vb Date :6/9/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SLL 9408T
We thank you for your instruction on 3/9/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
4/9/2018 at the premises of M/s PEGASUS ENFINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : $812,745.00
Revised Estimate Amount : §%3.564.00
"Check" Items Amount 1 5§232.00
Market Value 1 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

MNett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



1 H M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ©ofeq o 1950001060 CSTReg No. ME-000LG763
MS. FI rstca pltal & Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tek (656222 2311 Fax: [B5) 6222 3547

[laims & Hater Underwriting Depr 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (55 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849

woerwe mafirstcapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 28-08-2018 Our Ref No. D18006444MFSH
Accident Date 27-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHB4920M Third Party Vehicle. SLLS408T
Survey Location 74 KIAN TECK ROAD
Contact Person. QUEENIE QUAY
Contact No. 65137748/ 0 Fax No. 62513161
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
A d

Ppainte LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MA

G v .
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT Caniid D 6N Tanl

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

PEGASUS ENGINEERING

: Worksh ion.
e 2R & TRADING PTE LTD Astantion. Nt
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This iz a computer generatad latter, no signature requirad.

1 RN (RELRANCE R




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: wVeron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 September 2018 9:38 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: LUREMNEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006444MFSH/1, SLL 9408T
Attachments: SLL 9408T PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLL 9408T
Date of survey: 4/9/2018
Number of days : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 5:07 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: LURENEJIAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006444MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 04.09.2018.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6741-8434 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From:; Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 3 September, 2018 3:43 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006444MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Pegasus Engineering <ar_claims@ pegasusengrg.comsg>
Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 4:43 PM

To: veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalise For SLL9408T (DOA 27/08/2018)

Dear Veron Chen,

MNoted with thanks.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Lid
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161

On Thu, Oct 18, 2018 at 3:13 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Vivian,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm Part by Part repair $3,601.25 and 6 days repair.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
1



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 8:33 AM

To: 'Pegasus Engineering' <ar claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Lionel Chua
<lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg> <lionelchua@pegasusenarg.com.s6 josephyeh@vendaengrg com.sg;
Lawrence Sim <lawrencesim@vendaengrg COm.sg>; Seng Kee Wong <§engkee.wnng@pegasgsengrg.mm.sp;
Belinda Sim <belindasim@pegasusengre.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Finalise For SLLGA408T (DOA 27/08/2018)

Dear Vivian,

Kindly provides us before paint photos.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Pegasus Engineering <ar claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg=
Sent: Wednesday, 17 October 2018 5:51 PM

To: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com=; Lionel Chua <lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg=>
<lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg=; josephyeh@vendaengre.com.sg; Lawrence Sim
<lawrencesim@vendaengrg.com.sg=; Seng Kee Wong <sengkee.wong@pegasusengrg.com.sg>; Belinda S5im

<belindasim@pegasusengrg.com.sg=>
Subject: Finalise For SLLO4DBT (DOA 27/08/2018)

Dear Ms. Veron
Please find the calculation for your confirmation.

Part by Part repair $3,601 .25 and 6 days repair.



The attached copies of the documents for your attention.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office; 65137748

Fax: 62513161



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 3:14 PM

To: 'Pegasus Engineering’; SUR; ‘Lionel Chua <lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg>;
'josephyeh@vendaengrg.com.sg;; Lawrence Sim'; ‘Seng Kee Wong'; 'Belinda Sim'

Subject: RE: Finalise For SLL9408T (DOA 27/08/2018)

Dear Vivian,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm Part by Part repair $3.601.25 and 6 days repair.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 8:33 AM

To: 'Pegasus Engineering' <ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Lionel Chua
<lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg= <lionelchua @pegasusengrg.com.sg=; josephyeh@vendaengrg.com.sg;
Lawrence Sim <lawrencesim@vendaengrg.com.sg; Seng Kee Wong <sengkee.wong@pegasusengrg.com.sg>;
Belinda Sim <belindasim@pegasusengrg.com.sg=

subject: RE: Finalise For SLL408T (DOA 27/08/2018)

Dear Vivian,

Kindly provides us before paint photos.

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkaute.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Pegasus Engineering <ar claims{@pegasusengrg.com.sg=

Sent: Wednesday, 17 October 2018 5:51 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Lionel Chua <lionelchua @ pegasusengrg.com.sg> <linnelchua @ pegasusengrg.com.sg=;
josephyeh@vendaengrg.com.sg; Lawrence Sim <lawrencesim@vendaengre.com.sg=; Seng Kee Wong




<sengkee . wong@pegasusengrg.com.sg>; Belinda Sim <belindasim & pepasusengrg.com.sg>
Subject: Finalise For SLL9408T (DOA 27/08/2018)

Dear Ms, Veron
Please find the calculation for your confirmation.
Part by Part repair $3,601.25 and 6 days repair.

The attached copies of the documents for your attention.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161



> Back to OneMatoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Creenier 1D Type:

Crwner ID:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo

P aximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
T Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARE Eligibility:

PARF Eligihility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 28 Aug 2018

Company
F200G

SLLF408T

Mo

28 Aug 2018
TOYOTA

WVIOS 1.5E CVT
Silver

2017
ZMREX13064F
MHFB29F 34602007519
TR0 kW (105 bhpl
$12,946.00

14 Mar 2017

14 Mar 2017

o

$7.945.00

Yes
15 Mar 2027
£5,95%.00

15 Mar 2027

A - Car up to 1600ce & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$50,889.00

543 460,00

£49,419.00



;\ -~ PEGASUS

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation

From :

Customer :

Officer in
Tal:
Email :

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD
C/0 51 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 538216

Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG

Attn;
Tel :
Fax Mo.

| GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE

#01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960

Quotation No. : QD18/09-1026

CQuotation Date : 04/0%2018

Terms : 30 DAYS

Vehicle No. : SLL9408T

Chassis No. : MHFE28F 3602007519

Third Party Insurer :

Model : VIOS Date of Accident : 27/08/2018
l Remarks : I
| 1TEM | DESCRIPTION [ aty | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD) |
1 REAR BUMPER 1 505.0000 P& 505.00
2  REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER 2 1200000 AL ¥ 240.00
3 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER - SHORT 2 45.0000 A" 9000
4  REAR BUMPER CLIP 10 4.0000 ke~ 40.00
5  REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR 2 2150000 &< ¥ 430,00
6  REAR REINFORCEMENT 1 3250000 D 32500
7 BOOTUID COVER 1 825.0000 %ﬂm
8  BOOTLID COVER HINGE 2 80.0000 §vL X 160.00
9  BOOTLID TOYOTA EMBLEM 1 60.0000  Mes < 60.00
10 BOOTLID 'VIOS' BADGE 1 550000 #5500
# 11 BOOTLID'E BADGE 1 50.0000 pae o 50,00
12 BOOTLID OUTER MOULDING 1 290.0000 ?’;L 290.00
13  BOOTLID INMER TRIM COVER 1 235.0000 ¥ 23500
14  BOOTLID INNER TRIM COVER CLIPS 10 4.0000 nA ¢ 40.00
15  BOOTLID LICENSE PLATE LAMP 2 75.0000 > 150.00
16  REAR END PANEL 1 fegesV” 6950000 ﬁ'ki £95.00
17 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH 1 2550000 CF 7 25500
18 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS 10 50000 A% 3 50.00
19  REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL 1 7950000 >¢ 79500
20 REAR SPARE TYRE FLOOR BOARD 1 265.0000 < 265.00
21 REAR SPARE TYRE TOOLKIT FOAM 2 znn.ouuui"\“ ¥ 400.00
22  REAR FENDER 2 900.0000 3_1,800.00
23 REAR FENDER SPLASH SHIELD 2 70.0000 ¥ 140.00
CIF 0.00

Page 1of 3



-~ PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation

From :

Customer :

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD
CI/0 61 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 539216

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE
#01-08 MIDVIEW CITY

SINGAPORE 573960
Officer in Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG
Tel; Aftn:
Email ; Tel :
Fax No. :

Quotation No. : Q018/09-1026

Quotation Date : 04/09/2018

Terms : 30 DAYS

Vehicle No. : SLLS408T

Chassis No. : MHFB20F 3602007518

Third Party Insurer :

““Model : VIOS Date of Accident : 27/08/2018
]_Ramarks :
[ ITEM | DESCRIPTION [ aty | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD) |
BIF 0.00
24  REAR FENDER SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS 20 4.0000 K./~ < BO.00
25  REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER 2 450.0000 > 900.00
26  REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER CLIPS 20 40000 ~a S 8000
27  REARWEATHERSTRIP Ase Ve 1 50,55
LESS 20% (ITEM 1 - 26) -1,782.0000
p
28  REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR 2 2800000 220 N 5506
29  BOOTLID NUMBER PLATE AND CASING 1 60.0000 AN XX 60.00
— ;
30 TO REMOVE & REFIX INTERIOR FITTINGS, TRIMMINGS, GARNISH 1 1800000 6o 1peio
AND OTHER TO ENABLE REPAIR AND PERFORMING INTERIOR
CLEANING
31 TO REMOVE AND REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRING WHEN 1 1200000 A 3¢ 120.00
NECESSARY
32 TO REMOVE AND REPLACED REAR REVERSE SENSOR 1 150.0000 £o 1 994(1::
33 TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING/TUFTCOATING TREATMENT TO 1 1200000 Yo 12000
REPLACED PARTS 50
34  TO REMOVE, REPLACED DAMAGED BODYPARTS, REPAIR AND 1 1,200.0000 EE0 120000
REALIGN BODYWORK AND WHERE CONSISTANT TO THE s
ACGIDENT
35  TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTED AREAS 1 1,400.0000 TOD yenﬁ
CIF 0.00

Page 2 of 3



~~ - PEGASUS

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C
Quotation

From :
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

C/O 51 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 539216

Officer in Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG
Tel :
Email :

Customer :

| GRAE RENTALS PTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE

#01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960

Attn;
Tel :
Fax MNo. .

[Quotation No. : QO18/09-1026

Quotation Date : 04/05/2018

Terms : 30 DAYS

Vvehicle No. : SLL9408T

Chassis No. : MHFBE28F 3602007519

Third Party Insurer :

Date of Accident : 27/08/2018

Model : VIOS
iRemarks:
N DESCRIPTION | aty | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (sGD) |
BIF 0.00
i_ o 1T _
I
!
|
2

Please conduct the survey at
Pegasus Engineering @ 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Sub Total 12,745.00
GST(7.00%) 892.15
Total (SGD) 13,637.15



A o
e R

| 2%~ PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation
e _

Erom: Customer:

SEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD

£/0 51 DEFU LANE 10 18 SIN MING LANE

SINGAPORE 539216 #01-0B MIDVIEW CITY

/ SINGAPORE 573860

Officer in Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG

Tel: Adtr: :

Email ; Tel:

Fax Mo, :

Quotation No. : QO18/08-1026 Quotation Date : 04/08/2018 Terms : 30 DAYS |

Vehicle No. : SLLB408T | Chassis No. : MHFB28F3602007510 Third Party Insurer .

Model : VIOS Date of Accident : 27/08/2018 ‘
Iﬁmarks 1 i
[TITEM | DESCRIPTION [ ay | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD) |

1 REAR BUMPER 1 505.0000 P~ 505.00
2  REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER 2 120.0000 ¥ 240.00
4  REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER - SHORT 2 450000 A" 50.00
4  REAR BUMPER CLIP 10 4.0000 M= 40,00
s  REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR 2 215.0000 ¥ 43000
6  REAR REINFORCEMENT 1 so5.0000 Bfs7 325.00
f"-
7  BOOTLID COVER 1 A25.0000 5.00
8 BOOTLID COVER HINGE 2 80.0000 ¥ 180.00
g BOOTLIC 'TOYOTA' EMBLEM 1 60.0000 Aes 77 60.00
10 BOOTLID 'VIOS' BADGE i 56,0000 4ar” 5500
11 BOOTLID 'E BADGE 1 50,0000 e 5000
12 BOOTLID OUTER MOULDING 1 2g0.0000 X 7 4 290.00
13 BOOTLID INNER TRIM COVER 1 235,0000 ¥ 23500
14 BOOTLID INNER TRIM COVER CLIPS 10 40000 N 40,00
1§ BOOTLID LICENSE PLATE LAMP 2 75.0000 L 150.00
L g 4

16  REAR END PANEL > { fepevV” 6950000 695.00
7 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH @'5 1 0550000 A/ 25500
18  REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS 10 50000 A ¢ 3. 50,00
19  REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL i 765.0000 > 795.00
20 REAR SPARE TYRE FLOOR BOARD 1 265.0000 7~ 265.00
34 REAR SPARE TYRE TOOLKIT FOAM 2 200.0000 > 400.00
22  REAR FENDER 2 900.0000 %_1,800.00
97  REAR FENDER SPLASH SHIELD 2 70.0000 ¥ 140,00

CIF 0.00

Page 1ol 3



]

%’? _~ PEGASUS

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation

From :

Customer :

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTELTD
CJ/O 51 DEFU LANE 10

SINGAPDRE 539216 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPCRE 573860
Officer in Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG
Tel: Aftn: :
Email : Tel :
Fax No. .

GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
18 SIN MING LANE

Quotation No. : Q018/08-1026

Quotation Date : 04/08/2018

Terms : 30 DAYS

Vehicle No. : SLLO408T

Chassis No. : MHFE28F3602007518

Third Party Insurer :

Date of Accldent : 27/08/2018

© i Model : VIOS
| Remarks : _l
[ TTEM | DESCRIPTION Qy | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
BIF 0.00
24 REAR FENDER SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS 20 4.0000 ¥ 80.00
25  REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER 539 2 450.0000 % 900.00
26  REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER CLIPS 20 40000 = XR 80,00
27 REARWEATHERSTRIP aux 1 6% It U
LESS 20% (ITEM 1 - 26) 1,762.0000
- h“fd-""
28  REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR WSO 2 280.0000 30 9N 556G
29  BOOTLID NUMBER PLATE AND CASING 1 0.0000 5 60.00
a0 TQ REMOVE & REFIX INTERIOR FITTINGS, TRIMMINGS, GARNISH 1 180.0000 ‘1} 19eT0
AND OTHER TO ENABLE REPAIR AND PERFORMING INTERIOR
CLEANING
41  TOREMOVE AND REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRING WHEN 1 120,0000 5 120,00
NECESSARY 14 ks :
4t
32 TOREMOVE AND REPLACED REAR REVERSE SENSOR 1 1500000 4o 15900
43 TOAPPLY RUSTPROOFING/TUFTCOATING TREATMENT TO 1 1200000 Qo 12000
REPLACED PARTS 0
34  TO REMGVE, REPLACED DAMAGED BODYPARTS, REPAIR AND 1 12000000 o 1260700
REALIGN BODYWORK AND WHERE CONSISTANT TO THE &0
ACCIDENT :
a5 TOPUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTED AREAS 1 1,400.0000 TOD yaoﬁ:

CIF 0.00
Page 2 of 3



F.

‘2¥ 7 PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST / ROC COMPANY NO : 2011 01753C

Pleasa conduct the survey at

pagasus Engineering & 74 Kian Teck Road Singapora 828800

Quotation
From : Customer : B
SEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTELTD "GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
/o 51 DEFU LANE 10 18 SIN MING LANE
SINGAPORE 528216 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573860
Officer in Charge : QUAY SIEW TENG
Tel: Attn:
Email ; Tel:
Fax Mo. :
Quotation No. : QO18/09-1026 Quotation Date : 04/08/2018 Terms : 30 DAYS I
| Vehicle Mo, : SLLS408T Chassis No. : MHFBZOF3802007519 Third Party Insurer : 1
{Model : VIOS Date of Accident : 27/08/2018
| Remarks :
[ mem | DESGRIPTION | ay | UNITPRICE [ AMOUNT (SGD) |
BIF 0.00
g2\
ie ;)Q 'L — v ; { % a,g
[ 43 . (@l "
: ‘-)L}U H
(X - Y,
Vi L (5769 uPﬂmum(%
I =
a0 A et -
s il 2 G b s L{
bt Bl f, a.ur)
s
Dy loa[I8 @ (110
LK Auto Consultants hence notify
lhTE Repairer of the following: ‘:*_
* To resurvey belorelatiar spray painting e
« To display damaged part{s) during resurvay Q'_QI\-D L {é fm
» Parls prices are subject lo confmation
» Third party survey is en 2 “Withaut Prejudics” basis
» Moillegal modification(s) is allowed
'_Suppmr-enlnrr ilem{s) musl b
B (o) e UL
Acknowledgad by Repairer
Signature:
Dala:
Sub Total 12, 745.00
GST(7.00%) 892.15
Total (SGD) 13,637.15



' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

T 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

-
prar sy ¥ |
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCIM8016071/R1vbn2
T CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date 2310-2018 Wmmmmmw
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHB 4920M Veh. Inspected SLL 94087
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18006444MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 03/09/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWVIOS 1.5 c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. MHFB29F 3602007519 Colour GREY
Odometer BEEOS Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/50 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Front Tyre [195/50 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/50 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre [195/50 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,

5. General Information

Accident Date  27/08/2018 Inspection Date 04/08/2018

Survey held at 74 KIAN TECK RD
Repairer PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

5a. Remarks

A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO AGCIDENT REPORT.,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg, Mo: 198607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page No.1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLL 9408T
. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 505.00 505.00

2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$120.00 NOT NECESSARY 240.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER-SHORT @$45.00 NECESSARY 50.00 90.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP @%$4.00 NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR @$215.00 SERVICEABLE 430.00 =
1|REAR REINFORCEMENT BENT 325.00 325.00
1|BOOTLID COVER BENT 825.00 B25.00
2|BOOTLID COVER HINGE @$80.00 SERVICEABLE 160.00 -
1|BOOTLID "TOYOTA" EMBLEM NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|BOOTLID “VIOS" BADGE NECESSARY 55.00 55.00
1|BOOTLID "E" BADGE NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|BOOTLID QUTER MOULDING SERVICEABLE 290.00 -
1|BOOTLID INNER TRIM COVER NOT NECESSARY 235.00 -

10|BOOTLID INNER TRIM COVER CLIPS @34.00 NOT NECESSARY 40.00
2|BOOTLID LICENSE PLATE LAMP @$75.00 NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 695.00 -

LABOUR

1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH cuT 255.00 255.00
10|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS @3$5.00 NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL NOT NECESSARY 795.00 -
1|REAR SPARE TYRE FLOOR BOARD NOT NECESSARY 265.00 -
2|REAR SPARE TYRE TOOLKIT FOAM @$200.00 NOT NECESSARY 400.00 -
2|REAR FENDER @$800.00 NOT NECESSARY 1,800.00 -
2|REAR FENDER SPLASH SHIELD @$70.00 NOT NECESSARY 140.00 -
20|REAR FENDER SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS @34.00 NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER @$450.00 NOT NECESSARY 800.00 -

20|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER CLIPS @3$4.00 NOT NECESSARY 80.00
1|REAR WEATHERSTRIP NECESSARY 200.00 200.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,831.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - 613.75
7,324.00 1,841.25

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018071/R1vbn2




¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- ma . 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/'f_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607156R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo 2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
& a2 Workshop (S)| __(5)
2|REAR BUMPER REVERSES ENSOR @$280.00 (SN) NOT WORKING 560.00 200.00
1|BOOTLID NUMBER PLATE AND CASING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
620.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIX INTERIOR 180.00 60.00
FITTINGS TRIMMINGS GARNISH AND OTHER TO ENABLE
REPAIR AND PERFORMING INTERIOR CLEANING,
TO REMOVE AND REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRING  |NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
WHEN NECESSARY
TO REMOVE AND REPLACED REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 150.00 60.00
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING/TUFTCOATING TREATMENT 120.00 40.00
TO REPLACED PARTS.
10 REMOVE, REPLACED DAMAGED BODYPARTS REPAIR 1,200.00 700.00
AND REALIGN BODYWORK AND WHERE CONSISTENT
TO THE ACCIDENT INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
END PANEL.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTED 1,400.00 700.00
AREAS
3,170.00 1,560.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,114.00 3,601.25
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | i 3,601.25
Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016071 IRAvbn2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE,AMI RTE.AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




