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Date: 03.09.2018

AIG INSURANCE Fiaase Acknowiedge Recewed

78 SHENTON WAY #07-16
SINGAPORE 079120

Tel No: 6419 3000

Fax No: 6415 3727

Attn: Motorcycle Claims Dept (Third-party Claim)

Our Client: FBGB381L YAMAHA WR125X M

Your Insured: SLK2240K

Accident on 18/08/2018 at 2050HRS at Below Merdeka Bridge

Estimate repair for the above mentioned maotor-cvcle:

Original Parts:
NO QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE
1 1 Case Chain -5'-1 . 320.00
2 1 Cover Side 5 480.00
3 1 Fender Rear r,u/ﬂfc 360.00
Sub-Total $ 1.,160.00
less 10% discount $ 116.00
S 1.044 00
Nett Prices Parts:
4 LABOUR S 120.00
5 NUMBER PLATE SET A4 8 35.00
S 1.199.00
add 7% GST $ 8393
Grand Total $ 1 ,282.93

Please contact CK / Ahmad before sending surveyor to our workspop to
assess the damages.
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFINNF Rahata Enaiine

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
9766C

FBGB381L

No

07 Sep 2018
YAMAHA
WR125XM
White

2012
E3D9E108531
VG5DE072000010534
$5,526.00

15 Aug 2012
13 Dec 2012

2

$829.00

No

$0.00

12 Dec 2022
D - Motoreycle
10

$1,689.00
$720.00
$720.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Sep 2018

nm:m.mﬂ.It&guv,:nmlmum:lwunqulraHubahByFunlIl:Haluraﬂamqlnpum—uNEIIDN_ID-# Uan4009T
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.'; .ew Assignment - SLK2240K (OI) VS FBG8381L (TP) DOA 18/8/2018 Page 1 of |

- PO New Assignmant - SLK2240K [O1} VS FEOOISIL (TP] DOA 1882018
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Face g1/81

H_‘Bgf?ﬂlﬁ 18: 9% 67422284 LOOI'S MOTOR ENT P/L
Date: 03.09.2018
1S leou CE Please Acinowledige Recalved.

78 SHENTON WAY #07-18
SINGAPORE 079120

Tel No: 6419 3000

Fax No 6415 3727

Attn: Motorcycle Claims Dept (Third-party Claim)

Qur Client: FBG8381L YAMAHA WR125X M
Your Insured: SLK2240K
Accident on 18/08/2018 at 2050HRS at Balow Merdeka Bridge

mﬂmwmm
Original Parts:

NO QTy DESCRIPTION PRICE
1 1 Casa Chain $ 320.00
2 1 Cover Side 5 s 480.00
3 1 Fender Rear $ 360.00
Sub-Total $ 1.160.00
less 10% discount $ 116.00
$ 1,044.00
Nett Prices Parts:
4 LABOUR $ 120.00
S5 NUMBER PLATE SET $ 35.00
$_1.199.00
add 7% GST $ 83.93
Grand Total $ 128293
___'zﬁ_ﬁ‘—

Please contact CK / Ahmad before sanding surveyor to our workshop to
assess the damages.

Thank You.

From

CK

Looi's Motor Enterprise Pte Ltd
E-Mail; loois@singnet.com.sg



Hsiao Tnga !I.K KAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 10:56 AM

To: 'Eileen, May Hwee Yap'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2240K(AIG) & FBG 8381L ON 18/08/2018

rour Bef: SLK 2240K
Our Ref: CC4/LCR180146058/Upa3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2240K(AIG) & FBG B381L ON 18/08/2018

we refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid fo resolve the
claim against you and/ar your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We hove received a cloim rom FBG 83B1L against your insurance policy.

Both parfies involved have given conflict of version, Based on the circumstances of accident and both
parties damage profile, there is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either’s parties version. Therefore.
we are of the view that the case would be settled at equal liability.

It you have evidence/information to prove that we should not setile the third party claim, kindly let us have
them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 25/09/2018. after we shall proceed with negotiofion with Third
Party claimant an the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever
by you/your driver against the other party's insurer arising from this porticular accident

Please call us if you have further queries.

Hest Regurds

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: Gr42-3107 | emnll: chewhtiilkknito.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 53, Pova Uln Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #o2-25 | S(4o8933)



Vic (LKKAuto) S —————

From: Vic [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 February, 2020 9:41 AM

To: Mavis, Chew

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE- #51139563425G003#023# << AIG ref | Accident involving SLK2240K (O) &

FBGB381L on 18/08/18 along Crawford 5t LKK REF CC4/LCR18016058/Uha3

Dear Mavis,
We refer to your below email.
Please be informed that TP repairer informed us that there was no repair done to the vehicle till date.

As such, in view of no activity from the TP repairer, we will now proceed to close off the matter and submit our WP
report.

Thank you.

Hest Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkanto.com | fox: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

———
@ re——
[

Save the Earth: Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipienl. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient s prohibited, and may be a violallon of law. If you believe thal you recelved this e-mall In error, please do not
read this e-mall or any altached items. Please delele the e-mall and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sondar that you have delated the e-mail, all attlachments and any coples thereafl. Thank you,

From: Mavis, Chew [mailto:Chew.Mavis@aig.com|]

Sent: Thursday, 20 February, 2020 4:24 PM

To: Vic [LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: #51139563425G003#023# << AIG ref | Accident involving SLK2240K (O1) & FBG8381L on 18/08/18 along
Crawford St LKK REF CC4/LCR18016058/Uha3

Dear Vic,
Please update as we have not heard from you since September, thank you.

Best Regards,

Ms. Mavis Chew

AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.



AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel 4(65) 6419 1970
chew.mavis@aig.com | W.aig.s

[E} 100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Winin o loarn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
lick here to find more.

IMBORTANT NOTICE

The infarmalion in this emad (and any attachments) is confidential, If you are nol e intended recipient, vou must nol Lse or disseminate the
infarmation. I you have recelved this email in error, pleass immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delefe the onginal and
any copias or prinfouts thareof, Alhough this emall and any aftachmenis are ballsved fo be frea of any wirus or other defec! thal might affect any
computer systerm into which it is recaived and opaned, it is the responsibiiity of the recipient 1o ensure that it (8 virus free and no respongibilify i
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage ansing in any way from (s use.

From: Mavis, Chew

Sent: 20 December, 2019 10:40 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: #51139563425G0034#0234 << AIG ref | Accident involving SLK2240K (O1) & FBG8381L on 18/08/18 along
Crawford St LKK REF CC4/LCR18016058/Uha3

Importance: High

Dear Vic,

Please advise if COR has been finalized with the TP repairer. If not, please send a chaser to wrap up the matter soon.
Hope to hear from you, thanks!

Best Regards,
Ms. Mavis Chew
AlG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +|65) 6419 1970
chew.mavis@aig.com | www.alg.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit te learn more.

AlG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.

Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The informatian in this amall (and any atschments) is confidantial. i you are nof the infended recipiont, you must nol use or dissaminate e
informatian. I you have recelved this emall in error, please immediately notify me by “Reply” command and permanently daleta the original and
any coples or printouts thereol, Although this amail and any aftachments ane believed fo be free of any virus or ather defect that might affect any
computer systom into which If is roceived and cpened, it is the responsibilty of the recipisnt o ensure that if s virus free and no responsibility is
acceplied by AIG for any loss or damage ansing in any way from iis use

From: Mavis, Chew
Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2019 10:30 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuUto)



Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: #51139563425G003#023# << AIG ref | Accident involving SLK2240K (OI) & FBG8381L on 18/08/18 along
Crawford St LKK REF CC4/LCR18016058/Uha3

Dear Vic,
Thank you for the response.

FYl, based on the accident circumstances (both parties side swiped when approaching a bend), the settlement
should be at 50% unless otherwise proven with PIR/video footage.

Best Regards,
Ms. Mavis Chew
AlG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1970
chew. mavis@aig.com | www.alg.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visir to learn more.

AIG Asla Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this email fand any aftachmanis) is confidential. f you are nof the infended recipfent, you must nof use or disseminale the
irfarmation. If you hawe recelved this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanaently delete the oniginal and
any copies or prinfouts thereol. Alhough this email and any attachments are beliaved lo be frea of any virug or othar defect that mght affoct any
computer syatem inta which it is recefved and opaned, I is the respansibility of the recipient lo ensune that it s virus free and no msponsibilily iz
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, September 20, 2019 4:51 PM

To: Mavis, Chew

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 2nd Reminder #51139563425G003#023# << AIG ref | Accident Involving SLK2240K (OI)
& FBGB381L on 18/08/18 along Crawford St LKK REF CC4/LCR18016058/Uha3

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments,

Dear Mavis,

We refer to your below emall.

Please be informed that we are pending for finalization confirmation from TP repairer.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

'S 24 2
— - - = ‘ﬁw ke &rﬁ‘u %ﬂ‘ M,-? W TECESSITY”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sale use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
uninlended reciplent is prohiblted, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mall In error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items, Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and Inform the
sander that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Mavis, Chew [mallto:Chew.Mavis@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 20 September, 2019 4:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: 2nd Reminder #51139563425G003#023# << AIG ref | Accident involving SLK2240K (Ol) & FBGEB3B1L on
18/08/18 along Crawford 5t

Hi LKK officers,
There is no movement on this file for more than a year.
Please check with TP repairer on the status of this claim and get back to us soonest possible, thank you.

Best Regards,

Ms. Mavis Chew

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(B65) 6419 1570
chew.mavis@aig.com | www.a3Ig 5

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any altachments) is confidential. If you are not the infended recipiant, you must nol use or disserminale he
information. if you have received this email in error, please immediately notify mea by "Reply” command and permanently dalete the onginal and
any copies or printouts thereof. Afthough this emall and any attachments are balisved to be free of any virus or ather defoct that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the reciplent fo ensure thal i is virus free and no responsibility is
accepled by AIG for any loss or damage ansing in any way from jis use

From: Mavis, Chew

Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2019 2:11 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: #5113956342SG003#023# << AIG ref | Accident involving SLK2240K (OI) & FBG8381L on 18/08/18 along
Crawford St



Dear LKK officers,
Kindly advise on the status of this assignment. Is the TP still pursuing the claim?

Best Regards,

Ms. Mavis Chew

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1570
chew.mavis@aig.com | www.aig sg

100 Celebrnnng 100 Years:

Vis to learn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this emall {and any aftachments) is confidential. If you are nof the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminaie the
information. Iif you have rocenad this emall in eror, please immediatedy nofify me by “Reply” command and parmanantly delate the onginal and
any copes or prinfouts thersol. Athough this emal and any aftachments are beleved lo be free of any vinus or other defect that might affect any
compulter sysham into which i 18 received and oponed, it is the responsibiity of the recipiont to ensure that i is virus frea and no responsibility is
accaptiod by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally. for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...{Pending for Survey Report)

Revohed | Mo settlement

|CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Notihed Est Submitted | Ag) Assigned Adj Bpt AS] Cubmitted  |Ins Auth'ed Status
‘ |73 hug 2018 035w 2018 | ssm40.00 5$840.00 oo
_tanhes | £dit aay mat | m""m” view nt | cancel Casn |

Muin

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Trnsured: LCRF PTELTD, Co. Reg. No.: 2016245%7K

glr':mt: _m HATRUL NIZHAM JUMAHAT, 10: SBEIFTHEC
Wehicle Reg, | [ 18/08,/2018 00:00 - :59
s [FBGB3B1L B (Dot S LSS5 | 173 Manths and 3 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Clsim Type: TP / 51139563425G oliey/Cover | 0999994760 (Comprehensive}
Vehicle Reg. I
Policy No
Mo, SLK2240K (Cistmant): | F1773929
[Tresuired):
Exceys

Repairer: Lool's Motor Enterprise Pte. Ltd. (HQ) Mo 55 Kaki Bukit Place, Eunos Techpark, 416230 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 6743 1072
Handling iun Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (Express] - Tel £5-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Chew, Mavis| Chew Mavis@aig com

Insurer:

CIBImANTS | AXA Insurance Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6850 4588
Adjuster: |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel! 8256-3561 . [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] .. [Final Ept due 12/09/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED wiew &l |  Compose Case Man |

= AIG_SG (04/09/2016): Reguest To Uplond TP GLA Report
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg no 1sss071ser)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@kkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/LCR180168058/UHA3Q2

Date: 25/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid. Paolicy No: 0885994760
Claimant )
Vehicle No : FBGBR381L Insured Vehicle No : SLK2240K
Date of Loss: 1B/OB/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 5113856834256
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBGB381L
Make & Model: YAMAHA WR125X, 125¢cc Engine No. E3D9E108531
Req. Date: 15/08/2012 (Man. Year: 2012) Chassis No: VGSDEDT2000010534
Colour Black/\While Odometer: 59687 km
Engine Capacity 125 cc
Market Value/™New Car N/A
Price
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification; Mo Pre-accident Condition:
ITl FTYR
Front Tyre Size: 1107017 Rear Tyre Size: 14007017
Froni Left Side: Pirelli & mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli & mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side. 0 mm
The above walues epresent the remaming tyre eads depith
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %|
Parts 1,078.00 720.00 359.00 3327
Miscellapeous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 120.00 120.00 0.00 0.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S5) 1,189.00 B40.00 3159.00 29.94
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 83.93 58.80 2513 29.94
Nett Amount (S$§) 1,282.93 898.80 384.13 29.94
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: D3/092018
Date Inspected. 06/09/2018 Inspecied Al Lool's Maotor Enterprise Pte. Lid. (HQ)
No 55 Kaki Bukit Place. Eunos
T
Singapore 416230
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This report mprassents our findings af the fme and plece of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been cavmed out fo the bes! of our
knowledge and abfily buf any athar abiity under any cthar drcurnstances @ hersby sxpressly srcluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part Mo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *CASE CHAIN Broken 32000FL *320.00FL
2 1 *COVER SIDE 5 Cracked 480.00FL *480.00FL
3 1 *FENDER REAR (CRACKED) Not Consistent With The Impact 380.00 FL “~FL
4 1 *SET NUMBER PLATE Mot Necessary 3500FS ~FS

F=Franchiss part S=SpcMatl, L=ListiternDisc
Sub Total (S§)  1,195.00 800.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S$)  116.00 80.00

Total Parts (S§)  1,079.00 720.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out, |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous ilema selected,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR Naw 120.00 120.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 120.00 120.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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