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Make of Veh,

Brake:  Inotder | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or
Modi:  Nil I S{Rism | STD ARRim or
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Dale Pereon Contacted: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 11:34 AM

To: Boo seng yak; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing;
SUR

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SLF5909Y - OD AIG - SURVEYED 3 SEP 18

Dear Mr Boo,

Confirm repair cost of $5,814.32 before excess $600 and GST @ 5 days of repairs.

Kindly send us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

sent: Monday, 3 December 2018 5:11 AM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com=; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg=; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg;
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SLF5909Y - OD AIG - 5U RVEYED 3 SEP 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $5814.32 @ 5 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 12:10 PM

To: 'Claims Dept'; SUR: Admin A

Subject: RE: OD claim for SLF 5909 Y-DOA: 26/8/2018 (AIG OD)
Dear Jeffery,

Vehicle excess $600/-

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 11:03 AM

To: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD claim for SLF 5909 Y-DOA: 26/8/2018 (AIG OD)

Dear Jeffery,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLF 5909Y (Excess TBA-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assi gnment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 6:20 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD claim for SLF 5909 Y




Dear all,
Adrian have surveyed the vehicle this morning.

Kindly let us have the approval for this vehicle.

Owner is leaving the car behind in the next few days he hopes that approval can be given by then so we can proceed
with the repairs accordingly.

Many thanks!

Bast regards,
Jeffery Tan

Pramium Automobiles Pte Ltd jmee no 1esm0a71w)

55 bi Road 1 Road Singapore 4056599

p. +65 638B 2323 d.+65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159
| .

The all-new Audi Q2 L
#Huntaggable

938 p. +65 6836 2223
. .
f3 . 'l L E\

e

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may alse be privileged
|1 mail and then delete this message from your system.

Flease da not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose Its cantents oF any attachment to any other persan, Thank you

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 27 August, 2018 7:11 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD claim for 5LF 5809 Y

Good evening all,
Here are the GIA and estimate attachment for your kind reference .
Thank you .

Best Regards,
Phua
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd eg s tomscaiziwg
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159338 p. +65 6836 2223
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Chamer 1D:

Vehicle Details

Wahicle MNo.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
mManufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Moa

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Crriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Aug 2018

PARFICOF Rehatr Fnonirg

Singapore NRIC
BBA1E

SLES909Y

Mo

28 Aug 2018

AUD

A4 14TFSISTRONIC
White

2016

CVYMNO16564
WAUZZZF4BHADL7492
110.0 KW (147 bhp)
$£32,163.00

31 Aug 2016

31 Aug 2016

o

£27,029.00

Yes
30 Aug 2026
$20,271.00

30 Aug 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

£57,903.00

$46,353.00

$66,624.00

OK
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Mama of Policyholder @ Shawn Tan Wei Liang Vehicle No. + SLFSe09Y
Period of Insurance : 31 Aug 2017 To 30 Aug 2018 Policy Mo. : 2100481053-01
Engine No. ; CVND16564 Endorsament Mo.
Chassis No. : WAUZZZF48HAD1TES2 lzsuad Date ;16 Aug 2017
ABOUT THE COVER
Make/hModel < ALIDI A4 1.4 TFSI S tronic
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,385.00 CC Sum Insured  © Market Value First Year of Registration © 2016
Driver Restriction D NA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COEPARF  © Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Orive”

il Tree Podicyholdst

tij Any amar persor. wha & drivirg on e Poiicyholders ordar of wiim haiher parmeeon

This Bolicy wil indemndy the Polcymcider af ary authonsed drivesr oily iF havshe masts the speciled aga coraoon

el have $o ooy e addlional sum of $3.000 & "Young andior inerpersscad Driser Excess® {*YIDR) f You ane or ¥our Aurorsed Drivar (named or ormamsd) i& undar the ags of 23 mndior has less
1hAn 3 years’ driving Sipersrcs

Age Conditicn ; Al Age Condition

Limitation as to usa” .
| Ll ey lof socil, domesie and plaasum purposes anid fof e Paiicybolder's Busingss This Poloy doss rol CoVer LSa for hire o rewire, @ving jusion. drving iesl. recing, pace-muking; mlisbifty nal af
speackesing (he comad of goods ofer Ihan SAmples in CONNELHON willl any irace or husress of use for 20y popese n e ion with Motor Trada

« Limitatiang rencered rossalive By Sectian @ of the Molor Vahides (Thins-Fay Fisks and Compersation) A (Cap 189) and Sacaon 08 of e Rasd Trarspor Acl, 1987 {Malaysia), are nol o be
incluted pncss Thass Peadngs

e T s e e ! PR

Sectian 1
Firm - 50 Owwry Demage - S800 Thelt - 50 Fiood Cover - 5

Saction 2
Proparty Damage - 50

Windscreen : 5100

Named Driver and EXCesS iwhare spoicsbie)

Ehawn Tan Wei Lisng - S800 (Cwn Damage)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (F

1 Audi Customar Sarvice Certer Add: 55 Uk Road 1 Singapore 40800 1662323

Eor clher Approved Rapiming Cenmesisl Authorsed Repanes, please conlact ou 24-tou acddent emeegency bafing al +85 5333 G200, Altmmatesly. you may refer 0 A1 weliEdE Wae.3ig com sg
o MG 56 Mobie App. Sengly seamn and downioad 400 SG° rom iTunes o Googe Play.

IMPORTANT NOTES

II Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: United Overseas Bank Limited ]

e ety oanily that the policy 1o which this Carificate of Ingursfecs ralales i Esued in accordancs wiih this provisions of fe Motor Vahicks{Third Farty Bmke and Compansatce | st {Gap. 189, Pan IV of
tha Road Trapsport Ao, 1987 (Malaysia) and Molor Vehicies (Trord Party Risks| Aulas, 1953 {Malaysin)

OEOL1I5260

a2
PREMILM LEASING -CHE
284 ALEXANDRA ROAD AUDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
SINGAPORE 150928 AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd.
Underwritten by AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Phe, Lid, AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

BArFLEC




24-HOUR AIG AUTO HOTLINE: +65 6338 6200
IMPORTANT: KEEP THIS DOCUMENT IN YOUR CAR AT ALL TIMES.

IMPORTANT MOTICE

If you sell your motor vehicle, this Motice is IMPORTANT and MUST be compliad with. Palicyholders are hereby warned that under the
Matar Vehicles {Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act {Cap.B9), it shall be unlawiul for any person o USE OF CAUSE OfF permit any
other parsan to use a molor vehicle without a valid policy of insurance under the Act

The Policyholder is further warned that on the sale of a motor vehicle, they must surrender the Certificate of Insurance and the Palicy to
the insurance company. If the Certificate of Insurance has been lost or destroyed, a Statutory Daclaration to that effect must be mada.
Failure to comply with this abligation is an offence under the Mator Vehicles {Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap.Bg).

This Policy will cease to be valid once the motor vehicle has been sold to another person unless the transfer of interest has been duly
nafified to and agreed to by the insurance company concerned, If the insurance company agrees to cover the new owner, they will issue
a new Certificaie of Insurance in the new owner's name. The premium chargeable may vary according to the new owner's profile.
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax:6841 1183
Email: Mara. khai@premivmauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad1l

Contact No : 63662323

Fax Mo : 68411183
Reference +  PA/OD/OST77/2018/PH
Date i 27-Aug-18

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name

Mr Shawn Tan Wei Liang

Address : 139 Cavenagh Road
#06-12
Singapore 229627
Telephone : HP+65 91094600
Type of Claim :  Own Damage claims
Policy No. :  2100481053-01
Vehicle No : SLF5909Y
Model Code : Audi &4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI
Model / Year : Aug-16
Engine No :  CVNO16564
Chassis No T WAUZZZFABHAD1T7692
Mileage -
Date In :
Liability £ o
Excess Cost 8o

Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date 26-Aug-18
Place of Accident :  Cavenagh Road

4 mw @



Premium Automobiles

S5 Lihi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6B41 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident V e SLF 9Y.

Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Mature of Jobs Charges Recommedation

To remove and reinstall front wire harness for -
1 headlights,horns,fog lamps,outside temperature  S/N S 360.00
sensaor and headlight washer assy.

To dismantle and renew front bumper,lhs front

fender and lhs headlight.Re-organise front crash s 2.1(3_?-95'.. 1000

management components.Reinstall all parts i
removed. -
3 To respray front bumper,lhs front fender. $ 1,500.00 120
4 Tc.' renew lhs front rim and carry out wheel SN S 280.00 - '
alignment.
5 To carry out diagnostic check. SN 5 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 2 s 4,432.00

[—————S



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 63662323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLF 5909 Y.

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS
1 FRONTBUMPER Yefn_ C 5 1,849.00-
2 FIXING PARTS FOR FRONT BUMPER Ak AMe— s 245.00 +
3 AIRGUIDE-LH  p-t s s 73.00
4  AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH At =~ S 118.00 ©
5  GUIDESECTION-LH  MA A 5 31.00 7 1.
6  FRONT FENDER - LH “ et S 665.00 “
7 ATTACHMENT PRTS FOR FENDER AF /&t $ aspo0 ! A
8  CLOSINGELEMENT-LH  ,.. 5 44,00
9  BRACKET FOR FENDER - LH Dot S 31.00—
10  BRACKET FOR DEFORMATION ELEMENT -LH 4=~ S 43.00 —
11  BRACKET FOR FENDER Eel S 27.00 «
12  FENDERBRACE (7t Mt © S 103.00 7 ¥
13 WHEEL HOUSING LINER - LH e el S 215.00
14 ATTACHMENT PARTS FOR WHEEL HOUSING LINER T/ 1A“% 78.00 7 ¥
15  WHEEL SPOILER-LH D¢ 5 600 — 20
16  SPOILER - LH Net NeL- - ] 3000° X
17  STONE CHIP GUARD - SATIN BLACK ~ MNé S 44.00 ~
18  COVER-LH ’i?-””‘ 3 27.00
19 COVER-LH | s 20.00 -
20  LED HEADLIGHT - LH  Ne# fsem S  6,973.00
SUB- TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 10,724.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (0K} = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408639
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLF 5909 Y .

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS
21 ALUMINIUM RIM (X 5 563.00
22 SUNDRIES Ak, 5 300.00 « "3y
TOTAL SPARE PARTS : $ 11,587.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : S 4,432.00
GRAND TOTAL ; $ 16,019.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (0K) = Approved, Remarks (X} = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett,



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

LKK Auto Consultants hence notfy
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey heloradafter epray painting
« To display damaged part{s) duning resunasy
TEIEfﬂx » Parts prices ane subject 1o confirmation
= Third party survy i on a "Without Prajudics” bases
* N ifiegal modification(s) is allowed
| » Supplementary item{s) must bs resurveyed and
: \ s subjgact to final | from Irsurance Compeny

Name ’ ﬁ(.“ﬂcﬁ e, W ; e

Surveyed Date . 83 J 09 /r R W“""”m'wr Sy S

Authorised Date Date:

Excess Cost

Liability :

Remarks . Nt Btlonsed , ©5 Da(.}g,

Please Note *  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.
Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183
Ernail: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate +  Accident Repairs
Workshop *  Ubi Road 1

Contact No - G366 2323

Fax No :  EB411183
Reference +  PAJODID9TTI2018/PH
Date 1 27-Aug-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 078120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name + Mr Shawn Tan Wei Liang
Address : 138 Cavenagh Road

2 #OB-12

Singapore 229627

Telephone +  HP +65 910848600
Type of Claim - Own Damage Claim
Policy Mo. :  2100481053-01
Vehicle No : SLF5909Y
Model Code + Audi A4 14 TFSI
Model / Year T Aug-1B
Engine No : CWNO16564
Chassis No P WAUZZZFABHAD17602
Mileage o=
Date In :
Liability 5
Excess Cost I
Estimated By +  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date +  26-Aug-18

Place of Accident :  Cavenagh Road



Premium Automobiles

55 Ui Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLF 5909 Y .

SIN

Estimated
Nature of Jobs Charges

| 0 remave ana reinsiall ront wire narness 1or
headlights,horns fog lamps,outside temperature SN & 360.00

eanenr and haadlinht wachar azeu

To dismantle and renew front bumper,lhs front fender
and Ihs headlight. Re-organise front crash $ 2,100.00
managementcomponents.Reinstall all parts removed.

J60.00

1,000.00

1,100.00

280.00

192.00

To respray front bumper,lhs front fender. "'$  1,500.00
To renew Ihs front rim and carry out wheel alignment. S/IN 3 280.00
To carry out diagnostic check SIN & 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES . | 4,432.00

2,932.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLF 5909 Y.

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1  FRONT BUMPER $ 1,849.00 $ 1,479.20
2 FIXING PARTS FOR FRONT BUMPER 3 24500
3 AIR GUIDE - LH $ 73.00
4 AR GUIDE GRILLE - LH h 5 118.00
5  GUIDE SECTION - LH $ 31.00
& FRONT FENDER - LH $ 665.00 $ 532.00
7  ATTACHMENT PARTS FOR FENDER $ 45.00
8  CLOSING ELEMENT - LH 3 4400 § 34.56
9  BRACKET FOR FENDER - LH $ 3100 § 24.16

10 BRACKET FOR DEFORMATION ELEMENT - LH $ 43.00 $ 34.16
11 BRACKET FOR FENDER $ 27.00 § 21.60
12  FENDER BRACE $ 103.00
13 " WHEEL HOUSING LINER - LH $ 21500 $ 171.60
14  ATTACHMENT PARTS FOR WHEEL HOUSING LINER $ 78.00
15  WHEEL SPOILER - LH $ 6300 $ 50.16
16  SPOILER - LH $ 30.00
17  STONE CHIP GUARD - SATIN BLACK $ 4400 34.56
18 COVER-LH $ 2700 § 21.04
19 COVER-LH $ 20.00 15.36
20  LED HEADLIGHT - LH $ 6,973.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 10,724.00 $ 2,418.40
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks () = Not approved

Spare paris are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 4086939
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLF 5909 Y.
Damage Parts & Prices

§/N  Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
cif 5 2,418.40
21 ALUMINIUM RIM -3 563.00 $ 450.00
22  SUNDRIES b 300.00 § 13.92
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 11,587.00 § 2,882.32
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,432.00 3 2,932.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 16,019.00 $ 5814.32
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel'6768 5828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Norah Khai
78 Shenton Way HT68 9911
#07-16 AlG Building G541 1183

Singapore 079120
Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Yr Ref: SLF 5909 Y

Nora.khaig premiumauto.com.sg
Body & Paint Dept
PA/ODOITT2018/MAS
7 Jan 2019

Dear Sir,

RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SLF 5909 Y Audi A4 Sedan 1.4 TF51 5-Tro

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SLF 5909 Y, claimant,

Mr. Shawn Tan Wei Liang, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 85013319 - §85,579.32

2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If vou require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
6768 991 1.

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

Norah Khai
Claims Dept

Encls

AlG - SLF 5000°Y
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | MNotfed | EstSubmited | AdjAssigned |  AdjRpt | Ad)Submitted | InsAutn'ed [Status 1
27 Aug 2018 03 Sep 2018 £$5,814.32 5¢5,814.32 Pending for Survey
Main 18:00 Edit Estimates || View Rpt | Report -
Edit adj Rpt | | Cancel Case |

Reference Claim Details

—
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS ) — _|[created by insurer)
Insured: SHAWN TAN WEI LIANG, 10: STA3IBB41E, Tel: +6591094600, Email; NOEMAIL

: 26/08/2018 15:00 - ;58
vehicle Reg. No.: SLF5909Y | Date of Loss: [23 Months and 26 Days From LTA

| E _|Reg Date {Man ¥r}]
| Claim Type: _on / 364889872756 _F:gl::y,f_‘t:mr Note Mo, - I21_UEE‘IQS3 {Cnmprehensiveﬁ
- (Excesst  |S5%600.00

Repairer: Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI) 55 Ubi Road 1, 408699 Ubi - Tel: 67689828/0827/9911

i

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, ($G) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Mohd Zawaye,
|Norsazani] Norsazani Zawaye@aig com s i
it LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt
ol ‘due 12/09/2018] i i e e
Drriver/Custodian: SHAWMN TAN WEI LIANG (41 / Male), WRIC: STE3IRE41E, Tel: +6551094600

Handling Insurer;

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED =
‘e AIG_SG (04/09/2018): SLFS909Y / OD / 26/08/2018 / Coverage & Excess update

View A1l | Compose Case Mail ||

8
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS view All |  Search Tasks |  Create NewTask | Complete |
Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 11/1/2019
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Upload Documents

Claim Documents

*SLF5909Y (364B8987275G)
oD
Aug 26 2018 3:00PM
[SHAWN TAN WEI LIANG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
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Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sssor1ssr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Our File No:  CC3/AIG18016055/AVBNZ
AIG Building, 78 Shenton \Way #08-16
Singapore 079120 Date: 11/01/2019
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant:  SHAWRN TAN WEI LIANG Policy No: 2100481053
Date of Loss: 26/08/2018 Mature of Claim: OD Claim No: 364889872756
DESCRIPTICN & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHI
Reg No: SLF5909Y
Make & Model: ALDI A4, 1.4 TFSI S TRONIC (A) Engine No: CVNO18564
Req. Date: 31/08/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: WALZZIF48HAD1 7692
Colour: White Odometer: 30988 km
Engine Capacity: 1385 cc
Market Value/New Car
Prica: S%115,000.00
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
c F VE |
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes

Handbrake (Serviceable):
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size:

Front Left Side: Continental & mm
Front Right Side: Continental & mm

The above values represent the remaming fyre freads depth

205/60R16

COST OF CLAIMS

Parts
Miscellaneous ltems
Labour
Paintwark Labour
Towing
Calculated Gross Total (S$)
- Excess (55)
(5%)
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%)
Nett Amount (S§)
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 03/08/2018
Date Inspected:

Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days

Yes Engine Modification:

Rear Tyre Size:
Rear Left Side:
Rear Right Side:

Mo Pre-accident Condition:

205/60R16
Continental 6 mm
Continental 6 mm

Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
11,587.00 288232 8,704 68 7512

0.00 0.00 0.00
4.432.00 2932.00 1,500.00 3384

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00
16,019.00 5,814.32 10,204.68 63.70
600.00 600.00 0.00 0.00
15,419.00 5,214.32 10,204.68 66.18
1,079.33 365.00 714.33 66,18
16,498.33 5,579.32 10,919.01 66.18

03/09/2018 Inspected At:

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING

Manager: VEROMN CHEN

NOTE: This report represents pur findings al tha time and place of inspection staled herein. Such inspeclion has been camed out fo the bes! of our
knawledge and ability but any other Kability under any ather circumstances is hereby axpressly exclided

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/1/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Mo. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 "FRONT BUMPER Deformed 1,849.00F5*1 479.20F5
2 1 *FIXING PARTS FOR FRONT BUMPER Not Necessary  245.00F5 ~FS
3 1 “AlR GUIDE-LH Mot Necessary 73.00FS *-F§
4 1 *alR GUIDE GRILLE-LH Mot Necessary  118.00FS “FS
5 1 *GUIDE SECTION-LH Not Necessary 31.00FS *-F&
<] 1 *FRONT FENDER-LH Dented 665.00FS *532.00FS5
7 1 *ATTACHMENT PARTS FOR FENDER Mot Necessary 4500F5 -Fs
8 1 *CLOSING ELEMENT-LH Necessary 44 00FS "34.56FS
g 1 *BRACKET FOR FENDER-LH Bent 31.00FS *2416FS
10 1 *BRACKET FOR DEFORMATION ELEMENT-LH MNecessary 43.00FS *34.16FS
1 1 *BRACKET FOR FENDER Bent 27.00FS *21.60FS
12 1 *FENDER BRACE Mot Necessary  103.00F5 *-FS
13 1 *WHEEL HOUSING LINER-LH Deformed 215.00FS *171.60F3
14 1 “ATTACHMENT PARTS FOR WHEEL HOUSING LINER Not Necessary 7B.O0FS *.FS
5 1 *WHEEL SPOILER-LH Deformed 63.00F5 *50.16FS
16 1 *SPOILER-LH Mot Necessary 30.00FS *-FS
17 1 *STONE CHIP GUARD-SATIN BLACK Mecessary 44 00FS *34.56F5
18 1 *“COVER-LH MNecessary 27.00FS  *21.04FS
19 4 *“COVER-LH Mecessary 20.00FS *15.36FS
20 1 *LED HEADLIGHT-LH Mot Necessary 6973.00F5 *FS
21 1 “ALUMINIUM RIM Cut 563.00FS "450.00F%
22 1 *SUNDRIES Mecessary 300.00FS *13.92FS

F=Franchise par. S5=5pcMeti

Total Parts (S%) 11,587.00 2,882.32

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 11/1/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo  Particulars

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL FRONT WIRE HARNESS
FOR HEADLIGHTS,HORNS,FOG LAMPS,OUTSIDE
TEMPERATURE SENSOR AND HEADLIGHT WASHER
ASSY

2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER,LHS

FRONT FENDER AND LHS HEADLIGHT.RE-ORGANISE
FRONT CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS.REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED

3 TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER,LHS FRONT FENDER

4 TO RENEW LHS FRONT RIM AND CARRY OUT WHEEL
ALIGNMENT

5 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK

Lab.Type

MNew

New

MNew
Mew

New

Gross Labour Cost (S$)

Page 3 of 3

Repairer's Amount
380.00 360.00
2,100.00 1,000.00
1,500.00 1,100.00
280,00 280.00
192.00 192.00
4,432.00 2,932.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.ch m?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/1/2019



