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Catherine £hnr_&2 (LKK Auto) — -

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.coms

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September, 2018 11:53 AM

To: Tan, Rachel’

Ce: ‘LKK Assignments’

Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVC000003446 - YP 4623 X and GBC8352S (GA) on 27/8/2018
Jear Rachel,

As spoken, please be informed that no survey done for YP 4623X,
We will close this file at aur end without billing.

ltest Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultanis Pie Ltd

Fhone: 6741-8454 | emanil: assignmenisd ldagio com | fix 6256-4215

Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(go8031)

From: service@kkimhin,com.sg [mallto:service @kkimhin.cam.sg)

Seant: Wednesday, 5 September, 2018 9:15 AM

To: "Tan, Rache/' <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig. com>

Cc: sandrakhong@gmail.com; 'LKK'Aasignrnem;' {assu’,gnments@lkkaum.c_umx admin1@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVCO00003446 - YP 4623 X and GBCB3525 (GA) on 27/8/2018

D2ar Rachel

We will close this file on our end.
Qur clignt will do awh ra pairs,
Thanks & Regards

Sardra

6452 7018
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From: service@kkimhin,com.sg [mailto:servicegikk
Sent: Tuesday, September 4, 2018 7:32 PM
To: Tan, Rachel'

Cc: “sandrakhong@gmall.com'; 'LKK Assignments'; ‘adminl@kkimhin,com.sg’
Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVCO00003446 - YP 4623 X and GBCB3525 (GA) on 27/8/2018

Déar Rachel

Thenk you for these very clear videa shots,

Seams like our client driver is not telling the truth. We will inform the campany-about it
Many thanks,

Thanks & Regards
Sandra



Catherine Chnzﬂ !I.I(K Auto!

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September, 2018 3:15 AM

To: 'Tan, Rachel'

Cc: sandrakhong@gmail com; 'LKK Assignments’; adminl@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVCO00003446 - YP 4623 X and GBCEB352S (GA) on 27/8/2018
Dear Rachel

We will close this file on our end.
Jur client will do own repairs.

Thanks & Regards
sandra

2452 7018

<. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg [mallto:service@kkimhin.com,sg]
Sent: Tuesday, September 4, 2018 7132 PM

To: Tan, Rachel

Cc: 'sandrakhong@gmall.com'; 'LKK Assignments'; ‘adminl@kkimhin.com.sg'

Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVC000003446 - YP 4623 X and GBCB352S (GAY on 27/8/2018

[Jaar Rachel

Thank you for these very clear videa shots.

Sieems like our client driver is not telling the truth. We will Inform the company about it.
Many thanks,

“hanks & Regards:

Sandra

6452 7018
i, Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, September 4, 2018 7:23 PM

To: adminl@kkimhin.com.sg

Ce: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhongi@gmail com; LKK Assignments

Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVCD00003446 - YP 4623 X and GBCB3525 (GA) on 27/8/2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Shuman

Just an update, our driver managed to obtain video footage today,

We are of the view that your client is lable for accident, attached is a screenshot that your client is moving off from

ctationery position.









Hegards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Tan, Rachel

Sent: Thursday, August 30, 2018 3:22 PM

To: "adminl@kkimhin.com,.sg’ <adminl@kkimhin.com.sg>

Ce: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; LKK Assignments <assignments@Ikkauto . com>
Subject: RE: [External] RE: CLMOMVYCDO0D03446 - YP 4623 X and GBCR3525 (GA) on 27/8/2018

W

Dear Shuman
Moted. As agreed, we will appoint LKK as SIE



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 3:22 PM

To: admin1@kkimhirncom:sg

Ce: senvice@kkimhin.corm sg; sahdrakhong@gmail.com; LKK Assignments
Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVCO00003446 - YP 4623 X and GBCB3IS52S (GA) on 27/8/2018
Attachments: GIA REPORT.PDF; Ol sketch plan pdf

WP

[Dear Shuman _
Naoted, As agreed, we will appoint LKK as SIE.

Dzar LKK
Please accept assignment for TP survey. Attached reports for reference.

Thank you

Ragards

Rachel Tan

Evecutive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tal: BRO4 7846

from: adminl@kkimhin,com.sg <admin1@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, August 30, 2018 2:45 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Ce: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhnng@gmail com

Subject: [External] RE: CLMOMVCO00003446 - YP 4623 X and GBCB352S (GA) on 27/8/2018

Dear Rachel,

Thanks for the statement.

Kindly appoint surveyor, we may arrange for survey first.
Thank you.

tiest Regards,

Shumen

I, Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895

From: Tan, Ra:hel [maﬂm.ﬂaﬂﬂmiﬁﬂ!ﬂsm
Sent: 30 August 2018 11:11 AM

To: admini@kkimhin.com.sq
Ce: service@kkimhin.com.sq; sandrakhong@gmail.com; simon@kkimbin.com.sg; survey@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: CLMOMVCD00003446 - YP 4623 X and GEC83525 (GA) on 27/8/2018

Without Prejudice

Daar Shu man



Attached is O's sketch plan, and circumstance of accident. Liability is not clear —seems like a 50/50 case based on
conflicting version,
We may survey on a without prejudice basis. Let Lis kndw your preference.

LAMCL
Clreu b oy

| WAS DRIVING ALDNG THE DRIVE WAY INSIDE THE NORTH LINK BUILDING, | SAW A LORRY STATIORARY ON THE
e WUILE APEROAGCH THE LORRY. SUDDENLY THE LORRY WITHOUT CHECKING THE BLIND SPOT AND MAXE
A mw HIT ONTO MY VEH LEFT HAND SIDE.

Are nccldont photos avadable for attochment? YES
Was thoro anry video captired by Car Camera?  NO
W thece any awdio rocoided? NOD

DETAILS OF OTHER VEMHICLE PROPFERTY 1

Ragards

Rachel Tan

Evecitive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company

T2l: 6804 7846

From: admin1@kkimhin.com.sg <adminl@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, August 30, 2018 10:00 AM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel Tari ig.com

Ce: service @kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; simon @kkimhin.com.se; survey@kkimhin.com.sg

Subject: [External] Accident involving YP 4623 X and GBC8352S (GA) on 27/8/2018

Your ref: GBC 83525
Our ref: YP 4623 X

[ear Rachel,

Enclosed the GIA report of our client YP 4623 X, who was hit by your insured GBC 8352 S, on 27/8/2018.
\ehicle is not in yet, kindly appoint surveyor and we will arrange once ready.

Flease advise liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shuman

I£. Kim Hin Auto Pre Ltd
Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895
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