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ASSIGNMENT

Froim Dale Veh o, '-'J\TA 8781 VrReon: 2 olb OLL-
Estimated Cost: Type@' [ M.Cycle ! Bus | Van | Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |
OD/TP{WS /TP RES/ QD RES [ EVALINV MV Truck I Trailer or
To Inspect Vehicla No: Make! W %ff.‘ z B0 o ]q) {9
4t Workshap s Colour Blecede- - AC:  Insured | Std | NI NA
of Sp.Reading cLeYe T/Radio: Insured | Std ] NI NA
Insured; Eng/Mo:
Palicy Mo CiNo: Wo vl 3{;04.}_.14 12 L?%t
Claims Ng Gen, Cond: | Fair | Poor | Burnt
Sum Insured; Excess: Sleering: In { Jammed { Leaked | Burnt o

{Client's Recard) Brake:  Inarder | Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or
Make of Veh Modi:  Nil ﬁ | STD AIRim or

Tyre Size: 2%/ Y| ARR

{Policy Condition)

Remark: The veh had commenced its NIS o5

repair at the time of inspection.

Bal or Market Value:

IDAC Accident Rporl: Conststent? | Yes or No
GlA [ PR Seen: Consistent? : Yes or No
Est. Repairs. days Res: Yes or No
Lum Sum; % 3Val: Yes or No

CA | REY | REP. | 24HRS
Vehicle: INJOUT

[ate; Person Contacted

i a#s/kwﬁ’u 9.
BS/DUN | EXNOVA | GY | FS/ LIZA | NIC { OHTSU | PIR | SUMI |

TOYO | YOKO or [teck rﬁu‘d .

Fronl Rear

RiBal, 9% i RBA. é i
L/Bal 0 mm Lgal. & m
D.OA. DO, f??/ﬂ’%ﬁ? '
Survey held at P[";!rmﬂ__ s

Des. of Damages : Fri | Rear | @ | NIS I@i Rooftop or

The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due lo collision.

Date / Time | Action | Instruction

gy

Bls|ld  Advian Confumed LS $5300 (Rad o, us8, T4

sl emal piets ehsed to o

RECEIVED 1 & NAY 2013

Malef e, Fil Pass 37 : Preli. Report Days Of Repair: H \Silf =115
i) E: Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: Survey Fee: Hot 235
[Drate! e, File Relum o7 :[|r'|n3.;|r.rlr'|li|ul g}
T N-’ﬁ s Bvlﬂ- Add Fee; i Site Insp (% il | - i R

r_. Interview (% )| Py r\?\ 3"’(‘
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74 74

Company Registration Mo, 199607196R

S1 UBLAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFURE J08933 TEL @ (063 62503561 FAX © (631 62364315

Your ref: D18006495MESH
Our ref: CS/FC118016033/Avh Date : 14/5/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SJA 878K
We thank you for your instruction on 31/8/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
3/9/2018  at the premises of M/s PRIME MOTOR WORKS

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount + 8%25,728.00

Revised Estimate Amount : §§5,300.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount . 55

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
o/s portion and undercarriage

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAM LING WAl PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensed Appraisar



MS@FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapoee 048580
Tet [65] 6222 2311 Faw [B5) 6222 3547

Claiien, & Moter Underwriting Degt: 36 Robinson Road f16-01 City House Singagare DERETT

Tel: (65} 6507 3848 Fax (65) G507 3840
www msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

30-08-2018 Our Ref No. D18006495MFSH
28-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHD34275 Third Party Vehicle, SJA878K

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK C #01-43 BLK C @AUTOBAY
REENA/ SUKYI

67479241/ 0 Fax No. 67417276

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68418315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PRIME MOTOR WORKS Attention. NIL

NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey raport via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

L LAY

M35 First Capital Insurance Limited o nes 1o 1950001060 (51 Reg ho. MZ. 00016764




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

§_

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 9:15 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B006495MFSH/1, SJA BTBK
Attachments: SJA 878K PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJA 878K
Date of survey: 3/9/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 9:50 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006495MFSH/1, SIA 878K

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJA 878K on 3/9/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Iikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 12:44 PM
To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>




Co: JOANNEYONG @MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
‘Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006495MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer arrange survey on 03/09/2018.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assipnmentsi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaim
Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 12:37 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@E MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; JOANNEYONG @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006495MFSH/1

msfirstcapital.com.s

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

A“G. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
j WWW.ave.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 9:50 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Ce: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.5G; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B006495MFSH/1, SJA BTBK

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJA 878K on 3/9/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 12:44 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006495MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer arrange survey on 03,/08/2018.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto.cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 12:37 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; JOANNEYONG @MSFIRSTCAPITAL. COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006495MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.avg.com



PARE/COL Rebate Enquiry

lofl

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Ohner 1D Type:
Crwner 1D

Vehicle Detalls
Vehicle Mo,

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-reglstration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Modal:

Primary Colour:
Manufaciuring Year

Engine Mo,

Chassis No.

Paximum Power Chutput

Cpen Market Value:

COriginal Registration Date
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rehate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years|:

P Paid:

COE Rebats Amount:

Total Rebate Amount;

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Aug 2018

hups;vellta, govisgtaivrlaction‘enguireRebateByPublicBeforeDe .

Singapore MRIC
1958H

SIABTEK

Mo

30 Aug 2018
MERCEDESBENZ
EZ200 ALTO

Black

2018
65452080053125
WDD21300424123981
1430 kW (191 bhp)
$58,245.00

14 Dec 2014

14 Dec 2016

b E

$66,841.00

Yes
13 Dec 2026
250,130,000

13 Dec 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or $7kW (130bhp)
10

$44.229.00

$38,300.00

$88.430.00

OK

30/8/2018, 11:40 AM



- PRIME MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 1, KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-43, SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 6747 9241 FAX: 8741 7276 HP: 9067 8767 R 8
EMAIL: primemotorworks@hotmail.sg

RCB No: 53177286A

30/08/2018
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43
Singapore 417883 TP 15 (e im,. :

Accident date: 29/08/2018 VeroA

Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SIA878K MERCEDES E220 D 2.0 A '16
CHASSIS: WDD2130042A122981

S/N QTY ITEMS U/PRICE AMOUNT
1 1  Front R/H Head Lamp 2 et plam %7 X
2 1  Front R/H Head Lamp Lower Bracket X. .
3 1 Front Bumper s e 2013 4 ¥
4 1  Front R/H Bumper Side Retainer A+ %1 '
5 1  Front Bumper Centre Lower Chrome Moulding ##¢ s 487 X
6 1  Front Bumper Sensor /ol 4w 1%L k
7 1 Front R/H Fender Tertd JOYO
8 1  FrontR/HRim [.& dEY SN ULHA— —
9 1  FrontR/H Tyre st po 2§50 ¥
10 1 FrontR/H Lower Arm e (25 L~
11 1 Front R/H Knuckle Arm % ; 109 LT —
12 1  Front R/H Knuckle Arm Bearing #4<” - ¢Sy
13 1  FrontR/H Upper Arm MNT— 8 36 T,
14 1  Front R/H Drive Shaft X
15 1 FrontR/H Stabilizer Bar [ A~ e
16 1  Front Steering Rack 3’ 9057 &

Subtotal:- S0.00

-
%\
|



= F

Labour charges

To remove & refit front steering rack & drive shaft $450.00
To remove & refit R/H front undercarriage $380:00 2
Tuff kote $150.00 -

To check wiring sw s

To check wheel alignment computer $150.00 ¥
>

-_._'_'_,_,..-o-'
Panel beating W.DD 3o

Spray painting / _ 30 51,990.6540 J-
0
Subtotal:- $3,230.00

Total:- $3,230.00
%, 28

/él(_l(]i-n Ltll
Sonsuliants hence notify "‘J

R e e &8 03/ 0915

« To desplay damaged paris) during resuney

* Pa:ts prices ane subject to coalinmation

LEKE Autc

= Third party survey thout Prejudice” bass

» No llegal modifical 5 allowed O' l
o Supplementary ilemis) mus! ba resurvaved and
i subject to final approval from Insurance Company
Acknowledgad by Repaser
Signature: G C 7” {2
Date: : —




| PEOPLES AUTO TRADING
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-400

‘ TEL 6741 4646

' COMPUTERIZED ALIGNMENT SPECIALISTS

CUSTOMER

CASH

DATE

Aug 30, 2018 10:07:02 AM
LICENSE NO. SIARTS K
MILEAGE 52535
REFERENCE CUSTOM MODEL MERCEDES BENZ E CL.
Front Wheel SPECS DIAGNOSIS ADJUSTMEN
:;mm prv. max A | L total R A |L total R A
TOTAL TOE 0.00 1.00 210 2.40 2.30
PARTIAL TOE 0.000 050 1.00 L7 (.60 .30 .90
SET BACK o i —_— 0e0G" Fos" ]
CAMBER | -1°22" -0°38" 0°06" | -0°52" -1754" 17027 -0°48" -1°36" IDIJE"\
CASTER T4 AT w44t | SOSOP §°58" 0°08"| 8°50° §°58" n“nt-’r"J
hING-PIN - 7°30" 746" 0°16° 7°30" 46" 0°16)
INCLANGLE - - 636" 5°50)" 6°40" 5°48"
[oe-out on turns S — - . e
STEERING IN - = i ,
STEERING OUT . -
I
Rear Wheel SPECS DIAGNOSIS ADIUSTMEI
min prv. max A |[L total R AL total R A l

TOTAL TOE
PARTIAL TOE
SET BACK
CAMBER
THRUST ANGLE

000 210 420
000 100 210

0FO0" -

-0%08" 0.00  0°08"

1.90
0.50 1.30
012"
1718 1736" 0°16"
002"

1.90
0.50

012"
-1°18" -1736" 0°16"

-pro2”

1.30




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubd Industrial Park, Singapore 4086933

TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Rep. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAFPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref : CS/FCH8016033/Avbn2

3?;-35::?%? ESL?;EDSINGAF‘DRE 068877 D naosaen NIWI”"H"”M"“
Code: FCI2
4 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 34275 Veh. Inspected S5JA BTEK
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18006495MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 31/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E220 c.c 1950
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WDD2130042A122981 Colour BLACK
Odometer 52542 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTSE RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/40R1% HABILEAD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 R19 HABILEAD & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/40R13 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/40 R19 HABILEAD & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY AND UNDERCARRIAGE.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  29/08/2018 Inspection Date 03/08/2018
Survey held at PRIME MOTOR WORKS
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-43
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJA 878K

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Feg. Mo: 199607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Page No.:1 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |,y Chop (8) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT R/H HEAD LAMP NOT NECESSARY 3.467.00 -
1|FRONT R/H HEAD LAMP LOWER BERACKET (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|FRONT BUMPER TORN 2,023.00 2,023.00
1|FRONT R/H BUMPER SIDE RETAINER MECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE LOWER CHROME MOULDING |NOT NECESSARY 487.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER SENSOR MOT NECESSARY 1682.00 -
1|FRONT R/H FENDER DENTED 1,040.00 1,040.00
1|FRONT R/H TYRE NOT NECESSARY 380.00 &
1|FRONT R/H LOWER AREM BENT 625.00 625.00
1|FRONT R/H KNUCKLE ARM BENT 1,640.00 1,050.00
1|FRONT R/H KNUCKLE ARM BEARING MECESSARY 554 00 554 00
1|FRONT R/H UPPER ARM NOT NECESSARY 836,00 -
1|FRONT R/H DRIVE SHAFT {NPA) MOT NECESSARY - -
1|FRONT R/H STABILIZER BAR NOT NECESSARY 585.00 -
1|FRONT STEERING RACK NOT NECESSARY 0,097.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -532.70
20,961.00 4,794 30
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT R/H RiM (SN cuTt 1,837.00 850.00
1,537.00 B50.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT STEERING RACK & DRIVE |MOT NECESSARY 450,00 -
SHAFT.
TO REMOVE & REFIT R/H FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE. 3B0.00 220.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO CHECK WIRING, 100.00 30.00
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT COMPUTER 150.00 80.00
PANEL BEATING, 1,000.00 300.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,000.00 400.00
3,230.00 1,030.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016033/Avbn2




Page MNo..2 of 2
] GRAND TOTAL ] 25.723.1:0] a.u‘m.au]
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016033/Avbn2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solsly for the uss and benefit of the Client named cn the front page of this Report.




