Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 11:00 AM

To: Eric Kee

Cc: Motorsurvey; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: TP Survey assignment for GBC 7048C - DOA: 31/08/2018  Our ref: YN
6486Y/BT; Our Ref: NSV1800503

Attachments: 1 Trip & Stop(Detailed).pdf

Hi Eric

We refer to your email below.

Without admission of liability, please find attached GPS record for your reference which prove our insured is
innocent.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0816

F: +65 6423 0864

E: ben.tang@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Eric Kee <rsauto_eng@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 6:28 PM

To: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>

Cc: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: TP Survey assignment for GBC 7048C - DOA: 31/08/2018 Our ref: YN 6486Y/BT; Our Ref: NSV1800503
Hi Ben

Can show us the GPS record to prove that your insure vehicle is stationary at that time of accident ?

Thank you

Regards

Eric Kee

Sent from my iPhone



On 16 Oct 2018, at 17:06, Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Eric
We refer to above matter.

Without admission of liability, our insured vehicle YN 6486Y was parked outside the dormitory on
30/08/2018 at 07:28pm and it has been stationary all the while.

Our insured vehicle was install with a GPS tracker and have furnish to us the GPS trip record which
show that the vehicle was stationary on the alleged accident on 31/08/2018 at 07.00am.

Base on the above evidence, our insured is innocent and your client’s claim is deny.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0816

F: +65 6423 0864

E: ben.tang@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Eric Kee <rsauto _eng@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 October 2018 4:41 PM

To: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>

Cc: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP Survey assignment for GBC 7048C - DOA: 31/08/2018 Our ref: YN 6486Y/BT; Our Ref:
NSV1800503

Hi

Can we settle this case ?
Thank you

Regards

Eric Kee

Sent from my iPhone



On 26 Sep 2018, at 17:30, Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com> wrote:

Hi Eric
We have received your claim documents.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0816

F: +65 6423 0864

E: ben.tang@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Eric Kee <rsauto_eng@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 4:27 PM

To: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>

Cc: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP Survey assignment for GBC 7048C - DOA: 31/08/2018 Our ref: YN
6486Y/BT; Our Ref: NSV1800503

Hi Mr Ben
Ok

The document have you receive?

Thank you
Regards

Eric Kee

Sent from my iPhone

On 26 Sep 2018, at 14:51, Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Eric



We refer to above matter.

Without admission of liability, we are seeking clarification with our
insured on some issues.

We will write to you again once we received the requested
information.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0816

F: +65 6423 0864

E: ben.tang@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Eric Kee <rsauto eng@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 2:44 PM

To: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>

Cc: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: TP Survey assignment for GBC 7048C - DOA:
31/08/2018 Our ref: YN 6486Y/BT; Our Ref: NSV1800503

Hi

We had send out our invoice and other document to you
Have you receive?

Thank you

Regards

Eric Kee

Sent from my iPhone

On 7 Sep 2018, at 10:41, Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Hi Eric
We refer to above matter.

Without admission of liability, please forward to us
video footage and accident scene photographs for
our review.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore
079914

T: +65 6423 0816

F: +65 6423 0864

E: ben.tang@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Eric Kee <rsauto_eng@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September 2018 3:53 PM

To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP Survey assignment for GBC 7048C -
DOA: 31/08/2018 Our ref: YN 6486Y/BT

Hi

Can we have the liability for this case
And the officer In charge of this case
Thank you

Regards

Eric Kee

Sent from my iPhone

On 31 Aug 2018, at 16:56, Motorsurvey
<Motorsurvey@awac.com> wrote:
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The above captioned accident
refers.

Pursuant to the Practice Directions
Amendment No. 1 of 2016 which
was effective on 1 April 2016, we
like to advise that the third party
claimant and us do have consensus
in the appointment of Mr
Mohammed Rasul as the Single
Joint Expert to conduct the pre-
repair survey of the third party
claimant’s vehicle.

Please conduct "THIRD PARTY"
survey on without prejudice basis.
The information as are follows:

3 Party Vehicle : GBC 7048 C
Insured Vehicle : YN 6486 Y (Accident not Reported)
Policy Number : AVCPSB0066991703
Name of Workshop : Rong Sheng Auto Engineering Trading
Contact Number : 8239 0099
Person to Contact : Eric Kee
Eshmated.Cost of $1.336.48
repairs
Regards,
Claims Division
Copy to Rong Sheng Auto
Engineering Trading via Email
Note -
(x) 1. This is to keep you informed that we have appointed surveyors to ¢
client’s damaged vehicle on a without prejudice basis.

2. Please keep our motor surveyor and us informed so as to enal
post repair inspection once your client’s vehicle has been rep
the repaired vehicle to your customer.

3. Please quantify your client’s claim with all relevant supporting docu
vehicle has been repaired.

4. Please do not construe this appointment of surveyor and our above
liability.

Regards

Motor Claims
Claims Group
Global Market



The information contained in this
e-mail and any attachments
hereto is confidential. If you are
not the intended recipient, you
must not use or disseminate any
of this information. If you have
received this e-mail in error,
please immediately notify the
sender by reply e-mail and
permanently delete the original
e-mail (and any attachments
hereto) and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this
e-mail and any attachments
hereto are believed to be free of
any virus or other defect that
might affect any computer
system into which it is received
and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to
ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by
Allied World Assurance
Company Holdings, GmbH or its
subsidiaries or affiliates, either
jointly or severally, for any loss
or damage arising in any way
from its use.



