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!' V‘l‘{‘ Auto

- Consulfants
i A I Pie Lid Company Registration Mo, 198607 198R

51 URIAVE 1, ¥02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (065) 62564315

Your Ref: YP3515G/SL Date: 04 September 2018

Our Ref: CS/EGI18016014/Ksb

The Motor Claims Department
Ergo Insurance Pte Lid

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SHD 1658 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 03/09/2018 at the premises of M/s Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S8 2171743
Revised Estimate Amount : 58 5.972.51
“Check” Items Amount : S8 449.95
Market Value : 88

LTA Reimbursement Value 153

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion,

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 6 Days

Yours faithfully,
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto) »

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 4:32 PM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: 'SUR'

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1808-248--Accident involving SHD 1655 & YP 3515G on 28.08.18
Attachments: ESTIMATE MARKED.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shirley

We confirmed the COR amount $4,800.00 (befare GST).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

«%+ please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

‘T_g_ TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 5671 1

/..-...Ca :.i Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www . franscob.com.sg

idential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work proc et immunity or cther legal rules, 17
et us know by e-mail reply and de

us by Tax any messafe ol ntaining des

ar disclose lines as i

for response deadlines. Ti security of this message Cannot De-gu sranteed an the Internat

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 11:14 AM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TCS REF. AAD1808-248--Accident involving SHD 1655 & YP 3515G on 28.08.18

Dear Wai Yin,

Please confirm final fig $4.800.00 (lump sum) @ 6 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Pest Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkaute.com | fax: 6256-4315
8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5408933)



This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
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Shiriex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) < ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 3:49 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Cc ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; 'SUR'; 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: YP3515G / TP : SHD1655/LKK / DOA : 28/08/2018

Attachments: SHD 165S - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SHD 1655.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto,.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

Erom: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 12:03 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’ <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Ce: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP3515G /TP : SHD1655/LKK / DOA : 28/08/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) |maiItﬂ:5uweg.ﬁegurt@ergo,mm.s.g]
Sent: Monday, 3 September, 2018 10:13 AM

To: 'admin-d@Ikkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>
Subject: 01 : YP3515G /TP SHD1655/LKK / DOA : 28/08/2018

Dear Cathering/Nivitha,

Please assist to conduct these surveys:-

NO | VEHTO W/SHOP NAME PERSON TO CONTACT | OUR REF oIC REMARKS
BE SURVEY
1 SHD 1655 TRANS-CAB SERVICES GHIEN YEE LOONG @ | YP3515G/SL STEVE DOA: 28/08/2018
PTELTD @ 2 ANG MO | 6287 6666 Lim WP
KIO STREET 63




Catherine thnni (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 September, 2018 10:13 AM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’

Ce: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'

Subject: Ol - YP3515G / TP : SHD1655/LKK / DOA : 28/08/2018

Attachments: YP3515G - SAS.pdf: SHD165S - SAS.pdf; SHD1655 - PRS FORM.pdf; RE: Arrange for

survey - SHD165S (140 KB)

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

Please assist to conduct these surveys:-

NO | VEHTO W/SHOP NAME PERSON TO CONTACT | OUR REF oIc REMARKS
BE SURVEY
1 SHD 1655 TRANS-CAB SERVICES GHIEN YEE LOONG @ | YP3515G/SL STEVE DOA: 28/08/2018
PTELTD @ 2 ANG MO | 6287 6666 LIM WP
KIO STREET 63

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly update of the survey status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Kindly acknowledge receipt. K

Regards
Yee Peili
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

; Termnasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore D3BHES

DID.: +85 6629 9194

Tel @ +65 6825 5193

F +55 BRZG 9247

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Waorldwide ERGO = representad in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's lsading risk carrers

W, @rg0.Com 50
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> Back to OneMotoring

" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

WVehicle Owner Particulars
Owener 1D Type:

Orwner |D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

POF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

PAREINNF Rahats Fosilng

Company
357EK

SHD1855

Yes

29 Aug 2018
CHEVROLET

EPICA 2.0DSL AT ABS D/AB 2WD ADR TUREO
Red

2011

Z20514569 70K
KLILAGYRIBE1O4467
110.0 kW (147 bhp)
%14 578.00

07 Sep 2012

07 Sep 2012

0]

$14 578.00

Yes
06 Sep 2020
$10,204.00

04 5ep 2020

A~ Car [1600cc & below)
B

$51,531.00

$13.024.00

$23,228.00

Pleace note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE gxpiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutary lifespan (if applicable), whichever is ea rlier.

The information cantalned herein is correct as at 29 Aug 2018

OK
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Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHD 1655

Wehicle Mo.:

Chassis No..

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Date of Accident :

Third Party Insurer .

PART

1 1 Rear Bumper
2 1 Rear Bumper Beam
3 1 Rear Bumper Centre Absorber
4 1 Rear Bumper Side Retainer RH
5 1 Rear Bumper Side Retainer LH
6 1 Rear Bumper Reflectors RH
7 1 Rear Bumper Reflectors LH
8 1 Rear Bumper Tow Hook Cover
9 1 Rear End Panel Outer
10 1  Rear End Panel Inner Trim
11 1 Rear Luggage Floor Panel
12 1 Rear Luggage Floor Panel Insulator
13 1 Rear Luggage Floor Panel Trim Board
14 1 Bootlid
15 1 Bootlid inner trim board
16 1  Bootlid Weatherstrip
17 1  Bootlid Lock - Top
18 1 Bootlid 'CHEVROLET' Badge
19 1 Bootlid Logo
20 1  Bootlid 'EPICA LT' Badge
21 1 Bootlid Reflector Centre
22 1  Bootlid Reflector RH
23 1 Bootlid Reflector LH
24 1 Rear Tail Lamp RH
25 1 Rear Tail Lamp LH
26 1 Rear Exhaust Box (Muffler A-EXH,RR)
27 1 Rear Fender RH
28 1 Rear Fender Inner Trim RH
29 1 Rear Fender LH

AAD1802-248

AT AT iy
J//B?, Py
SHD 165S
KL1LAGORJBB 104469
CHEVROLET
EPICA 2.0
28.8.2018
ERGO

LIST
$ N 1,20200 =
$ A 23004 K
$ /26000 R
$ fn 6876 X
$ S\ 6876 X
$ Ja 11974 X
$ S, 11974 X
$ Joy 9300 4
$ e 62376 —
$ 277 26384 —
4 2T 973.00 4
$ fer 6350 X
§ Jn 37800 ¥
$ 47 97300 &~
$ S~ 400.00 X
3 b1 My 34428 SO J1n—
$ 7T 46656
$ stz 12062 —
$ e, 13884 —
g U, 11984 —
% <) 21797 —
$ €r24 12840 —
$ Crmn 12840 ~—
$ fen. 47930 X
$ €/ 47930 «—
$ T 111000 ¥
$ 7C 114500 X
§ Jeo 41844 X
$ 7t 1,145.00 {



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHD 1655

30 1 Rear Fender Inner Trim LH

TOTAL
10%

Specical Nett

1 1Set Bootlid inner trim board Clip

2 1Set Rear Bumper Parking Sensor

3 1Set Rear Bumper Fastener Clip

4  1Set Rear Fender Inner Trim Clip LH

5  1Set Rear Bumper End Dust Cover Clip

6 1 Rear Exhaust Mounting

7 2 Rear Windscreen Sealant

8 1 Rear Windscreen Inner Sponge Seal

9 1 Spare Tyre

10 1 Spare Wheel Rim

11 1 REAR BOOT ADVERTISEMENT STICKER

12 1 REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT STICKER

13 1 LEFT REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT STICKER

14 1 RIGHT REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT STICKER

TOTAL

TOTAL PARTS

Panel Beating, Knocking And Straightening The
Necessary Portion, Remove And Renewal Of
Parts, Adjust And Realign The Same

To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned.

To Rust-Proofing Of The Affected Areas.

Putty And Spray Painting Of The Affected Portion.

To reinstall rear bumper parking sensor.

AAD1808-248
g fn a184s )
$ 12,707.43
$ 1,270.74
$ 11,436.69
§ V™ 4000 X
$ Jin 30000 «
$ A, 4400 —
3 A 3000
$ VL 30.00
$ Fu. 30000
$ VA 80.00
$ A 100.00
§ Ju. 18000
$ ‘5 12674
$ U4 30000
$ A4 20000
$ Y~ 300.00
$ o BGD.UDJ
$ 2,330.74
$ 13,767.43
$ 350000 #Cc/
% 170,00 Z""f
$ 1?&.90{;(
$ 3,000.00 Fo ¢/
$ 170.00 =/



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1808-248

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel Mo. : 6287 6666 Fax Mo, : 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHD 1655

To transfer of end panel fittings and conduct
water seepage test. $ 4" 17000 X

To transfer of boot fittings and conduct water
seepage test. 4 170.00 Q/;(

To remove and refit interior fittings, trimings,
garnish, fittings and other, to enable repair. $ 38000 “Z7/

To check steering geometry and computer wheel

alignment $ YV 22000 X
s 7,950.00
TOTAL $ 21,717.43
Repair Days (LUMP SUM) _A0DAYS

LEK AL_; Cdnsullanls he.

r"L --(_:..d il cé no tl I




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref © CS/EGI1B8016014/Ksbn2
[N
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 08-01-2019
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1 Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 3515G Veh. Inspected SHD 1655
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. YP3515G/SL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEEPEILI Assign Date 03/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CHEVROLET ERICA (&) c.c 1991
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. KL1LABSRJBB 104469 Colour WHITE / RED
Odometer 880423 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/63 R15 GITI 9 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 GITI g mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 GITI 9 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/65 R15 GITI g mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/08/2018 [inspection Date 03/09/2018
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
NO.2 ANG MO KIO ST 83
SINGAPORE 569111
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

6 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 1655
- Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ chop {:}} .t’:-;
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED 1,202.00 1,202.00
1|REAR BUMPER BEAM TC REPAIR SEE 239.94 .
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE ABSORBER SERVICEABLE 260.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH SERVICEAELE BB.TH .
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH SERVICEABLE 68.76 -
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS RH SERVICEABLE 119.74 -
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS LH SERVICEABLE 118.74 -
1|REAR BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER SERVICEABLE 83.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL OUTER BUCKLED 623.76 623.76
1|REAR END PANEL INNER TRIM DISTORTED 263 B4 263.84
1|REAR LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 973.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR SERVICEABLE 63.50 %
1|REAR LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL TRIM BOARD SERVICEABLE 378.00 .
1|BOOTLID BENT 973.00 §73.00
1|BOOTLID INNER TRIM BOARD SERVICEABLE 400.00 -
1|BOOTLID LOCK-TOP TO REPAIR SEE 466.56 5
LABOUR
1|BOOTLID "CHEVROLET"' BADGE NECESSARY 120,62 120.62
1|BOOTLID LOGO NECESSARY 138.84 138.84
1|BOOTLID "EPICA LT" BADGE NECESSARY 119.84 119.84
1|BOOTLID REFLECTOR CENTRE CRACKED 217.97 217.87
1|BOOTLID REFLECTOR RH CRACKED 128.40 128.40
1|BOOTLID REFLECTOR LH CRACKED 128.40 128.40
1|REAR TAIL LAMP RH SERVICEABLE 478.30 -
1|REAR TAIL LAMP LH CRACKED 479.30 47530
1|REAR EXHAUST BOX (MUFFLER A-EXH RR) TO REPAIR SEE 1,110.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,145.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM RH SERVICEABLE 418.44 .

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18016014/Ksbn2




V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

,‘/.;'_! 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No- 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No:2 of 3
Qty Description of Parts Condition w?::;;?n bt ‘"‘{:i]"’ we
1|REAR FENDER LH TO REPAIR SEE 1,145.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM LH SERVIGEABLE 418.44 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,236.31 -439.60
11,126.84 3,956.37
1|BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP (50%){SN) DISTORTED/ 34428 172.14
DENTED
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -34.43 -
309.85 172.14
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET BOOTLID INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00 =
1|SET REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 300.00 -
1|SET REAR BUMPER FASTENER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 44.00 44.00
1|SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIP LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|SET REAR BUMPER END DUST COVER CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING (SN) SERVICEABLE 300.00 -
2|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1|SPARE TYRE (SN) SERVICEABLE 180.00 -
1|SPARE WHEEL RIM (SN) SERVICEABLE 126.74 -
1|REAR BOOT ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 300.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
1|LEFT REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN)  |[NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
1|RIGHT REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN)  [NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
2,330.74 44,00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING,KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 3,500.00 700.00
NECESSARY PORTION,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER BEAM REAR LUGGAGE
FLOOR PANEL,BOOTLID LOCK-TOP,REAR EXHAUST BOX
(MUFFLER A-EXH RR) REAR FENDER RH AND REAR
FENDER LH.

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18016014/Ksbn2




1 V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-, Bna = 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-2607198-R Page No.:3 of 3
" Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
oy 2 Workshop (8))] _(8)

TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED 170.00 20.00
TO RUST-PROCFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. 170.00 §0.00
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 3,000.00 800.00
PORTION
TO REINSTALL REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR 170.00 60.00
TO TRANSFER OF END PANEL FITTINGS AND CONDUCT [NOT NECESSARY 170,00 -
WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRAMSFER OF BOOT FITTINGS AND CONDUCT 170.00 60.00
WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR 380.00 100.00
FITTINGS, TRIMINGS GARNISH,
EITTINGS AND OTHER, TO ENABLE REPAIR.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER MOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMEMT,

7.850.00 1,800.00
GRAND TOTAL 21,717.43 597251
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIR 4,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18016014/Ksbn2

y/isa

KONG

SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client namad on the front page of this Report.




