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'Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner |1D Type: Business
Owner ID: 1659K
MR YL 1311 PV 7 | .= S == =S =1 ==~
Vehicle No.: GBG4362T
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 04 Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: FIAT
Vehicle Model: DOBLO CARGO MAXI 1.6 MTJ 6MT GLAZE
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: 198A30008100650
Chassis No.: ZFA26300006G96062
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value: $18,776.00
Original Registration Date: 08 Aug 2017
First Registration Date: 08 Aug 2017
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $939.00
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
COE Expiry Date: 07 Aug 2027
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $42,809.00
COE Rebate Amount: $38,205.00
Total Rebate Amount: $38,205.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Sep 2018

OK

hrtps: v ita gov.sgiianTiiacion/engquire e balsdyrFubhcHarocrallansginpuliFUunNG | IN_ID=FUEUa0UY | |



M/S: LIFEIS..
676B PUNGGOL DRIVE
#11-716 WATERWAY SINGAPORE 822676
ATTN:
Your Ref No: TP O718-5156
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date: 19/072014
TP Veh Reg No;  SHC15ME
Description
Labour

[ ¥

TOKNOUK OUT DENTS, REMOVE, REPLACE ACCIDENT

PARTS

PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Blk 30224 Uibi Foad 1 #0454 Simgapore 408716
TEL: 6741 5336 FAX: 6741 T208  Emmil; progaulos progaubo com sg
GST201006849C ROB NOCZ0 | 64590

Estimate No:  ESTIS03878

Date: 20 Jul 2018

Policy No: VCA/P1969653

Veh Reg No: GBG4362T

Make/Model:  FIAT DOBLO CARGO
MAXI 1.6 MT) 6MT
GLAZE

Chassis No: ZFA26300006GY6062

Engine No: 198A30008 100650

Reg. Date: 08/08/2017

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :GBG4362T

TO RESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS
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Nivitha (LKK Autu!

From: Motor Claim - lIl <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 10:20 AM

To: 500 Leong Keat; "sur@Ikkauto.com’; Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Ce: Sundari Nagarajan - |lI

Subject: RE: MCT18070957/01/sn; TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBG4362T &

SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST $588.50

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle GEG47A2T and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Sundar.

*Merimen file has been created already.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tal: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: 500 Leong Keat [mailto:lksoo@procarcare.com.sg)

Sent: 31 August, 2018 9:24 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - Il <sundari @iil.com.sg>

Subject: RE: MCT18070957/01/sn; TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBGA4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST
$588.50

Importance: High

Dear Sir
Kindly arrange LK for survey.

Thank youi,

Regards,

Leong Keat SO0

Claims Advisory

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T: 4656741 5336 | F:+656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare. com.sg

W: www . pro IfCare.com.sg




“With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automative Pte Ltd will be rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd.
You may now reach us at our new email oddresses (@procarcore com.sg) ond our old emoil oddresses
{@progauto.com.sg) shall cease to function with effect from 1 Sep 2018. We look forward to your continued support.

From: Motor Claim - |ll ematarclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 5:06 PM

To: 500 Leong Keat <[ks roCarcare, >

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - lll ssundari@lil.com.sg>

Subject: RE: MCT18070957/01/sn; TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBGA4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST
$588.50

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyars:

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecl| Street | #05 0B Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Sundari Nagarajan - lli

Sent: 30 August, 2018 3:33 PM

To: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Ce: 'Lily’ <bhlim@procarcare.com.sg>; 'Peiwen’ <peiwen@procarcare.com.sg>; 'Ray’ <ra fOCarcare.com.sg>;

'Wayne' <wayne @procarcare com.sg>; "Soo Leong Keat' <lksoo@procarcare com.sg>

:uhjnct: RE: MCT18070957/01/sn; TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBGA4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST
588.50

Urgent
Dear Gahriel

Please arrange survey. Claim already created in merimen,
Regards,

Sundari Nagarajan
DID: 63476071

From: Soo Leong Keat [mailto:lksooi@procarca

Sent: Thursday, 30 August, 2018 2:56 PM

To: Sundari Nagarajan - |l <sundari@iil.com.sg>

Cc: Joel Nah Shern Ern <JoelNah@iii.com.sg>; Lily <bhlim @procarcare.com.sg>; Peiwen
<peiwen@procarcare.com.sg>, Ray <ray@procarcare.com.sg>; Wayne <wayn r LCOMm.5g>
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Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBG4362T & SHC1544E_DO0A:19/07/2018_EST 5588.50
Importance: High

Dear Sundari
Kindly make arrangement for survey on Monday moring 10am (03/09/2018).

Thank you.

Regards,

Leong Keat SO0

Claims Advisory

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T:+65 67415336 | F: +656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

W: www.procarcare.com.sg

"With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd will be rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd.
You may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.com.sq) and our old email oddresses
(@progauto.com.sg) shall cease to function with effect from 1 Sep 2018. We look forward to your continued support.

From: Soo Leong Keat On Behalf Of Claims
Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 5:51 PM
To: 'Sundari Nagarajan - llI' <sundari@iil.com.sg>

Cc: Joel Nah Shern Ern' <JoeINah@iii.com.sg>; Lily <bhlim @procarcare.com.sg>; Peiwen
wen@procarcare.com.sg>; Ray <ray@procarcare.com.sg>; Wayne <w rocarcare.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBG4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST $588.50
Importance: High

Dear Sundari
Did your insured reported?
Kindly advise the liability for the case above.

Thank you.

Regards,

Leong Keat SO0

Claims Advisory

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T:+65 6741 5336 | F: +656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

W: Www.procarcare.com.sg

“With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd will be rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

You may now reach us at our new email oddresses (@procarcare.com.sg) and our old email addresses
(@progauto.com.sg) shall cease to function with effect from 1 Sep 2018. We look forward to your continued support.
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From: 500 Leong Keat On Behalf Of Claims

Sent: Friday, 17 August 2018 12:03 PM

To: 'Sundari Nagarajan - II' <sundari@lil.com.sg>

Cc: 'Joel Nah Shern Ern' <JoelNah@iil.com.sg>; Lily <bhlim @procarcare.com.sg>; Peiwen
<peiwen(@procarcare com sg>; Ray <ray@procarcare.com.sg>; Wayne <wayne@procarcare.com.sg>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBG4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST 5588.50
Importance: High

Dear Sundari
Did your insured reported?
Kindly advise the liability for the case above.

Thank you.

Regards,

Leong Keat SO0

Claims Advisory

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T: +65 6741 5336 | F:+656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

W: www.procarcare.com.sg

*With effect from 1 S5ep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd will be rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd.
You may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.cam.sg) and our old email addresses
(@progouto.com.sg) shall cease to function with effect fram 1 Sep 2018. We look farward to your continued support.

From: Sundari Nagarajan - |l <sundari@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 9:28 AM
To: 'lksoo@progauto.com.sg' <lksoo@progauto. 5

Cc: Joel Nah Shern Ern <JgelNah@iii.com.sg>
Subject: FW: TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBG4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST $588.50
Importance: High

Without Prejudice save as to cost
Dear Sir

We refer to your email below. Our driver does not seem to have reported the accident. We are writing to our
insured about the same. In the meanwhile please hold hands

Aside Joel
Please send NR letter urgently
Regards,

Sundari Nagarajan
DID: 63476071

From: Motor Claim - 11l
Sent: Friday, 27 July, 2018 10:47 AM



To:Sundari Nagarajan - lll <sundari@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Soo Leong Keat <lksoo@progauto.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBGA4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST $588.50
Importance: High

Dear Officer,
Please assist.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecll Street | #05 I0B Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: 500 Leong Keat [mallto:lksoo@progauto.com.sg)

Sent: 27 July, 2018 10:30 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motarclaim@illcom.sg>

Ce: bhlim@progauto.com 5g; 'Peiwen PROGAUTO' <peiwen@progauto.com.sg>; progauto @ progauto.com.sg
Subject: TP CLAIMS_PROGRESSIVE_GBGA4362T & SHC1544E_DOA:19/07/2018_EST 5588.50

Importance: High

Dear Sir
Please refer to attached and advise OIC.
Did your insured reported?

Kindly advise the liability for the case above.



| & A -
GBG 4362 T (online-video-cutter.com)
2018:-07-18 12/60. 41 (M=

Regards,

Leong. Keat. Soo

(Claims Advisor)

Email: lksoo@progauto.com.sg

Tel: 6741 5336

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This emuil is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this

6



message or any delay in delivery which mayv arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment,
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be cutirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability {or any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claimn to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data. sharing vour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

[T you are not the person for whom this ¢-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake. please delete it immediuicly and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for uny errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which (.ay arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pe Lud.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

wWe
[l:l.l.'l“ SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Casa | Notified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad) Rpt Ad| Submitted | Ins Authed Status
| ' 31 2018 Pending for Survey
| a2 Aug 2018 Horsd $$450.00 $3450.00 s
| kit Estimates | | view mot | Concel Case |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by insurer]

Ingured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Re=g No.: 1993038218

Main _
Clamant: | IFEIS.,  Co.Reg. No.: 53241650k

Vehicle Reg.
Mo, |

Clalm Type:

19/07/2018 13:00 - :59
[11 Months and 11 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r]]

MCOMOD1E (Third Party Dnly )

il:l-ubed' Loss:

PolicyCover
| Note No.:

Palicy Nao,
(Claimant):

[E::u.r.
Progressive Automative Pte Lid (HQ) BLK 30224 UB] ROAD | #01-45/46,, (MB716 bl - Tel:
India International Insurance Pte Ltd (MQ) - Tel: 63478100 ... [Handled by Sundarl Nagarajan - 5347 6071]

GBG4362T

TP / MCT1BD70957

SHC1544E VCA/P1969653

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288
LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by XING GUO QIANG] ... [Final Rpt due 11/09/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

view Al |  Compose Case man |
« 111_SG (D8/11/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - GBGA362T - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagara...

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—

Due Date Priority Type
No resylis

View All | Search Tasks | Create New Tass | Compiet= |
Handler Assigned By Completed On

Task Group Subject

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp... 14/11/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*GBG4362T (MCT18070957)
[SHC1544E]
™
LIFE IS ...
Jul 19 2018 1:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]

Page 1 of 2

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd
Upload Documents | Uplad photos | Compose New Latter | View [View m Browser | v |
'Video 1 i)
im: [Finalired On Progressive Car Care Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
L |20/07/18 14:00 mmh r 0 | Losa M
\Photos/Images Jperpage  [w]| M
(No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
{1 |05/09/1820:15 | General View 0 | e | A
2 |05/09/1820:15 | General View 0 | Lesdwc |
3 |0S/09/18 20:15 | Genersl View O | waows | 4
4 |DS/08/18 20:15 | General View 0| wews | A
5 |05/09/18 20:15 | General View 0 | sdws | A
6 |06/00/18 20:15 | General View 0| wawws | A
7 |05/09/1820:15 | General View ©  towws |
8 |0S/06/18 200115 | General View [ i BETTTE |
5 |05/09/1B20:15 | General View 0! oatws | A
10 |05/09/18 20:15 | General View 0D wadrws | 4
11 |05/09/18 20:15 | General View @ | saaws | B4
12 |05/09/1B 20015 | Genersl View 0| s | A
13 [05/09/18 20:15 | General View 0| oadws | A
14 |05/09/18 20:15 | General View 0D | wsaws | A
15 |05/09/18 20:15 | General View D | edwc | A
16 |05/09/18 20:15 | General View D | wadwrs | A
17 |05/09/1820:15 | Odomater Reading D | weaws | A
18 |D5/09/18 20:15 | Chassis Numbar | wceawc | A
Documentation i:_m i B
Mo |Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
! [21/08/18 14:43 | Singapors Accidant Statemant -1V © | Loadpor
No |Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 |05/08/18 09:05 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED 0 | cedror
Linked Accident Report Documents
View [view in Browser | v
hm 1 per page vl BA
He |Finalized On Progressive Car Care Pis Lid (HQ) Thismbnail | Print
1 |20/07/18 14:00 | Video - Accident 0 | Load mra
Assessment Reports - 1 per w1 B
No  [Finalized On Progressive Car Care Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumitnail | Print
't 20/07/18 34:10 | Accident Statement O | o
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Video tperpage V]| 64
| Progressive Thumbnall| Primt
G 5T B T e O |
13 l2o007/18 14115 Accident Statement Addm. &1 0 | iosd M
4 |24/10/1812:25 | Addendum Shest © | wawrs |
24/10/16 12:25 | Accident Statement Addm. 2 [ B
Photos/Images 3 ~l 4
Mo | Finaled On Progressivs Car Care Pte Ltd (HGQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 20/07/18 14:10 Accident Photo _! Load PG E
2 |20/07/18 14110 | Accident Photo O | drs | &
3 |20/07/18 14:10 | Accident Photo 0| waws | A
4 |20/07/18 14:10 | Accident Photo 0 | sdres | A
5 |20/07/18 1410 | Accident Photo O | wwaws | A
Documentation 1 per page 'El [~}
Mo | Finalized On Progressive Car Care Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall| Peint/
L |20/07/18 13:58 | Sketch Plan Q| wauws | A
2 20/07/18 13:56 | Sketch Plan #2 O | wwews | 4
3 |I0/07/18 14:17 | POLICE REPORT s Load TIF
4 20/07/18 14:12 | POLICE REPORT Load TIF
'S |20/07/18 14:12 | POLICE REPORT O | s | @
& | 20/07/18 14:12 | Common Statement 0 | wadws | A
7  |20/07/18 14:12 Individual Statement 0 | Ldwc | A
8 w0812 |a O [ et
9 |20/07/18 14:12 | DRIVER 1C/DL O | eews | B
10 |20/07/18 14:17 | DRIVER IC/OL © | tcdws | A

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

mlmlmun

There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

W
Show Remarks an:_ﬁ Handling Insurer
Hess: Bamarhs e privale wnless you shos it o other parties.
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Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg ne 1ses071s8m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page 1 of 4

Our File No: CCa/lINBO15827/GUA3C2
Data: 141172018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Inlermnational Insurance Pla Lid ~ Policy No: MCOMDO18
Clalmant Vehicle GpGassaT Insured Vehicle No: SHC1544E
Date of Loss: 18/0772018 Malure of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT1B070857
RIFTION & IDENTIFI | F |
Reg No: GBG43l62T
Make & Model: FIAT DOBLO, 1.6 D CARGO MJ (M) Engine No: 198A30008100650
Reg. Dale DA/08/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: ZFA26300006G96062
Colour: Grey Odometer: 35054 km
Engine Capacity 1598 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla), Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 185/60 R16
Front Left Side Pirelli 6 mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 8 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli & mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli & mm
The abiove valuss represent I remaining lyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous |lems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 550,00 450.00 100.00 18.18
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 550.00 450.00 100.00 18.18
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 3850 31.50 7.00 18.18
Nett Amount (S§) 588.50 481.50 107.00 18.18
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 31/08/2018
Date Inspectad: 0/08/2018 Inspecied Al Pr Automaotive Ple Lid (HQ)
BLK 3022A UBI ROAD 1 #01-45/46,
Singapore 048716
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG

Manager: THIN THIN HLAING

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 14/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This report regreseniz our findings al the lime and place of inspection sialed harein. Such inspection has been carmiod out o the best of owr
Imowiedge and abilty but mny oty inbility under any ather circumstances i@ heneby expressly axciuded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: {Last Synchronised: 14 Nov 2018}

Parts: NIA FIAT DOBLO 1.6 D CARGO MJ (M) (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for GBG4362T)

Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the las! estimate page

Further Info: llemsivalues nol in reference catalogue are prefived with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

Thare are no new parts selected.
[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out,
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour tems
1 TO KNOCK OUT DENTS ,REMOVE ,REPLACE ACCIDENT New 150.00 100.00
PARTS
2 TO RESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS Mew 400.00 350.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5§) 550.00 450.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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