Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: may jean lee <mayjeanlee@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 January 2019 10:46 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

€Ec: kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015867/Ufb3; Your Veh: SLU 90425
Hi Poh Kin,

Please proceed to settle via insurance.
Thanks.

Regards,
May Jean

On Mon, 7 Jan 2019 at 4:54 PM, Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@]Jkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015867/Ufb3

Your Veh: SLU 9042S

Dear Mr Don/ Ms May Jean,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLU 9042S AND SLA 7201T ON 24/08/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our surveyor after inspection of the claimant’s vehicle had managed to reduce the
cost of repair as below, and proposed quantum of private settlement is as below:-

Amount Amount
Claimed Revised
1. Cost of Repair $ 3,116.70 (before gst) $ 866.70 ($810.00 + 7% GST)
2. Loss of Rental $ 278.00 (2 days x $  214.00 ($2 days x $100.00)+7%
$130.00)+7%gst gst
3. GIA search fee $ 2.00 $ 2.00
Total | $ 3,396.70 $ 1.082.70




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 January 2019 4:54 PM

To: 'kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg’; ‘'may jean lee'

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015867/Ufb3; Your Veh: SLU 90425

Attachments: TP Estimate-Marked.pdf; P8300048.jpg; P8300050.jpg; P8300051.jpg; P8300052.jpg;

P8300057.jpg; P8300058 jpg; P8300070.jpg; P8300071.jpg; P8300072.jpg;
P8300074 jpg; P8300075.jpg; P8300076.jpg; P8300078 jpg; P8300079 jpg;
P8300081.jpg; TP LOD_SLA 7021T.pdf

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015867/Ufb3
Your Veh: SLU 9042S

Dear Mr Don/ Ms May Jean,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLU 9042S AND SLA 7201T ON 24/08/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our surveyor after inspection of the claimant’s vehicle had managed to reduce
the cost of repair as below, and proposed quantum of private settlement is as below:-

Amount Amount
Claimed Revised
1. Cost of Repair S 3,116.70 (before gst) S 866.70(5810.00 + 7% GST)
2. Loss of Rental S 278.00 (2 days x $ 214.00 (52 days x $100.00)+7%
$130.00)+7%gst gst
3. GIA search fee S 2.00 S 2.00
Total | $ 3,396.70 S 1,082.70

$$1,082.70 + $342.40(survey fee $320.00+7%gst) = $ 1,425.10

Please confirm if you would like to settle the matter privately or will let Insurance settle the claim within 3
days from the date of this email.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)
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ELERER WY Sqve the Larthe Print omly when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

1



read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 2:14 PM

To: 'may jean lee' <mayjeanlee@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015867/Ufb3; Your Veh: SLU 90425
Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015867/Ufb3
Your Veh: SLU 9042S

Dear Ms May Jean,

We refer to the above matter.

Thank you for your prompt reply.

Please be informed that our standard Survey fee is $320.00 before gst.

Please confirm if you would like to settle the matter privately or will let Insurance settle the claim.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

ZLERER W Spve the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: may jean lee [mailto:mayjeanlee @gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 1 January 2019 10:35 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015867/Ufb3; Your Veh: SLU 90425

Hi Poh Kin,

Thank you for your reply. I am currently away from Singapore and do not have access to my phone.

May I know roughly how much is the surveyor fee?



