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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner 1D: 75317
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: YN9476G
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended De-registration Date: 30 Aug 2018
Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI

Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:

CANTER FEB21ER4SDEB (CBU)
White

Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: 4P10B81241
Chassis No.: FEB21EA10360
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $28,557.00
Original Registration Date: 25 Sep 2015
First Registration Date: 25 Sep 2015
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $1,428.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 24 Sep 2025
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $5,283.00

COE Rebate Amount: $3.734.00

Total Rebate Amount: $3,734.00

Page 1 of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Aug 2018

OK

1

https:/vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput ?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 30-Aug-18



CHENG MOTOR WORK CO

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE.6 #01-83
SINGAPORE 417883
Tel:65551185/6 Fax:65551184

H/P: 96713335 P_, R4 /
E-mail:chengmaotor27@yahoo.com Ly
_.——'—'_'_'-_.-F-
i i~
FWD Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. 30/8/2018 266

6 Temasek Boulevard
#18-01 Suntec Tower Four
Singapore 038986

Attn: motor claims Dept

_Estimante Cost of repair vehicle no: YN 9476G

Front Signal lamp R/h
Front side lamp
Front side garnish
Front bumper side
Front step garnish

A€ e 26600
A 22200 ¢
#1 50600
€n7 34100 _—

~ 1 £13.00
?' (fz, St k’

$1948.00
Le:jytﬁ;ﬁ 194.80
§1753.20
To check wiring 2000 Yo
Labour for knocking, replaced of Parts 300.00 -J—(FZ)
To spray paint on front door, side garnish 500.00 3 f O
Total $2593.20
= f)«%ﬁz/ﬁ/
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd conegne 1sssazises

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
]

408933
Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@ikkauto.com assignments{@kkaulo.com
T FWD Singapore Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
8 Temasek Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#18-01 Suntac Towar 4 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapare D38086 Singapore 408833
Attn Josey Loh Date: 31 Aug 2018

Preliminary Advice
Insured Vehicle No ~ FBM1794T

TP Vehicle No CYNB4TEG Accident Date 28/08/2018
Make MITSUBISHI CANTER Assignment Date 30/08/2018
Date of Inspection  : 30/08/2018 Est Duration of Repair 2 days
Inspection At Cheng Motor Work Co. (HQ)

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-83

Singapore 417883

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages ....O/S front.. portion and parts claimed are consistant to the accident

Repairar's Estimate (Gross) 55 258320
Revised Amount 5% 1.135.25
Check ltems (Estimated) 55 0.00
Total 8% 1,13525
Lurmp Sum Repair 55

Total Loss Consideralion

New for Old Valus 5%
Pre-Accident Value 5%
COE / PARF Rebate 5%
Salvage Value ‘5%
Margin for Repair 11

Remarks

{ |  The vehicle is repairable al our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authorisation,

{ ) Thevehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite lender for the wreck

{ X ) Other comments  We have not authorzed repairs.



CHENG MOTOR WORK CO

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01.83 AutoBay® Kaki Bukit
SINGAFORE 417883
TEL: 5?411336.55551 185 FAX:655511R4

SFA N & DISC v

I/We hereby declare that the repairs 1o my/our Vehicle Na/\/fi} ‘}% ; C/E E has been completed to the amount

of 53 [Dallars) Paid/payable 1o Cheng Motir
—_— ———
Work Co for such FEQairs is in full discharge of my/our claims under Policy/0) imNo,

In respact of the damages causad |n the accident which oczurred on '? day of :S)Z.;"U
—_— x_&

Date; Signature:




Print Received Message

This mail Is assoctaled with .

*YMNE4TEG (1201800010924)
[FBM1794T]
™

M/S RUI GE ENTERPRISE (S) PTE LTD
Aug 28 2018 B:00AM
[KWOK HWA HWA]
Cheng Motor Work Co.

From FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) (FWD_SG), sent on 09/11/2018 17:27 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (551423.20) - YN9476G - Claim Handler: Clara Li ZI Rong

Approved:1423.20.




Nivitha (LKK Autuz

From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 5:45 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com: admin-
d@lkkauto.com

Cc motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: Our ref: RN kt.0048.15.V6 / ACCIDENT ON 28.8.2018 INVOLVING YN 9476G

AND FBM 1794T ALONG UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD AFTER JUNCTION DAIRY
FARM ROAD (FWD Ref: PNMC2017-00000819-01)

Attachments: 0048,15.pdf

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the attached and liaise with TP repairer for PRS.

Please create the case in Merimen.

Thank you.

Find Regards

losey Lah

Executive, Claims

FWOD Singapare Pte, Ltd.
& Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)6727 5872
E joseyloh@fwd.com

W fwd.com.sg

FWD

insurance

WiTh TW D, you get in narp il
ST HCD hor Life Mo mustter wiial

P g N L S -

From: Tan Lay Keng [mailto:singlaw@singnet.com.sg|

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August, 2018 5:36 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Subject: RE: Our ref: RN.kt.0048.15.V6 / ACCIDENT ON 28.8.2018 INVOLVING YN 9476G AND FBM 17947 ALONG
UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD AFTER JUNCTION DAIRY FARM ROAD (FWD Ref: PNMC2017-00000819-01)

Dear Sirs

We are instructed by our client to request you 1o appoint LKk Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to contact Mr Alan Tan aof
Cheng Mator Work Company to arrange for the joint pre-repair survey

i



Best Regards
Tan Lay Keng & Co

From: motorclaims sa@fwd,.com ; ' fwd.

Sent: Wednesday, August 29, 2018 2:55

To:

Cc:

Subject: RE: Our ref: RN.kt.0048.15.V6 / ACCIDENT ON 28.8.2018 INVOLVING YN 9476G AND FBM 1794T ALONG
UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD AFTER JUNCTION DAIRY FARM ROAD (FWD Ref: PNMC2017-00000819-01)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,
We refer to your letter dated 29 August 2018 of the PRI Notice of your client’s vehicle YNS476G.

Please find our panel surveyors as follows: -
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE

AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD
Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
VICOM Ltd

S )

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we reserve our rights to request for pre-repair inspection of your client's
vehicle.

We look forward to receiving your reply.
Thank you.

*Please note that we do not accept fax. Hence, please send in any correspondences related to Mator Claims via e-

mail te motorclaims.sq@fwd.com. Thank you.

Kind Regards
losey Lok
Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pre. Ltd.
b Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 03R986

T (b65)6727 5872
E losey loh@fwd.c
W fwd.com.sg

FWD

insurance

e W yew gt fe beap Yol
SO NCD Far L'y, Mo rmatbar winas

1 Gt Somtd e




From: Tan Lay Keng [mailto:singlaw @si t.com.s

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August, 2018 2:42 PM

To: Motor Claims 5G - SG Common

Subject: Our ref: RN.kt.0048.15.V6 ACCIDENT ON 28.8.2018 INVOLVING YN 9476G AND FEM 17947 ALONG UPPER
BUKIT TIMAH ROAD AFTER JUNCTION DAIRY FARM ROAD

Motor Claims Department
We enclose herewith a copy of a letter dated 29 August 2018 for your attention.

Best Regards
Tan Lay Keng & Co

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However. you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed, If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However. you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments,
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Advocates & Solicitors * Commissioners for Oatlis # Notaries Public * Trade Mark et

Tan Lay Keng 115 qiwnsl, ('t 1T1 North Bridge Road
#1410 Peninsula PMlaza
Singa pore 170008

Tel 6318 2388, 4318 113D
Fax: 6338 3710

Your Ref: UEN No, 531312621

Raymond Y.E Ng 0 i 08 8 ey

Our Rel: RN KLOO48.15.V6
29 August 2018

Mator Claims Department BY EMAIL: maotorelaims.sga fwd.com
IFWD Insurance Singapore Pre Lid & HAND

6 lemasek Boulevard

#418-01 Suntec Tower Four

Singapore (138986

Desr Sirs

ACCIDENT ON 2882018 INVOLVING YN 94760 AND FBM 17997 ALONG
UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD AFTER JUNCTION DAIRY FARM ROAD

We are mstructed by the owner of YN 9476G.
You are the insurers of motor vehicle No. FBM 17947

We are instructed 1o give you 48 hours® Notice for the pre-repair inspection under NIMA
protocol of the damage 1o our client’s car before any repairs are carried oul.

Our client’s car may be inspected ot Cheng Motor Work Company at | Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-83 Singapore 417883, Contact person: Mr Alan Tan Tel: 6555 1185/9671 3335

You KW/}:‘;\I}JI}'

ce client



CHENG MOTOR WORK CO

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE.6 #01-83
SINGAPORE 417883
Tel:65551185/6 Fax:65551184
H/P: 96713335
E-mail:chengmotor27@yahoo.com

FWD Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. 16/10/2018
& Temasek Boulevard

#18-01 Suntec Tower Four

Singapore 038986

Attn: motor claims Dept

Accident involving YN9476G/FBM 17947
We are instructed to claim the following.

1 Cost of repair (part by part) $935.75
2 Loss of Use 2 days x 5200 400.00
3 Loss of use provided under NIMA protocol 2days  400.00
4 LTA enquiry fee ___ 7145
Total $1743.20




Your Ref
Date  : ¢ lp‘s/l?ﬁlq
Motor Claims Department
LETTER OF AUTHORITY

wnﬁf_@%u%ﬁmegm ZISZ/Z  owmercf
Vehicle no. 74 ) _hereby authorized M/S Cheng Motor Work Co

tonwideﬁr?niaiﬂs&ﬁmmmywﬂh&ngmuﬁdcmmﬂmm all further
Correspondence should be addressing to | Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #0]-83 Singapore 417883

I'We hereby authorized the cheque payment to be issued in favor of M/S Cheng Motor Work Co

Owner’s Signature

Name

NRIC

Withness by
Nk .___TAN LYE HOCK

$1543605)

NRIC

Date : agé/g////?ijﬁ




ELEAS

Claim Reference: 1201800010924
Surveyor's Reference: | CC4/FWD18015865/Uea3
TP Reference; YN 94766

We, CHENG MOTOR WORK CO. (" Workshop”) hereby agree and confirm that we are authorized by
the owner ["Claimant”) of motar vehicle YN 94766 (“Vehicle”) to accept the sum of $1,423.20, being the
amount claimed for $935.75 (repair costs), $480.00 (lnss of sestal/ use), § - (loss of income|, $7.45 (search
fees) as compensation for the loss of o damage to the Vehicle, as a result of an accident (“Accident” ] which

occurred on 28/08/2018 (date of accident) at / along UPPER BUKIT TIMAH RD AFTER JUNC DAIRY FARM RD
(location] involving vehicle no/s. YN 9476G and FBM 17947

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 30/08/2018 (date) at the Workshop.

We confirm that this acceptance is in full and final settlement of all claims arising from the damage to
the Vehicle (whether now or hereafter to become manifest), to the intent that FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. and
all other persons, in particular the driver of EBM 17947 be absolutely and finally exonerated and discharged
from all claims of every nature and kind whatsoever which have been made or which may be made in respect
of this Accident

We also declare that we are sutharized by the Claimant to receive the above compensation and we
have full authority to make the claim as set out above and to s&ttle the matter on behalfl of the Claimant in

any manner we desm fit.

This settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis. As such, this
Release is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of FWD Singapore Pte Ltd, their
policyholder and / or authorised driver and shall not be used as evidence in any claims and / or action which
may be lodged by any of them.

Dated this ﬁ day of A/t I'-/zma
wm

L
W
[
t#ﬂiﬁ*_ 1'r CKS

— -

OR&

[Signed by the “Workshop® with Co. Stamp] [FWD's appainted surveyor with Co. Stamp)
For and on behalf of the “Claimant” For and on behalf of FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd,



CHENG MOTOR WORK CO

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE.6 #01-83
SINGAPORE 417883
Tel:65551185/6 Fax:65551184
H/P: 95713335
E-mail:chengmotor27@yahoo.com

FWD Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. 16/10/2018
b Temasek Boulevard

#1B8-01 Suntec Tower Four

Singapore 038986

Attn: motor claims Dept

Cost of repair vehicle no: YN 9476G

To supply and labour for repaired/Paintwork
Part by Part $935.75
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Direet Settlement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cane Motified | Est Submitted Ad) Assigned Agd| Rpt Agd] Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
31 Aug 2018 29 Aug 3018 | gegug 75 $$935.75 ""'""'"'m. i for ey,
e £t pase Eait Extimates | | view Rpt |
ey Eclit Ad Rpt I Ret Cancel Cass I

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
insurea: KWOK HWA WWA, 1D0: 582312601

M/§ RUI GE ENTERPRISE (S) PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 2007075312

. |28/08/2018 08:00 - :59
YN9476G Date of Loss: [3% Manths and 3 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

TP / 1201800010924 ::'"-’E_“’“‘-' PHMC2017-00000819-01 (Comprehensive)

Folicy No.
FEM1794T {Claimant): DMCVSNINGTTRITOZ

~ Excess: .
Motor Work Co. (WQ) | KAKI BUKTT AVE & #01-83, 417883 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 65551185/6, 67411336, 67472350

| FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ... [Handied by Clars Li Zi Rong)

China Taiping Insurance | Singapora) Pte. Lid. (HQ) - Tel: 5389 6111
LXK Auto Consultants Pt Ltd (HQ) - Teli 6256-3561 ... [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 10/09/2018]

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compese Case mai |
» FWD_SG (09/11/2018); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$14323.20) - YNS476G - Clalm Handier: Clars Ui Z1 ...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tosks | Create new Task | Compiese |

Due Date  Prierity Type Task Group  Subject Handler  Asaigned By Completed On Crested On  Done? |
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 22/11/2018
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Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*YN9476G (1201800010924)

[FBM1794T]
L

M/S RUI GE ENTERPRISE (S) PTE LTD

Aug 28 2018 B:00AM
[KWOK HWA HWA]

Cheng Motor Waork Co.
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Documentation 1 per page E [
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https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do... 22/1 112018
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|\“Ihil:ll No: FEM1794T (insd veh) Model: ITSUBISHI CANTER 3.0D
YNO4TEG (TP veh) B21ER4SDEB (CBU) (M)

| Date of Accident: | 28/08/2018

Global Sum Settiement || [ ] Yes | [X] No

Repar Estimate '8 2,593.20

Final Repair Cost $ 8935.75

Loss of Usa $ 480.00 4,00 days at $120.00 per day
Rental (if any) 3 0.00 days

LTA J GIA Search Fesa ] T45

Others: - 0.00

b
Final Settlement Sum - 1,423.20

|s Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? | ] YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Mon GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

) For GiA Registered Wor Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable

BOLA Liahility: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assassed Liability to be filled only for chain coliisions and for cases whare BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payes's Breakdown

1) | Cheng Motor Work Co s 1,42320
2) 8
3) r
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN zgnr:gu
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents o the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 22/11/2018
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co regno 1sssc71ses)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408533
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No:  CC4/FWD1B015865/UEA3QZ

Date: 221112018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: FWD Singapore Ple. Lid.  Policy No PNMC2017-00000818-01
Claimant Vehicle vng476G Insured Vehicle No : FBM1794T
Date of Loss Z28/08/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 1201800010824
F
Reg No: YNG4T6G
Make & Model :-:ﬂr;fEUEISHI CANTER, 3.0 D FEB21ER4SDEB (CBU) Engine No: 4P10B81241
Reg. Date: 25/08/2015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis Nao: FEB21EA10360
Colour: White Odometer: 158953 km
Engine Capacity: 2908 co
Market Value/Mew Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
R
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185 R15 Rear Tyre Size; 185 R15 (D)
Front Left Side: Goodyear 6§ mm Rear Laft Side: Goodyear 6/8 mm
Front Right Side Goodyear 6 mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear B8 mm
The above values represen! the remaining fyre ireads dapth
(COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Differance  Diff %)
Parts 1,753.20 255.75 1,487.45 B85.41
Miscellaneous ltlems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 840.00 680.00 160.00 19.05
Pantwork Labour 0,00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (5§) 2,503.20 93575 1,657.45 63.92
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x 55120.00/day) (55) 480.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 745
Nett Liability (58) 142320
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 29/08/2018
Date Inspected: 30/08/2018  Inspected AL Cheng Motor Wark Co, (HQ)
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-83
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 22/11/2018
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong Y

NOTE: This report reprasants our findings af the time and place of napection stated herein Such inapection has been camed ouf fo the best of aur
knowledge and abily but any ofher listiity under any ofher circumatances (s hereby sxpressly sxciuded.

https:ﬂsingapure.m:ﬁmm.cunﬁclainwindﬂ.cﬁn?ﬁ:scbnx=MTRndjust¢r&fuscactinn=gen... 22/11/2018
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 29 Oct 2018)

_Pl-l‘tu: MIA MITSUBISHI CANTER 3.0 D FEBZ1ER4SDEE (CBU) (M) (Model not available in database)

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code; (Unsubmitted, no pnni-code for YNS4TEG)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last esimate page

[Further Info: itemsAvalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 “FRONT SIGNAL LAMP R/H (CRACKED] Mot Consistent With The Impact 266.00 FL *FL
2 1 *FRONT SIDE LAMP Not Necessary 222 00FL “FL
3 1 *FRONT SIDE GARNISH Repair 506,00FL “FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE Cut 341.00FL *341.00FL
5 1 *FRONT STEP GARNISH Nol Necessary 613.00FL *FL

F=Franchisa part. L=ListliemDisc
Sub Total (S$) 1,948.00 341.00

- List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/25.00% (S5%) 194.80 8525

Total Parts (S§) 1,753.20 25575

[ Report was unsubmitied during this prini-out. |

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 22/11/2018
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous itoms selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO CHECK WIRING MNew 40.00 20.00

2 LABOUR FOR KNOCKING ,REPLACED OF PARTS Mew 300.00 280.00

3 TO SPRAY PAINT ON FRONT DOOR ,SIDE GARNISH New 500.00 380.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) B840.00 680.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 22/11/2018



