Jux Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 1:59 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau; Janice Yeoh ; Jess Kong;
KkLau

Subject: REF: SNM18D04157C02/2 - FOR MANDATE / PC 3532G ON 27.08.2018 / SM SPRAY
SKE 68247

LKK REF: CCE/CTI18015706/Aja3
CTI REF: SNM18D04157C02/2 (PC3532G)

Dear Joy Irene
We refer to your email and reminder pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $6,806.00.
Aside to Catherine, please assist to follow up on the Section Il Excess recovery for the sum of 51,500.00
Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel {65) 6389 6183
Fax {65) 6224 7478
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com
Disclaimer :
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a wrinten agreement berween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd, Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited [f you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediarely.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 January, 2015 8:14 PM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred. toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: REF: SNM18D04157C02/2 - FOR MANDATE / PC 3532G ON 27.08.2018 / SM SPRAY 5KE 6824T

REF: SNM18D04157C02
LKK REF: CCh/CTI118015706/Aja3

Dear Sirs,
We would like to follow-up on your mandate approval.

Kindly advise.

Thank you,



‘Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 11:12 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Cc: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg cntaiping.com=>; Admin A

<admin-a@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: REF: SNM18D04157C02 - FOR MANDATE / PC 3532G ON 27.08.2018 / SM SPRAY SKE 6824T

REF: SNM18D04157C02
LKK REF; CC6/CTI18015706/Aja3
Dear Sirs,

This is a front-to-rear scenario whereby our insured vehicle was behind. BOLA 27.-100% Liability is down
against us.

Insured agreed to settle and aware of NCD issue.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s SM SPRAY PAINTING is as follows:

Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference.
The above summary is subject for your approval.

Kindly advise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene @lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
2



Ju! Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LEKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 8:55 AM

To: chan pick yuen; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: SKE6824T & PC3532G DOA 27.08.2018 LKK REF CC6/CTI18015706/Aja3

Attachments: GIA Report.pdf, RENTAL AGREEMENT.JPG; SCENEJPEG; INVOICE.JPG; RENTAL
INVOICE.JPG

Without Prejudice

Dear Joy,

Our ref: CCA/CTI18015706/Aja3

FYMNA please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥F LSES o

ALZREZn WU Spue the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, 20 October, 2018 4:48 PM

To: Admin A

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: SKE6824T & PC3532G DOA 27.08.2018

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our invoice , LOA , GIA , Rental agreement with bill & scene photo.
Please advise OIC & claim no .
As request following :

1. RC 56206 ( $5800+ 7% GST )
2. LOR $880 ( $176 X 5 DAYS -4 DAYS recommend + 1 DAY waiting PRS + 1 day weekend )

@ 100% ( direct from behind with scene photo )



TOTAL S 7086/-.

* Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

S M SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD
HP; 92712214



¥ . Auto
Consuttants
Ple Lid

S UBRIAVE 1 #01-25 PAY A UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEI (651 62363500 FAX @ (065167414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18015706/Aja3
06 SEPTEMBER 2018

LONGLIM PTE LTD
34 JALAN TARI PIRIG
JALAN KAYU ESTATE
SINGAPORE 799187

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 3532G AND SKE 6824T ON 27/08/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Joy Irene
C andler
DID: 6841 2409

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: jovirenef lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
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5 M SPHAY PAINTING
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Accident on — —
Invab ing Vehicle Mo SKG L? 1'1(7 i PC 3‘3' 3 2 6 -—
Abong, _51’? K‘d Dﬁ EVFQ_W‘(,-L -

| Wi the registered owner 'deiver of vehicle registration ne. ;ﬁE Gq E g_ —

have mvolved m the abose BoCidem

I We hereby authorise WS S M SPRAY PAINTING w0 commcnoc repant™ ol the sand wehiche forthwah

I W sigree 1o assien the whole proccesds of my/ oul compreRcRsive el prares < Maion Ber yoks aned o

(TR T = 1o act on vy o behalt i reapedt of the above
wniier, And il applacable. nry ou solicitory shall accept this a8 my ‘our i voscabie authaority 1o pay
the w45 deemed compensated direct to vou afier deduction of their costs on @ solicwor and
chiem bisn

I Wi undertake 10 co-operate fully with vou and our solicilors 10 ensure that Clag successiul

| ‘W alse suthoriesr sou 1o sign all discliange vou hers mndemunity forms and all Becew-ary pRpeTs in
relatson with the above claim in my our absence

Yarur kind co-operatien i this matier will be mac uppresialed
Phank vou

Yours truly
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MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Foliey Mo : DMBEISHNIOZ1791800 Claim Wo : SHM1BDO4157COZ
Claimant H SEE BENG HWEE
Amount ¢ S8%,700.00

ETNGAFORE DOLLARE =IX THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDEED OHLY.

I/ agres to ascapt the-above mantioned gmount E6 Be Paic to me/us in full g
final sectlement of all cleims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
gustained by me/us through an aceident involving

Claimant Vehicle Wo, : SKEE GE24T

Insurad Vehicle No. : PC 35320

Date af Loss £ 2700872018

Plare of hocident : SLIF ROAD TO EXPO DRIVE

IN COMSIDERATION of the. payment made to me/us of che aforementisnsd sum by
CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agre= absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. andfor

Insured Name : LONGLIM PTE LTD
CDriver Mame ! ONG GUAN HOE

from all claims, present or futurs in raspact of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admissies of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPGRE) PTE. LTD.

(1} Glokal Sum 55 6,700,008
P LA ey S et
TOPRL: comcecn & @ 8 5 Qs 5 o % oSS G, 700 .00

?
Claimant Hame : &E %{“j HME HRIC HNo : M

[ :
Signature ¢ pare o W20

A




2017

g M SPRAY PAINTING

BLOCK 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #08-30 SYN ERGY @ KB Singapore 417800
Tel: 6384 1755/1766 Fax: 6384 1744

TAX INVOICE

SEE BENG HWEE Date: 20-Oct-18

25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 GST Reg.No: M90370396N
#08-30 SYNERGY @KB .
Singapore 417800

Accident date: 27™ AUGUST 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SKE6824T MERCEDES BENZ E250

‘Descriptions AMOUNT
ump Sum repair cost as recommended by $5,800.00

KK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

S/DLRS: SIX THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED SIX ONLY
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25 Wkl Bukil Rioad &, £00-30 Synery@KB Siagapore 417800
Tl 0384 1766, HP BB 6348 Fax B384 17484
Business Reg No: 201437044C
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§ M CAR RENTAL PTELTD
@SN e
AL Lp 9822 8246 /9731 7938 OMice: 6384 1755 Fax 6384 1744
Co Reg No_ 201437044C

Sales Invoice
ml: Lo Telimg
i = Invoice No: SMORO0O1L7
S - Tooar s Date: 27/8/2018
Description Unit Price ($) | Amount (55)
LITERES) Car Rental For the Persd of;
SRAD B

17/0R 201N - 31082018

Sub Total| SA80.00
Liess: Daposit sa.00

[y rp—— 4 snd e guaruivie 15 5 M Car Rawtal P Lid”

LICHS Bank 3503051870




