Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August, 2018 5:17 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: LOD AGAINST AXA - ACCIDENT ON 26/10/2016 INVOLVING YP2901G & GBE5492E
Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please refer to our conversation on 27/06/2018.

Please revert with your settlement offer by 04/09/2018.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok/sparkcarcare/cdge/delgronotes

To: admin-a@lkkauto.com

Date: 27/06/2018 04:35 PM

Subject: Fw: LOD AGAINST AXA - ACCIDENT ON 26/10/2016 INVOLVING YP2901G & GBE5492E

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

This matter has been long protracted. Please revert with your offer without further delay.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok/sparkcarcare/cdge/delgronotes
To: admin-a@lkkauto.com



Date: 29/11/2017 02:01 PM
Subject: LOD AGAINST AXA - ACCIDENT ON 26/10/2016 INVOLVING YP2901G & GBE5492E

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam
Attached our LOD dated 29/11/17 for your attention.[attachment "img-Y29140629.pdf" deleted by Cecilia
Lee Peng Geok/sparkcarcare/cdge/delgronotes]

Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843



