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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear George,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Monday, 3 September 2018 11:21 AM

‘Claims Dept’; SUR

RE: RE : OD claim for SDS 9809 C-DOA: 22/8/2018

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDS 9809C (Excess $1600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company

before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 4:48 PM
To: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: RE : OD claim for SDS 9809 C-DOA: 22/8/2018

Dear George,

We are pending approval from AIG.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims

remiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 3:36 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims Dept' <claim

remiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE : OD claim for SDS 9809 C-DOA: 22/8/2018



Dear Ms. Veron,
Any updates for the above mentioned vehicle?
Thank you,

Best Regards,
GEOFEE WGng
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (peg se taosazzriwg

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Qo

The all=-new Audi Q2 !

#untaggable |

Emall Disclaimer
This email, Including any artack
I vt

Please do nol copy it or use it for any purp

| nave received it inermg mediatehy b

or any attachment to any othe

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 1:33 PM

To: "Veron Chen (LKKAuto)'; 'SUR'; 'Admin A'

Cc: 'Claims Dept'

Subject: RE: RE : OD claim for SDS 9809 C-DOA: 22/8/2018

Dear Ms. Veron,
Attached is the necessary documentation and Photos for you kind reference.
Kindly assist in OD claims approval and confirm the excess,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
George Wong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd iregne tooarmiw)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. 4656841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 155938 p. +65 6836 2223




The all-new Audi Q2

t#tuntaggable

Email Disclaimer

This emall, including any altachmend, is confidential and may afeo be privilepe

I you hawe received it in lease natify us immediately by reply il and then delete (his message from your system
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person, Thank you

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 12:14 PM

To: Claims; SUR; Admin A

Cc: 'Nora Khai'

Subject: RE: RE : OD claim for SDS 9809 C-DOA: 22/8/2018

Dear Phua,
Attached with surveyor marking.

Please forward us a copy of CI and driver’s driving licensed.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 9:18 AM

To: 'Claims' =claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: RE : OD claim for SDS 9809 C-DOA: 22/8/2018

Dear Phua,

Please forward us a copy of CI and driver’s driving licensed.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 1:09 PM

To: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: RE : OD claim for SD5 9809 C

Dear Phua,

Attachment?

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 1:06 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE : OD claim for SDS 9809 C

Good afternoon all ,
Here are the estimate of GIA report and estimate for your kind reference .
Thank you .

Best Regards,
Phua
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jueg no 19sseamiw

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408629

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 22‘23
i, J T 21 1

11
The all=-new Audi Q2 L
Huntaggable

affors

o

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sg/audi promotions/promotions/car_pr: ions/new-audi-g2-
2017.html

Email Disclaimear

ail, Including amy attachment, is confidential and may atso be privileged

If you have received it in error, please notify ws immediataby by reply i then delete this message from youwr system



/32018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
*SDS9809C (24626973845G)
oD
Aug 22 2018 9:30AM

[THONG MaAY LAL]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

| repiy | Reply an | mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Massage | Forwara |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AlG_5G), sent cn 03/09/2018 10:58 AM,
To LKK_HGQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5%10637.00) - SD59809C - Claim Handler: Loo, Tong Shing

Approved: 10637.00:Re-Iinspection to be done for damage check and suppl.e_rnent-ary i.tem:s-f.rahour.

;DDCUHEH’TS SUMMARY
There are no documents,

https.//singapore. merimen.comiclaims/index.cfm?fusebox=3VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewdmode=1&iinboxid=1346811&IDomainld=11&i0bjld=12... 172



81292018

hitps:/isingapore.meriman.com/claimsfindex.cimfusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rptmode=25&caseid=736182&extid=281171&adjcur...

Rich Text Editor, SYVCDOCIrcontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {Ca.Reg.No: 198607 198R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AlG Building
78 Shenton Way #07-16
Singapore 078120

Attn:

Vehicle No

Make

Assignment Date
Date of Inspection
Inspection At

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Date: 28 Aug 2018
Preliminary Advice
: SDS9809C Accident Date 1 22/08/2018
S AUDI A4 Policy No. : 1800017516
. 28/08/2018 Excess : 5%0.00
. 28/08/2018 Est. Duration of Repair  : 7.00

: PREMIUM AUTOMORILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

The vehicle sustained impact / damages rooftop and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Remarks

(X))

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check ltems (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

5%
S%
55
5%

55

55
5%
5%
5%
ot

14,755.00
10,637.00

600.00
11,237.00

148,000.00
69,062.00

78,938.00

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy

coverage. Kindly let us have your authorisation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

Other comments :

mn



MPEATIBT0BTET-0 | Premmism Automobiles Ple Lid -
ENTRY DATE & TIME. 23/08/2018 10:00
SUBMITTED BY: Jeffrey Tan Eng Su

1B

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleasa report CDF'E'L""!' the details of the acciden to spead up e Claims process
2. This Form nmasst be compdeled by the Poboyhalder andior the Aulhorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurale as possible, Any willul misrepresentation or witholding of matenal facts may allow insurance companies 1o

repudiate policy ability,

4, The issue and acceptance of thes Form by Insurance companies i not an admission of policy liabdity on the part of the insurance companies
5. Any talse reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

fi. This reporl will be farwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avadable upon application by inferested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this repart to the msurers, you hereby congent fo the archiving of this report at the centre and 1o copies of the reporl baing made available

aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

23/08/2018 10:00

22/08/2018 02:30

101 ¥ISHUN AVE 5 CHONG PANG CITY LOTBS CARPARK
SINGAFORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
MRIC Mo

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phane Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Ara you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state aclion to be taken
Vehicle Calegory

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

Qccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SDS9809C

THOMG BAY LA
569436911
MICES809@YAHOO.COM.SG
(LOCAL) +65-97603516
OTHERS-97603516

AUDI
A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI 8W

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

1800017516

THOMNG MAY LA
SE9436911

1211271969

INDOOR

08/11/1993

24 YEARS AND 9 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-97603516

OTHERS-97T603516
MIC2809@YAHOO.COM.SG

Page 1of 18



No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Paga 3 of 18



Sketch Plan #2

SKETCH PLAN
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Police Report

SINGAPORE WO

POLICE FORCE i

POLICE REPORT (NF2%3) CONTINUATION OF REPORT Repan No, JE018082202042

A6 about 053082 | roturiest o my car and discovered that & rougtly S-metre-ong free brareh hisd
hrakar off frar an sdacen tree and *slien or ton of my car

A3 @ rosult of the impact, the raol of my ca was dentad The framebow between the ront windecresn
ars ot left passange” sidc doar was alsc dented.

Thie faten iree nad Biso darmaged ansther velucks lyisen var| parked in Lot B8

i was raning hesvity In the vicinity sarier. Town Councl ws 8l 56300 16 assst to mmove the chslrutting
tee brarches. Police also altended 10 me

| & lgdging this mport for insureanee claim pJrposes,

|signature Of Infarmant

Offiger in- l:!w i}\‘ C.m Claesimgalion Of Casa
J | Jurang an Divisiorsal HQ |

Stafl S5t WANG ZHENXIONG

Cortact No.. BTE10000 |

i = [ g (===

Autharteaton SRR

Fage T of 18



RIZRIZ2MA

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner |0;

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Nao.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:

‘ehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Aug 2018

PARENNOFE Rahata Frmiiing

Singapore NRIC
36911

SDS9809C

Mo

28 Aug 2018

AUDI

A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI S TRONIC (NAV)
Silver

2017

CVKO50766
WAUZZZF44JAD75336
140.0 kW (187 bhp)
$£33,419.00

08 Feb 2018

08 Feb 2018

0

$38,787.00

Yes
07 Feh 2028
$2%,090.00

07 Feb 2028

B - Car above 1400cc or 97kW (130bhp)

10

$42,322.00
£39,972.00
269,062.00

nOps:vrlta. gov. sgianvrvaction/enguireepate sy rHun ICHaToreLeraginput FHUNG HION_IU=FU3uduud | |



PG AN Ama Pacif nsurancs Pie. Lid

ftsrighl

Co. Fag. Ho 20710084048 |

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder @ Thong May Lai Vehicle No. : SDS9809C

Period of Insurance : 08 Feb 2018 To 07 Feb 2019 Policy No. : 18000175186

Engine No. : CVKDS07E6 Endorsement No.

Chassis No. : WAUZZZF44.JA075336 Issued Date : 21 Feb 2018
ABOUT THE COVER
Make/Model . AUD| A4 Sedan 2.0 TFSI § trenic ?
Engine Capacity/Tonnage :© 1,984.00 CC Sum Insured : Market Value First Year of Registration ; 2018

Person ar Classes of Persons Entitled to Orive™
| a1 Tha Palcynalder

Drriver Rastriction MA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COE/PARF  : Yes i
|

wh s driving e the Policyhalier's order or wish histes permicsion
der o any A ged divvar ardy I nedshe meets the specfed age condition

| Youl haree Lo pay an il mairrs o 53,000 a3 “Young andior Inesperienced Diiver Excess® CYIDRif You are of Your Authenscd Dver (named of tinamad) i undder Fie age of 23 arcior has less
than 2 yoars anying eaperssEncs

| Age Condition All Age Condition

Limitation as to use”™
Lise oty for social, somestic and pleasurs MFPUses
This Policy does not cover uas for hire or reward, d
business of use for Sny purpcas i CORm BTN with

il for the Policyhalkdes's business
oo, g tesl, racira, pase-making, reliabity trial ar cpeed-testing, the camiage of goods other than samples In connecticn with any trade o
rade

| Loss of Use 1800cc - 2000ce Optional
* Lirndatiors rondered moperatve by Section 8 of the Mownr Vanicles (Thind-Parly Risks and Compansation) Act {Cap. 168) and Section 95 af the Road Transpart Act 1987 (Malaysia), are ned 1o be
meluded undar these headngs

Sectien 1

Fire < 0 Cwn Damage - 31600 Theh - 50 Flood Gover - 50

Saction 2 |
Propaty Damage - 30

|
|
|
| Windscreen : £100
|
I

| Named Criver and Excess (whem appicabiz]

|
| Thorg May Lai - $1600 (Own Damage)

RELATED REPAIRS)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS

1. Auds Custamar Sarvice Cesler Add; 25 Uk Aoad 7 Singapore 408899 63662323

Far other Approved Reparing CeatrasiAlG Authonsed Aepavers, please contac! sur 24-hour accident amengency holline st +65 G330 6200 Allernatively. you may rafier lo AIG websie sww.B0.COM.5]
af AKS 56 Mobide App. Simply search and dosnioad ~AKG 267 from Tunes of Goooks Play

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: MayBank J

"W Faralry carily thal he poliey 1o which This Certificate of Insurance relates 18 lBsead in accordance wam thi provisians of the Maotor Vahicles( Thd Party Risks and Compensatan] Acl {Cap. 183, Pan IV of
the Road Transpon Acl 1887 {Malaysia) and Motar Wehickes {Third Pary Risks) Rulps 1308 (Malayeia).

0504125256

PREMIUM LEASING -LSYA

281 ALEXANDBEA ROAD ALDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE —
SINGAPORE 158938 AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd.
AUTHORISED REFRESENTATIVE

Underaritten by AIG Asia Pacific Insuranca Pte, Lid. E L

G Building SO0 20 LI 3565 63418 3000 | Ex




THONG MAY LA

Ak W

CHINESE

Dite af Birtn Sex TP TR
12-12-1868 F

Cowtiry of Birth

SINGAPORE

AR

MR B60436911

Dwrtw of lapum
23-03-2008

APFT BLK 8 ROSEWDOD DRIVE #09-18
SINGAPORE 737938
56843661 ovizon4

dinesnod



YOU ARE LICENSED TC DRIVE VEHICLES IN THE FOLLOWING CLASS{ES)

PASS DATE

Class 1 Molor Cars and Motoy Tractors the waighl of 048 Hov 1993
wiiich wnksdan does nol ex ceed 2500 kilograms

T

% menmm




CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE -

AUDI AUTO PROTEGTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyhofder  : Thong May Lai Vehicle No. : SDS9809C
Period of Insurance : 08 Feb 2018 To O7 Feb 2019 Pollcy No. : 1800017516
Engine No. ; CVKO50766 Endorsement No, @
Chassis No. : WALZZZF44JA075336 Issued Date : 21 Feb 2018
ABOUT THE COVER
| Make/Modal : AUDI Ad Sedan 2.0 TFS| 5 fronic :
| Engine Capacity/Tonnaga - 1,884.00 CC Sum Insured - Market Valua First Year of Registration : 2018
| Driver Resfriction : NA Off Peak Car - Mo insuring with COE/PARF  : Yes

Person or Classes of Persens Entitled to Drive®

&) Tha Poleyholda

) Ay oEther parson whio & deiving o ihe Policyholkiersy oider of wilh hisher permiss of

Tris Puticy sill isdsmnily the Policyfaider ar ary authansed dive) only il hedane m wela thit spacifind dgi condaed

¥ 0w P W0 iy an ackdtionat suen of 53,000 a8 "Young ndior Ingxperisnced Driver Ext s DR You sre o Your Aulhorsed Drivar {named of A i nter e ago of 27 andior has kst

ey 3 yaare’ driivg o8 PR |

| |
Age Condition ; All Age Condition

Limitation as o use® | |
Ui cly o sucml, damestic arad phiasite purposes and for the Folicyhiclder's busress

This FubCy does nol cover use ior hite of rewasd, ditving huilion, droving Josl, (acng, pate-making, rekaldty gl &7 §
o8 0f W for any purpaie i conmiclion with Molor Trade

pepi-1sling, B carmage of gicds ather fhan ganiples 1 polnacion wilh any lrads of

Loss of Usa 1800cc - 2000cc Optional
| * Unbstions randestd innparaibe Iy Saction 8 of the Metar Vahicies {Thed.Party Rigks and Comparsalion) Aot {Cop 185} and Seclion 85 of (Fa Rosd Teanspur A
| inchuced nder rene hasdings

1087 (Malaysa) gré nol o B

Section 1
Fire - 10 Own Damags - $1800 Thett - S0 Fload Caver - 30

Saction 2
Property Damage - 20

Windschesn : §100

Mamed Driver and EXcess iwrere sppicabic)

Thorg May Lai - §1600 (0w Damage)

S RELATED REPAIRS)

RISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIM

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRESIAUTHO

. Auigh Cuisimar Sarice Conigs Add: 55 L Asad 1 Singepose 400050 3562323

mabaits W G L0 KD

For pirer Appioved Regoring CentraaiAIG Aulhonsed Fagalrers, plests cenact our 24-howr accident gmengiacy holine Bl 165 6333 G200, Allerralnly, Fo) Y refet W AIG
& &IG 56 Mobda App. Sanply sparch and desninad "AIG 53 lrom iTures or Joogl: Play

IMPORTANT NOTES

| Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: MayBan - _l

AW hariby cortly Tal (e policy 10 which this Canmifcate of Insuranca relates & lssued i ccnciancs with [hg proviessns of the Moigs Yehches(Trad Farty fists and Coenparastion] Act {Cap, 1831 Farl b/ af
o Rand Trampon Adl, 1967 (Malzysia) and Motor Vehices (Third Farty Risis) Rules, 1859 (Malaysin).

0504125258 w\}/

PREMILIM LEASING -LSYA

281 ALEXANDRA ROAD AUDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

SINGAPORE 189938 AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd,

oo fag M3 IST00R40MM | Copyeght & 2018 NG At Paciie sirance Fre. Lid

AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

Underwritien by A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pla. Lid. BECIAN

S Cher iy PTG R BT SOTATA) [t 1800 Fitbandis 2723 ] wes g Lom 3a AlCr A Pt in=tnnca PR et



REPUBLIC OF SINGAPDRE
IDENTITY GARD NO. S6943691!

THONG MAY LAl

L]

CHINESE

Bt af pirth S sOU4 T
1g-12-1968 F

Country ol birth

SINGAPORE

(E R 1R

: WmcHe. 56943691

Duta ol b
23-03-2009

APT BLK 8 ROSEWDOD DRIVE #08-18

SINGAPORE 737838
568435811 2710012014
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SINGAPORE S T

POLICE FORCE 272
1of2
POLICE REPORT (NP298) Report No. J/20180822/2045
Police Station Of Origin
Woodlands East N.P.C.
3 Woodlands Drive 63 SINGAPORE 737880
Tel No: 1800-7679999
Date/Time Report Made ide Report No. a Statib}__niary No.
22/08/2018 11:20 F/20180822/0119 70
Name Of Informant Address
THONG MAY LAI APT BLK 9 ROSEWOOD DRIVE #09-18 SINGAPORE
737938 o
ID Type / ID No. Contact No.
NRIC NO / 569436011 Home/Office Mobile
: 97603516
Nationality Email Address
SINGAPCRE CITIZEN : —
Occupation Sex Age Date of Bith |Race
HIGHER TECHNICAL OFFICER Female |48 112/12/1969 Chinese
Institution/School Name Language
Date/Time Of Incident Location Of Incident
22/08/2018 09:30 101 YISHUN AVENUE 5 CHONG PANG CITY
SINGAPORE 760101
ILOT 85 OPEN CARPARK o
Brief details.

| am the driver of vehicle SDS9808C.

On 22/08/2018 at about 0750hrs, | parked my car at Lot 85 of the open carpark Blk 101 Yishun Ave 5
(near Chong Pang Market). Everything was intact.

Signature Of er Recording The Ftepngggq 135 Signature Of Informant:
J/Sgt2 LED’@ gva SHENG, KENNETH I Mﬁﬁfﬂ
S i

Signature Of Inmiﬁﬁ'-““""' p— |paterT irémeé'
Not i ‘ Bl - !

ot applicable “apore oL Horee /22193;2 18 11:20
Officer In-Charge Of Case: Classification Of Case:
J / Jurong Police Divisional HQ /
Staff Sgt WANG ZHENXIONG

Contact No.: 67910000

Authentication Stamp



SINGAPORE A A

POLICE FORCE oo

POLICE REPORT (NP299) CONTINUATION OF REPORT Report No J/20180822/2045

At about 0930hrs, | returned to my car and discovered that a roughly 5-metre-long tree branch had
broken off from an adjacent tree and fallen on top of my car.

As a result of the impact, the roof of my car was dented. The frame/bow between the front windscreen
and front left passenger side door was also dented.

The fallen tree had also damaged another vehicle (green van) parked in Lot 886.

It was raining heavily in the vicinity earlier. Town Council was at scene to assist to remove the obstructing
tree branches. Police also attended to me.

| am lodging this report for insurance claim purposes.

j'i‘a:gnatui'e .fo'uag,-r Recording The Report: SN 130 [Srgnature Of Infarmant
J / Sqt 2 TJ% SHENG, KENNETH

Signatute Obsnterpreter "¢ ° flf DafelTime:

Not app cﬂﬂlhgﬁﬁﬁ e P(}!“{IE FDI’C& L/ /08/2018 11:20
Officer Ln-Charge Of C‘.ase Classification Of Case:
J f Jurong Police Divisional HQ /

Staff Sgt WANG ZHENXIONG

Contact No.: 67810000

Authentication Stamp



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408693
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183
Email: Mora khai@premiumauto.com.sq / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoadl

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 68411183
Reference :  PA/DD/0266/2018/PH
Date : 24-Aug-18

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6B41 D055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Ms Tong Mei Lai

9 Rosewood Dr
#09-18

Singapore 737938
{HP) +65 97603516
Own Damage Claim
1800017516

SD59805 C

Audi &4 2.0 TFSI
Feb-18

CVK 050766
WAUZZZF44)A07336

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
22-Aug-18
101 Yishun Ave 5 Chong Pang City lot 85 carpark



