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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGI18015540/Uvd3
5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD I
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 27-08-2018
SINGAPORE 038285
Code: EGI

Folicy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh, YK 6230J Veh. Inspected GBE 3199R
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. YKBZ30/RH/pI Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 27/08/2018
24 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg.
Chassis No, Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5, General Information
Accident Date  07/08/2018 Inspection Date 27/08/2018
Survey held at LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE B #01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE
417883
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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- Consultants
A B Pie Lid Company Registration No, 198607 198R

t

51 UBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) B256H4315

Your Ref; YK 62300/RH/pl
Our Ref: CS/EGI18015540/Uvd3 Date: 28/8/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Without Prejudice

Dear SirfMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.GBE 3199R

We thank you for your instruction on 27/8/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
21 18 at the premises of M/s LIUSB R AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5$3,161.00
Revised Estimate Amount 1 §82.453.50
"Check” Items Amount 1 5%
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
n/s front portion.

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

f

From: Veron Chen (LEKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 2:00 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: YK6230) / TP : GBE3199R/LKK / DOA : 07/08/2018
Attachments: GBE 3199R PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBE 3199R
Date of survey: 27/8/2018

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 1:34 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : YK6230J / TP : GBE3199R/LKK / DOA : 07/08/2018

Dear Catherine,
In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016 in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.
Please conduct this survey request from LIU’S BROTHER AUTO,

ADDRESS ¢ NO 1KAKIBUKIT AVENUE &

#01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : SUSAN @ 6741 1730
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : ROHAINI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please note that our insured/insured driver has yet to e-file their SAS
for this accident. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain estimate from workshop
and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.



Attached is TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee Pei Li (Ms)
Claims Assistant {Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

§ Temasak Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 035985

DID.: +65 6829 9194

Tel. . +65 8B29 51499

Fax : +65 BR20 9247

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is representad in more than 20 countries and concentrates
on Eurcpe and Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world’s leading risk camiars

W ETQ0.COM.53



Dt 27.08.2018

Sent via Fax

YK 6230)/RH/pl

Our Reference:

GBE 3199R

Your Reterence:

ar

Tt LIU'S BROTHER AUTO

Email

Pre-Re PRS) Acknowledgement

GBE 3199R

ir Surve

Vehicle For Inspection;

liusbro@ymail.cam

Insured's Vehicle: YK 6230

Date OF Accldent: 07.08.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on:

24.08.2018

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor fram

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *. *
Als Automohife Inspection Services Ple Ltd LBS L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pre Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pre Ltd LEK LEK Aute Consultants Ple Ltd
IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service [ Pricrity Services
IPE 1P Knights Pte L1d VAL Vicam Ltd
v

Your request for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy,

Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA regort, kindly forward a copy,

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upan receipt of estimate

i Cur Insured’s driver has not reported the accident to us tadate,
V. |others.  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - ROHAINI
Prepared by: \ Pei Li 68209194 |claims@ergo.com.sg
LU oL il
Signature: \ = FAX : 68299247
Assessor use only: Woaorkshop use only:

Assipnment Date:

Assignment Time:

Remarks:

Assessor attended workshop on;
Date:

Time

Inspector:

[ vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.,

Kindly acknowledge aur fssessor pr

Warkshap Acknowledgement tamp.

Note: Our Inspection is on & without admissien te lability basis.

nee for the abave job .



Date:

Our Reference:

Your Reference:

To:

27.08.2018

YK 6230J/RH/pl

GBE 3199R

LIU'S BROTHER AUTO

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement
Vehicle For Inspection; GBE 3199R

Insured's Vehicle:

Date Of Accident;

We acknowledge

YK 6230J

07.08.2018

receipt of your request for PRS on:

24.08.2018

ERGO

Sent vla Fax

ar

liushro@ymail.com

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

&

AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pre Ltd LBS L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pre Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
1AS Infiniti Appraisal Service P5 Priority Services

JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd VAL Vicom Ltd

1'Ir Others:

OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - ROHAINI

v Qur Insured’s driver has not reperted the accident to us todate,

v Your request for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.

Your request for inspection does not have your client’s GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

Prepared by: W Pei Li 6829 9194 claims@ergo.com.sg
Signature: N— FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor usa only: w h
r workshop on:

Assignment Date: Date:
Assignment Time: Time

Inspectar:
Remarks: D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time,

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job |

Waorkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.

Nate: Qur Inspection is on o without odmission to liability basis.




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 1:34 PM

To: ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’

Subject: Ol : YK6230) / TP : GBE3195R/LKK / DOA : 07/08/2018

Attachments: GEE3199R - SAS pdf; GEE3199R - PRS FORM.pdf; Re: RE: Request for 3rd party

claims survey GBE3199R Claims against YK6... (29.1 KB)

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016”" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single loint Expert”,

Please conduct this survey request from LIU’S BROTHER AUTO,

ADDRESS :  NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417283

PERSON TO CONTACT : SUSAN @ 6741 1730
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : ROHAINI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please note that our insured/insured driver has yet to e-file their 5AS
for this accident. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain estimate from workshop
and inform the repairer in _writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.
Attached is TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee Pei Li(Ms)
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038983

DID,; +656B29 9194

Tel, - +65 6828 9100

Fax - +B65 6829 9247

ERGO

ERGO s one of the major insurance groups in Gemany and Europs, Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concentratas
an Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the warld's leading risk carners

WhW EFQ0 £om.sg
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> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authorily
10 Sin Ming Drive:
Singapore 575701

G5T Registration No. | M4-0008528-2
Print Date/Time ! 21 Aug 2018/ 12910
Receipt Date/Time . 21 Aug 018 /12111
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt Mo | ITNET-000D0-180821-001046
Previous Receipt No

SN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (53%) (5%) (5%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - YKE230J
As at 07 Aug 2018/08:40:00

i,
Insurance Co: ERGO INSURANCE PTE. LTD
1 |nsurance Enguiry - YRE230J
Enquiry Fee 700 049 749
201808211 0937226230
Sub-Total T.00 049 749
Tatal Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 749
Rounding Difference 004
Total Amount Payable 7 45
Paid By
C C
oOOnOonROae 59 pt LA 7.45
VieaMasterCard
Total 745
Cash Change Q.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00
—_—

THAME YOU AND HAVE A MICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

1ofl T1-Aug-18 12011 P
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOF Reahate Frmoine

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company
1196N

GBE3199R
No

27 Aug 2018
TOYOTA

TOYOTA HIACE VAN TURBO 5 DR
MANUAL

White

2015

1KD2561451
JTFHTO2P300179985
$27,741.00

30 0ct 2015

30 Oct 2015

1

$1,388.00

Mo

$0.00

29 Oct 2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$42,743.00
$30,655.00
$30,655.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Aug 2018

nttpsifivrlita.gov.sgiitaivriaction/enguireRebateByPu blicBeforeDereginput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT

M



LIU'S BROTHER AL'TO X \I-I\I ERING WORKsHor InvideesRel Moy GBE3199R 180807

Pece | Rk Mkt Aoy SEEAE don Mar o Kabn ik S, e 41 78K
B b SNIUETAD Wyt WPL-ATH TRL BRHES 1 Forenl Barhwost oo oat b o
Customer _._J B - - B - —| e J o a
Name:  ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd _— _ ) ~ Date: 24-08-18
Address; Mnml _E]gﬂm J)J_artmunt R — VehicleNo:  GBEngsR
5 If_u_'ﬂa:_r:k Boulevard #ogon - _ Model/Make:  Toyota Hiace V: m_
Suntec Tower Five ‘:lllHﬂEUFE u}!:!:_;ﬂg, Turbo 5 DR Manual
Original Revised
Iiem No. Descriptions OF Parts Chuntation ¢ Cuotation ¢
Estimation Cost OF Repair
=
1 Front LHSide Mirror <Ay {"5{{-, (o § L12730 ]
I
2 Head Lam ¢ . S g30.70 P
P M Gpryg e 9307 7
3 Head Lamp Clipsi1set 4 1 $ 7 O5.00 |sn
4 Door "ROC” Sticker /& 5 4800 |sn Tol nJ
5 “Corporate” Advertisement & Artwork A § 250,00 |sn /S cﬁ} <.
To check all wiring & electrical component for proper function S qoo0 |- [ 2D
Labor for Panel Beating, Cut, Weld, Straighten & Replacing Parts Frcs £ 30000 | - 2 ﬁ
To putty & spray painting & including touch up paint on accident affectecd arel s 4oo.0o | i

Liatal Parts & Labour of eslimate for damaged vomde | [3 31a1.00]
[Total omount in tump Sum Bosls Tor repaired vehicls ]
SDLS = ) o ) .
M/s Liv's Brother Auto Engrg Wis
ot Mﬂ/
/ @ U 9.64
Pl _
Lo /ﬁz%’ v
' =%

wai fTe

—— e
pohnowinigec U



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. Mo: 189607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automohile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref | CS/EGI1B015540/Uvd3n2
TV
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 03-08-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YK 62304 Veh. Inspected GBE 3199R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. YKE230/RH/pl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEEPEILI Assign Date 27/08/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE (M) c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. JTFHTO2P300179985 Colour WHITE
Odometer 77597 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195R15 CST TIRES & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 CST TIRES & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195R15 CST TIRES & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195R15 CST TIRES & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PG—I;TIDN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/08/2018 |inspection Date 27/08/2018
Survey held at LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP
1 KAK] BUKIT AVENUE & #01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE
417883
Ba. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;J A B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAM: 6256 4315

Req. Mo: 199607 198R - GST Reg. No. 19-96071968-R Page No..1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBE 3199R

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
o/ e Workshop ()| (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1IFRONT LH SIDE MIRROR BROKEN 1,127.30 84510
1|HEAD LAMP CRACKED 830.70 801.10
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -436 55
2,058.00 1,309.65
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET HEAD LAMP CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 65.00 .
1|DOOR "ROC" STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 458 .00 30.00
1|"CORPORATE" ADVERTISEMENT & ARTWORK (SN) WECESSARY 250.00 180.00
363.00 210.00
LABQUR
TO CHECK ALL WIRING & ELACTRICAL COMPONENT 40.00 20.00
FOR PROPER FUNCTION
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING CUT WELD STRAIGHTEN 300.00 280.00
& REPLACING PARTS ETCS.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING & INCLUDING TOUCH UP A400.00 400.00
PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA
740,00 TO0.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,161.00 2.219.65
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | I 2,219.65|

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18015540/Uvd3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobély for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




