Joy Irene (LKKAuto) e ————————————————————————

From: Janet Tan <janettan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 2:01 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAUta)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIRB042M (Ol : EQI - DM18HO02221/)T)

AND SLZ4855U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI18015425/Kjb3) on 20.08.2018

Dear Joy,
Please proceed to offer up to $3000.00

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eq’nsuronce

L‘f.-uﬂftf.}vﬁ"?‘ﬁ'mrdf

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4130
WWW.BQinsurance.com.sg

J‘ A Member of Citystate @__

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tf

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, October 1, 2018 1:37 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJR8042M (01 : EQI - TBA) AND SLZ4855U (TP : LKK REF -
CCE/EQI18015425/Kjb3) on 20.08.2018

Dear lanet,
We refer to our e-mail on 06/09/18.
We would like to follow-up on your approval or instruction to TP's request at $3k for cash in lieu.

Kindly advise.

Best Regards,

loy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene @Ikkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
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Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 4:08 PM

To: 'lanet Tan' <janet.tan@eginsurance.com sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>: loy Irene (LKKAuto) <loyirene@lkkauto.coms

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIRS042M (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SLZ4855U (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI18015425/Kjb3) on 20.08.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case, We had inspected TP vehicle SLZ 4855U at M/s T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP's GIA report
Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Libi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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- EBW NW Consultants
il B A &K P“__-. Lid

Company Registration No, 199607 198R

STUBTAVE L, #02-25 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65) 625363561 FAX : ((65) 6253643153

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 18/10/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicle No. SJR 8042M (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMCFHQ17-000185
SLZ 48550 (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. : CC6/EQI18015425/Kjb3s2
Date of Accident 20/8/2018
Liability 100%
Cash-in-Lieu $ 3,000.00
Loss of Use % 240.00 3 days
Rental (If any) % days
Others: $ 7.49
$

3,247.49

Final Settlement Sum |: $ 3,000.00 | (GLOBAL SUM)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) [T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

.3 3,000.00

NUR SHAQILAH
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive
#08-14 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 686]
GST Registration Mo: 200910712E

Email; tntautoservices@ gmail.com

Date: 28™ August 2018
Our Ref: 0818-1384
Your Ref’

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

EQ Insurance Company Litd

5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block, MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Dear Sir,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR8042M / SLZ4855U ON 20/08/2018
Please refer to the above-mentioned accident.

We are writing on behalf of Stars Rental & Leasing, the registered owner of motor vehicle no:
SLZ4855U which was involved in the abowve accident.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence
of your insured's vehicle no: SIR8042M. As a result of which, our client have suffered loss
and expenses.

We are instructed by our client to claim for:-

1. Cash-In-Lieu :S53,000.00
2. Loss of Use (3 days @ $200.00/day) 8§ 600,00
3. LTA Search 8 7.45

TOTAL :5%3.607.45

We enclosed hereby the following documents for your consideration:
(a) GIA Report lodged by our driver

(b} Owner & Driver [/C/Driving Licence

(¢} Certificate of Insurance

(d) LTA Search

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and your favourable reply is greatly
appreciated.

Yours faithfully,

Vincent Tan



Juz Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 12:13 PM

To: enquiry@rosetlimo.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 8042M AND SLZ 4855U ON 20/08/18

Our ref: CC6/EQI18015425/Kjb3

ROSET LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTE LTD
Policy Holder

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 8042M AND SLZ 4855U ON 20/08/18

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

loy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.lt may contain confidential and/or privileged
Information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender immediately and
destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



TO:
0 INSURME  (aMPRN LD

$ MARWEILE Sk
#17-00 Towdt hade , MnD conn@t

S (6644
Dear Sirs,

CLAIMANT:
ACCIDENT INVOLVING ST B0l M snp  SLZ AU oN _ Jelodfi€

AT PiE &lcioh To Sy hudhauE

We, Sis  ReRTrL o Lekib® , am/are the registered owner of motor
car no. Sz HsS U

Plesse note that1 have assigned all compensation monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

[/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-
mentioned accident to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD and forward your settlement
cheque to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collect the said

compensation monies.

Thank you.

CEeessa NG c s e AT RS ST e R

Signature of Glaimant
Date:




> Back to OneMotoring

land Trams;;uurt&‘ki,ltImrit;;I

Land Transpori Autharity

10 Zin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration Mo, - Ma-0006529-2

Print Date/Time © 23 Aug 2018 / 13:00:05
Receipt Date/Time = 23 Aug 2018 / 13:00:05

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt Mo. : ITNET-D0000-180823-001016
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transacton Reference Before Amount After GST
Na, GST (5%) (53) (53%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SIRB0O42M
As at 20 Aug 2018/19:30:00

Insurance Co: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - SJRB0O42M

Enguiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.48
20180823125921181631
Sub-Total 7.00 0.489 7.48
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
20180823125835567 ﬁ;ﬁ?ﬂ;"::;::‘;;s Hl 7.45
Total T.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendared Amount T45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider { financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and recelpt Is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as PDF



B/24/2018 PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

"> Back to OneMatoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

The Infermation contained hareinis correct as at 24 Aug 2018

. Vehicle Owner Particulars

“Owner |D Type: Business

Cwener 10 2317L

WVehicle Details

" Vehicle Mo SLZ4B55U

Wehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended De-registration Date: 24 Aug 2018

ehicle Make: B.MW.

Wehicle Model: 5201 AUTO ABS AIRBAG 2WD XENON HEADLAMP
Primary Colous: Blue

Manufacturing Year: 2008

Engine No. ARDAI23FNAGB208E
Chagsls Mo WEANT12000CH 29537
Maximum Power Quiput: 115.0 kW (154 bihp)
Open Market Value; $49,738.00

Criginal Registration Date: 18 Sep 2008

First Registration Date: 18 Sep 2008
Transfer Count: 3

Actual ARF Paid: 34973800
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: ‘Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 17 Sep 2018

PARF Rebate Amount; $24 869,00
Intended COE Rebate Detalls

COE Expiry Date: 17 Sep 2018

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period{¥aars]: 10

QP Paid: $14.001.00

COE Rebate Ameasnt: £91.00

Total Rebate Amaount: $24,960.00

OK
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