Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: Torque 5 Claims <claims@torque5.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 2:12 FM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuta); Asher 5ng (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto), Zayyer (LKKAuto); Zaini
(LK Auto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: claims@torgques.com; Admin A

Subject: Accident Involving 3JK 9848 K & 5L0Q 8546 H on 21/08/2018. Our ref: 5JK9848K.

Attachments: image010wmgz; SJK 9848K - 21082018 LOD pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Attached is the Total loss, Loss of Use, LTA fee and GIA fee of the above mentioned vehicle.

Claim amount as per below:-

1. Total Loss 3 1,731.00
2. Loss of Use for 10 x $80/- per day $ 480.00
3. Loss of Storage 10 x $30/- per day ;] 300.00
4  LTA/GIA Search fee 3 45.00

TOTAL: 3 2556.00

The above settlement is in respect of our client’s claim for damages pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not prejudice our
client’s claim in respect of damages
and consequential loss in relation of his personal injuries

Kindly acknowledge by replying to this email and let us have your offer soon.

Your assistance is greatly appreciated.

TOROQUE ]
GROUP

Thank you

Varmest R gara
Rachel Wu
Claims Officer | Motor Claims Department

otlir (63) 64532 4457 | 112 ax (65) 6452 4584

Address B Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #01-49/50/51/52/53/54
Premier (@ KB, Singapore 4158735

REVIVE YOUR DF
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September 2018 3:03 PM

To: 'BUTTERPAPERSTUDIO@GMAILCOM'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLO 8546H AND SJK 9848K ALOMNG JALAN DATOH / BALESTIER

ROAD ON 21/08/2018

12 SEPT 2018

GOH WEI KIAT

Dear Sirf Mdm

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18015401/Gea3

YOUR REF :SLQ 8546H

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 8546H AND SJK 9848K ALONG JALAN DATOH / BALESTIER ROAD ON
21/08/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s TORQUE 5 PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SJK 9848K against
your motor insurance policy.

Basing on the circumstances of the accident reported by both parties, where your vehicle was involved in a four
(4) vehicle chain collision and was the 3™ vehicle and rear-ended the Third Party Vehicle SJK 9848K and we
are of the opinion that we cannot be absolved from liability.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded
under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party
claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date
of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
ashersng@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at our reporting centre. The
list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep
us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim
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To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA's prior
knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at
ashersng@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng@Ikkauto.com

c.c. AXA Insurance Pte Lid (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)
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Torque 5 Pte Ltd

¢ y ‘4 Mo .8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Premier @ Kakl Bukit, #01-50 Singapore 415875
4 | 2 Tel: +65 6452 4457 | Fax: +65 6452 4584 | Email; enquiryi@torques. cam
Co. Reg. No.: 201313221G

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

. '/Il. I*(. A i :-'.' 1 | i ol
hccldent an ,!"r"u '!.}l'-)] a|ang v Lifdy I'l_]..- fl. I+
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Involving vehicles STk QPYKE, S(A ESHH, SWRFZmT oV C

Inconsideration of Torque 5 Pte Ltd, 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit #01-50
singapore 415875, renairing my/our motor vehicle no - EAg 45l
I/we, &M QHF* RENTAL PIE LTD {"the claimant”) of
(address) bearing NRIC No _'© das the owner
of motor vehicle no S‘Gﬁ‘imn , hereby authorize them to demand claim, settle
and receive whatever amount settle payable by the insurance company or third party or
commence legal proceeding for cost of repairs, loss of use and etc to any of their appointed
solicitors to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and all the amount claimed
or settled shall belong and make payable to them absolutely by the insurance company of
the third party. I/We further authorized them to give an absolute discharge on my/our
behalf and to sign discharge voucher(s) and any other documents necessary or incidentals to
the conduct and disposal of my/our above claims.

at my request,

13 0 e

I/We further agree to fully co-operate and attend all court hearings that are necessary to
prosecute the claims maintained by Torque 5 Pte Ltd.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against my/our claim for costs which
arise therewith.

In the event that my/our claim is unsuccessful, I/we undertake to pay to Torque 5 Pte Ltd
the cost of repairs to my/our vehicle.

In the event that the settlement/payment cheque is being made in my/our favour, |/we
hereby undertake to return the full amount to Torque 5 Pte Ltd account, within 7 days from
receiving and clearance of the said settlement/payment cheque. Failing which, Torque 5 Pte
Ltd will have the legal rights to take legal proceedings against me/us to recover the said sum,
with further costs and disbursements to be incurred by me/us.

I/We further authorize Torque 5 Pte Ltd to settle the aforesaid claim in a manner that you
deem fit and to utilize the monies to pay your charges without further reference to me/us.
The payment to Torque 5 Pte Ltd shall amount to a good discharge of Torque 5 Pte Ltd
obligation to me/us in respect of the settlement monies.

2 ; [
Dated this dayof - b {month) 20 J (year] =
.:-I.'.‘:'_-H: #
oSN i r\ 2
L“;\: ,I:I.r'-) L : ff\ t:-
\ e’ /,r :
Signed by “the claimant” Signed by Torque 5 Ftéfﬁfd
i |
< riar Crnf 61 Vo /44
Name: DM cre ZenTit fle 1k MR [ /4
2MT00 SS5Lh

MRIC No: e N I




p. Y redefining /insurance

CLAIN REF PSEMODSZG
INSURED P GOH WE| KIAY

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l (SM CAR RENTAL PTE LTD, NRIC NO. 2017005526] hereby agree ta accept the sum of dollars

[TWO THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED AND SIXTY TWO ONLY.] [552,362.00] paid to us/me by AXA
INSURANCE PTE LTD as full end final settlement af all claims of whataver kind Including damages for

personal injuries and damages to property that we/l may have agalnst the sald AXA INSURANCE PTE
LTO or their Insured or the driver of moter vehicle no, [§ S46H] as & result of an accident along
[JALAN DATOH] on [21/08/2018] of which wefl werefwas the driver/ owner/ hirer/
passenper/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehicle no. [SIE 9848K],

Wefl hereby declare that the said Insurer or owner andfor driver of Insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and wheosoever present or future that wefl may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/for driver of vehicle no. [SLG 8546H] in connection directly ar
Indiractly with the sald accldent and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l arefam the person(s} entitled to recefve the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any clalm made or to be made In
respect of this settlement,

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of llabllity whatsoever
on the part of the safd Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehlcle no. [SLO 8546H].

Dated this day of Novgaher 2018

01 4
Clalmant's Signature étfé\? @

X
MNRIC no./ Company Stamp < ( ) T
T

5
el

:

Occupation/ Business

Address

Telephone No.

1 | w +

Witness's Name : Wi Lime,
1

Witness's Sipnature : L
Witness's NRIC No. : SEA AL F
AXA Irsurance Pie Lid {Company Reg, Mo, 1990035121)) R
e Glie ot e Ehesgt OGBS G/ s oy g vt
e 6303 1518 T 1o 0y csher elaims acising lrors 1 s a=iens
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Bl2af2018

GENERAL
INSURANCE

ASS0CIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
G Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048560
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref Mot GR-18-129109

Date of Reguest: 23/0852018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Torgque 5 Ple Lid

Mo, 8§ Kaki Bukil Ave 4,

#01-50

Singapore 415875

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 23/08/2018

Encguiry By Stephanie Teo Wan Ting

TP Vehicle Mo, SLO8s546H o

Accident Data 21/08/2018 (7"] \C 9'[ ('C- q’ % t"

Enquiry Result

TP Vahicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, Na.
SLOB546H AXA Insurance Ple Lid 221090201 7-21/09/2018 6338 7288
Thank You.

The images provided to you are laken fram the original reports forwarded to the cantra by the members of the Ganeral Insurance Association of Sinpapora
and we lake no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoaver for any loss or damage arising aut of or in connection
with the reports or thelr images,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https:ffsingapora.merimen,comdclaimsifindex.cimfusehox=iTReasdluseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=1804504&CFID=303163384CF TOKEN=2dah5a5 .
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B2aro1a Involee

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Ralllas Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 35T Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Cur Ref Mo: GR-18-128109
Date of Request: 23/08/2018 Your Ref Ma: Online Purchase

Torque 5 Ple Lid

Mo, & Kaki Bukit Ave 4,
#0150

Singapore 415875

Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 23/08/2018
Enquiry By Staphanie Teo Wan Ting ()Hﬁ ¥ J”'.'l%,u(% K

TP Vehicle Na, SLas546H
Accident Date 21/08/72018

DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (S8)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusiva) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[¥] GIRO [ ] Cash | | Chequa

hitps:iisingapare merimen.comiclaimsindax cim?usebox=MTRsas&luseaction=dsp_geninvip&rafid=1804504 4 CFID=193163388CF TOKEN=2dabsR5 .. 27



i GEMERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
G Raffles Q W18-00, Bingapore 048580
INSUMNCE Phon: :ﬁsuﬂagzd ooin Fnr-ls??rﬁs G224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam lo Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CONTRE Co) Registration No: MADRD17 735

SEARCH RESULTS

Cur Rl Ma: GR-18-129775

Date of Roquest: 23)08/2018 Yotr Rial Mo Ondine Purchasa

Torque 5 Ple Lid

Mo, B Waki Bukil Ave 4,

#01-50

Singapora 4 15875

Dear Siftadam,

Your Search Criterla;

Date of Accidenl: 21marzoia

Flace of Accidant: JALAN DATOH

Clignt Vahicle Mo SJK9848K

Wil reference to your search crileria for Ihe accident repart, the following documents were ound to clesely match your search criteria:

REQ. VEHICLE ACCIDENT LOCATION ACCIDENT DATE
SLOBG4EH JALAN DATOH/BALESTIER ROAD 59w 21/0BI2016 16:30
SLXIINT JALAN DATOH E.I:_ii \"y’] 29/0B12018 16:20
YM1T47C No match found,

Thank You.

Thi images provided to you are inken from the oiginal reports ferwarded 1o the centra by the members af th General Insurance Assoclation of Singapore and wa lake no responsibility o
thels pocurmcy of conbenls and shall be uder no Rabilly whalsoever lor any 0ss of darmage arising oul of or in connection with the repors o their Images.

This is a camputer generated documaent and requires no signalure,




e B RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
:’ = GEHERAL & Rafflas Cuay §18-00, Singapore (48580
£H 1NSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 (010 Fax. +85 6224 0030
TEEERY ASSOCIATION Opoeraling Hours: Monday Lo Friday $am to Spm

! [ : M4D001TTIS
RECORDS MANAGEMENY CENTRE OS5 Repistration No

TAX INVOICE

Clur Ral Mo: GR-1B-129775
Diatn of Request 2AGEZ01E Your Ref Mo

Torgue 5 Ple Lid

Mo, 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4,
#01-50

Singapere 415875

Dear SifMadam.

o i

Diale of Accidend: 24MBi2048
Place of Accident JALAN DATOH
Chont Vahicle Mao: SJKasd8K

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

Online Purchass

DEECRIPTION

AMOUNT (53)

E-File Search Fea [Pubilic)

14.02

GET Amount

0.98

Tolal Amount Due (GST Inclusive)

Thiank You

This 15 & computar ganaralad document and requires no signaiure,

15.00

Far GIARME Official use:
Dhaals:
[%] GIRG [ | Caszh [] Chequa

i it oy et Wt



GENERAL
INSURANCE

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMEMT CEMTKL

Our Ref No:
Dale of Raguesi:

Targua § Ple L
Mo, B Kaki Bukit Ave 4,

HO1-50
Singapore 415875

Dear SirfMadarm,

Date of Azeadant:
Vehicle Mo:

Flace of Accident:
Involving Vehicle Ne:

With reference to your application for the accident repor, we heve attached the following

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Guay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Mondaey e Fridey Bam io Spm

GR-18-129306
2470872018

21/0Br2018
SJKBB4AK
JALAMN DATOH
5LOBG46H

GET Ragistration Me: MADDD1T T35

Your Rel Mo:

TAX INVOICE

acckden reporis as raquesiad:

Online Purchase

S 2 i

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (55) Ty AMOUNT (55)

SLO8546H JALAN DATOH 14.00(1 13.08
GET Amaounl 082
Total Amount Due (GST Inclushe) 14,00

The: images provided to you are taken from the origins reporis forwarded o tha centre by the members of the General Insurance Assoclation of Singapare and wa take
no responsibility for thelr accuracy or cantents and shall be under no Eabllity whatsoever for any oss or damage arising oul of or in conneclion wilh the reparts or heir

Images.,
Thank You.

This |s & computer generalad documeni and requires no signalure.

For GIARMC Official use:
Diate:
|¥] GIRD [ ] Cash | | Cheque
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Crwner D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Wehicle ta be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date;
“ierhicle Make:

Wehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year;

Engine Mo.;

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount;

Total Rebate Amount:;

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 24 Aug 2018

PARFITMF Rahata Froiin

Company
0552G

SIk7E48K

Yes

24 Aug 2018
HYLIMDAL

HD AVANTE 1.6.4
Grey

2008
G4FCBUS35130
KMHDU41BRIUA13114
B9.7 kW (120 bhp)
$11,942.00

12 Moy 2008

12 Nowv 2008

3

$11,94200

Yes
11 Nov 2018
£5,971.00

11 New 2018

A-Car (1600cc & below)
10

$13,801.00

$29B.00

£6,269.00

OK
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