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¥y 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Uni Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9507198-R
Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCIB015357/Grd3
sopomsonmond womoreaeaerr oo masae [N
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 3027M Veh. Inspected SJU 217G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18006278MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CWS [JOANNE YONG) Assign Date 23/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  1B/0B/2018 Inspection Date 23/08/2018
Survey held at SUCCESS UNITED PTELTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-33 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417821
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




51 URL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065} 625363561 FAX : (063) 61564315

Your Ref: D18006278MFSH Date: 19 November 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18015357/Grd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SJU 1217G .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 23/08/2018 at the premises of M/s _SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S% 1852882 .
Revised Estimate Amount ;S8 11.624.77
“Check” Items Amount : 8%

Market Value : S§ -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ -

Nett Value : 58 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear and front portion.

rear

Yours faithfully

XING GUO QIANG
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coreq Mo, 1950000060 GST Reg e M2-0001675-9
fi Raifies Quay 421-00 Singapore 048580

Tel (B5) B2€2 2311 Fax:(B5)6222 3547

Clalms & Metor Undensiting Depe: 36 Robinson Read #16-01 City House Singapare 0BBS7T
Tel: (65) 6307 3648 Fax: (65) 6507 3843
win. mafirsteapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

21-08-2018 Our Ref No. D18008278MFSH
18-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHD3027M Third Party Vehicle. SJU1217G

BLK 1065 EUNOS AVE 4 #01-150/152
SOOKIE

67461315/ 0 Fax No. 67485015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc ; TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CESS UNITED P
Shlte 9 Liz Attention. NIL
LTD
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

i oot REEERE (HILSARCE B0




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAUto)

Sent: Monday, Movember 19, 2018 7:11 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc 'Eileen Lee'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008131MFSH/
Attachments: SJU 1217G.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SIU 1217G

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, November 19, 2018 5:33 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008191MFSH/1

Dear 5ir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 19 November, 2018 5:33 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <Eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008191MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Jarice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: sirina@successunited.com.sg <sirinassk@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 11:00 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Cc: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); sirina@successunited.com.sg
Subject: Re: SJU 1217G - Check items, after paint

Morning Janice
OK. confirmed.

Thank Y ou.
Best Regards,
Sirina Soon

Senior Claims Executive
Mobile: +65 9223 6288

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 / #02-29

kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015

On Mon, Nov 19, 2018 at 6:58 PM Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <J anicelee(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sirina,

Kindly confirm L/S $6,500.00 @ 7 DAYS

Thank you,

Best Regards,
Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-1561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



WFA315050668 | Falcon-fir fulo Senvices Fie Lid - Tampines
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 26072018 1313
EUBMITTED BY: Lanet Lim

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 26/07/2018 16:13

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the deais of the accicent to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form maust be completed by tha Policyholder and/lor the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthfuul and accurate as possible, Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies 1o

repudiata policy ability

4. The fssue and accepiance of this Form by insurance companies ks not an admission of pelcy liability on the pan of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by lhe insurers of the GlA Records Management Gentre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapora [GLA] for
archiving and that copées of this rapart will, for a fee, be made availabla upon application by interested partias.
7. By the lodgement of this report to the inaurers, you heraby consent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre-and 1o copies of the report being made availabla

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date OFf Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

26/07/2018 13113

22/07/2018 20:00

T-JUNCTION OF BEDOK RESERVOIR RD/BEDOK NRTH AVE 3
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
MNRIC Mo

Email Address

Mabile Phone Mo

Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturar

Maodel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accidant

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action lo be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleat Policy

Palicy Number

Cover Note Number

Drriver

Name of Driver

Passport No/FIN

Date Of Birth

Ccocupation

Date Of Driving Pass

DOriving Experiance

Gender

Maobile Numbear

Fax Number

Contact Mumhber

Ehtail Address

FBJ3070B

MUTHUMAN| SIVAKUMAR

S57285202H
MUTHUMANISIVAKUMAREGMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-94244070
OTHERS-94244070

SYM
COMBIZ 125-125CC

NO

THIRD PARTY
MOTORCYCLE

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
THIRD PARTY
MO

5064719487

KARUPPAIAH MANIK ANDAN
GaZe4486W

20/05/15885

CUTDOOR

31/08/2016

1 YEAR AND 10 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-84240511

NOEMAIL

Page 1 af 31



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Wehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner 1D Type:

Owner 10

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo,

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.;

Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value;

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Aug 2018

Singapore MNRIC
1259E

SIU1217G

Mo

21Aug 2018
CHEVROLET

CRUZE 1.6L AUTO ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR
White

2009

F14D34818241
KL1IAGFE1AKS62697
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
£12.527.00

18 Nov 2009

18 Moy 2009

Q

$12,527.00

Yes
17 Nov 2019
$4 88900

17 Now 2019

B - Car [1600cc & below)
10

£16,201.00

£2,01000

48 899,00

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION_ID=F030...

Page 1 of 1

20/8/2018



8/24/2018

> Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

B e T Y 5 S SR o S B

Owner |D Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D: 1259E

Vehicle No.: SJU1217G

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended De-registration Date: 24 Aug 2018

Vehicle Make: CHEVROLET

Vehicle Model: CRUZE 1.6L AUTO ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR
Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2009

Engine No.: F16D34818261
Chassis No.: KL1JA6961AK562699
Maximum Power Qutput: 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $12,527.00

Original Registration Date; 18 Nov 2009

First Registration Date: 18 Nov 2009

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid: $12,527.00

_

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 17 Nov 2019

PARF Rebate Amount; $6,889.00

COE Expiry Date: 17 Nov 2019

COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $16,201.00

COE Rebate Amount: $1,997.00

Total Rebate Amount: $8,886.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Aug 2018

OK

nitpsivrlita,gov.sgitaiviaction/enquire RebatebyFublicHetorellereginput /- UNG | 1N _IU=HUE 040 | 11



MoE L 2 4 WM

,’\\ SLICCESS LINTED PTE LLTE-
: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 / #02-29 Kaki Bukit AutoHub Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 /| 6747 1787 Fax: 6748 5015

L o | www. successunited.com.sg Co. | GST Reg: 2004025700

Estimate - TP/18-092

M/s  MS First Capital Insurance Ltd Date : 21st August 2018
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House Vehicle No : SJU1217G
Singapore 0GBB77 Make/ Model ;: Chev Cruze
Chassis No @ KL1JABDS1 ARSG2699
Attn . Motor Claim Acc. Date . 18.08.18
Policy No .
Tel: 65073848
Fax. 65073849 Email - 1 cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.s Your Ref : SHD 3027M
S/n. Qty Particulars Unit Price _Amount
Materials o
1 1pc Frt Bumper Assy ..-/{E’E 3 1,250.00 / /2
2 1pc Frt Bumper No. Plate Gamnish ~~ "-m 5 §8.00
3 1 pc Frt Bumper Inner Sponge A fmA g 16800 -~
4 1pc Frt Bumper Reinforcement )>( ﬂf[‘/ ] B47.00
5 2 pc Frt Bumper Side Holder LR .~ @& $ 5500 § 110.00¢¢
6 1pc Frt Bumper Logo .~ J§ . $ 152.00 L.
7 1 pc Frt Top Grille Assy X M $ 352.40
8 1pc Frt Center Grile .~ G $ 284.10 2.
] 1 pe Frt Bonnet -~ 70 3 1,554.00 1S4
10 1pc Frt Bonner Lock X M $ 115.00 y
11 1 pe Centre Brace Panel )X 5 398.00 |
12 1 pc Rear Bumper Assy .~ R4 qr $ 161520 7.9 |
13 2 pc Rear Bumper Side Holder LIR .~ ! L3 58.00 3 118.00. roe
14 1pc Rear Bumper Tow Hook Cover _~AA'S $ 4800 “ 7
15 1 pc Rear Bumper Reinforcement -4/ $ 944.80 734 2%
16 2pc Rear LampL/R _~ i 5 655.80 3 131160 _-
17 2pc Rear Boot Lamp L/IR l.’/ﬂA % 350.00 % 700.00 -~
18 1pc Rear BootLid .~ $ 1,264.00 ~
19 1pc Rear Boot "Chevrolet' Emblem ~7 5 108.00
20 1pc Rear Boot "Cruze” Emblem [J . - 54 00
21 1 pc Rear BootLogo $ 54.00 -
22 1pc Rear Boot Mechanism Lock - T 5 284.00
23 1pc Rear Boot Weatherstip _~ T, /LH-" a/& $ 168.00 -
24 2 pc Rear Lamp Lower Bracket LIRH == '?\-\ - 55.00 ] 110.00 5
25 1pc Rear Bumper Center Bracket -~ C.A- . M?( NNV $ 110.00 ;¢
26 1pc Rear End Panel R/ fiat $ 988.70 -/
27 1 pc Rear End Panel Inner Top Gamish -~ ILE $ 185.00 11
28 1 pc Rear Spare Tyre Panel w M'rw ) 5 1,080.00
3 14,329 80
G 008 < Less 10% : $ 1.432.98
; /T — Total : % 12,806.82
| '.;:"lll.j; .'I [ Y ] | —

Page 1 of 2 Estimate - SJU 1217G



O

. /ﬂ SUCCESS LUNITEDQ PTE L.TOQ
_;g" = 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 / #02-29 Kaki Bukit AutoHub Singapore 417921
Tel; 6746 1515 / 6747 1787 Fax: 6748 5015
Slrrn=a UrlTr=En/AT= LTro WWww_successunited.com.sg Co. / G5T Reg: 2004025706
Special Nett 9y &
29 1pc Rear No Plate wiframe  ~~ $ 4500 -~
30 1pc Frt No Plate w/frame _- b 4500 ~
a0 4 pc Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor _- Pan, 3 158.00 3 632.00 o <]
Special Nett 3 722.00
Labour
1 Toremove, rearrange electrical wirings, check lightings $ 80.00 ba
2  Toremove, replace rear exhaust silencer & re-align 5 180.00 A/
3  Toremove, reinstall inner tnim, garnishes & upholstery. 3 250.00 éﬁ;
4 Toremove, repair and replaced damaged bodyparts, realign $ 260000 so8c-.
bodyworks & where consistent to the accident.
5 To putty and respray painting on affected area. 5 1,800.00 J‘fpa
Total Labour = § 4.910.00

Total Parts & Labour : § 18,528.82

AL {-Ii-' i
Swuccess United Pte Ltd :
|. - " .
| i I} Jo
No of Days 2
Re-Survey Beforey, int
Part By Part/Lu

Surveyed By (ame QP - contact No. ?p"\r% o028 )-

Date of Survey '225 ! % h g Fax No.

NOTE: LUMP SUM WILL BE REVISED IF SUPPLEMENT REPAIR |5 REQUIRED

]

Page 2 of 2 Estimate - 5JU 1217G



¥y LAY LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCHB015357/Grd3n2
i?ﬁ:ﬂaéﬁ'ﬁ? ngsﬂE%INGAFDHE 068877 Date . 26-11-2018 ” H”M'”"“”““ ”I
Code : FCI2
ik Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 3027M Veh. Inspected SJU 217G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1800627T8MFSH Excess {5} 0.00
Assign From  JOANNE YONG Assign Date 23/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CHEVROLET CRUZE c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. KL1JABIE1AKSE2699 Colour WHITE
Odometer 252305 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [205/60 R16 FIREMZA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 FIRENZA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 FIRENZA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre [205/60 R16 FIRENZA, & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT AND REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
i General Information
Accident Date  18/08/2018 Inspection Date 23/08/2018
Survey held at SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-33 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
Sa. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOCD FOR REPAIR: 7 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJU1217G

51 Ui Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Page Mo.10of 2

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workahon {gﬂ )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRT BUMPER ASSY DEFORMED 1,250.00 895.00
1|FRT BUMPER NO PLATE GARNISH CRACKED 68.00 £8.00
1|FRT BUMPER INNER SPONGE CRACKED 158.00 158.00
1|FRT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 847.00 :
2|FRT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER LR @$55.00 DEFORMED 110.00 24.00
1|FRT BUMPER LOGOD SCRATCHED 152.00 65.00
1|FRT TOP GRILLE ASSY NOT NECESSARY 352.40 -
1|FRT CENTER GRILLE cuT 284.10 263.00
1|FRT BONNET DENTED 1,554 .00 1,455.00
1|FRT BONNET LOCK NOT NECESSARY 115.00 d
1|CENTRE BRACE PANEL NOT NECESSARY 398.00 ;
1|REAR BUMPER ASSY DEFORMED 1.515.20 1,291 00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER L/R @358.00 DEFORMED 116.00 100.00
1|REAR BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER MISSING 48.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 944 80 736.25
2|REAR LAMP LR @$655.80 cuT 1,311.60 1,311.60
2|REAR BODT LAMP L/R @$350.00 CRACKED 700.00 700.00
1|REAR BOOT LID BENT 1,264.00 1,264.00
1|REAR BOOT "CHEVROLET" EMBLEM NECESSARY 108.00 65.00
1|REAR BOOT "CRUZE" EMBLEM NECESSARY 54.00 54.00
1|REAR BOOT LOGO NECESSARY 54,00 54.00
1|REAR BOOT MECHANISM LOCK BENT 284,00 284.00
1|REAR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 168.00 168.00
2|REAR LAMP LOWER BRACKET L/RH @$55.00 N/S CRACKED / O/S 110.00 55.00
NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR BUMPER CENTER BRACKET cuT 110.00 75.00
1|REAR END PANEL BUCKLED 988 70 906,00
1|REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 185.00 139.00
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,080.00 :
LABOUR

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18015357/Grd3n2




T Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

A s B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6266 1561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 108807188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Pa Condition
il ik k Workshop (§))|  (5)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,432.98 -1,016.08
12,896 82 914477
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NO PLATE W/FRAME (SN) SCRATCHED 45.00 45.00
1|FRT NO PLATE W/FRAME (SN CRACKED 45.00 45.00
4|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @$158.00 (SN) DAMAGED 632.00 200.00
722.00 290.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRINGS,CHECK 80.00 30.00
LIGHTINGS
TO REMOVE,REPLACE REAR EXHAUST SILENCER & RE- |NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
ALIGN.
TO REMOVE,REINSTALL INNER TRIM.GARNISHES & 250.00 80.00
UPHOLSTERY,
TO REMOVE,REPAIR AND REPLACED DAMAGED 2600.00 1,000.00
BODYPARTS,REALIGN BODYWORKS & WHERE
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED 1,800.00 1,100.00
AREA.
4,910.00 2,190.00
GRAND TOTAL 18,528.82 11,624.77
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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MARKET VALUE: $16,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $8,886.00=NETT VALUE: $7,114.00
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DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobely for the use and banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repor.
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