1112372018 Meriman e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail iz associated with :

*SLRTI9E6T (C0474239)
[SHD328P]
TP
GOH HOCK WAH
Aug 17 2018 10:008M
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES FTE LTD]
Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd - Bedok

From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 21/11/2018 17:42 PM.
To LKK_HQO

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$19500.00) - SLR7996T - Claim Handler: Richard Ang

Approved:19500.00:Please propose global sum at $19,500.

hl'tps:.f.-'singal:lufe.mel‘imen.mrrﬂclaims.find&x.clm"fus:ebuFE‘-.f{:mail&!usfeactiumdsp_F'rint&CFID=M23295B&GI-_FOKEN=3-IHI:I452GT3f|:|5f4ﬂ-69... M



Hsiao Tnnﬁ (LKKAuto)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 9:42 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Re: Letter of Claim for SLR 7996 T *LKK REF: CC4/AXA18015308/Upa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We accept the offer, kindly send us DV.

Warmest Regards,
Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
19450 7920

““zoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -

On Fri, Nov 30, 2018 at 8:08 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ |kkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Hi Elin,

We refer to your below email,

Qur principal had reviewed the matter and we have our instruction to maintain our offer at a global sum

of $19,500.00(all-in).

Kindly re-consider our offer.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims."”



Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, 24 November 2018 11:49 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Letter of Claim for SLR 7996 T *LKK REF: CC4/AXA18015308/Upa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Kindly consider $20,000(all-in) for a swift settlement.

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
@9450 7920

“fzoomautowerks mail.com

Y

sﬂggféagtmumchanyeziu ailing

ered address with effect from 1st July

On 5at, Nov 24, 2018 at 8:05 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Hi Elin,

We refer to your below email.

Qur principal had reviewed the matter and we have our instruction to improve our offer at a global sum

of $19,500.00(all-in).

Fleass confirm settlement,

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 9:31 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Letter of Claim for SLR 7996 T *LKK REF: CC4/AXA18015308/Upa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Kindly revert with offer, thank you.



Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
1320 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130

(19450 7920

“fizoomautowerks@amail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from st July
2018 -

On Mon, Oct 8, 2018 at 7:02 PM Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Considering the accident was on 17/08/2018, and repair works was over 2 weekends,
kindly accept our counter offer for a swift settlement.

1) Vehicle Repair Costs $17,600.00
2} Loss of Rental (SGD$120.00 x 20Days) $2,400.00
3) LTA Search Fee 57.45

4) Towing Fee $120.00
Total : $20,127.45

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai



Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130

9450 7920

“Hizoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -

On Mon, Oct 8, 2018 at 2:37 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi Elin,

We refer to your below email.

We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $18,630.00(all-in).

Flease confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | 5(408933)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 4 October 2018 10:58 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Letter of Claim for SLR 7996 T *LKK REF: CC4/AXA18015308/Upa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Decline offer.

Please consider our counter offer:

1) Vehicle Repair Costs 517,600.00
2) Loss of Rental (SGD5140.00 x 24Days) 53,360.00
3) LTA Search Fee $7.45

4] Towing Fee 5120.00
Total : $21,087.45

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130

39450 7920

““zoomautowerks@gmail.com



ing/registered address with effect from 1st July

On Thu, Oct 4, 2018 at 9:40 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi Elin,

Wa refer to the above matter,

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of 518,000.00(all-in),

Please confirm acceptance.

"Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as
an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims,”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 8:09 AM

To: zoomautowerks@gmail.com; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Letter of Claim for SLR 7996 T




WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Elin,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Kindly assist CC4/AXA18015308/Upa3

Kindly nate that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on o without prefudice basis with the sole
intention af resalving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed /inferred from this negatiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



From: Zoom Autowerks [mailto:zoomautowerks@gmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, 15 September, 2018 1:13 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Letter of Claim for SLR 7996 T

Dear Vivian,

- Without Prejudice -

Enclosed please find Letter of Claim for your kind attention,

Look forward to your favorable reply.

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
19450 7920

““zoomautow m
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1EDTS Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...{Pendmg for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
TRTls ) Rl ) _. .--I Submitied | 1me --._|I'...-_' | atu T

i 20 Aug 2018 E;?:g #0190 5%17,600.00 5%17,600.00 ::::::9 for Survey
in : i
Edit Adj Rpt I Eci Estimipteq | View Rpt | | Cancel Case I

Reference Claim Details Show All

Insured: :THAHS-CAB SEIWICES PTEL I'.Tl:lI Cu Reg. Nu 200303878K
i | Main
Claimant:

:ihlcle Reg. SLR7996T Data of Lose: |17/08/2018 10:00 - :59

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS ) [Created by insurer]

GOH HOCK WAH, ID: 515954430

" |[11 Months and 19 Days From LTA Reg Date {Man ¥r)]

| Claim Type: | TP / C0474239 POLarCOVer | P1680520 (Third Party Only)

Palicy No.
{Claimant):

L [ Vehicle Ftég.
M, SHD3I2BP
(Insured):

C18MPCOO00750

' —— _ |Excess: _ |s$5,000.00
| | Repairer: zﬂum ﬁutuwnﬂ:: Pte Ltd (HQ) 130 Beduk { Reservair Road, Eu.—,,uf, Spring, #08-1339, 470130 Bedok - Tel 94507920

el | AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288 .. [Handled by Richard Ang]

Claimant's
I* | Insurer:

| Adjuster: iI.Im Auto cpnpﬁqpl_:n_fge;_ Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 525’5-3551 .. [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] .
| | Driver/Custo
B | dian NG HOCEK SO0N (60 / Male), MNRIC: S1279766D, Tel: +65B81B8926
[ (Insured):

'Imlla International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63475100

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All |  Compose C;;e:‘lnﬂ.
|+ AXA_SG (21/11/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$19500.00) - SLR7996T - Claim Handler: Richard An... |

= AXA_SG{02/10/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$18630.00) - SLR7996T - Claim Handler: Richard An...
| = AXA_SG (23/08/2018): TP settlement - C0474239/P1680520

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | _Search Tasks | _Create New Task | _Complete ||
Due Date Priority ~ Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dane?
Mo results.

hitps:/isingapore.merimen.comiclaimsindex cimMusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_cimheaderdcaseid=7347865&exlid=2806934CFID=4677632... 1/2
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hitps/isingapore. merimen.comiclaims/index.cim?fusebox=MTRad|uster&fuseaction=dsp_cimheaderdcaseid=7347868exlid=2806938CFID=4677632... 22



11072018 Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLR7996T (C0474239)
[SHD328P]
TP

GOH HOCK WAH
Aug 17 2018 10:00AM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd

Upload Documents | Upload Photos ] Composa Naw Letrer] Uplead Video | Upload Audic i View | View in Browser ¥
Latterstorrespundances 1 per pagl! A o
Mo |Finalize rr. |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [-|Q'- ) o ___ i 'i'I;In_r:Hmt Prlnt
1 (Draft) Third Party Express Settlement ~ Payment Breakdown B @ | e
Documentation o a . 1 ptfpage- rq__i;!g

:N':J __F|||.Jlm-_r' On [& XA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) = == ____-_ j:rﬁn:I;nall Print |

1 20/08/1809:11 | EMAIL - _ g €  Load POF

2 20/08/1809:11  SHD328P INS GIA - | € | Load poF '

3 20/08/1809:11  SLR7996T TP GIA - B ) | € | Load POF |

4 21/08/1805:23  Emall list of SJE to TP o | €© | LoadPOF |

5 23/08/1809:15  Email from TP - Marcus of LKK as SJE | €9 | Loas POF

No iR_Er-_*_'g!f;l.-’R_mrder LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - i ] [Thumbnail | Print |

1 |06/09/18 08:47 LKK Survey Photos ) _ © | oacpor |

2 19/09/1816:12  LKK Resurvey Photos1 - - | @ | LoadPoF |

3 19/09/1816:12  LKK Resurvey Photos 2 - | @ | LoadPoF |

4 19/09/1816:12 TP ESTIMATE_MARKED - ) ) ﬂ | Load PDF |

5 19/09/18 16:30  PARF_COE REBATE - - - ® | Load PDF |

6 19/09/1816:31  IA (with mandate) dd 190918 - © | loacror |

7 10/01/1910:50  AUTHORISATION TO ACT O | waseor |

8 10/01/1310:50  DISCHARGE VOUCHER O [ Load PDF |

9 10/01/19 10:50 | LETTER TO OI - | @ | woadeoF |

10 |10/01/19 10:50 |LOD — € | Load POF |

11 10/01/19 10:50 |LTA SEARCH = = - 1@ [ tocaror |

12 10/01/19 10:50  RENTAL RECEIPT == B €  LoaaroF |

13 10/01/1910:50  TOWING FEE - ) | @ | oadpoF |

14 10/01/19 10:50  WORKSHOP INVOICE ' i | € | LoagpoF |
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | Print ||

There are no document checklists configured.,

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

| Show Remarks To: Handling Insurer
Note: Remarks are private unkss you show |k o other partas,

hitps./isingapore.merimen.com/claims/index cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docview&domainid=1&corole=4&objid=7347864exid=2806638 .. 172



12019 Merimen e-Claimg

hitps:#/singapore. merimen. com/claims/index cim?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docview&domainid=18&corcle=48objid=734T8E&exlid=2806934& ... 2/7



11102018

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR

Praeview

TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SHD328P (Insd veh) Model: ONDA FREED 1.5 G (A)
SLRT7996T (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: | 17/08/2018
Global Sum Settlerment | ' | [X] Yes | [ 1 Mo
Repair Estimate 3 34,474,588
Final Repair Cost i 17,600.00
Loss of Use - days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) o 2,000.00 20 days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee 5 7.45
Towing Fee; ] 120.00
-
Final Settlement Sum (GLOBAL SUM) 3 19,500.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered?

YES [X] NO

(Kindly indicate below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop:

Agreed Liability 100 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA, Liability:

(%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

Assessed Liability (*):

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain coliisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.

(%)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1] | Zoom Autowerks Pte Lid 5 19,500,00
2) £
3) -
:1:| : 5
NUR SHAQILAH BTE ABDOL WAHAB 130#39"

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report: Medical Report/ Bill

{if any)

L



112019 Adjusiar Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregno1sssorissr)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapare 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AXA18015308/UPA3S2

Date: 10/01/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Policy No: P1680520
5::":’““"' Vehicle & 7906t Insured Vehicle No : SHD328P
Date of Loss: 17/08/2018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: CO474239
R & IDENTIFICATION LE
Reg No: SLR7996T
Make & Model: HONDA FREED, 1.5 G (A) Engine No: LEB5S560453
Reg. Date: 29/08/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: GB71033631
Colour White Odometar: 20975 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 co
Market Value/Mew Car Prica: MIA
Sum Insured {S5); Market Value/New Car Price
M EHICLE AT THE TIM E RVEY
General Condition: Good  Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla); Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITI TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/65R15
Front Left Side: Dunlop 8 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 8 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop 8 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 8 mm
The atrove values represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %)
Parts 27,864 .88 18,377.84 9 487.04 34.05
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 6,610.00 3,630.00 2,980.00 45,08
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5%) 34,474.88 22,007.84 12,467.04 36.16
Approved Total (Overridden) (5%) 17,600.00
Nett Amount (S§) 34,474.88 17,600.00 16,874.88 48.95
+ Car Rental (20.0 x 55100.00/day) (5%) 2.000.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 745
+ Other Costs (5%) 120.00
Nett Liability (S$) 19,727.45
Global Sum Settlement (S$) 19,500.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 23/08/2018
Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd (HQ)
Date Inspected: 23/08/2018 Inspecled At: 130 Bedok Reservoir Road, Eunos Spring, #08-1339
Singapore 470130
Estimated Period of Repair: 14.0 days

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index cim?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaclion=gen_printrpl&caseid=T34T86&exlid=280693&CFID=46TT63264C... 1/5



1102018 Adjuster Report

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager; CHEW HSIAQ TONG

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the lime and place of inspechion stated herein. Such inspection has baen carmed out to the bast of cur knowledge and ability but
any other liatwlity under any other circumstances is hereby expressly axciuded.

hiips:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index cim?fusebox=MTRadjuster&luseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=734786&extid=280693&8CFID=467T6326&C... 2/5



1102019

Adjusier Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG
M1-MPY
Repairer's

Parts:
Labour;

Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 10 Jan 2019)

(Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLR7996T)

Validity:

END OF ESTIMATES marker an the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

HOMDA FREED 1.5 G (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Recommended Parts

No. Qty :f}“
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27
28
29
30
K3
az
33
34
35
36
ar
38
39
40

B e R R R T I S NI 'L — 1

Particulars

*FRONT BONNET (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT BONNET HINGE (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT HEADLAMP O/S (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT)

*SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT FENDER O/S (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD (COMNSISTENT)

*SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP (CONSISTENT)
“FRONT FENDER HYERID EMELEM (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT WHEEL HUB (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT WHEEL BEARING (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT KNUCKLE ARM [CONSISTENT)

*FRONT LOWER ARM (COMNSISTENT)

*FRONT TIE ROD (CONSISTENT)

“POWER STEERING RACK (CONSISTENT)

*POWER STEERING RACK CROSS MEMBER (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT DRIVESHAFT (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT DOOR - R/IH (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT DOOR CHECKER (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT DOOR GLASS OUTER MOULDING (CONSISTENT)
“FRONT DOOR HINGES (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT DOOR INNER BOARD (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT DOOR LOCK (COMNSISTENT)

“FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT DOOR REGULATOR (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT DOOR RUBBER (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR (CONSISTENT)
“FRONT DOOR BELACK TAPE (CONSISTENT)
*FRONT DOOR OUTER PILLAR (CONSISTENT)
“FRONT DOOR PILLAR INNER GARNISH (CONSISTENT)
*CENTRE PILLAR (CONSISTENT)

*ROCKER PAMNEL (CONSISTENT)

“FRONT DASHBOARD (CONSISTENT)

*STEERING AIR BAG (CONSISTENT)

*FRONT PASSENGER AIR BAG (CONSISTENT)

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with the

Condition Repairer's Amount
Repair T20.B0FL *-FL
Repair 45 60 FL *-FL
Cracked 1,98040 FL *1,980.40 FL
Distorted 1,050.40FL *1,050.40 FL
MNecessary 55.00 FL *85.00 FL
Not Necessary 295.40FL *-FL
Bent 29.50FL “29.50 FL
Mot Necessary 2540FL *-FL
Distorted 440 B0FL *440B0FL
Torn 120.80FL *120.80FL
Necessary 55.00FL  "55.00FL
Necessary 80.10FL  "BO.10FL
Bent 20040FL *200.40FL
Mecessary 186.40FL “186.40FL
Bent 420.80FL *325.00FL
Bent 350.80FL *350.80FL
Bent 300.30FL *300.30FL
Twisted B9.60 FL “89.60 FL
Bent / Jammed 1,4B0.20FL *1,480.20FL
Dented [ Twisted 890.60FL *990.80 FL
Mot Necessary 1,350, 20 FL *-FL
Badly Dented 1,725.80FL *1,120.00FL
Twisted 950 B0FL *141.00FL
Mot Necessary T5.60FL *-FL
Lower Bent 91.60FL *45.00 FL
Deformed / TAO20FL *7BO.20FL
Cracked

Mot Mecessary 262.80FL *-FL
Mot Mecessary 342 BOFL *-FL
Bent 364, 50FL *364.50FL
Shorted 355.80FL *355.B0FL
MNecessary 110.B0FL  *110.BOFL
Cut 67450FL *520.00FL
Mecessary 56.90 FL *56.90 FL
Badly Dented 1,150.20FL *866.00 FL
Mot Necessary 129.80 FL *-FL
Repair 1,400.30 FL *-FL
Badly Dented 289.40FL *289.40FL
Burst 854 20FL "854.20FL
Activated 248060FL *2,165.00 FL
Activated 3.012.40FL *2,880.00 FL

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

|

hitps:singapore.menmen . com/claimsindex cim?lusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=T34T868axlid=2B06934CFID=46TT6326&C ... 3/5



112019 Adjuster Report

No.

41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55

56
57
S8

Part

Oty No. Particulars Condition Repairer's

2 *FRONT SAFETY BELTS (CONSISTENT) Activated 1,196.80 FL
1 *AlG BAG CONTROL UNIT (CONSISTENT) Activated 981 40FL
1 "AIR BAG CLOCK SENSOR (CONSISTENT) Activated 278.80FL
1 *REAR SLIDING DOOR (CONSISTENT) Dented / Bent 1,105 80FL
1 "REAR SLIDING DOOR INNER BOARD (CONSISTENT) Mot Mecessary 672.40FL
1 *REAR SLIDING DOOR OUTER HANDLE (CONSISTENT) Mot Necessary T4.90FL
1 *REAR SLIDING DOOR LOWER ROLLER (CONSISTENT) Mot Necessary 155.00 FL
1 "REAR SLIDING DOOR CENTRE ROLLER (CONSISTENT) Mot Necessary 160.00 FL
1 "REAR SLIDING DOOR REGULATOR (CONSISTENT) Not Necessary 3B9.40FL
1 “REAR SLIDING DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR (CONSISTENT) Mot Necessary 335.80FL
1 "REAR SLIDING DOOR RUBBER (CONSISTENT) Cut 129.80FL
1 "REAR SLIDING DOOR BELACK TAPE (CONSISTENT) MNecessary 45.80 FL
1 “REAR WHEEL HUB WITH BEARING (CONSISTENT) Mot Necessary 321.40FL
1 "REAR SHOCK AESORBER (CONSISTENT) Mot Mecessary 336.40FL
1 *FRONT TYRE (LOCAL PURCHASE) (@ $200.00 DISC 80%) Cut 450.00FS

(CONSISTENT)

1 *FRONT SPORT RIM (CONSISTENT) Dented / Bent 850.00F5
1 *REAR TYRE (CONSISTENT) Serviceable 450.00F5
1 ‘REAR SPORT RIM (CONSISTENT) Cut B50.00FS

F=Franchise parl. S=Spchett, L=ListitemDise.

Sub Total (S%) 34,181.10 22,782.30
- List Item Discount on L items 20.00/20.00% (S$)

Amount

"1,196.80 FL
*981.40 FL
*278.80 FL

*1,105.80 FL

*FL

“-FL

“FL

*FL

“-FL

“-FL
*129.80 FL
*45.80 FL
*-FL

*FL
*160.00FS

*300.00FS
“-FS
*300.00 FS

6,316.22

4,404 46

Total Parts (5%) 27,864.88

18,377.84

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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11002018 Adjuster Report
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

Thare are no new miscellanasus items selected.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 TO CHECK WIRING AND RESET HEADLAMPS FOCUSING. MNew B0.00 30.00
2 TO REMOVE AND REFIT FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE. New 450.00 300.00
3 TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR UNDERCARRIAGE. MNew 350,00 0.00
4  TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT, New 180.00 60.00
5  TO REMOVE, REPLACE DOOR DAMAGED PARTS AND TRANSFER ALL Mew 400.00 120.00
FITTINGS.
& TO APPLY UNDERCOATING. New 250.00 120.00
T PANEL BEATING. New 2,500.00 1,400.00
8 TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED AREAS, New 2,400.00 1,600.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 6,610.00 3,630.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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