Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 9:46 AM

To: Parthiban, Theerthan

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts; SUR
Subject: RE: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL / 8211577852SG / SLN7819T
Dear Troy,

We are pending invoice and discharge voucher from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 9:35 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts
<NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>

Subject: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL / 82115778525G / SLN7819T

AlG <

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

Este es un mensaje cifrado y seguro. Para leerlo, abra el archivo
adjunto.

Esta € uma mensagem criptografada segura. Para |é-lo, abra o
anexo.

Ceci est une sécurité, un message crypté. Pour le lire, ouvrez la
piece jointe.

NEBESEEN-BEFA—ILTY, BEICEFFTI7A41L
ZRWLTLIEELY,



Click here by 2019-12-16 20:34 EST to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info



