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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April, 2019 11:46 AM

To: Alfred Toh

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB6517C (OI: SNM18D03996C02/7) and 

SHC7282X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18015268/R1wa3) on 15.08.2018

Attachments: LKK Inspection Photos.pdf; LKK Reinspection Photos.pdf; LKKAdjustment1 (1).pdf; 

LKKInspection (1).pdf; LOD.pdf

Your ref: SNM18D03996C02/7 
Our Ref: CC3/CTI18015268/R1wa3 
 
Dear Alfred, 
 
Accident involving Vehicle GBB 6517C & SHC 7282X on 15/08/2018 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
  
This accident happened OID overtake TP and TP make a right turn and collided. We spoke to PIC Ms May Lim ( 
67453833) she aware on the CCTV and agree to settle at best. 
   
We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.     
 
We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd is as follows: 
 

                                                              Amount Claimed        Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair (+GST)                                     S$ 7,512.04                S$ 5,735.84 
2. Loss of RENTAL  ($115.00 x 6.5 days)          S$    720.00                S$    747.50 ( Surveyor recommend 6 days) 
3.Loss of Income  ($ 50.00 x 6.5days)                S$    520.00                S$     325.00 
3. GIA SEARCH                                                  S$         7.49               S$         7.49 
  
                                                                              S$ 8,759.53              S$ 6,815.83 
 
Amount of claim at liability 100% S$ 6,815.83 
 
For your approval please. 
 
 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April, 2019 10:55 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB6517C (OI: SNM18D03996C02/7) and SHC7282X (TP : LKK 

REF - CC3/CTI18015268/R1wa3) on 15.08.2018 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 2:34 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB6517C (OI: SNM18D03996C02/7) and SHC7282X (TP : LKK REF - 

CC3/CTI18015268/R1wa3) on 15.08.2018 

 

LKK REF - CC3/CTI18015268/R1wa3 

CTI REF – SNM18D03996C02/7 (GBB6517C) 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please proceed to negotiate the third party claim at best possible terms as there is no response from mutual client. 

 
Best Regards 

 

Alfred Toh 

Senior Executive 

Claims Department 

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   

Tel          (65) 6389 6183  

Fax         (65) 6224 7478  

Email:     claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 

               alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com 

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com  

Disclaimer :  

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except 

where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized 

disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,

please notify the sender immediately.  

 

 

From: Claims Dept of CTI  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March, 2019 5:47 PM 

To: MAY <jaeauto@pacific.net.sg>; weegiap@singnet.com.sg 

Cc: Hsiao Tong <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay 

<irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB6517C (OI: SNM18D03996C02/7) and SHC7282X (TP : LKK REF - 

CC3/CTI18015268/R1wa3) on 15.08.2018 

 

M/s JAE Auto Pte Ltd 

Attn: Ms May 

 

Dear May 
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We refer to the accident involving GBB6517C & SHC7282X on 15 August 2018. 

 

Based on the nature, we are of the opinion that liability is not in GBB6517C’s favour. 

 

Please advise on the status of your claim against SHC7282X urgently (SUCCESSFUL or REJECTED)  

 
Best Regards 

 

Alfred Toh 

Senior Executive 

Claims Department 

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   

Tel          (65) 6389 6183  

Fax         (65) 6224 7478  

Email:     claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 

               alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com 

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com  

Disclaimer :  

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except 

where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized 

disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,

please notify the sender immediately.  


