Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 September, 2019 10:52 AM

To: 'Pegasus Engineering'

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise For SLN4302L (DOA 17/08/2018)
Hi Vivian,

COR I/s $1150, 5 days. Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 6 September 2019 8:55 AM

To: Pegasus Engineering; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise For SLN4302L (DOA 17/08/2018)
Importance: High

Without Prejudice
Dear Taufikh,
FYNA please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LSES
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From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019 10:13 AM

To: Vivian Tan

Cc: CS ATeam; Admin A

Subject: Re: Finalise For SLN4302L (DOA 17/08/2018)



Dear Taufikh,

Good Day,

We would like to check & follow up on our finalisation for the cost of repair as we have haven hear from
you pertaining to the above.

Hope to hear you soon.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161

On Thu, Jun 27, 2019 at 3:51 PM Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg @ gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Taufikh,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Finalise amount @ Lump Sum $1,150.00 @ 5 working days.

Parts - $127.20
Labour - $1,340.00

Total - $1,467.20 (Less 20%)

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road $628800

Office: 65137748



Fax: 62513161
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