Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 July, 2020 11:12 AM

To: Tyson Koh

Cc: SK Admin; KY; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 6563E & YOUR REF: GBD 470G on 16.08.2018

- LKK REF CC4/ASM18015202/T1hb3

Categories: HMK

Dear Tyson,
We refer further to the below email.

Please be informed that our principal maintain rejection for this case based on Bola 24.

24, Vehicle X — Reversing infout of

parking lot 100% | 0%
— Moving infout of
arking lot
-— L_| B g

Vehicle ¥ — Going straight

Reason: Vehicle reversing
infout or mowving infout of
parking lot should exercise
greater caution|

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 July, 2020 8:46 AM

To: Tyson Koh <tysonkoh @skauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cec: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>; KY <kyleong @skauto.com.sg>; CS A Team <cs-
a@]lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 6563E & YOUR REF: GBD 470G on 16.08.2018 -
LKK REF CC4/ASM18015202/T1hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that Vic is no longer in LKK.



We will check and get back to you.
Hi Admin Team,

Pls reassign the case to respective handler. Thanks. CC4/ASM18015202/T1ha3s2

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Tyson Koh <tysonkoh @skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 July 2020 11:53 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SK Admin <admin @skauto.com.sg>; KY <kyleong @skauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 6563E & YOUR REF: GBD 470G on 16.08.2018 -
LKK REF CC4/ASM18015202/T1hb3

Dear Vic,

May I ask for an update on my appeal.

In view of conflicting statements, may I suggest an amicable settlement at 50/50.
Kindly let me know.

Thank You & Kind regards,
Tyson Koh
HP: 93827852 (24HRS)

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have
received this email in error please notify SK Automobile Pte Ltd. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named. If
you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received
this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking
any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.

On Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 5:00 PM Tyson Koh <tysonkoh @skauto.com.sg> wrote:
Dear Vic,




May | ask for an update on my appeal.
In view of conflicting statements, may I suggest an amicable settlement at 50/50.

Kindly let me know.

Thank You & Kind regards,
Tyson Koh
HP: 93827852 (24HRS)

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have
received this email in error please notify SK Automobile Pte Ltd. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named. If
you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received
this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking
any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.

On Mon, Mar 23, 2020 at 11:33 AM Tyson Koh <tysonkoh @skauto.com.sg> wrote:
Dear Vic,

May I appeal, in view of conflict statement, for an amicable settlement suggests at 50/50.

Please consider and let me know if this is possible.

Thank You & Kind regards,
Tyson Koh
HP: 93827852 (24HRS)

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have
received this email in error please notify SK Automobile Pte Ltd. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named.
If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have
received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying,
distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.

On Mon, Mar 23, 2020 at 11:21 AM SK Admin <admin @ skauto.com.sg> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com>

Date: Mon, Mar 23, 2020 at 10:21 AM

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 6563E & YOUR REF: GBD 470G on 16.08.2019 -
LKK REF CC4/ASM18015202/T1hb3

To: SK Admin <admin @ skauto.com.sg>

Cc: Simon Koh <simon @skauto.com.sg>, KY Leong <kyleong @skauto.com.sg>, Julie Johari

<julie @skauto.com.sg>, Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice
Dear Huey Lee,

We refer further to the below email.



Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available
information at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured’s version is more probable.

It was reported by your client that he was reversing to park the vehicle and our Insured was driving along
the drive way at the time of accident.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.
We will now close the matter in our end.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

N Save the Larthe Print only whetr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March, 2020 4:19 PM

To: 'SK Admin'

Cec: Simon Koh; KY Leong; 'Julie Johari'; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 6563E & YOUR REF: GBD 470G on 16.08.2019
- LKK REF CC4/ASM18015202/T1hb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Huey Lee,



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. It was reported that your client was reversing to park at the
lot when the collision occurred. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate either party’s version.
Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with
our OI we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for
legal assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: SK Admin [mailto:admin @skauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March, 2020 3:31 PM

To: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Cec: Vic (LKKAuto); Simon Koh; KY Leong; CS A Team; Julie Johari; Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 6563E & YOUR REF: GBD 470G on 16.08.2019




Dear Su Li,

Noted with thanks

Regards,
Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Wed, Mar 4, 2020 at 3:26 PM Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Mr Vic.

Hi Vic,

FYNA, our ref CC4/ASM18015202/T1hb3

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 (Ext:119) Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SK Admin [mailto:admin @skauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 3:02 PM

To: CS A Team; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Simon Koh; KY Leong; Julie Johari

Subject: Re: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 6563E & YOUR REF: GBD 470G on 16.08.2019

Dear Joy,

Refer to the above matter.

We would like to check the claim status that we submitted the relevant doc. on 18/06/2018.

Kindly assist to update the claim status / offer as early as possible.

Thank you

Regards,

Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 10:55 AM Julie Johari <julie @skauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam, "WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

Enclosed the final bill and relevant documents for your attention.



Kindly refer to attachment and revert back to us the soonest.

Breakdown as below:

Cost of Repair : S$ 5,136.00

Loss of Rental :S$ 1,920.00 (12 days X S$160.00)

LTA Search 'S 2.00

Total : S$ 7.058.00

If acceptable, kindly forward your discharge voucher to us to enable our client to complete and sign.

We appreciate your early reply

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

Best Regards,

Ms Julie

SK Automobile Pte Ltd (201500047H)
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#03-01 VICOM Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel: 6789 5155

Fax: 6783 5155

DID: 9623 4440



