Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 October, 2018 9:39 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Naz (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: FINAL REMINDER: Finalization for CB7614L
Attachments: 432 - CB7614L.jpg; LOD.jpg; LOA.jpg

Hi Vic

I have attached the LOD, LOA & Tax Inv for yr ref.
Pls kindly revert on yr offer to us for a direct settlement.
Thanks

On Tue, Oct 2, 2018 at 9:09 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Naz,

Solely for a direct settlement, we accept the finalization of $3950 , 04 days.
Thanks

On Tue, Oct 2, 2018 at 8:54 AM Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Winnie,

Apologies for the late reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate
following a check on the part prices. We will proceed to finalize if you are agreeable
with the amended COR;

PARTS -  $3,718

LESS 10% - $3.346.20

LABOUR - $1,600

LESS LUMP SUM 20% - $3,956.96

TOTAL-  $3,950/ 4 REPAIR DAYS

Thank you.



Best Regards,
Naz| Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 28 September 2018 5:00:29 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINAL REMINDER: Finalization for CB7614L

Hi Naz
Is the finalization ready ?
Thanks

On Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 12:05 PM, Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Winne,

Apologies for the late reply. The estimate is being reviewed by the technical adviser. |
will proceed to finalize with you once he is done.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Naz| Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 10:34 AM

To: Naz (LKKAuto); Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: FINAL REMINDER: Finalization for CB7614L

Hi Naz
Pls kindly revert on the finalization.

Thanks

On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 3:06 PM, Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Naz

Pls kindly revert on the finalization.

Thanks

On Tue, Sep 4, 2018 at 9:27 AM, Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Naz

Pls kindly revert on the finalization.
Thanks

On Mon, Aug 27, 2018 at 9:14 AM, Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com> wrote:
HI Naz,

Attached is the after repair photos for yr ref.
Pls kindly revert on the finalization.

Thanks
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