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Nivitha (LKK Auto)
“

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 17 August 2018 9:17 AM
To: assignments
Ce: Admin A
Subject: FW: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving CB7614L & SKK5452H |
yr insured ) on 16/08/18
a-»3am@ (1|8 I\é
winm £
Hi Nivitha, pson © ,’
weicle rot 1N

Kindly assist. =5 Wik e LN
TP AXA = Smart. ssg wuud'ﬂ\da

RA fren dem
Thank you. M*""ﬁ"’ )
Best Regurds,

Mei Kwan | Admin
LEK Aute Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4089:4)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnle@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 5:30 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving CB7614L & SKK5452H | yr insured | on 16/08/18

Evening

| have attached the GIA & estimate & CCTV for yr ref.
Pls kindly assign yr surveyor down for the survey.
Thanks

-

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-2666



Vic !I.I{KAutu!

From: Winnie Chal <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 December, 2018 11:15 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: URGENT & FINAL REMINDER: Finalization for CB7614L LKK REF
CC4/ASM18015174/Nha3

Attachments: DV.pdf

Hi Vie

Attached is the signed DV for yr ref.
Thanks
On Tue, Dec 18, 2018 at 11:54 AM Vic (LKKAulo) <vicalpehf@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Winnie,

We refer further to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured's
part, we have our principal's mandate and propose to offer a global sum of $4,400.00 (all in) to settle your client’s
claim.

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV then forward back to us a copy for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to CONNECT3.

Thank you.

‘"plegse note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on & without prejudice basts, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference sholl be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FRESES .
SLERIT == Save bhe Larth- FPrint only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any attached llems. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thatl you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereol. Thank you.

From: Winnie Chail [mailto:connect3winni ail.com
Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 11:48 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Naz [LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: URGENT & FINAL REMINDER: Finalization for CB7614L LKK REF CC4/ASM18015174/Nha3

Hi Vic

Pls kindly revert on the offer for this case after viewing the CCTV fumished.

Thanks
On Mon, Dee 10, 2018 at 2:35 PM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie(@gmail.com= wrote:
Hi Vie

Pls kindly revert on the offer for this case after viewing the CCTV furnished.



Thanks

On Tue, Dec 4, 2018 at 11:40 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie/@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Vic

Pls kindly revert on yr offer for this case after viewing the CCTV furnished for yr ref.

On Mon. Nov 26, 2018 at 10:31 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnief@gmail.com> wrole:

Hi Vie

Attached is the CCTV for yr ref.

Thanks
On Mon, Nov 26, 2018 at 10:19 AM Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Dear Winnie,

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence yet to
substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for
your perusal.



1211872048 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) »

Re <MANDATE IA=- S8M DV ACCIDENT | Y8LVING
& LES SKK 5452H (Ol) AND CB 7614L (TP
16/08/2018 TOTAL. $4,5 0

Type
© Question

Message
Hi LKK, COR agreed. For LOU, pls offer $100 up to $120. TY.

hitps:/\vp smartclaims axa com.sg/claim-portalhtmiindex-vendor-sanvice-requests himifisarvice-requests/view-message/TserviceRequesiNumbe ... 11



c2connect3

566 Woodlands Rd ( Mandai Estate ) Singapore 728697
UEN no: $3360061L
HP (+65) 9850-9666 Email Connect3winme@gmail com

Your Ref * Pls advise

02 October 2018

AXA Insurance Singapore Pre Lid

8 Shenton Way, #27-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 068811

Dear Sir,

TO PROPOSE A CLAIM OF AN ACCIDENT INVOLVING © ﬂTﬁI-IL & SKK54521
ON 16/08/18.

We refer 1o the above, we are authonized by owner Premiere Coach Service of vehicle no
CB76141. w negotiate and settle the claim on his behall

We hereby quantify our claim as follows -

1 Repair Cost S8 3.950.00
3 Loss of Use @ $150 X 04
= days S$ 600.00

Total S8 4,550.00
We enclosed a copy of each of the following for your consideration:

1) Repair Bill inv: 432

2y Motor Accident report of vehicle no CB76 141

3)  Lener Authonzation (onginal available upon request)
4)  Insurance Certificate

S} Vehicle registration curd

6)  Pre repair inspection (done Naz LKK on 20/08/18)

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above smd documents and hope 1o receive your
favourable reply ASAP

Thank vou

‘r"uu ilﬂ{:t'ﬁ:hf -{- =7

W'Il'lﬂll.. (. 2-.. -

HE. 9550-9&&&
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S1UBIAVE L, #01.25 PAYA UBHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 62564015

11 DECEMBER 2018

TAI SIN ELECTRIC LIMITED By Post & By Email
24 GUL CRESCENT

JURONG TOWN

SINGAPORE 629531

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18015174/Nha3

YOUR REF : SKK 5452H

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK 5452H AND CB 7614L ALONG JURONG TOWN HALL
ROAD ON 16.08.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third-party claim
against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s CONNECT3 acting on behalf of the owner of CB
7614L against your motor insurance policy

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and available evidence at hand, it was
reported that your vehicle had collided to the Third Party vehicle CB 7614L while turning
at the junction. As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) may be affected as
a result of the claim against your policy

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the palicy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the

following to vicalpeh@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not
provided at AXA's reporting centre. The list below i1s not all inclusive and further

document may be required;

+ Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)



&1 UL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UHT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62363561 FAX ; (D65) 62564315

« |If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s} and the
status of the claim

To protect your interast(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please gquote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Vig ;ﬂdpe

Cese Handler

DID: 6841 2096

FAX:. 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c. AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)

cmlin{@taisin.com.sq
(Email)




Vic (LI{I{Autn!

From: Vic (LEKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December, 2018 3:20 PM

To: cmlin@taisin.com.sg

Ce: Admin A Vic (LEKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF: SKK 5452H_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK 5452H AND CB 7614L ALONG

JURONG TOWN HALL ROAD ON 16.08.2018

l P’ Auro
- W -—! Consuftants
Sdm BA B Pie Lid

SEUIAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAIORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

11 DECEMBER 2018

TAI SIN ELECTRIC LIMITED By Post & By Email
24 GUL CRESCENT

JURONG TOWN

SINGAPORE 629531

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18015174/Nha3
YOUR REF : SKK 5452H
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK 5452H AND CB 7614L ALONG JURONG TOWN HALL ROAD ON 16.08.2018

We refer to the above subject matter, We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third-party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s CONNECT3 acting on behalf of the owner of CB 7614L against your motor
insurance palicy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and available evidence at hand, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided to the Third Party vehicle CB 7614L while turning at the junction. As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) may be affected as a result of the claim against
your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under
the palicy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek 1o take conduct of third party claim(s)
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com

within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at AXA’s reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive
and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
+ Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)
« Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)
« \ideo footage of accident (if any)
« Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)
1



s If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior knowledge and
consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter{s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phime: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubil Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

¥ el
ILKK = Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

Thie g-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of tha intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
uninlended reciplent is prohibiled, and may be a violation of law, If you believe thal you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereaf, and inform the
sander that you have deleted the e-mall, all atachments and any coples thereof. Thank you
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LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMNITY
Connectl

566 Woodlands Road | Mandal Estate | 5 (7286571

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLEND. _CBIGIUL  AND SLLSH"}JH

3§5ﬁ Twn gl td j(_h&iL ON Ihlﬂﬂm‘

@ 3
If We, the owner of vehicle no. CBieivL harsby instruct and authorize you to commence repairs 1o
the sald vehicie and to make 3™ party claim on my behalf for my loss and damage.

Your are further suthorited to appoint solicitors on my our behalf and give the solicitors full Instructions as if
I:l'uippﬂntlmmhm;d-mdhum:ﬂmumumhm-mmmmmﬂumduﬂnrmﬁwdﬂn
l;lln,ltﬂﬂthlnfplnydﬂnrlndwhhimrlﬂmdudlmﬂnmﬂ.mmmlﬂllll'ﬂﬂdhlﬂh!
Court in my/ our name against the 1™ party.

You have my/ our full suthority to Instruct my/ our solicitor to nagotiste a settiement with the third party and/
or his insurers on such terms as you deem fit,

Uﬂﬂﬂmnlmfwhlmmllluﬁmuwﬂmmﬂw:ﬂbﬂﬁmmﬂhmmmlhr
m'ufuﬂonumulnddhhwummhrlnln[fwml!mmdmmmmdhhﬂmﬂﬁu
settiemant sum on my/ our behalf directly Into YOUur account

In the event that |/ we am/ are required to attend at my/ our solicitors’ office or to attend Court connection
with my/ our elaim, |/ we shall render full co-operation,

Inthtﬂlmlhltmﬂwrdﬂnmlmtthl!'mmmhlilmunumﬂmuﬂwmmh
mmUuwﬂuﬂummm-mmmm"wwmlmmmﬂnﬂmnmd
any losses recoverable under my/ our policy of insurance. In this respect, |/ we understand and sccept that
ptn-nmlhtllbhmhnrlllqulcmm:mﬂwwuhdﬂmhﬂfwthuﬂrmuhmm

I/ We hereby Irrevocably direct all insurer to make all settlement sums payable to *Connecta” or my, our
!ﬂummdnuttnmt.iudiplwmmmlﬂblfulllndnﬂdhdumhmﬁu

cheutﬂmmmllplldl:nmu..fmdllruﬂywmimﬂulnswlnmndwlﬂnlnﬂm
Mlllmurmubmm.uwtmmmmmwmvmuhMuumh
mrfmﬂnqummuummmwrmmmmmmmmnmuﬂumwm.

ﬂforwhlll'ﬂrrllm.nwfwrinimujlﬂmrfmrdhlwlndwnrﬂﬂluﬂnmﬂnluﬂhlnﬂﬁiw
n‘ti'urhnnmmmth-mlnﬂluumwmhmnﬁ.rmmhnmmllmmdﬂm
h\rwunrmhwrlmpdlwﬁnunntmrmmh.lim“wmmmmmMImﬂd
vmruﬂlrbllwmrr-unnnanruummmmmlmndmmfwrmmtnmwu
th.dWlmmm.uﬁuuumwh.

b o 08 2018

Signature

\!\Nm{m Chow

Name : F;R'EW-H'-’E ' Name of Witness: 4
NRICNo. . 5312 bs30K NRIC No ; §9%o b0 B

(Company stamp, if applicable)




To

LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMNITY

Connect3

566 Woodlands Road | Mendal Estate | § (728637)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. _CB3GIML  aND SevSus) H

aT_Jueng  Town Mol 1A AL ow 16|08 1ok
nOran

L

Ja

I/ We, the owner of vehicie no. (B AGIY L hereby Instruct and authorize you to commence repairs ta
the said vehicle and to make 3™ party claim on my behalf for my loss and damage.

Your are further authorized to appoint solichors on my our behalf and give the solicitors full instructions as if
muppulmmlntﬂmwlmmmmhmusmmmﬂumnGunﬂnwwdah
llllﬂnthlthlrﬂnlﬂ'rdﬂwlndwhhinmnindudir'ﬂnmm\r.mmmmlmlpmmdhpm
Court In my/ our name against the 3™ party

‘fﬂuhl'l'lmﬂout"ullluﬂ'mﬂwwmuuﬂmrfwr:dkmmnqnmunmmmwmmmhﬂmmlw
or his insurers on such terms as you deem fit.

Upan resolving my/ our claim, you are authorized to agree with my/ our solicitors on the amount of their
wﬂuﬁnﬂm-nﬁdﬁhwuhmmfwmﬂm snd to receive payment of the balance of the
Hﬂhn-mmnnnmwnurhmﬂmhnumrm

In the event that I/ we am/ are required to sttend at my/ our solicttors’ office or to attend Court connection
with my/ aur claim, |f we shall render full co-operation.

lnth:mntmttmwuurdlinmhutth-!"puwmfarhmnmml:nmmuﬂunrunmh
m'M'lh.Umwtlm-luwutnM.-:Hmmhﬂmfwwﬂlmmfmth-nmﬂlmhmd
wlm:mmmfnwpdwmmm mmm.uummwmm
mlﬂhﬂ-tnb-nullLmltmhlnnmﬂﬂmhdﬂmﬂmhtuumrmuhmﬂhm

I/ We hereby irrevocably direct all insurer to make all settlement sums payabie to “Connect3” or my/ our
soligtors, and not to me. Mm:hﬂhmllmdnﬂmhmﬁm.

Hrl'telﬂ'tlrn-nttumIipildtnI‘I‘llfull:llrlﬂhhrdwuuclmmthlnsut!flhﬂuirdhdﬂdhmandfur
n-ﬂlnmurmummmummmmmmnrmmhmwm“w
mrrwrchnquumurmmmmtﬂmmmmmnmmmummmﬂu

If for whatever reason, my/ our Insurers reject my/our clesim for Indemnity for the cost of repairs and/ or any
Mhuhuumlbllundlrthlpﬂﬂnﬂimnmmmnhmnﬂuwurmmﬂmmdﬂm
hvnuumwInmnnMﬁwduunutcu-urmhd.hmlfmlpnmdwmmpwmhﬂummd

ruurnlniirbil-nd-umhuundawmhummﬁtimrﬂmm{mrhﬁﬂﬂmwm
the difference in amount, as the case may be.

Datethis ' of ©OF 2018

4
Signature ; A=
Name : Name of Witness:
NRIC N& NRIC Mo -

(Company stamp, if applicable)




redefining / Insurance

CLAIM REF : SEMO0SDV.
INSURED : TAI SIN ELECTRIC LTD

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/I, PREMIERE COACH SERVICE, CO. REG. NO.53126530K hereby agree to accept the sum of
dolfars FQUR THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED ONLY (5$4.400.00) paid to us/me by AXA INSURANCE

PTE LTD as full and final settiement of all claims of whatever kind including damages for personal
injuries and damages to property that we/| may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or
their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle no, SKK 5452H as a result of an accident along JURONG
TOWN HALL TOWARDS AYE on 16/08/2018 of which we/l were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/
passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehicle no. CB 7614L,

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whasoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SKK S452H Iin connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/| hereby declare that we/| are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settiement.

it is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SKK 54524,

Dated this 19 day of Def. 2018

Claimant’s Signature i X _?q':\\‘
'H _:'_J

Scanned with CamScanner



cJconnect3
558 Wooalanas Hoad
Singapore 725687
Tel (+55) G850.0866 Email connecidwinnis@gmail com
UEN No: 53360061L

BILLTO:
INVOICE NO.: 432
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd  DATE 2-0ct-18
8 Shenton Wav, #27-01 AXA Tower DO NO -
Singapore 06881 1 PIO NO -
VEHICLE NO CB7614L
TERMS COD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Accident damage claim repair cost to vehicle CB7614L § 3.950.00

Accident date | 16/08/18

SUB-TOTAL [ $ 3.950.00

TOTAL: §  3.950.00

EAQE

* If no discrepancy is reporied within 7 days from
ihe dale of this siatemenl Ihe account will be
considerad as comect

* A 1% Late Payment Charge will be /mposed an
any oulstanding balance in the nex! siatement. if
no paymeni is recaived

* All cheque(s) should be crossed and made

payable 1o * Connectd "



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Vehicle No: |SKK 5452H (Insd veh) Model: KING LONG
ICB Te14L (TP vah)
Date of Accident: [16/08/2018
Global Sum Settlement | ' [ [X] Yes | 1 No
Repair Estimate 3 8,208.00
Final Repair Cosl 5 3,850.00
Loss of Use § 480 008 4days at $120.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 days
LTA f GIA Search Fee 5 0.00
Others: ] $| 0.00
Final Setllement Sum (GLOBAL S'l;.'.i) $ 4,400.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
Ibelow) '

A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agread Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Appiicable. Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No.
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: a &

BOLA Liabllity (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assassed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) JCOMNECT 3 5 4,400.00
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 281212018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

/

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice: Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill {if any)



' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408533
- TEL 6258 1561 FAX 8258 4115

Reg. No: 198807186R GS5T Reg. Mo. 15-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automobiia

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/ASM18015174/Nha3g2
oWk NGAPORE 05 owe awzas | IR
ATTN RICHARD ANG Code: ASM °
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKK 5452H Veh. Inspected CB 7614L
Policy No. GAD54696/1 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S8M00SDV Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 17/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KING LONG c.c BE81
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. LABR1FSH2ZFB101375 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 204462 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |366/11 R225 AMBERSTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |386M11 R225 AMBERSTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[366/11 R22.5 (D) AMBERSTONE 6/6 mim
L/H Rear Tyre |366/11 R22.5(D) AMBERSTOMNE 6/6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE /S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  16/08/2018 Inspection Date 20/08/2018
Survey held at CONNECT3
7 OLD TOH TUCK ROAD
SINGAPORE 597848
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607 188R GST Reg No, 18-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. CB 7614L
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
of Parts Condition
o e Workshop (S)| (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|RH COMPARTMENT COVETS @51650 00(CONSISTENT) |DENTED 3.300.00 3,000.00
1|RH REFLECTOR LAMP ASSY (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 118.00 118.00
1|RH COMPARTMENT LAMP [CONSISTENT) CRACKED 410.00 200.00
1|RH REAR WHEEL COVER (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1,300.00 -
LABOUR
1|RH RIM COVER (CONSISTENT) SCRATCHED 580.00 400,00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -371.80
5.708.00 3.346.20
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING 1,000.00 700.00
LABOUR CHARGES.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF RH 1.500.00 900.00
REAR WHEEL COVER .
2.500.00 1.600.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,208.00 4 946.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPMRS 3,950.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) ’
Report RefMNo. CC4/ASM18015174/Nha3q2
f]- ﬂ
[l
MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIER - This Repor s made salely for ihe uss snd benedit of (e Cliewi named as the frani pege sf this Repan
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