Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 12:15 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A; 'Alfred Toh'

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE2626G (OI : CAI - TBA) and SHB738A
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18015155/Nwa3) on 14.08.2018

Attachments: LKK Inspection Photos.pdf; LKK Reinspection Photos.pdf; LKKAdjustmentl.pdf;

LKKInspection.pdf; LOD.PDF

Your Ref : TBA
Our Ref: CC3/CTI18015155/Nwa3

Dear Irene

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 2626G & SHB 738A ON 14/08/2018 ALONG SOUTH BRIGDE RD

We refer to the above matter

This accident happened OID change lane, TP travelling straight. BOLA 15 applies.

We did clarify with OI the nature of accident, he agreed to settle and aware of NCD issues

We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed

1. Cost of Repair (+GST) S$ 43,037.64
2. Loss of RENTAL ($ 113.42 X 9 day) S$  1,020.78
3. Loss of Income ( $50.00 x 1 days) S$ 60.00
4. GIA SEARCH S$  7.00
S$44,125.42

Amount of claim at liability 100% S$ 13,156.08

For your approval please.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Amount Revised
S$ 12,078.30
S$ 1,020.78( Surveyor recommend 6 days)
S$  50.00
S$ 7.00

S$ 13,156.08



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 August, 2018 2:27 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE2626G (Ol : CAl - TBA) and SHB738A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI118015155/Nwa3) on 14.08.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SHB 738A at M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands).

Enclosed for your perusal is:
e TP GIAreport
e TP estimated cost of repair
e Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



