Hsiao Trma SLI{KAutu!

From: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Saturday, 2 March 2019 5:14 FM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YNS1408 (O : CTI -
SNM1B8D04085C02) AND SGJTHBH (TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI18015110/Upa3) on
17/08/2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please proceed to settle third party as per your advice,

Thank you.

Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
Direct (65) 6388 6174

Fax (65)6224 7174 /6224 7478

www sq.cntaiping. com

ANMIVERSARY
la Sempapace iwave 1918

Oisclaimer .

This message is confidential; ity cantents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre, Lrd. excepr
where pravided for in @ written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Any unaurhorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, gither in whole or partial, s prohibired {f you are nor the intended recipienr of the message,
please notify the sender immediarely

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 21 February, 2019 9:29 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408B (Ol : CTi - SNM18D04095C02) AND
SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer o our mandate dated 04/11/2018.

Kindly let us have your mandate/instruction as third party is chasing for offer.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-9197 | email: chewhi@®kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 02-25 | §{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 6 November 2018 12:03 PM
To: 'claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com' < cntaiping.com>

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; "chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com'

<chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408 (Ol : CTI - SNM18D04095C02) AND
SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018

Yourref : SNM18D04095C02
Our ref : CC4/CTI18015110/Upa3qg2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5140B(0I) & 5GJ 768H(TP) ON 17/08/2018

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured driver collided onto third party parked vehicle. Liability is down
against our insured driver.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the occident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer " FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at 513 A ll-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amouni Revised

Claimed
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 322,799.67 $12,555.72
2. Loss of Rental [Sdays x $180.00) $ %00.00 $ B800.00 [5days x $160.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 200

Total $23.70147  $13.357.72
**04 days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = 5days
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

For your approval please.



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkaute.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 12:36 PM

To: claim ipin

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)

<vicalpeh@ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408B (Ol : CT1 - TBA) AND SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT118015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018

Hi Sirs/Mdm,

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 21 August 2018 3:50 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Ce: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angie. foo@sg.cntaiping.com=; Hslao Tong [LKKAuto)
<chewht@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com=

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408 (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SGI768H (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT118015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle 5G] 768H at M /s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please note that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@ |kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.svmanteccloud.com




Hsiao Tnnﬂ !LKKAutnz

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 23 March 2019 8:45 AM

To: 'Ong Chin Kiat'; Claims Dept of CTI

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving YN51408 (O] : CTI -
SNM18D04095C02) AND 5GJT68H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18015110/Upa3) on
17/08/2018

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Case has been settled at a global sum of $13,250.00{all-In) with Third Party repairer.
We are pending for signed DV from third party and will proceed to close file once DV received.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fux: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Saturday, 2 March 2019 5:14 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408 (Ol : CTI- SNM18D04095C02) AND
SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Please proceed to settle third party as per your advice.

Thank you.

Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908
Direct (65) 6388 6174



Fax (B5)6224 7174 / 6224 7478

ANNIVERSARY
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Disclatmer

This messagte s canfidential; fts contents do not constitnte a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lrd. except
where provided for in a wrilten agreement between vou and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid Any unanthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited If vou are not the infended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immedfarely.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@|kkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 21 February, 2019 9:29 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408 (01 : CTI - SNM18D04095C02) AND

SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our mandole dated 06/11/2018.

Kindly let us have your mandate/instruction as third party is chasing for offer.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 6 November 2018 12:03 PM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Ce: Vic [LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admi lkkauto.com>; 'chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com’
iat.o ing.com>

Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408 (Ol : CTI - SNM18D04095C02) AND
SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI18015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018



Your ref : SNM18D04095C02
Our ref : CC4/CT118015110/Upa3q2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5140B(Ol) & 5GJ 768H(TP) ON 17/08/2018

we refer o the above matter.

The occident occurred when our insured driver collided onto third party parked vehicle. Liability is down
against our insured driver.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval fo offer Third Party repairer " FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" of $13,357.72(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised

Claimed
1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) $22.799.67 $12.555.72
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $180.00) $ 900.00 §$ B0DO.00 (5days x $140.00)
3.LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2,00 $ 2.00

Total $23.701.67  $13,357.72
**04 days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = Sdays
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for yvour perusal,

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 12:36 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vic [LKKAuto)

<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN51408 (OI : CT1 - TBA) AND SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018

Hi Sirs/Mdm.

Enclosed tor your perusal is:
TF estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 202-25 | S{408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August 2018 3:50 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Ce: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angle Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

<chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN5140B (OI : CT1- TBA) AND SGJ768H (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/CTI18015110/Upa3) on 17/08/2018
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle SG] 768H at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
. Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition
Please note that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.
We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405/ 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 2000062621

Date 12.092018

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Lid
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleal Tower

Singapore 0799049

Attn: Motor Claim Department

Dear SirMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES : S0 T68H / YN 51408 ON 17.08.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SGI768H | which was involved
in the captioned accidemt with your insured vehicle no: YN S1408 . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage 1o the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
yvour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 12.555.72
2} Loss of Rental 5 500,00
3)  GIA Search Fee $ 2.00

S 13,457.72
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the cluims:
a) Final Repair Invoice b) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement
¢) GIA Search Result d) Letter of Authorisation, ec...
e) GIA Report t) Police Report
2} I'C & Driving Licence hi Insurance Certificate

i} Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as s00n as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimani.

Thank you. o
Yours faithfully,

Jason Tang (jasoniaif;
For Fastech Auto Pre id
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Our Ref: CCO/CTIHBOI5110/Upa3
14 SEPT 2018

N & J SHIPY ARD SERVICES
158 RACE COURSE ROAD
SINGAPORE 218601

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear SirMadam.,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 51408 AND SGJ 768H ON 17/08/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform vou that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid to deal with
the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SGJ 768H against your motor insurance policy,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario. liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

AN
CHEW HSIAO TONG
Case Handler
DID: 6742 3197
FAX: 6741 4108
EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Moter Claims Dept)
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owner of vehicle no, Wl %3 H in cons:derauun of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle 16 ] T64H at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever
amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings. if necessary, under my name, tor the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use.
ete. and to their appointing solicitor (o act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I"We further agree and undertake 1o indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

-

.
Signature of Owner : ;"4/

Name of Owner : Wﬁ\ bﬁF hﬂ
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Policy No : DMCVSN30S51461800 Claim No : SNM18D04035C02
Claimant : WONG KOK FAH
Amaunt ¢ B%13,250.00

Singapere Dollars THIRTEEM THOUSAND ‘TWO HUNDRED FIFTY Oonly
I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to he paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invalving

Claimant Vehicle Mo. : SGJT6EH

Inaured Velicle No. : ¥YNS1l40B
Date of lLoss : 17/08/2018
Place of Accident : WEST CORST PARK CARPARK 3

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCRE} PTE. LTD., 1/We agres absclutely te
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE. LTD. and/ar

N & J SHIPYARD SERVICES
LAKHDEEP SINGH

Insured Hams s
Priver Name H
from all clsims, present or future in respect of all loss, imjury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the sald aceident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD.

{1} Global Sum 55 13,250.00
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TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452062 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 2000062621

Tax Invoice : 20509
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Lid
3 Anson Road Date 12092018
#16-00 Springleaf Tower Vehicle No  SGJ 768H
Singapore 079909 MakeModel - MERCEDES E250
Chassis'Eng#
Attn : Motor Claim Department Accident Date  ~ 17.08.2018
Claim No
Reférence DEIR  -20509
Paolicy No
Amount
To proceed on parts by parts repair s$ 11734.32
inclusive of knocking .spray painting
labour charges and ete.
E. & O. E. Total = S% 11734.32
GST (@ 7% : S% $21.40
Amount Due - 88 12555.72

X

for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
ANl Tnvoices are subjected (o GST




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520 / 6746 5786
Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: WONG KOK FAH Invoice : DCR-2018-08-24
Date : 30.08.2018

Agreement No : 20081
Payment Term : LOD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SIR7314K | DB18-20509 ) S 900.00
Rental Period from 25.08.2018 to 30.08.2018
E.& Q. E. Total 900.00
LINA PANG

for Dynamic Car Rental



Dynamic Car Rental

I KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6. #01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Co. Reg. No. 52028467K

No. 20081
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Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

m RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
NME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Manday to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: Ma00017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-1B-127626
Date of Request: 20/08/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwes Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 20/08/2018

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. YN5140B

Accident Date 17/08/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.,
YN51408 China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple, Lid, 30/07/2018-01110/2018 6388 6111
Thank You.

The images provided o you are taken from the original reports forwarded 1o the centre by the membars of the General Insuranca
Associmtion of Singapore and we take no responsibility for thair accuracy or contents and shall be under no kability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_... 24-Aug-18
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-127828
Date of Reguest; 20/08/2018 Your Refl No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Ple Ltd
1 Kak) Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kakl Bukit
Singapore 417883
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 20/08/2018
Engquiry By Tang Kok Wee. Allan
TP Vehicle No. YMNS1408
Accident Date 17/08/2018

DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.
This is a computer generated documant and requires no signature
For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chequs
https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 24-Aug-18



