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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 1:51 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: 3773175891SG *Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015107/Upa3 [ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SKV 4216Y(OI) & SLM 1790K(TP) ON 15/08/2018]

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
As per video footage, we could observe TPV was travelling straight within the lane, it is very likely that our insured 
was also travelling straight but on the right-turn only lane. As such, liability is not in our favor. Please proceed to 
settle claim at best. 
 
However, please do check with insured and clear on this accident. 
 
Regards, 
George Lee 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416 
 
Ming-Yao.Lee@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 28 August 2018 12:19 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao 
Subject: Your Ref: 3773175891SG *Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015107/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 4216Y(OI) & 
SLM 1790K(TP) ON 15/08/2018] 
 
Your Ref: 3773175891SG                                  
Our Ref: CC6/AIG18015107/Upa3 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 4216Y(OI) & SLM 1790K(TP) ON 15/08/2018 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have uploaded a copy of third party video in Merimen for your easy reference. 
 
From third party video, it shows that our insured was going straight(on the right-turn only lane) instead of 
turning right and resulted the collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our insured’s favour. 
 
Kindly let us have your comments/ instruction after viewing the video. 
 
We will engage insured on this matter once we receive your instruction. 



2

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 


