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Vehick: Owner Particulars — = —

Drwener 10 Type: . o Singapors NRIC . j
| Owner |0: BS400 '

Vehicie Details

Vehicle No_ SEV289X
| Wehicle to be Exported: Me
| Itended De-registeation Crate: 24 Augg 2018

Winhichk: Make: LAND ROVER

Wehics Model: FREELANDER 2 LF 321 [A) ABS B G/D SR

Primary Colour- White

Mantacturing Year: 2011 |

Engine No- B6324531051116361 !

Cnassts Mo SALFAZAAZEH262920 I

Mascimum Power Outpur 17104W 229 bhol |

Open Market Valus: $4021800 !
" Original Ragistration Diate: 20 Aug 2011 |
| First Ragistration Date- 22 Aug 2011 !
| Trangter Count o |
| Actual ARF Paic: $40.21800 ]

Intended PARF Rebate Details N S ol e

PARF Eighblty: M S B S, e
| PARF Bigibilty Expiry Date: N T %
| PARF Rebate Amount: 524,130.00 18 C '

Intended COE Rebate Details =20 ,\Y M

COE Category: B- Car (1601cx & above)

COE Period(Years): 10 |

QP Paid: $4552100 |

COE Rebate Amaount: £19.40300 i
| Total Rebate Amount: $43,73300 |

The inforration contained herain is cormeot 25 & 20 Aug 2018
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Bi20/4014 Singapors Used Car Listings -

sGCAarMART.COM
THE ONLY PLACE TOR SMART CAR BUYIRS
Land Rover Freelander Used Vehicle List (5 vehicles)

Zar Model Price Depreciation  Reg Data EngCap  Mileage  Company Availability
Lantl Rover Freslander 2 3.28 - - Fapug-2011  3192cc - Rispiocn Agancy Avaitable
4SE

| Rabate Amaunt As At 31-07-2018 ls $46167, Road Tax Bxpiry 21/08/2018.

2fftee No, = 62233007

Audrey - 0 | Jeremy Lim - 0

_and Rover Freelander 2 324 $59,800 $13,830 fyr 21-Juk2011 3192cc 70000km  FasterAuto Trading Available
4SE

LD Lo, Balluon Schisme Or Lissing Avaliablis, 1 Ovimsr,Low Milesge Done Orily 70,000Km, Full Agent Senviced, Ex-Bankmuptoy And Bad Credit

‘Walcame, Guarantes Buy Back 4t $23,000 By July 2011 Free Personal A...

Qffice No. - B161970"

ﬂﬂe - 07480900, | Nmmy - 31010212 | Thomas - S6645002

g Rover Freelander 2 3.24  $52,800  $12710/y  03-Mar-2011  3,192¢cc 90,000 km Available

~ol Whie With Matching Sitwer Chrome Trim, Wedl Maintaines By Owner And Tn Smooth Running Condition. Ready For Viwing And Depling. & High Rider
Mith Coo| Features. An Excslient Ride For Business Or...

e Mo, - =

Casith - H1088B10

| gﬂuwwz:m $53,500 $13,100 fyr FiFebatil  3,192cc 73300 km  PrimeMotor & Leasing  Avaitable
| H

Shegant Blark SUV, Grie Owner Only, Low Milage Dane, Powerful Deive, All Whisl Deive, With Twin Mooarodl, Viery Well Maistained, Drive Away With
Minimm Diven Fayment, Fledble 14 Hogse Lyon Packages Av...

Office No. - 66723113 o

Larvy - 96661029 | Eliz - BA6BO011 | Jack - 91096509

Land Rover Freelander 23,24  $51,800  $12,510 /yr 17-Feb-2011  3,192¢c 143,000 km Available
HSE

Careful Owner. Seigom Deiven. Price Negotiabia.

Oifice No..- -
Hioryston - 92239689

ig}':_arfﬂlirrhmambﬁmwdmmedshwﬂanmtuuﬁmHmuu.Niﬂmhlmmmlmw.ﬂmmphmdmsmﬁb,mmmﬁ
mrs,Emcm‘r‘aq,vmsftrudns-,I-'ryl_:ridcair:;ipnrt#m-nrﬂﬂumummmabgharﬁmrmm.mtupwm.mmﬁmgammmmm,
campeirk rates & car |rsurance, We fave new car dealers comptising paralldl importers, suthoelsed car dawlers, and usad car dealeis on our st Find new o3t
price: lists, e car fauncives 3nd hew car promotions, and 2ise mitormg advice, tar reviews & car niewy on the [atest models, Visit our partner sites for 115
oeenings for Singapare jobs, real estale properiies (or s3le, mover, car perfoenipnee partd, or discussion, ferym discussion, mommercie vehicke leising & C0E
el !

tmmummmm. ]

it iwww.sgcarman. comiused_carsisearch resull JWMWMWWEWT 11



Celine Fnﬂ [LKI{hutu!

Fram; Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbscom>
Sent: Thursday, 23 August 2018 .54 PM

Te: Celine Fong (LKKAUTD)

Ce: LKK Valuation; Shiau Chan (LKKAutD)

Subject: RE: Valuation Reguest

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,

We rafer to the below gmails.

Please let us have the valuation report for SDV2E9SX.
Thank you.

Audrey Goh

CHG/ WM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
D35 Bank Ltd

Tel - GETE 8026

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 23 August 2018 15:04

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Ci: LKK Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <slewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

This mail originated from an external party outside D8S - celinefong@lkkauto.com.

Dear Audrey,

Tae Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SDV289X MV: $54K FS: $43.8K
2) SKC3775G MV: $25K FS: $22K

As at August 2018

Bast Regands,

Celine Fong

LKEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6256-3561 | email: calinefougilidiauto.com | fus: ba56-4315
Bik 51. Pova Ubt Industrial Park, Ubi Avenne 1, #02-25 | S(408033])

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs. com>

Sant: Thursday, 23 August 2018 10:13 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuUto) <celinefong@|kkauto.com>

Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Valuation Request



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

e

Fram: Celine Fong [LKKAUtS)

Sant Thursday, 23 August 2018 3:04 P
Ta: Audray Hwea Ling GOH

Cz LEK Valuation; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Valuation Request

Cear Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SDVZESX MV 554K FS: 543.8K
2) SKC3775G MV §25K FS: 822K
As at August 2018
Best Regards,
Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
phemes bagb-antn | email: colinofonge bk ocom | fax: 6256-4415
Blk 51, Payva Ubl Industrinl Pirk, Ubl Avenog'y, #62-25 | S{408943)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Sant: Thursday, 23 August 2018 10:13 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@Iikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sabject: RE: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,

We refer to the below emails.

May we have the update of the valuation?
Trank you,

Audrey Goh

CBG/WM Credit Collection

Risk Management Group

DBS Bank Ltd
T2l - 6878 9026

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) v:gg'iiﬂefggg@ir,kgugg,;nm:

Sant: 20 August 2018 12:22
To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dhbs.com>
Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.coms>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

This mall originated from an external party outside DBS - celinefong@lkkauto.com.
1
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