Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 2:08 PM

To: ‘Justin Wong'; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: PRS REQUEST : ACCIDENT ON 31/07/2018 INVOLVING FBL6824M AND

SJR4346M, ALONG HOLLAND ROAD & LORNIE ROAD

Categories: HMK

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Justin Wong [mailto:justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 11:01 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: PRS REQUEST : ACCIDENT ON 31/07/2018 INVOLVING FBL6824M AND SJR4346M, ALONG HOLLAND ROAD
& LORNIE ROAD

Dear LKK,

Kindly assist with urgent PRS from Honda Workshop representing vehicle no: FBL6824M.
Person in-charge is Mr Toh Boon Wah, contactable at 91121132.

Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims
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EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
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