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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-95071%8-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCI18014963/Kqd3

Date: 16-06-2018

I

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 7584 Veh. Inspected SLU 2366T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1B00BOBEMFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  CWS (SERENE LER) Assign Date 16/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  10/08/2018 Inspection Date 16/08/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
205 BRADDELL ROAD
Blk C. 3rd Floor
SINGAPORE 579701,
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




MS @ FirstCapital

6 Raffies Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fac (65] 6222 3547

MS First Capital Insurance Limited cCo®eg Mo (950000060 GST Reg. Ne M2-0001675-4

Claims & Mator Undsnwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Oty House Singapore 0BBET7

Tek {55] 6307 3848 Fax [65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapitalcom.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.
Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

13-08-2018 Our Ref No
10-08-2018 Claim Type
SH7699X Third Party Vehicle
205 BRADDELL ROAD BLOCK C CAR DEPT
ANDREW
63837362/ 0 Fax No
DIRECT SETTLEMENT: EST. COR - $2290.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
MNA Fax No
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. D1800B06EMFSH

. Third Party

. SLU2566T

. 62815767

. 68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cec : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

COMFORTDELGRO Attsntion. NIL
ENGINEERING PTE LTD
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required

mbar 0! RAREERIN (RS HARCE GADUR




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 17 August 2018 3:58 PM

To: ‘Claim Waorkflow System'; assignments

Cc: SEREMELER@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
5uhj£l:t: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006066MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18014963Kqd3.pdf

Dear Serene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLU 2566T.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 2:10 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006066MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstca pital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 8:19 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SEREN ELER@ MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006066MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System
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SLUBTAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX ¢ (D65) 61564315

Your Ref: D18006066MFSH Date: 17 August 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18014963/kKaqd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLU 2566T .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 16/08/2018 at the premises of M/s COMFORTDELGRO. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 18§ 3.768.88
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 1.452.24
“Check” Items Amount 1S3 280.00
Market Value 158 -
LTA Reimbursement Value :S% -
Nett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser



WMBHHTE103523.07 | Ajgx Mars Pl Lid - Sukil Marah
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 110672018 01:08
SUBMITTED BY: Victar And

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleasa raport CG‘ITE(:'.IE the detalls of the accidenl 0 speed up the claims process.

2, This Farm must ba comploied by the Polcyholder andlor the Authcrised Drrivar,

3. Infarmation provided must be as fruthiul and accurate as possivle. Ay wiful misrepresentation or withalding of mater al facts may allow msurance companies lo
repudiate policy ability.

4. The issue &nd acceptance of this Form by insurance companies s nol an admission of policy fiability on the part of the insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred 1o the Police for investigation.

&. This sapor will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by tha General Insurancea Association of Singapare (GiA) for
archiving and that coples of fhis report will, for 3 fee, be made available upon application by interested parkies.

7. By the lodgermant of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consant io the archiving of this repont at the centre and W ¢opies of the repor being made availabls
aloresald

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 11/08/2018 01:08
Date Of Accident 10/08/2018 14:00
Exact Location Of Accident ALONG PUNGGOL EAST
Country/State of Loss SINGAFORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
“ehicle Registration Number SLUZSEET
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner COMFORTDELGRO RENT-A-CAR PTE. LTD
Co Reg No 198105775H
Email Address MOEMAIL
Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone MNo OFFICE-BB8208858
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer MAZDA
Mode| MAZDA 3
E;qa{flr;[fﬁe”:ol which vehicle was being used al .\ rp
Are you elaiming under your own insurance policy
for repair o your vehicle? NG
If Mo, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY
Yehicle Category FRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURAMCE PTELTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Flaat Policy YES
Policy Number M4soa02
Cover Note NMumber M,
Drriver
Name aof Driver TAN BAN HONG
MHRIC No STa24122|
Date Of Birth 17/08/1979
Cccupation INDOOR
Date OF Driving Pass 01/04/2004
Driving Experienca 14 YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
Gender MALE
Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-80118083
Fax NMumber
Contact Number OFFICE-20118083
EMail Address MOEMAIL



i BLK 637A PUNGGCL DRIVE
Address 414431

Postecode B21637
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - HIRER

Wehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle 3

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Yehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance, W
Mumber of Fassengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

VWas the accident reported to the police? MO
If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

| was traveling along Punggol East on the left lane, | braked my car to a stop when taxi SHT699X from behind collided onto the
rear of my car. Damages to my car were on the rear portion, Mo injuries were involved.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for sttachment? YES

Was thers any video captured by Car Camera? M

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SHTGE9X

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HYUNDA/KO 1,7L CRDIVBLU
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Catagory TAX]

MName of Driver
NRIC/Fassport Mumber
Contact Number

Address

Postoode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)



Sketch Plan
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Commeon Statement

ACCIDENT STATEMENT (2000 characters)

| was traveling along Punggol East on

rear portion. No injuries were involved.

SH7699X from behind collided onto the rear of my car. Damages lo my car were on the{

the left lane. | braked my car to a stop when taxi

Tax| Vouchar ko

DECLARATION

|AWe daclate thal the above particulars & infarmation provided Abov Ara ree \n 2very aspec

VERIFIED BY AJAX MARS AEPOATING OFFICEA -
MUHAMMAD FAIZAL BIN PABILA

MARS COfticar

Jot Complete Date/Time

Fregestarmd Chanar of Diriganr's E‘-; A

Crate Time

10 August 2018 a8 5:41 PM

10 Aligus 2018 a1 5 41 PM

Page 4 of 19



15/08/2018

SPARKY

AR CARL

705 Braddell Road S(579701)

1st

ACCIDENT REPAIR ESTIMATE

Our Ref:
Type of Claim P
Ins Company 1/ FCI
Excess
Date of Accident HOS201 S
Suggested Days of Repair
Repair Estimate _'
Parts (a) Cost/ List Price Hems b 1. 498.60
Plus/Less 20% 5 299.72
Fotal of Cost/ List 5 1.198.58
(b} Nen Price Items 5 -
l.ess
Total of Nett Item
e} Special Nett ltems 5 280,00
Total Parts Cost (Appendix A) 5 1,478.58
Labour (Appendis B) 5 21,290.00
Tuotal Repair Cost 5 3.768.88

The above total will be subjected to T4 OGS T

SLU2566T

Vehicle Mo,

Make & Model AMAZDAZ SEDAN L5 AT ELG

207
JM6BN22ABJ0182572

Year of Manufaciure

Chassis No.

Engine Ma.

Policy ko

Time of Accident

In-house Vehicle Assgssor

Case Owner Andrew

Signature

Contact Mo

Frt Counter Operation
H383 Tane — Patrick Tia

6383 TT30 - Brends Mg

65383 T8 - Roham

braddel! crisparkearcane gom

Waorkshop Operation
63837656 - Neo Toh Wee

£©38317362 - Andrew Goh
A3BIR11S - William Wang

braddell _operation sparkcarcars. com

A ey e g
/%

Wame of Survevor

Aenacrs

Company

295

Survey conducted on

8/

al

(k) Recommended Days of Repair

(1) The repair of this vehicle jgabertzed [ is not authorized until further notice.

o2

day(s)

{ch Resurvey

{d) Excess i 4

(&) Signature of surveyor

Required / BT Regqeired

- ﬁ’ /8l f

Dane:

AUTIDERT KEFAm ESTIMATERFL



Spare Paris

Vehicle Mo

Make & Model

Spark Car Care
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

205 Braddell Road 5 (579701)
Tel: 63837168 / 63837460 Fax:62844284.62815767

¢ SLU2S66T Case Orwner . Andrew

MAZDA3ISEDAN 1.5 AT EL Year Manufacture @ 2017

Page 1

Chassis No - JM6BN22A8J0182572 Engine No 0

Sales Order Supplier

Order By Type of Claim . TP

SNo Part Deseription oTY Caost List Melt Disposition By

Price Price Price SN Surveyor
| |Rear bumper | Yer? Ba | 1.074.80 —
= |Rear bumper lower garnish 1 Y, TBA
5 |Rear bumper tow cover LH | j‘& b 15.70 x
4 |Rear bumper tow cover RH 1 Jin 5 15.70 X
5 |Rear bumepr reflector LH I S, b 50.40 *
& |Rear bumper reflector RH [ S, |8 50.40 X
7 |Rear bumper side retainer LH 1 Ju, $ 36.10 o
g |Rear bumper side retainer RH I S | § 36.10 A
5 |Rear bumper clips 10 Ar | s 28.00 —
10 |Bootlid emblem logo 1 A | § 74.40 x
11 |Bootlid emblem SKYACTIV | aals 3.60 X
1> [Bootlid emblem MAZDA 3 | An |s 5340 X
13 |Reverse sensor | S 280.00 7
14 (0 0
15 |0 0
- 16 |0 1]

17 |0 0
18 [0 0
19 0
20 0
21
2 1]
23 |0
24
25
26 |0 [
27 |0 0
25 |0 0
24 0
3l 0

Note: If any of the quoted parts are recommended to be repaired, then an additional labour charge

will be charged accordingly under supplementary.

15/08/2018 1:22 PM




Spark Car Care
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
205 Braddell Road S (579701)
Tel: 63837168 / 63837466 Fax:62844284.628 15767

Labour
Vehicle No. t SLU2566T Case Cwner Andrew
Make & Model : IAZDA3 SEDAN 1.5 AT EUG Year of Manufacture - 2017
S/No Labour Description Esimated Adjusted
Price Price
| |To panel beat, repair rear end panel, bootlid and to replace damaged $720.00 zZ 52‘-’2{
parts
2 |To install reverse sensor $120.00 d’f’(’
1 |Toapply rust proofing on repair and replace panels A=v | £200.00 ,\/
4 |To putty and spray paint rear bumper. rear bumper lower garnish. £1,250.00 ﬁfﬁ'{
bootlid, rear end panel and all affected areas
= P

LWL Ak
WO TN Ty

ftamts e oty —
the Repairer of tf

following:

» Ta resurvey,

P AT

1 SPIEY painting

Ty TS TRy

3n & -Wahaut Prejudice” basis

eyed angd

AT apCTOva TG MSUrance Lompany

Note: The above estimate of repair is based on visual assessment of the external affected areas.
additional damages observed during the course of repair will he quote accordingly as a suy

Any
iplementary




Spark Car Care

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
205 Braddell Road S (579701)
Tel: 63837168 / 63837466 Fax:62844284,62815767

Spare Paris

Veh

icle No © SLUZSG6T Case Owner : Andrew

Make & Model : MAZDA3 SEDAN 1.5 AT El Year Manufacture : 2017

Page 1

Chassis Mo : JM6BN22ZASJ0182572 Engine No :
Sales Order 1 Supplier
Crder By : Type of Claim : TP
SNo Part Deseription orTy Lot His e Rispualuim by
Price Price Price SN Surveyar
' 1 |Rear bumper 1 Ve Ko |5 1,074.80 __/ —
Y 2 Rearbumpestewer_garnish 1 TBA
3 |Rear bumper tow cover LH 1 i 3 15.70 X
4 |Rear bumper tow cover RH | Sim b 15.70 X
5 |Rear bumepr reflector L1 1 fo. | § 50.40 *
6 |Rear bumper reflector RH | Fo, |$ 5040 A
7 |Rear bumper side retainer LH | fu, |$ 3610 f
8 |Rear bumper side retainer RH ! So |8 36.10 " A
9 |Rear bumper clips 10 Az, | § 25.00 / —
o |Bootlid emblem logo | ra | s 7440 X
11 |Bootlid emblem SKYACTIV 1 An | 63.60 X
12 |Bootlid emblem MAZDA 3 | An s 53.40 X
13 |Reverse sensor ] Jin $ 280.00 §
14 |0 0
15 |0 1]
£ 180 0
Yoo 0
1z |0 0
19 |0 ]
20 |0 0
21 |0 0
22 |0 0
23 |0 0
24 |0 0
15 |0 0
26 |0 0
27 |0 0
28 |0 1]
29 |0 0
a0 |0 0

Note: If any of the quoted parts are recommended to be repaired, then an additional labowr charge

oV

wifl

be charged accordingly nnder supplementary.

T
\* L r .
15/08/2018 SR\

L

1:22 PM



Spark Car Care
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
205 Braddell Road S (579701)
Tel: 63837168 / 63837466 Fax:62844284,62815767

Labour
Vehicle No. @ SLU2566T Case Owner Andrew
Make & Model : IAZDA3 SEDAN 1.5 AT EUG Year of Manufacture 2017
S/No Labour Description Esimated Adjusted
Price Price
I |To panel beat, repair rear end panel, bootlid and to replace damaged $720.00 z 52’-'?.(
parts
2 |Tao install reverse sensor $120.00 fﬂ(
3 |To apply rust proofing on repair and replace panels A=v | $200.00 )‘/
4 |To putty and spray paint rear bumper, rear bumper lower garnish, $1,250.00 ﬂj&g

bootlid, rear end panel and all affected areas

/

LIRS A s h-uﬂ itinﬁmﬁ
thllHerernf he fo .
-Tums s bTora)

T

» Parts prices ana suh}utiumrmmn

* Third party survey is on a "Without Prejudice” basis
» Mo ilsgal medificationls) le-aliowad

. Sup;ﬂlm:an item(s) must be resurveyed and

WE LOmparny

Acknowiadgad by Repairer

gkl

7.2 ?ﬁ'ﬂ”ﬁ Date:

T2 r7s = 770080
- dad: £

= &40 -3:;["

T L obliy 4?_!0 o

/ 4{; #:1 _.c:)‘-?.“ __/

x.ii

# R S 1 o

" o e
/ [

'f—"'z ifl s

Note: The above estimate of repair is based on visual assessment of the external affected areas. Any

additional damages observed during the course of repair will be quote accordi ngly as a supplementary.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November 2018 9:03 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Cc: 'Serene Ler’; assignments

Subject: RE: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D18006066MFSH;ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SH7699X AND SLU2566T ON 10-08-2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Shiau Chan,

FYNA. Our Ref: C5/FCI118014963/Kqd3

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkaulo.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S408033)

From: CWS5 Mator Claims [ma‘|Ito:ﬂwsmat::nrcIaErns@msfirstcapital_mm,sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 9:33 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST OF SU RVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D18006066MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH7699X AND SLU256ET
ON 10-08-2018

Dear Sir,
We received LOD from workshop/solicitor.
Please let us have the Survey Report including Vehicle Inspection Photos & Survey Fees Invoice asap.

Kindly upload the survey report through CWS from document management screen by selecting option
Survey report.

Thanks & Regards,
Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R

Affiliated to Fedaration Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

36 ROBINSON ROAD

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref - CSIFCI18014963/Kad3e2

Data

Code: FCI2

22-11-2018

(AR

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SH 7BE9X Veh. Inspected SLU 2566T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18006066MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SERENE LER Assign Date 16/08/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDA 3 (A) C.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JMEBMNZ2ABJ0182572 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 15078 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/80 R16 YOKOHAMA 9 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/60 R18 YOKOHAMA 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 YOKOHAMA g mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 YOKOHAMA g mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  10/08/2018 Inspection Date 16/08/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
205 BRADDELL RDAD
Blk C, 3rd Floor
SINGAPORE 575701.
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b, Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLU 2566T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408233
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4316
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: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) $)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED ! 1,074.80 1,074.80
BUCKLED
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH [(NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER LH SERVICEABLE 15.70 s
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER RH SERVICEABLE 16.70 -
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH SERVICEABLE 50.40 -
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RH SERVICEABLE 50.40 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH SERVICEABLE 35.10 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH SERVICEABLE 36,10 =
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 28.00 2800
1|BOOTLID EMELEM LOGO NOT NECESSARY 74.40 =
1|BOOTLID EMBLEM SKYACTIV NOT NECESSARY 83,80 .
1|BOOTLID EMBLEM MAZDA 3 NOT NECESSARY 53.40
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -299.72 -220.56
1,198.88 882.24
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 280.00 2
280.00 -
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEAT, REPAIR REAR END PANEL, BOOTLID 720,00 240.00
AND TO REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS.
TO INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR. 120.00 B0.00
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING ON REPAIR AND REPLACE |NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
PANELS
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER, REAR 1,250.00 250.00
BUMPER LOWER GARNISH, BOOTLID, REAR END PANEL
AMD ALL AFFECTED AREAS.
225000 570.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,768.88 1,452.24

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS

1,452.24|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI118014963/Kqd3e2
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KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TOD THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart ks made solely for the use and bensfit of the Cllent named on the frant page of this Repor,

Ho liability of responsibillty whatsosver, in contact or tort, bs atcepied to any third garty who may reply on the Repor whally o part. Any third pary acting or replying on this
Beport. In wiale or in gart, dees 80 at his or her own sk, -



