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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
T

Ce:
Subject:

Diear all

Jenny Tah <jenny.toh@gbe.com=>

Friday, 17 August 2018 9:53 AM

Nivitha {LKK Auto); ‘assignments’

'SLIR’

RE: Request for Survey - Accident Involving SJR 9958 P & YL 8586 Pon 15.08.2018

Workshop called this morning said your surveyor unable to go their workshop today due to urgency they have

raguested to change

Surveyor. As such, we will cancel this assignment.

Thank you.

S2nor Assmtant Clamns

JBE Ermarging Markats — Singapora

QBE Insumangs (Smgepone) Pre Lid

Phang +55 8477 1225

Email penny jphifabe com

Vidil us on the web 31 wosew gbe om sn

We create insurance solutions for

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailte:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 3:32 PM
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qgbe.com>; 'assignments’ <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Co: 'SUR' <suri@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Survey - Accident Involving SIR 9958 P & YL 8586 P on 15.08.2018

Dear Sic/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment

Please be informed vehicle not in warkshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admiin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: assienments@lkkautocom | fax: baRh-3715
Bk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408035)

From: Jenny Toh [mailta:jenny.toh@qbe.com)
Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 2:52 PM



_I'divitha (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 2:52 PM

To: assignrents

e Jenny Toh

Subject: Request for Survey - Accident Involving SIR 9958 P & YL 8586 P on 15082018
Attachments: SJR99SBP GIA Report pdf

Our ref; VD012636

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly survey the third party claim:
Insured : YLESBGP

TP Vehicle : SIR9G958P

Date of accident : 15/08/2018

Contact: as below

Kindly acknowledge receipt.

regards

l=nny Toh

saflar Assetant Clakms

CHEE Emarging Markeis — Singapone
CBE Innurancs (Ringapdes) P Lid

Frione +g5 5477 1225
Ermail jpany \philghe com
J [EH S on Tha wal bl W DS CiT) 5_.-;

| We create insurance solutions for

Marine

B

_\. e *'-.I J

Fram: Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 10:23 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny. toh@qgbe.com>

Cc: sipmotoring@gmall.com

Subject: FW: Request for Survey - Accident Involving SIR 9958 P & YL 8586 P on 15.08.2018

Cear lenny,
Pleass assist

Thanks.



Yynhasda Othman
senlal Exocistive Clsims
ABE Asia Pocfic = Singnpong

ABE Insurancs (Sngapore) Fie Lid
DD +8aF7 1130 Fax | «6533 3270

Ema| syanesds pihman@abe com
Wisit s on the wab at wvwegbe com sa

From: Susan Lim/Fion Pee [mailto:sipmotoring@gmail.com)

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 10:18 AM

To: Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@gbe.com>; Gwen Tan <gwen.tan@qbe.com>;
joyce heng@qbe.com

Subject: Request for Survey - Accident Involving SJR 9958 P & YL 8586 P on 15.08.2018

Dear Officer,
Kindly send your surveyor to do a survey for the following accident claim:

Qur Vehicle; SJR 9958 P
Your Ret: YL 8588 P (QBE Insurad)
Subject: Accident Involving SJR 8958 P & YL 8586 P on 15.08.2018

Workshop: SLP Motoring Services
Address: Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint #03-07 Singapore 568047

An Estimate will be provided to the surveyor upon his arrival. We have attached a copy of our insured GIA report far your
reference.

Pigase confirm with us via emall, fax (6484 1482) or phone (81004390)
Thank you for your kind attention.

** Moving forward does QBE have a general mailbox that we can send to? **

Blest Regards,
Kane
SLP Motoring Services

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
ere not the intended recipient, any us¢ or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this-email and destroy any hard copies
produced.



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.coms

Sent: Friday, 17 August 2018 10:40 AM

To: Jenny Toh'; "assignments'

Co 'SUR’

Subject: RE: Request far Survey - Accident Involving SIR 9358 P & YL B586 P on 15.08.2018

Dearlenny ,
Thank you for the emall.
Hefer to bur tele-conversation earlier, we will take note of the instructinon

As suth we will close this file at our end

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Plione! 6841-1972 | emmaily pssignmentsilklanto com | fax: bese- 315
Bik 51, Paya Uhi Industrind Park, Ubi Aveniie 1. rou-2s | Slqo8043)

From: lenny Toh [mallto:jenny.toh@qbe.com]

Sent: Friday, 17 August 2018 9:53 AM

Tu: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; ‘assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ci: 'SUR' csur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Survey - Accident Invelving SIR 9958 P & YL 8586 P on 15,08.2018

Dear All
Workshop called this morning said your surveyar unabie to go their workshop today due to urgency they have

requested to change
surveyor. As such, we will cancel this assignment.

Thank you
Jenny Ton

Serugr Assistant, Clams

Q8= Ememging Markabs — Sinpapare

QBE Insurance (Singapon) Ple' Lid
Fhong +85 8477 1225

Emal lenny toh E.Iglﬁ_- [ea 4y

G o the wehh Bt wiiid dbe com 1g




