
Joy lrene (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:
Attachments:

chan pick yuen <chris-chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Thursday, 13 December 2018 1:20 PM

Joy lrene (LKKAuto)

Fw: SGF2695S & FW2866M doa 14/8/18
SAS2455792.PDF; SD.pdf

Dear Joy ,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report , invoice, LOA, rental bill with agreement & scene photos .

As request following :

1. RC S 4000 (As agreed )

2. LORS960 (S 120X8 DAYS -6 Days recommend + l daywaiting PRS + l dayweekend

@ l$Oo/o ( Direct from behind with scene photo)

Total S4960/-.

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

PERFECT WERKZ

CHRSI CHAN

HP:927722L4

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, AuBust 20, 2018 5:40 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Cci Joy lrene (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SGF2695S & FW2866M doa 1418/18

Dear Chris,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contactloy at6749 5792.

0ur respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability ol the case handler , you mdy contact the undersigned,

Best Regards,

Shu PeilAdmin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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Phone: 5365-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com I fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue'1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 8:21 PM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>
subject: sGF26955 & FW2866M doa 74l8l18

Dear Shu Pei ,

Enclosed is GIA report .

Please check liability 100% in our favour .

Your insured already report & admitted hit from behind . Thanks

Best Regards,

PERFECT WERKZ

CHRSI CHAN

HP:92712274
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5l Ut l AVE l, #{}1.25 PA}A UBI INDUS TIALPARK, SIN(;APORI) 408933 TEl,: {065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 625ff.115

17 JANUARY 2019

MUHAMMAD FAZI-Y BIN SAZATI

BtK 425 PASIR RIS DRIVE 6
#06-83
SINGAPORE 510425

Dear Sir/Madam,

oUR REF : cc4lASM18014929/Aib3
YOURREF : FW 2866M

ACCIDENT INVOTVING FW 2866M AND SGF 26955 ALONG UBI AVE 2 ON 14.08.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA lnsurance Singapore Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s PERFECT WERKZ, acting on behalf of the owner of SGF 26955
against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had hit
Third Party vehicle from the rear. As such, liabillty is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result ofthe claim
against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subiect to the merits of the case and according to the
rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek

to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence,
please reply to us within 10 davs from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally
expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim ls required and kindly submit the following to
iovirene@lkkauto.com withln 10 davs from the date of this letter..f.-!.9!-plgtddcd_a!-qullgDo4!!g
centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

o Police report, Police lnvestigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and

status (if any)
o Drive/s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
. Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)
o Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (lf any)
o Video footage of accident (if any)
. Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)



! !!!! xi*"**
4 ra L pte Ltd

5l UBI AVtl l, #0r-25 PAYA UllI INDLTSTRTAL PARK SINGAPORI,I408933 TEL r (065) 62563561 IAX:(065) 62s6{.1ts

o lf you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s),
you are to keep us lnformed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of
the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement
without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AxA of their rights to repudiate any claim
because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may
have committed.

ln the event of receiving and handllng of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you
informed of the fina I indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

lf you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at
iovirene@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely,

/_|/_/.-u
Jdy lrene./
Case,tt/ndter
DID: 6841 2409
FAX:67414108
E ma il: ieyirclejflLhslq4gE

AXA lnsurdnce Singapore Pte Ltd (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)



WARRANTTO ACT

Road traffic accident involving my m o:ton'unia" %I r]! {r{ and rnotor-vehicle no(s).

(Date) along

t/Weherebyabsolutelyauthor;zeandempoweryoutoactforme/usinallaspectsofthismatterandtouseyour
absolute discretion in accepting any offer of settlement which you deem to be fair and reasonable and to release all

such settlement funds including loss of use or vehicle rental tees (wheie applicable)' surveyor fees' police report fees'

etc. to my motor-workshop, PERFECT WERKZ'

Youmayproceedtoapplytherelevantauthoritiesorbodiestoobtainnecessaryreportsorinformationarisingfromol
inconnectionwiththeaforesaidaccidentasmayberequiredbyyou.Thereafteryoumayproceedtonegotiateon
,nvlou, i"i'rft *ith the party/parties and/or with insurer(s) concerned for settlement'

lntheeventthatasettlementisnotforthcomingorreached'youmay'withoutreterencetome/us'commencelegal
proceedings aBainst the other party/parties for the recovery of the damages due to me/us'

t/we shall render full co-operation by giving instructions to you. and signinE documents connected with the proceedings

as and when required by you. f/wu ,iiff 
"ti"na 

court Siving evidence at the hearing of the proceedings where necessary

and do all that is reasonable to ensure recovery of the dama8es in the above matter'

lf you are of the opinion that proceedings should not be commenced, o. if commenced should be discontinued, than

t/we shall ablde by your advice and shall be liable to pay the repair costs, vehicle rental fees (if applicable)' surveyo/s

fees and any other expenses Incurr ed by pERFECI WER(Z in repairing my/our vehicle to their full ertend or for the

extend that it is unpaid by the negligent party. I will also pay you' reJsonuble fees and expenses in acting for me/us in

the event that you are not paid yJui reasonable fees and expenses by the neglisent party'

your fees, on a solicitor and client basis, shall be determined by agreement between the said workshop and you' or as

may be determineo upon ,rrr,ion *ilre appticaute, wrrich shall ie deducted from the settlement funds' ln the event

that t/we are personally liable to pay your fees and expenses, r/wi 
"r" 

,n"nt" to agroe on the sums than they shall be

determlned bY taxation.

h,' :ddf, 4
orzt ,*vg -l ,8t41

-P//O{tqr'Ewr, /att aaa,vl y'He,{-NRlc/co. Reisn No ' 'P//o ! 
tl?6 : of (Address)

dr heowne(s)of mo:"'""ll:1"::;,^ 
-,,.^^..

;t1ffi'.."niliionto,tn"aamagesuWehavesufferedasaresultoftheaforesaidaccident,

t/we fu.ly understand and irrevocablv agree and authorize vou to rel-,?::3:*1;:,"i::"::*:ilJ::tt'::;
,1I: H#::ilffiT:"ffiffi;iff;';'; ;;;tl"i,'1,:: y:r.*'f.: ::;::::il:Iff#
ffi';;;;ilfiring,i" .o"t" orvourfoliowing anv/or all of mv/instruction or the of my/our said motor-

Name:
NRIC:

3,,4 lr{t l$tt{'
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PERFECT WERKZ
Block 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #06-51 synergr'@'KB Si-ngrpore 417800

;ffi;irr* Fax: (65) 6s661s26 Roc : s3364s12c

INVOICE

Date:20h OCT'18
GOH CHONG PHENG

25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4

#06-51 SYNERGY @KB
Singapore 417800

Accident date:14th AUGUST 20'18

;;ii;:ii ili v"t i"r" No: sGF26e5s roYorA wrsH l '8A

Lrmo sum repair cost ?s recommended'by
'r-ii auro cdlsUlrltlrs PTE LrD

: Mr Adrian Ling

SIDLRS:THREE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED ONLY

$3,700.00

Page 306
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DRI\IEWORKS SINGAPORE BU3TNESS REGN: 5330e735E

+65 8311 3331 | adsin@drivcworLs.cg I www.&ivcworls'eg

zS kali bulit roed,t synergy@Lb #08-47 s4178o0

VEHIGLELEAS@
This Agreement is made on the 16 AUGUST 2018

DRIVEWORKS SINGAPORE
Havino its reqistered otfice at:
zs raii BuxiiRoad 4 Svnersv@KB #108-47 (S417800)

Hereinafter knows as "the Owner" of the one part

YEO JIAJIAN S9O410132
BLK 730 TAMPINES STREET 71 #06-65 S(520730)

Hereinafte. also known as "the Hiref' of the other part

Hirer the vehicle known as "thc Vetlicle" upon the terms and cooditions

RENTAL FEE S$ 120\DAY with refundablelnon'refundable depos:t ot

ss0
a. R$tal Fse includes the lollowing items:

i. Unlimited mileage.
ii. Service and maintonance.
iil. Road Tax and Radio License.
iv. Motol insurance coverage (Excess applicable)'

v, 24 hour breakdown and emergency service (ln Singapore only)'

u. Wthout pre1uOice io the O*""it 
"in"i 

tig"hts, ine nirerj witt o; liable to an administrative fee of $500 00

plus 20% late inierest prvr"rt Gorprt"-o on 1mo.nt_hy 
basis) if the Rentat Fee or other paynenl remain

unpaid after becoming Orr.'in if''," event, tha Rental iee rematn unpaid more than three (01) calendat

;;F;ih; Owner mayiodge 
" 

poit."i"port 
"" 

a toss ol vehicle and activate the vehicle repossession tearn

io ieirieve venicle. fhe iniioe*ar cost ior the repossession process will bs charge to the ljk€rs'

". eff p"Vrl"S Oue nsreunOei snatt Oe maAe to the Ownor at its addross stated herein or at such other

addressastheOwnermayfromtimetot:mecommun:cat6totheHir6r$.Anypaymenlssentbyposlshall
u. 

"o ".nt 
at tn" risk of thi Hirers. Payment mode can be CASH or CHEQUE'

DEPOSIT
i. Th" H:r", shall upon signing this Agreement pay to the Ownor a deposll (the Dsposit) of 9$---.lg--- 

as iecurity. tne beposit sni[ main-tain at the sam6 amount during the Rental Period...

b. Without prejudice to the o*""i;" oif,"i nghts, the Owner shall be-entitled to torfeit and/or retain any part of

the Deposit in the svent the iiir"t Or"""n-u., iaits or neglecls to pay any sums or charges due to or owning

And

Between

Hereby agleed that the owner will let the
hereinafter appearing.

1. DESCRIPTION OF VEHICL€
Make & Model : HONDA STREAM 1.8A
Registraiion No ; SJR6305T

c. Color : GREY

2. RENTAL PERIOD Daio From 

-16/08/2018- 

to 231A912018

to the Owner.

stated in this after 30

b.

3.

4.

". i1i O"poiit *ill be futly reiunded if any, jnterest-free only wher lhe,Hire_r-has fully dischatge its obligation

The

Hirpr,q lniiial Com Stamo

30 days of the exPiry of the the Rental Period

off as part of the monthly rental fee.
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DRIVEWORKS SINGAPORE,,,*,,, *N: 5330v/35E

+55 8311 831 | admir@driveworks.sg I wwr.drlramrla.rg
25 kaki bukit road 4 sFer$/@[b *08-47 5417800

TO:

Yeo Jiajian
s90410132
Blk 730 Tamp:nes
Street 71 #06-65

Singapore 520730

Remarks:

OTFICIAL RTCEIPT

RECETPT NO S0800050

DATE: 16 AUGUST 2018

Rental for Honda stream SJR6305T fto.n LGloS/zolg to 23/08/2018 @ sGDS120/day

lnvoice $00080827

SUBTOTAL

GST

AMOUNT PAIO

AMOUNT DUT

Thank You


