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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 16 August 2018 1 1:48 AN.4

'Jocelyn Ng'; SUR

RE: MV - 5FJ26681- DOA: 03/08/2018

Dear Jocelyn,

The market value ofSFJ 2668L is $12K-$13K (Estimated) as at Aug 18.

Best Regard<,

Veron chen I case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | enrail ;su r@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 15(408933)

From: Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn_ng@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 7:06 PM

subject: MV - 5FJ26681- DOA: 03108/2078

Dear al[,

Ptease hetp to advise on the market value of the above mentioned vehicte.

Thank you
t:lave a gre Lweet" ahead!

Jocelyn Ng
Executive, Ctaims Services
D: +65 6594 2539 lF: +65 6225 7402 liocetvn nq@sq. msiq-asia. com

i-t ,,\il,iS tnsurer ctaimsMSIG I *- . .;'' i;;;iiniv"u,
| 'ffi . :' :r. 2016

MSIG lnsurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Rafftes Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Buitding, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 62256371 | co. Reg. No. 20041?212G I msie.com.se O @ P

nu",ot",or lS!@ rNsuRANcE cRouP

CONFIDFNTIAL1TY I'IOTICE
Thlsenlail (incudinganyattachments)maycontaininformationthatlsprivilegedorconfdential.Thesendlngoithise-lna toalry
person other tlr.:rn the ifLended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confldentiality that attaches to it. If you are not ihe intended
recipreat, please notlfy the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose lts contents.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
v

Doh: slslF
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner lD Type: Singapore NRIC

25954
(rnsta)

Owner lD:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: sF.t2668L

Vehicle to be Exported:

lntended De-registration Date: 1s 49s2018
HONDAVehicle Make:

Vehicle Model: ACCORD 2.4A

PrimaryColour:

ManufacturingYear:

Black

Engine No.: K24A42AOO170

Chassis No.: MRHCM55404P080006

Maximum P_ow€rOutput:

Open MarketValue:

Ori8inal Regjstration Dater ..19.1!af-299a.
First Registration Date: 19 May 2004

Transfercount: 0

ActualARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details

11B.0 kW (158 bhp)

$27,36s.OO

$30,102.00

PARF Elisibilityl

PARF Eligibility Expiry Datel

PARF RebateAmount: $0.00

CoEExpjryDate: 37Mer 2019

COE Category: B - Car (16o1cc & abov;)

COE Period(Yearsl 5

Forfeited

PQP Paid: $38,360.00
COE Rebate Amount:

Totel Rebate Amount:

Message

$4,805.00

$4,805.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches jts statutorylifespan (if applicable), which€!€r is earlier.

The information co nta ined herein is correctas at 15Au82018
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Transfer Fee :

Amount Before GST

ts$,

2s.oo

GSTAmount
(s$)

AmountAfterGST
(s$)

25.00

25.O0TotalAmount Payable:
Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry orwhen the
vehicle reaches its statutory Lllgiqan.!l-q!gLrg4!el whjciever is earlier.

You may print this page for reference.

OK Print


