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. MS‘ FirstCapitaI MS First Capital Insurance Limited tomeq No. 195000106C GST eg Mo M2 00016759

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65)6222 3547
Clakms & Moter Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

02-08-2018 Our Ref No. D18005859MFSH
31-07-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC2726R Third Party Vehicle. FBK8025U

610 SERANGOON ROAD
MR KWAN S.H
63922555/ 0 Fax No. 62975400

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

BIKE PRODUCTION PTE

LTD Attention. NIL
APAC LAW

Solicitor F . NA
CORPORATION TP Solicitor Fax No
KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

' EEEERI (RSUHANCE GROUP




' V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl B = §1 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI18014879/Nsd3
nooromvotscancaroneasssrr oo oo |||
1t Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 2726R Veh. Inspected FBK 8025U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18005859MFSH Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From  CWS (KAREN TAN) Assign Date 15/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
<t Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/07/2018 Inspection Date 16/08/2018
Survey held at BIKE PRODUCTION PTE LTD
610 SERANGOON ROAD
SINGAPORE 218216
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




10/4/2018

> Back to OneMotoring

-* Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Oct 2018

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Singapore NRIC
5558)

FBK8025U

No

04 Oct 2018
HONDA
CB400X ABS
Black

2015
NC47E5000387
JH2ZNC4796EK000385
$6,516.00

02 Feb 2016

02 Feb 2016

1

$978.00

No

$0.00

01 Feb 2026
D - Motorcycle
10

$6,512.00
$4,770.00
$4,770.00

NUPS://VrLIta.gov.sg/ita/vryacuon/enquirerepalesyruplicoeroreveraginpui/FUNG HUN_IUSFUsuauud ||

i



: .'_Sﬂrley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>
Sent: Saturday, 27 October 2018 9:34 AM
To: Naz (LKKAuto)

(ol Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: FBK 8025U FINALIZATION
[Without Prejudice]

Dear Naz,

Good Day. The insured has decided to claim under his own insurance as there is a waiver on his excess. Thank you
very much for your attention and sorry for the inconvenience caused.

Regards,
Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Fri, 10/26/18, Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Subject: FBK 8025U FINALIZATION

To: "Sbk E" <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Cc: "Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)" <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Date: Friday, October 26, 2018, 5:38 PM

Dear Mr Kwan

!

Apologies for the late

reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate following a check on the part prices. We will proceed to
finalize if you

are agreeable with the amended COR;

PARTS -
$12,220

LESS 10% -
$10,998

SPECIAL NETT -
$1,170



“'LABOUR -
$1,060

LESS
LUMP SUM 20% - $10,582

LUMP
SUM TOTAL - $10,600/ 5 REPAIR DAYS

Thank
you.

Best Regards,

Naz|
Technical Investigator

LKK Auto
Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 |
Email: Naz@lkkauto.com |
Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Naz (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 11:59:14 AM
To: Sbk E

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS - FBK8025U

Dear Mr Kwan ,



- "Apologies for

the late reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate following a che

will proceed to finalize
if you are agreeable with the amended COR;

PARTS

- $11,900

LESS

10% - $10,710

LABOUR

- $2,230

LESS LUMP SUM 20% -
$10,352

TOTAL -

$10,300/ 5 REPAIR DAYS

Thank
you.

Best

Regards,

Naz|

Technical Investigator

LKK Auto

Consultants

Phone:

6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com |
Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi

Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E
<sbk5643e@yahoo.com>
Sent: Sunday, 9 September 2018 8:13 AM

To: Naz (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS - FBK8025U

Dear
Naz,

please finalise. Thanks.

Regards,

ck on the part prices. We



“'Kwan S. H.
Director

Bike Production Pte Ltd



. Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

— e
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 20 August 2018 9:09 AM
To: 'karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg’; 'Claim Workflow System'’
Cc: 'SUR’; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)’
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005859MFSH/1
Attachments: FBK 8025U - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Karen,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of FBK 8025U.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 3:49 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005859MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 14 August 2018 6:56 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg; cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005859MFSH/1

Please find below link to download document
Jobsheet D18005859MFSH TPDI1.pdf

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



. ‘Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




! I['{.V Auto

. Cansultanis
B 3 = Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 193607198R

2] UBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18005859MFSH Date: 20 August 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18014879/Nsd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __FBK 8025U .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 16/08/2018 at the premises of M/s Bike Production Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S8 17.276.50
Revised Estimate Amount : S§ 1.060.00
“Check” Items Amount : S8 4.486.00
Market Value : S8
LTA Reimbursement Value : S8
Nett Value : 8§

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the front portion & o/s body.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Muhammad Nazril
Automotive Assessor
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9/21/2018 Used MotorCycles/Bikes For Sale in Singapore by Owners & Dealers - SGBikemart

Honda CB400X

S6D$17000

Reg : 01/06/2017
Type: Sport Tourers
399cc

11661km

Welcome trade in. Loan available. Ambra Enterprises is
located at Block 5034 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-
327.

Posted on : 12/09/2018

PAID AL DEALER Al

COMPARE DETAILS

Honda CB400X

SGD$11500

Reg : 07/11/2013
Type: Sport Tourers
399cc

35000km

Very good condition. Regularly maintained. Used only for
office commute in Singapore. Always parked in covered
parking lot. Price is negotiable.

Posted on : 11/08/2018

COMPARE DETAILS

Honda CB400X

SGD$13800
Reg : 30/01/2015
Type: Sport Tourers
399cc

Visit us at Ah Fook Motor. Well maintained condition.
Trade in welcome / Loan available.
Posted on ; 10/09/2018

SAID AL DEALER AD

COMPARE

DETAILS

Honda CB400X

S6P$16500

Reg : 06/06/2014
Type: Sport Tourers
399cc

70000km

Well maintain. Trade in/Loan of vehicle available.
Interested buyers are welcome to neg. Come visit Albert
Motor Supply.

Posted on : 03/09/2018

FAID AD DEALER AD

COMPARE DETAILS

https://www.sgbikemart,com.sg/listing/usedbikes/listing/?bike_model=Honda+C B400X&bike_type=&price_from=&price_to=&license_class=2A&re... 11
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire FARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

-Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Detalls
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Sep 2018

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Singapore NRIC
5558)

FBKB025U

No

215ep 2018
HONDA
CB400X ABS
Black

2015
NCA7ES000387
JH2ZNC4796EKO00385
$6,516.00

02 Feb 2016

02 Feb 2016

1

$978.00

No

$0.00

01 Feb 2026

D - Motorcycle
10

$6,512.00
$4,794.00
£4,794.00

OK

NUPS://Vr.ita.gov.sg/ita/vryacton/enquirexepale sy uplicserorevereginput /FUNL |HIUN_IU=FUSU4UUY L |

W



BEIKE PRODUCTION PTE LTD

610, Serangoon Road S(218216)
Tel: 63922555, 62995177 Fax: 62975400

ROC/ GST Reg No.: 200007407G

Dae 13 August 2018

ASSESSMENT FOR REPAIR: HONDA CB400X ABS - FBKS!

Fadiator [an motor
Fadiator [an cover

hasas No JH2NC4796EK000385
Fngiee o NCA7E5000387
Qty Description
L pc Front mudguard
pc Front wheel axle
2 pes Steering stem bearing @ $45.00
Lps Front brake disk
pc ABS disk
' ABS sensor
i Front left fork assembly
e Front right fork assembly
e Steering head crown
. pt Steering stem underbracket
pe Viindshield
7 pis Mincashield support bracket @ $75.00
pc Headlamp assembly
| pc Headlamp bracket
pc Outer meter cover
L pe Inner meter cover
o Front beak cover
pZz Left inner cover
pc Right inner cover
pc Upper crash bar right
1 pc Upper crash bar left
tpc Lower crash bar left
L pc L awer crash bar right
Lipc Right engine cover
1 pc kight engine cover gaskel
pc Belly pan
pe Eelly pan aluminium cover
pe Right handguard
L pc | eft handguard
pc L eft view mirror
pc Kight view mirror
C hanole bar
pc Eraka laver
v fuel tank assembly
pe Hor
P fight body fairing
1 pc Laflt hody fairing
7 pos Honda wing decal @ $45.00
7 XS Mark X decal @ $65.00
nc I.eft body inner fairing
b ight body inner fairing
pe fught body side fairing
P Kadator
fC
|

Page 1

)

P 1P 2=/4
.

g 0J

e

¢1s PH XG0

'-\'

stimate

$235.0( ’ng\
$95.00 /v 5
$80 00~ TAC
£36500 SR
$275.00 26y
§175.00 7 A 5\

2 fLA65T0
14500~ BT

$430.00 7X SVC
$480.00 )« k4
6105.0( 7 ts 309
$150.00 X L_Hf&?r)
548000 3¢
527570 7V CRA
245,00 “Sta
$245,00 7/ C-D
25500 - geoKBn/

$65.00 2/ TR

$65 0L > VLR
$180.00 2 VPt
$£180.00 .~ IR
$175.00 7w bef
$175.00 2 ~ Dex
405,00 X sV L

$65 00 X An
€285 00~ SC
€275.00 .~ SR
$125 00 7 sek
L12500 7 5L
L1400 /S

- £140.0( PN

L5000 Ksve
30.06 7/ (&
33000 20~
nlc

S
£3
53

%87 06
€130 00 “ake
£195 00 2w oAk
€195 QG 70~

¢305.00.7 VCA°

fnk s DD

§29000Y .~ A7
$11500 2 v (A

—

9,0 00



e ‘i ' Rear right signal 105,00 X8 V _t Y
I pc Coolant $15.00 / e )
| pe Right rear fooltrest $95.007 8
| pc Right rear footrest holder q rqs $155.00 ? s‘ Zv Bt
| pe Front right footrest holder "yey $195.00 x4 Y& B4
| pc Front right footrest 4 20 $05.00 <&
I pc Exhaust assembly -~ 0D/ $1,880:00.~ Sl
I ‘?Og $15,035.00
Less discount 10% __' 1 j__ __$1,503.50
0310 $13,531.50
Special natt items [
1pc Front sport rim $700,00 X nA+~ BY
1 pc Front number plate $20.00 > #l g
I pc Rear top case 3450.00 — bBD
1 pc Rear box bracket 4.2f(} 00 -//Mf X C
1) Towing charges $40.00 /
Replace, realign and adjust above
2) damaged parts sgugn Uo©
3) Balancing front wheel rim sesaa. SO
To remove/refit, replace (If damage) check and o .
) straighten front fork tubes 318090 100
3) Reset meter 3000~ S0
To knock, straighten chassis & body
5) balancing 5 MRS M’UD’— | & C
7) Spray painting £ Tl 0 200
Total Estimate 71 12, 49 _$17,276.50
Lass e 1, 598
flota: The above estimate is subjected to the prevailing GST of 7% | 3304 <o

oblc
QQ-

S
Todal~ 10 3C2

For Bike Proﬂuct on Ple Ltd /

Ne2 L
iLfg/isy 1605
L[S

S" (,{q LX A
herel elhe. (oo

Page 2
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BIKE PRODUCTION PTE LTD
610, Serangoon Road 5(218216)

Tel: 63922555, 62995177 Fax: 62975400
iROC/ GST Reg No.: 2000074076G

e S5 August 2018

LSSESSMENT FOR REPAIR: HONDA CB400X ABS - FBK8025U.

Tassic Moo J42NC47962K000385

ciine No. NC47E5000387
Ly Description Ectimate
I e Front bracket comp $80.00 /?31' A
| e Brake nedal $135.00 _~sep. A
e Right body side fairing ___$305.00 e A
$520.00
Less discount 10% . $52.00
1468.0)
special nett items
rotal Additional Estimate ___$468.00
Hote: The asove estiinate is subjected to the prevailing GST of 7%
OQ“C"[Q‘



Y BIKE PRODUCTION PTE LTD

ot 610, Serangoon Road $(218216)
Tel: 63922555, 62995177 Fax: 62975400
OC/ GST Reg No,: 200007407G

( Augisl 2008

| » fie ViE

ITT!

FOR REPAIR: HONDA CB400X ABS - FBK8UZLU.

goar Gt J2004796EK000385
pea? 5000387

© [Lght body fairing
° L "t hody fairing
e wing decal @ $45.00
rl Ak % {h,*cal @ $65.00
¢ | ¢ft body inner fairing
e Ilight body inner fairing
a light body side fairing

il bescriptio LEScuiat ¢
Front mudquard 6235 0 TR A
2 o Front wheel axle a5 £~ BT
- Stearing stem bearing @ $45.00 SB0 CLr~% 4
[ Front brake disk G305 Cl; Loaet?
: » ABS disk , 2750 8~ 8 ¥
ABBS sunsor / J—— S by e f:*f‘
Front ieft fork assembly 51108 ¢t <7 7
F ot night fork assembly 51,105 O oy
o Sleering head crown #4350 G HX AV
o Sleering stem underbracket w450 C 11/./8 v
it wincshield L BSOS L 708 Aa!
8 Aincdshieid support bracket @ 5/5.00 -J.H_’ﬁ 150 4, }{ L i
; Headlamp assembly s
J o icadlamp bracket L) ’: L “-/ tﬂ-f‘
T B ! Ouler meter cover - w215 0L 275c
e n 2 [nner neler cover 245 Ol 'ﬁl/tm ¥
I'ront heak cover G5 0~ froK %y
: ® Lot inner cover S05 0 B -TRp '
¢ Right inner cover chH5 Ui @p s,
w Uppar crash bar right LIE0 L0Y B Y ‘
Lipper crash bar laft £ Ho (e R
& Lower crash bar left c bt { .~ DET
® | ower crash bar right N Wit E S DEF
LE Slght angine cover h -*-u(}&.v«:-b-‘ S»
s ~ight engine cover gaskel R Ca et L
i Rally pan €285 ."-;a'L
Eeily pan aluminium cover 4750077 yer
. Ughe nandguard G125 (i 7 sy
: L et handguard §125 (. A
Lol Aew mirrar 140 ¢ ,/; 4
Rzt siew mirror ! €140 Uiy 7
o handle bar §145 ¢ [; ‘}-f ‘E\
Erale levor ' CP5 L T NER
® Lol nk assembly ki'}hj Ll DT
[RisTi] mhh fy K 3we

SRR 10 I Ul (¥ &
£330 00 4 R
G99 (1 7 e

6130 Ll e

€105 ¢y L b
ci95 (. € -j’ofu*
5305 07 <% (LR

fadhiator SO0 S D
= Baciator fan motor $26] (L6~ JoM
s Codiater fan cover LA AN

Page



[ ear rignt signal
- { oulant
fzight roar footrest

n o ight rear foolresl holder

i ¢ | ront right feotrest holder
[ ront rght footrest

, t xliaust assembly

Lasu dimcount 10%

Special nett items
I ¢ FFront sport rim
b e Front numbaer plate
i) fear top case
lLear box Bracket
rront yre

Towina charges
veslace, raalign and adjust above
* camaged parts
Baang ny front wheel rim :
o
Foorernove/refit, replace (if damage) check and
} <lraighten fronl fork tubes
fesat medel
Ty ke ok, straighten chassis & body
) batnung
. . 'x‘kj i Spray nainting
' L T Trpial Bstimate

Sl e gl ove estiimaie s subjected to the prevailing GST of 7%
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¥y V I V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i IS 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCI18014879/Nsd3e2
re———— L
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 2726R Veh. Inspected FBK 8025U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18005859MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  KAREN TAN Assign Date 14/08/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CB400X ABS c.C 399
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JH2NC4796EK000385 Colour BLACK
Odometer 69044 Steering JAMMED
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [120/60 R17 PIRELLI 5mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre [160/60 R17 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY AND FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/07/2018 Inspection Date 16/08/2018
Survey held at BIKE PRODUCTION PTE LTD
610 SERANGOON ROAD
SINGAPORE 218216
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




J L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L; ; ; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBK 8025U
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo. rks'hop?sy)) (SJ]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT MUDGUARD CRACKED 235.00 235.00
1|FRONT WHEEL AXLE BENT 95.00 95.00
2|STEERING STEM BEARING @$40.00 NECESSARY 80.00 80.00
1|FRONT BRAKE DISK SCRATCHED 305.00 270.00
1|ABS DISK BENT 275.00 275.00
1|ABS SENSOR SERVICEABLE 175.00 -
1|FRONT LEFT FORK ASSEMBLY BENT 1,105.00 800.00
1|FRONT RIGHT FORK ASSEMBLY BENT 1,105.00 800.00
1|STEERING HEAD CROWN SERVICEABLE 430.00
1|STEERING STEM UNDERBRACKET BENT 480.00 480.00
1|WINDSHIELD MISSING 195.00 195.00
2|WINDSHIELD SUPPORT BRACKET @%75.00 N/S BENT / O/S 150.00 75.00
SERVICEABLE
1|HEADLAMP ASSEMBLY SCRATCHED 480.00 480.00
1|HEADLAMP BRACKET CRACKED 275.00 240.00
1|OUTER METER COVER SCRATCHED 245.00 245.00
1|INNER METER COVER CRACKED 245.00 24500
1|FRONT BEAK COVER BROKEN 255.00 255.00
1|LEFT INNER COVER CRACKED 65.00 65.00
1|RIGHT INNER COVER CRACKED 65.00 65.00
1|UPPER CRASH BAR RIGHT BENT 180.00 180.00
1|UPPER CRASH BAR LEFT SCRATCHED 180.00 180.00
1|LOWER CRASH BAR LEFT DEFORMED 175.00 175.00
1|LOWER CRASH BAR RIGHT DEFORMED 175.00 175.00
1|RIGHT ENGINE COVER SERVICEABLE 405.00 -
1|RIGHT ENGINE COVER GASKET NOT NECESSARY 65.00 -
1|BELLY PAN SCRATCHED 285.00 285.00
1|BELLY PAN ALUMINIUM COVER SCRATCHED 275.00 275.00
1|RIGHT HANDGUARD SCRATCHED 125.00 125.00
1|LEFT HANDGUARD SCRATCHED 125.00 125.00
1|LEFT VIEW MIRROR SCRATCHED 140.00 140.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18014879/Nsd3e2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2of 3
: Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | &8 mmp?{n (31,
1|RIGHT VIEW MIRROR SCRATCHED 140.00 140.00
1|HANDLE BAR BENT 195.00 150.00
1|BRAKE LEVER SCRATCHED 75.00 75.00
1|FUEL TANK ASSEMBLY DENTED 980.00 950.00
1|HORN SERVICEABLE 55.00 -
1|RIGHT BODY FAIRING CRACKED 330.00 330.00
1|LEFT BODY FAIRING CRACKED 330.00 330.00
2|HONDA WING DECAL @$45.00 NECESSARY 90.00 90.00
2|MARK X DECAL @$65.00 NECESSARY 130.00 130.00
1|LEFT BODY INNER FAIRING CRACKED 195.00 195.00
1|RIGHT BODY INNER FAIRING CRACKED 195.00 195.00
1|RIGHT BODY SIDE FAIRING CRACKED 305.00 305.00
1|RADIATOR DENTED 650.00 450.00
1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR JAMMED 290.00 200.00
1|RADIATOR FAN COVER CRACKED 115.00 115.00
1|REAR RIGHT SIGNAL SERVICEABLE 105.00 -
1|COOLANT NECESSARY 45.00 45.00
1|RIGHT REAR FOOTREST SCRATCHED 95.00 95.00
1|RIGHT REAR FOOTREST HOLDER BENT 155.00 155.00
1|FRONT RIGHT FOOTREST HOLDER BENT 195.00 195.00
1|FRONT RIGHT FOOTREST SCRATCHED 95.00 95.00
1|EXHAUST ASSEMBLY SCRATCHED 1,880.00 900.00
1|FRONT BRACKET COMP (ADDITIONAL) BENT 80.00 80.00
1|BRAKE PEDAL (ADDITIONAL) SCRATCHED 135.00 135.00
1|RIGHT BODY SIDE FAIRING (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 305.00 305.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,555.50 -1,222.00
13,999.50 10,998.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT SPORT RIM (SN) BENT 700.00 700.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) MISSING 20.00 20.00
1|REAR TOP CASE (SN) DENTED 450.00 450.00
1|REAR BOX BRACKET (SN) SERVICEABLE 220.00 .

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18014879/Nsd3e2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bdin BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:3 of 3
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE:rtli(’:;;;?sy)) Our A(gj)usted
1|FRONT TYRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 175.00 J
1,565.00 1,170.00
LABOUR
TOWING CHARGES 80.00 80.00
REPLACE, REALIGN AND ADJUST ABOVE DAMAGED 800.00 400.00
PARTS.
BALANCING FRONT WHEEL RIM. 150.00 50.00
TO REMOVE / REFIT, REPLACE (IF DAMAGE) CHECK 180.00 100.00
AND STRAIGHTEN FRONT FORK TUBES.
RESET METER 120.00 50.00
TO KNOCK, STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS & BODY BALANCING. 450.00 180.00
SPRAY PAINTING 400.00 200.00
2,180.00 1,060.00
GRAND TOTAL 17,744.50 13,228.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 10,600.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18014879/Nsd3e2

MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




