Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August 2018 4:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Anikka Lai; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident between SJY 2466 B AND your insured SDS 8596 Y *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18014726/Npa3

Dear all,

Kindly take note that our client decided to claim under Own damage.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Jack, Ng
Hp: 8288 6309

Email : Jackng@honda.com.sg

BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE

8 MANDAI ESTATE SINGAPORE 729905

TEL : +65 6514 5248 FAX : +65 6362 5015

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD)
Website: www.honda.com.sg

w ij Wigit our

Facebook page

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2018 9:35 AM

To: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Cc: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident between SJY 2466 B AND your insured SDS 8596 Y *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18014726/Npa3

Without Prejudice
Hi Jack,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that our insured has yet lodge the accident report. Therefore, we are unable to advise
liability at this moment.

We will follow up and get back to you asap.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 9:31 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@l|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident between SJY 2466 B AND your insured SDS 8596 Y *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18014726/Npa3

Good morning Hsiao Tong,
Kindly assist on this case liability states.

Thank you and have a nice day ahead.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Jack, Ng
Hp: 8288 6309

Email : Jackng@honda.com.sq

BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE

8 MANDAI ESTATE SINGAPORE 729905

TEL : +65 6514 5248 FAX : +65 6362 5015

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD)
Website: www.honda.com.sg

w n Wisit our

Facebook page

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 14, 2018 2:57 PM

To: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Cc: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)




<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident between SJY 2466 B AND your insured SDS 8596 Y *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18014726/Npa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has yet to report the accident and we are currently pending verification for direct
settlement.

Please provide us evidence i.e. video and scene photo.
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 August, 2018 8:44 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Cc: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>

Subject: Accident between SJY 2466 B AND your insured SDS 8596 Y

Dear all,
Attached is our estimate and GIA report for your kind reference.
Kindly let us know who we look for to arrange surveyor to survey our client vehicle.

Thank you and have a nice days ahead.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Jack, Ng
HP: 8288 6309

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.
Website: www.honda.com.sg

w i’] Wisit our

Facebook page



Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.
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communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.
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