Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 5:30 PM

To: ‘Tan, Rachel'

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: Re: CLMOMVC000003222 - PRI- SLF7855E & YK9962K (GA) 30 /4/18
Attachments: SLF 7855E - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLF 7855E.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 7:55 AM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: Re: CLMOMVC000003222 - PRI- SLF7855E & YK9962K (GA) 30 /4/18

Dear Rachel,

Please be informed survey has done for SLF 7855E.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan @sg.gaig.com>

Date: Mon, Aug 13, 2018 at 8:46 AM

Subject: RE: Re: CLMOMVC000003222 - PRI- SLF7855E & YK9962K (GA) 30 /4/18
To: SHL Motor Pte Ltd <shlmotorpteltd @ gmail.com>

Without Prejudice

Dear May

Liability is against the driver of YK9962K.



Dear LKK

Please accept assignment for TP survey. Thank you.

Regards
Rachel Tan
Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company

Tel: 6804 7846

From: SHL Motor Pte Ltd <shimotorpteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, August 12, 2018 12:39 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: SHL Motor <shimotorpteltd@gmail.com>

Subject: [External] Re: CLMOMVC000003222 - PRI- SLF7855E & YK9962K (GA) 30 /4/18

Dear Ms Tan

Kindly arrange for LKK Auto Consultants to carry out the survey.

Please advise on liability.

Thanks & regards,
May Sim

SHL MOTOR PTE. LTD.

Co. Regn. No. 201611814M

Blk 51, Ubi Avenue 1,

#01-09, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Singapore 408933

Tel: +65 6282 6184 Fax: +65 6287 5977

The information transmitted by this email/facsimile communication, including any additional pages or
attachments, is intended only for the addressee and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any
interception, review, retransmission, disclosure, dissemination, or other use and/or taking of any action upon
this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited by law and may subject
them to criminal or civil liability. If you received this communication in error, please contact us
immediately at +65 62826184, and delete the communication from any computer or network system or

dispose of the documents as directed. Thank you.



On Tue, Aug 7, 2018 at 5:15 PM, Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan @sg.gaig.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Gilbert/ May

We spoke, we append the following list of our panel surveyors:-
1.  AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

2. A-PAC Investigation Solutions Pte Ltd

3. Priority Services

4.  RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

5. LKK Auto Consultants

6. JP KNIGHTS PTE LTD

Kindly let us know which SJE is selected and furnish the estimates for the survey to be carried out.

Regards
Rachel Tan
Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company

Tel: 6804 7846

From: SHL Motor Pte Ltd <shimotorpteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2018 11:47 AM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims @sg.gaig.com>

Cc: SHL Motor <shimotorpteltd@gmail.com>

Subject: [External] Pre-repair inspection for accident involving SLF7855E & YK9962K

Dear Sirs/Madam,

RE: ACCIDENT ON 30/04/2018 INVOLVING SLF7855E & YK9962K

We are instructed by Mr Vincent Tan Lek Meng to notify you of a road traffic accident on 30/04/2018 at about 1700hrs at
51 Ubi Ave 1 Paya Ubi Industrial Park car park involving our client's vehicle registration number SLF7855E and vehicle
registration number YK9962K driven by you/your authorised driver at the material time. A copy of the Singapore accident
statement and police report enclosed.



As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before we proceed to repair the damaged vehicle,
please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would like to conduct
a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed
to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Kindly contact Ms. May Sim or Mr Gilbert Leow at 6282 6184 for arrangement.

Thanks & regards,
May Sim

SHL MOTOR PTE. LTD.

Co. Regn. No. 201611814M

Blk 51, Ubi Avenue 1,

#01-09, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Singapore 408933

Tel: +65 6282 6184 Fax: +65 6287 5977

The information transmitted by this email/facsimile communication, including any additional pages or
attachments, is intended only for the addressee and may contain confidential and/or privileged material.
Any interception, review, retransmission, disclosure, dissemination, or other use and/or taking of any
action upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited by law
and may subject them to criminal or civil liability. If you received this communication in error, please
contact us immediately at +65 62826184, and delete the communication from any computer or network
system or dispose of the documents as directed. Thank you.
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