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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Elmer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com>
Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 11:06 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; motor.survey@axa.com.sg
Subject: RE: 14TH follow up ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SLN1044B AND 

YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SJL918X DATE: 09/08/2018 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM18014709/ua3

Hi, 
 
Please be inform my customer filed the claim to FIDREC and giving you 10 days notice to response. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Elmer Alfonso  
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 12:09 PM 
To: Elmer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 14TH follow up ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SLN1044B AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE 
SJL918X DATE: 09/08/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18014709/ua3 
 
Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Apologised for late response. 
 
We propose 50/50 as the accident was happened in the yellow box and there was no lane marking. Both 
parties should exercise caution. 
 
Please confirm. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Elmer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com>  
Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 4:25 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 14TH follow up ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SLN1044B AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE 
SJL918X DATE: 09/08/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18014709/ua3 
 
Hi, 
 
Please give me update for the above mentioned. We’ve been waiting the outcome for 6 months already. 
 
Looking forward to your quick response. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Elmer Alfonso 
96450084 
 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 9:42 AM 
To: Elmer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com> 
Subject: Automatic reply: 13TH follow up ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SLN1044B AND YOUR INSURED 
VEHICLE SJL918X DATE: 09/08/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18014709/ua3 
 
  

Hi, 

Thank you for your email. 

I am on leave and will be back to office on 20 Feb 2019. 

I will look into your email when I am back. 

Thank you. 

Regards, 

Hsiao Tong 

  


