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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. G256 4313
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref :  CS/FCI18014547/Ktd3

Date: 10-08-2018

LT

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 9219K Veh. Inspected SLX 25005
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18005883MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CWS (SERENE LER) Assign Date 10/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/08/2018 |Inspection Date 10/08/2018
Survey held at C.S. ONGAUTOPTELTD
BLOCK 10 ANG MO KIO IND PK 2A #04-01/#03-11
AMK AUTOPOINT
SINGAPORE 568047
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URD INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : ((45) 62563561 FANX : ((45) 62564315

Your Ref: D13005983MFSH Date: 31/8/2018
Our Ref: CSIFCI18014547/K1td3

The Motor Claims Department
First ital Insuran td

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO,_SLX 250058 __

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
10/8/2018 at the premises of M/s_C.S Ong and have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount 188 5.100.00(LABOUR ONLY)
Revised Estimate Amount : 8 2.100.00
“Check™ Items Amount (8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%
Nett Value : 5%
Description of Damage: PRI
The vehicle sustained damages at the
o/s body portion. e I ] ;h’l B
by
ol sacs

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital i

MOTOR SUR" £
Date 08-08-2018
Accident Date 08-08-2018
Insured Vehicle SHO219K Tk

Survey Location 10 ANG MO KIO IND PA!

Contact Person. A,
Contact No. G484155570
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Apgointed LKK AUTC CONSULT "
Surveyor
Contact Person Ma
Contact Number. NA
FORDIE™ ™
Please submit to us the Tax Invoice togethor wit re
NIMA Benchmark rates) to i
THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
Cc : Workshop .5 ONG AUTO PTE LT
Cc : TP Solicitor A T
Officer Incharge SERENE
IMPOR
Kindly subimit the survey reporl via CWS within 14 ;s
This is a computar nane

Tyt

o0010aL

1501 City Hu

tadaie

—ax o

1800558"

ird Party

¥2500%

‘241822

ATOBE

116315

]
40

w5 far re-in

g on




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: C.S. ONG AUTO PTE. LTD. <csongauto@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 6:04 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLX2500S question mark photos

Hi,

Have finalize with kenneth. Accept with thanks.
Warmest Regards,
C.S.ONG AUTO PTE. LTD.

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,

#02-16 AMK AutoPoint, Singapore 568047
Tel: 6484 1933 | Fax: 6484 1922

E-Mail: csongauto@yahoo.com.sg

On Monday, 29 October 2018, 3:54:39 PM GMT+8, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay @ lkkauto.coms= wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

Offer at $4550, 8days

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3551 | email: denjsetay @ |kkauto.com | fax: G256-4315

Rik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 10:07 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAutg); 'Claim Workflow System’; assignments
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.5G; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005983MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SLX 2500S.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLX 25005

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay @ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #032-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 August 2018 10:33 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005983MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotor
Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 7:13 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005983MFSH/1

claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,



"f//;y & ¢354

C. S. ONG AUTO PTE. LTD. f,

Company & GST Reg No.: 201408916W
10, Ang Mo Kio Ind. Park 2A, #02-16, AMK AutoPoint, Singapore (568047)
Tel: 6484 1933 | Fax: 6484 1922
E-Mail: csongauto@yahoo.com.sg

To: Motor Claims Department, Date: 08/08/2018
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Accident Involving Vehicles SLX25008 & SH9219K [Your Insured] on 08/08/2018 @
0820 Hrs along Tavistock Ave

Estimated Repair Costs For SLX2500S [Honda Shuttle]

1Pc Rear RH Fender $ ﬂ7 1,010.80 .
1Pc  RH Lower Rocker Panel g A 45500 A
1Pc  Rear RH Door $ 4 1,150.00 —
1Pc  Rear RH Door Handle $ 7510000 X
1Pc  Rear RH Door Sticker $ A 4050 x
1Set Rear RH Door Inner Trim Board Clips $ 7= 4500
1Pc Rear RH Door Opening Trim Weatherstrip Rubber $ 5970 A——"
1Pc  Rear RH Door Lower Rubber $ . 2850 X

1Pc  Rear RH Door Outer Window Side Garnish [Front] $ [Su7560 A

1Pc Rear RH Door Outer Window Side Garnish [Rear] $ P~ 7210 X

1Pc  Rear RH Door Outer Window Garnish $ J 8560 A
1Pc  Rear RH Power Window Motor § Fm361.00 %—
1Pc  Rear RH Window Regulator $ 361.00 &—
1 Pc Front RH Door s 7 115000 —
1 Pc Front RH Door Sticker $ 7= 3560 e
1 Pc Front RH Door Upper Hinge Assy $ /T 4850 X
1Pec Front RH Door Lower Hinge Assy $ 7l 4850 X

1 Pc Front RH Door Handle Assy $ ™~ 108.00 X

1 Pc Front RH Door Inner Lock Assy $ ~C 21000 X

1P¢  Front RH Door Outer Lock $ /410530
1Pc  Front RH Door Outer Window Side Garnish [Front] b 'S 7410 X
1Pc  Front RH Door Outer Window Side Garnish [Rear] $ 7/~ 8340 X
1Pc  Front RH Door Outer Window Garnish $ b 8560 X

1 Pc Front RH Door Inner Weatherstrip Rubber s ‘¢ 5970 K

1 Pc Front RH Door Opening Trim Weatherstrip Rubber $ /2810 X

1 Pec  Front RH Door Power Window Motor $ 7, 15180 *—
1 Pc Front RH Door Window Regulator $ 7 151.80 2



1Set Front RH Inner Trim Board Clips § 2~ 4500 X
Total: $ 6,239.30
Parts Less 20%: % 1,247.86
Parts Total: $ 4,991.44

Labour & MISC Charges
* To putty & re-spray new paintwork on all RHS Front & Rear Door % 2,400.00 *’d’h/
affected areas.

* To panel beat, repair & replace all RHS Front & Rear Door damaged $ 2,400.00 /7 sz
panels to transfer door parts, to refit & realignall of the above items.

* To conduct a check on all wiring systems. $ 100.00 2o/
* To anti-rust all affected areas. $ 200.00 ?f/
Labour & Charges Total: S 5,100.00
Parts Total: $ 4,991.44
Labour & Charges Total: $ 5,100.00
Total Cost of Repair: $ 10,091.44

(Non inclsive of 7% GST)
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C. S. ONG AUTO PTE. LTD. e

Company & GST Reg No.: 201408916W
10, Ang Mo Kio Ind. Park 2A, #02-16, AMK AutoPoint, Singapore (568047)
Tel: 6484 1933 | Fax: 6484 1922
E-Mail: csongauto@yahoo.com.sg

To: Motor Claims Department, Date: 08/08/2018
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Accident Involving Vehicles SLX2500S & SH9219K [Your Insured] on 08/08/2018 @
0820 Hrs along Tavistock Ave

1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Set
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1 Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pe
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Pc
1Set

Estimated Repair Costs For SLX2500S [Honda Shuttle]

Rear RH Fender #y

RH Lower Rocker Panel 7% %

Rear RH Door ot —

Rear RH Door Handle ¥

Rear RH Door Sticker Aft—

Rear RH Door Inner Trim Board Clips oo X

Rear RH Door Opening Trim Weatherstrip Rubber  /##+—
Rear RH Door Lower Rubber  Ji~ £

Rear RH Door Outer Window Side Gamish [Front] ~
Rear RH Door Outer Window Side Garnish [Rear] A~
Rear RH Door Outer Window Gamish -

Rear RH Power Window Motor [y

Rear RH Window Regulator L &

Front RH Door By —

Front RH Door Sticker  Ate—

Front RH Door Upper Hinge Assy /C4

Front RH Door Lower Hinge Assy /T X

Front RH Door Handle Assy /¥

Front RH Door Inner Lock Assy #¢ *

Front RH Door Quter Lock

Front RH Door Outer Window Side Garnish [Front] o
Front RH Door Outer Window Side Garnish [Rear] /+tx
Front RH Door Outer Window Garnish 7

Front RH Door Inner Weatherstrip Rubber v X

Front RH Door Opening Trim Weatherstrip Rubber 7
Front RH Door Power Window Motor =

Front RH Door Window Regulator 7

Front RH Inner Trim Board Clips 7



Total: 3
Parts Less 20%: %
Parts Total: $

Labour & MISC Charge
* To putty & re-spray new paintwork on all RHS Front & Rear Door 3
affected areas.

* To panel beat, repair & replace all RHS Front & Rear Door damaged $
panels to transfer door parts, to refit & realignall of the above items.

* To conduct a check on all wiring systems. g
* To anti-rust all affected areas. ¢
Labour & Charges Total: $
Parts Total: $
Labour & Charges Total: $
Total Cost of Repair: $

(Non inclsive of 7% GST)

|r LKK Auto Consultants hence nofify
e Danair - -~
e mMepaire

s To resurvesy beloradaliar spray painting

/ ﬂ?é"-' (
2,400.00

Xc-;ﬁ,(,
2,400.00
100.00 Z€(

200.00 ?a/
5,100.00

5,100.00
5,100.00



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 109607198R GST Rag. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CSIFCI18014547/Ktd3n2
sromsonsod e oo e [N
Code - FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 9219K Veh. Inspected SLX 25008
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18005983MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SERENE Assign Date 0B/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA SHUTTLE (A) c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. GPT71205408 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 28738 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA, & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/60 R15 YOROHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/08/2018 |inspection Date 10/08/2018
Survey held at C. S ONG AUTO PTE LTD
BLOCK 10 ANG MO KIO IND PK 24 #04-01/#03-11
AMK AUTOPOINT
SINGAPORE 568047
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

8 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Feg. Mo: 199607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-86807198-R Page Mo..1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLX 25008
Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | Estima up?;n ;{“
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR RH FENDER BENT 1.010.80 1.010.590
1|RH LOWER ROCKER PAMNEL TO REPAIR SEE 45500 -
LABOUR
1|REAR RH DOOR BENT 1,150.00/ 1,150.00
1|REAR RH DOOR HANDLE SERVICEABLE 108.00 -
1|REAR RH DOOR STICKER NECESSARY 4050 40.50
1|SET REAR RH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 45,00 45.00
1|REAR RH DOOR OPENING TRIM WEATHERSTRIP HECESSARY 58.70 5870
RUEBEBER
1|REAR RH DOOR LOWER RUBEBER SERVICEABLE 28.50 -
1|REAR RH DOOR CUTER WINDOW SIDE GARNISH SERVICEABLE 75.60 -
(FRONT)
1|REAR RH DOOR OUTER WINDOW SIDE GARNISH (REAR) |SERVICEABLE 7210 =
1|REAR RH DOOR CUTER WINDOW GARNISH SERVICEABLE B5.60 -
1|REAR RH POWER WINDOW MOTOR JAMMED 361.00 361.00
1|REAR RH WINDOW REGULATOR BENT 361.00 381.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR BENT 1,150.00 1,150.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR STICKER MNECESSARY 3560 35.60
1|FRONT RH DOOR UPPER HINGE ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 48.50 2
LABOUR
1|FRONT RH DOOR LOWER HINGE ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 48.50 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT RH DOOR HANDLE ASSY SERVICEABLE 108.00 -
1|FRONT RH DOOR INNER LOCK ASSY TO REFPAIR SEE 210.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT RH DOOR OUTER LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 105.30 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT RH DOOR OUTER WINDOW SIDE GARNISH SERVICEABLE 7410 -
(FRONT)
1|FRONT RH DOOR OUTER WINDOW SIDE GARNISH SERVICEABLE 83.40 -
(REAR)
1|FRONT RH DOOR OUTER WINDOW GARMNISH SERVICEABLE B5.60
1|FRONT RH DOCR INMER WEATHERSTRIP RUBBER SERVICEABLE 59.70 -
1|FRONT RH DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR JAMMED 151.80 151.80

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18014547/Ktd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bdm BE B 54 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ui Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607168R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition
Y o Workshop ($)| __(5)
1|FRONT RH DOOR WINDOW REGULATOR DISTORTED 151.80 151.80
1|SET FRONT RH INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 4500 -
1|FRONT RH DOOR OPENING TRIM WEATHERSTRIP SERVICEABLE 28.10
RUBBER
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,247 86 -903 46
4,991 44 3,613.84
LABOUR
TO PUTTY & RE-SPRAY NEW PAINTWORK ON ALL RHS 2,400.00 1,000.00
FRONT & REAR DOOR AFFECTED AREAS.
TO PANEL BEAT,REPAIR & REPLACE ALL RHS FRONT & 2,400.00 1,000.00
REAR DOOR DAMAGED PANELS TO TRANSFER DOOR
PARTS,TO REFIT & REALIGNALL OF THE ABOVE
ITEMS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF RH LOWER
ROCKER PANEL, FRONT RH DOOR UPPER HINGE
ASSY,FRONT RH DOOR LOWER HINGE ASSY FRONT RH
DOOR INNER LOCK ASSY AND FRONT RH DOOR OUTER
LOCK.
TO CONDUCT A CHECK ON ALL WIRING SYSTEMS. 100.00 20.00
TO ANTI-RUST ALL AFFECTED AREAS. 200.00 50.00
5,100.00 2,110.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,091.44 5723.84
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,550.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18014547/Ktd3n2

Y éva

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart I8 made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frant page of this Report.




