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' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

0 P 51 Uni Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189607196 GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CSIFCI18014543/R1sd3

38 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 088877 Date: 10-08-2018

AT

Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 9188H Veh. Inspected SDS 8805H
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D18005964MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CWS (LURENE JAW) Assign Date 10/08/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 08/08/2018 Inspection Date 27/08/2018
Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRAROAD
SINGAPORE 159941
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Ao
Consultants
Pte Lid

Company Registration No. 193607T198R

£] URI AVE 1, #02-25 PAYVA URL INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (65} 62564315

Your Ref: D18005964MFESH

Our Ref: CS/ECI18014543/R1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

Datc: 29 August 2018

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SDS 9905H .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 27/08/2018 at the premises of M/s Performance Motors Limited and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§ 9,832.50

Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 5.670.85

“Check” Items Amount : 5% 818.85

Market Value : S5

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Mett Value 5%

Description of Damage: i

The vehicle sustained damages e

at the front ofs portion. e @i Frewt
aftsse

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

MOTOR = =

Date 08-08-2018 e ,
Accident Date 06-08-2018 P Ty
Insured Vehicle SHAZ1EEH
Survey Location 302 ALEXAMNDRA IR 7
Contact Person. CARO|
Contact No. 63190174 -
Survey Type DIREGT SETTLERE!
Appointed

PR LKK AUTO ~rsin
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA
Contact Number. BA
Please submit to us the Tax Inyoics teme v - rsad on

NIMA Berniclhimor!

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUE

PERECM AR T
Cc : Workshop

MOTC
Cc : TP Solicitor MA
Officer Incharge LUREMNE

Kindly submit the survey (eoort

This s




Shirtez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 11:29 AM

To: 'PBSF

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SDS9905H

Hi Caroline,
Confirmed final fig of $ 5.872.90 (part by part) @ 4 days of repairs before GST.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@|kkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: PBSP [mailtu:pml—pbsp@simedarbv.mm.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 2:30 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: Re: FINAL REPORT / SD5S9905H

Dear Sirs

As requested, please see attached and kindly confirm COR.

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 2:15:01 PM

To: PBSP

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SDS9905H

Hi Caroline,

Kindly send us supplementary photo.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handlar

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.s

Sent: Thursday, 22 November 2018 3:59 PM

To: Rasul <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL REPORT / SD59905H

Dear Rasul
We refer to the above and attached Final Report.
Please confirm COR as follows:

Total Labour : 2,465.00
Total Parts : 3,407.90
Total Labour & Parts : 5,872.90

Repair days: 4

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159841

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions
expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime

Darby's.”



ﬁley Hiew_{I.Kl( Auto)

#

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 4:20 PM

To: LUREMNEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc sur@lkkauto.com; ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)’; ASSIGN MEMNTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005964MFSH/1

Attachments: SDS 9905H - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Lurene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SDS 9905H.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 10 August 2018 3:18 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005964MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not In workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmepts@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 5:39 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; LUREMEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005964MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

1



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3840

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com
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i e Ll ™ b
w = Performance Motors Limited 2
& member of the Sime Darky Group "
O, Reg. Ho. TS7401E59W ST Reg. Ko M2-0020081-x Pakar f <
363, Al d Reoad ZR0, Eampong Areng Eoad il f'.-nx.m:.::g_n:.-:-: m
"-\-I:'.'I:' E;:::nl:::o:m-.;.n Centre East I"MH:: Centra - E:T:T;J:SEEJ?;E-;:EJ- cemere
gingapore 155541 Singagere 438180 Tel, 63150528 |Aftersales)
Tal, 63190100 (Sales & RAming Tel, E3Ls0REn (AfcerEalen) EI1BEEY3 630 IMotarTad]
£31190111 {AfCersales) Fax, &3445773 Fax. Ed4756601 iafrerdales)
Fax. G4747770 64 THEEZE (Motorrad)
GST REG. NO M2 - 0020081 - X 07 AUG 2018
ESTIMATE
- !
Estimate No. i bl 474959 Page No. :+ 1 of 5
Date Estimated : 07/08/2018
| Prepared By : Inthiran A/L Thurasamy ]
' N
- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 303

#11-528

Pee Eng Yau (Peng RongYao)
142 Bishan Street 12

Singapore 570142

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

& Raffles Quay
#21-00
Singapore 048580

and repair right fender.
e 'T_.-;:
Painting front bumper and fender right.

To check electrical wiring systems at the front section
for proper function including adjustments of headlights.

To replace right headiight including program
and conduct tests for proper function.

Sundries

DESCRIPTION

FRT BUMPER RH INSERT

FRT RH SIDE PANEL TOP MOUNTING

FRT FLAP TOWING EYE PRIMED

RH FINISHER {LUXURY LINE}

RH SUPPORT FOG LAMP (GESCHLOSSEN)
FRT BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (PMA)
GRILLE SIDE OPEN RH (LUXURY LINE+FPD
RH SUPPORT HEADLIGHT ARM

RH HEADLIGHT LED TECHNOLOGY

RH FOG LIGHT

ULTRASONIC SENSOR BLACK
DECOUPING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTER

Total Labour 1: 5,686.00
oTY _ PRIC __VALUE
1 9.70 <7 970
1 8.85 YA ) <7 gass
1 41.80 > 4180
1 52.55 ./ 2, 555
1 77.60 FeL X 7760
1 84200 feb~ 542 00
1 g5 85 LA 7 9585
1 124.85 rrl 7 12485
1 2,348.00 S 2 348 00
1 276.40 < T, 276.40
1 248.70 r‘-"bf- ¥ 24870
4 505 <7 2020
otal Parts : 4. 146.50

i '
REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGM. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SDS9905H 5B45372 19/09/2016 216d G TOURER (4]

DESCRIPTION

PY 1y
1So )?ﬁ'“

WS 52000
{\eL ﬂﬂy

M




EMd Dieales
A mamber of the Sime Darby Group

Performance Motors Limited

Co. Reg, Wo, 15740155%% O5T Res, Ho M- G0A00AL=X

303, Alexandra Road

cime Darby Performance Centre

280, Kampeong Arang Road

115, Alexardya Road
Sime Darby Business Centre

Eagt Cogast Ceatré

Singapore 159944

Singapore 1aasdl Singepore 438180 Tel, 63190528 |Aftergales)
Tel. 63190100 (Sales & Rdmin) rel. E3150888 (AfferSales) £3180533/530 [Mororrad)
£1150111 (AfcerSales) Fax. 53448771 Fax. E47IEEDL [RfterSales)
Fax., &4747TTTO E4TOREI4 IMotorrad)
GST REG. WO : M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMATE
Estimate No. : bl 474959 Fage No. 2 0f 5
Date Estimated : 07/08/2018
Prepared By : Inthiran A/L Thurasamy y
REGM. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MCODEL MILEAGE
SDS9905H 5B45372 19/09/2016 216d G TOURER 0
Date&Time 11 oY g:ﬂ“{'f_ Excess 53 B
ivevar's Name ___w____ Sign :
Surveyor's Tel ____JAYD. L‘i&& Authcs Yes | Mo '!
TO BY SURVEYOR Yes/No PML Yes/No |
& B B |
— — - _4 % — |
I
|
5 /'-ﬂ'll. i) v
— r "
ey B Labour 1 5,686.00
- ) = Parts 4,146.50
Labour 2 0.00
Excess 0.00
Total GST @ 7% 688.28
Grand Total 10,520.78

** THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY™
++ PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE ™



Performance Motors Limited 2

A marrbsr of thi Sime Darry Group
e, Ry P, 1574071559, OBT Rieg. Mo, MZ-HI200E1-2

SUPPLEMENTARY
Ectimate Mo : bl 47958 Fage Mo. :
Cate Estimated : o7/08/2018
Prepared By ' Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
FREPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 303
Paa Eng Yau (Peng RongYao) M5 First Capital Insurance Limited
142 Bishan Street 12 6 Raffles Quay
#11-528 #21-00

Singapore 048580
Singapore 570142

FEEM NO CHASS 5 NO REGM DATE WMIEL M LENE

SDS59905H 5845372 19/09/2016 216d G TOURER ]

DESCRIPTION ORIGINAL PRICE DISC, % METT

DESCRIPTION ) UNIT PRICE QTyY DISC, % NETT

# PLAQUE B2NM * £0.50 1.00 A 69.50 A 7

Total Labowr :
Total Parts : 69.50
Total Labour & Parts : 69.50

Final Report SDS9205H, Page 1 Finalised by: Caroline DID: 63190174 Fax: 64794601



Performance Motors Limited

& mésriber of the Simea Dartry Group
o Fng. o, 197401850W, GST Aog. Mo, M2-0020081-X

FINAL REPORT
Estinmete ho. : bl 47959 Page Mo. |
[ete Estimated ; 07/08/2018
Prepared By : Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
BEPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 303
Pes Eng Yau (Pang RongYao) M5 First Capital Insurance Limited
142 Bishan Streat 12 & Raffles Quay
#11-528 #21-00

Singapore 048580
Singapora 570142

FEM MO CHASE 5 NO REM DATE WCCEL M LEACE
SDS9905H 5845372 19/08/2016 216d G TOURER 0
DESCRIFTION ORIGINAL PRICE DISC. % METT
To replace front bumper and attachments include 850.00 850,00
kniocking out dents caused by the accident
To spray paint front bumper 934.00 934.00
To check electrical wiring systems at the front section 150.00 150,00
far proper function
Ta replace RH LED technalogy headlight include 451,00 451,00
programming and conducting tests for proper function
Sundries. 80.00 80.00
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE QTY¥  DISC. % NETT
RH FINISHER (LUXURY LINE) 52.55 1.00 52.55
FRT BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (PMA) B4A2,00 1.00 842.00
GRILLE SIDE OPEN RH (LUXURY LINE+PD 9585 1.00 95.85
# PLAQUE B2ZMM * 1 69,50 1.00 69.50
RH HEADUGHT LED TECHNOLOGY 2,348.00 1.00 2,348.00

# SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS

Total Labour : 2.465.00
Total Parts : 3,407.90
Total Labour & Parts 587290
Deduction for Excess : 0.00
Total Repair Costs less Excess: 587290
GST @7%: 411.10
Grand Total : 6,284.00

Final Report SDS59905H, Page 1 Finalised by: Caroline DID: 63190174 Fax 64794601



TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No 19-89607 198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref ©  CS/FCI18014543/R1sd3n2
$16.01 Q1T HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date 27112018 M“wnmmmm
Code . FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 9188H Veh. Inspected SDS 9905H
Policy No. Coverage (3) D.00
Claim No. D18005964MF SH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date o8/082018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 216D GRAN TOURER c.C 1456
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WBAZE320905B45372 Colour GREY
Odometer 30632 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [205/55 R17 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R17 FIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R17 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55 R17 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT OVS PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  06/08/2018 [Inspection Date 2710812018
Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159841
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Beg Mo: 100B07198R GST Reg. Mo 19-8607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SDS 9905H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | Chop {:l} “]}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRT BUMPER RH INSERT (SN) SERVICEABLE 9.70 -
1|FRT RH SIDE PANEL TOP MOUNTING (SN) SERVICEABLE 8.85
1|FRT FLAP TOWING EYE PRIMED (SN) SERVICEABLE 41,80 :
1|RH FINISHER (LUXURY LINE}(SN) SCRATCHED 52.55 5255
1|RH SUPPORT FOG LAMP (GESCHLOSSEN}(SN) SERVICEABLE 7760
1|FRT BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (PMA)(SN) SCRATCHED 842.00 842.00
1|GRILLE SIDE OPEN RH (LUXURY LINE+PD)(SN) SCRATCHED 95,85 9585
1|RH SUPPORT HEADLIGHT ARM (SN) SERVICEABLE 124.85 ;
1|RH HEADLIGHT LED TECHNOLOGY (SN} SCRATCHED 234800 2.348.00
1|RH FOG LIGHT (SN) SERVICEABLE 276.40 2
1|ULTRASONIC SENSOR BLACK (SN) SERVICEABLE 248.70 .
4|DECOUPING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTER (SN) SERVICEABLE 20,20 -
1| PLAQUE 82MM (SN){(ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 69.50 69.50
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 80.00
4,296.00 3,487.90
LABOUR
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, RIGHT HEADLAMP 2,875.00 850.00
SUPPORT ATTACHMENTS AND REPAIR RIGHT FENDER
PAINTING FRONT BUMPER AND FENDER RIGHT. 1,923.00 934.00
10 CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEMS AT THE 177.00 150.00
FRONT SECTION FOR PROPER FUNCTION INCLUDING
ADJUSTMENTS OF HEADLIGHTS.
TO REPLACE RIGHT HEADLIGHT INCLUDING PROGRAM 531.00 451.00
AND CONDUCT TESTS FOR PROPER FUNCTION.
5,606.00 2,385.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,902.00 5,872.90
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I 5,872.90

Report Ref No. CS/FC118014543/R1sd3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

f

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS
Automaotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY T0 THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is made soiely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

Mo labisity of responsibiits whatsoaver
Beport. in whole or in part, does S0 at his or her 0wn Gek.




