Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2019 12:53 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Ce MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020819, ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JF

2324C AND SJL 290Y ON 06/08/2018 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Asher,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all {vew lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 9:03 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020819, ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JF 2324C AND 5JL 290Y ON
06/08/2018

Your Ref: 18/18/18/VP05,/020819
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJF 2324C AND SJL 290Y ON 06/08/2018

We have highlighted to your good office on 17/08/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when our insured changed lane and collided third party vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY is as follows: -

1



Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4,353.19 $ 2,407.50
2. Loss of Use (4days x $80.00) $320.00 $ 320.00 (4days x 580.00)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 52.00 $2.00

Total | $ 2,729.50

**4 days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval please.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

Mo, 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind, Park 2A #00-00 AME Autopomnt Singapore S68047
TEL: 6483 12441 4 lines ) FAX: 6483 6170 Email; ahlimmeia singnet. com sg
s MO-0%e39-E RUB NOZG64TO300B

Our Ref : MC0913336
Your Ref SJLzZ90Y
Date : 05/08/2019

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04

THE CONCOURSE
SINGAPORE 199555
Dear SirfMadam,

Request for Direct Settlement for Accident involving our client's vehicle SJF2324C and your
Insured SJL290Y ON 06/08/2018 17:40 ALONG SELETAR WEST LINK

We refer to the above matter.

Please assess through your Insured's (SJL290Y) report and our Client (SJF2324C) - KHOO CHOON
BENG's report as attached and advise whether there are possibilities of direct settlement.

Please find attached the following

1) Final Bill

2)  GIA Motor Accident Report form

3) Certificate of Insurance, IC and Driving Licence
4) LTA Search

The above vehicle was surveyed by Kenneth from LKK as appointed by LONPAC on 14/08/2018.

We would quantify our claim as below:-

Cost of Repair : $2,407 50
Loss Of Use : $320.00(4 X $80) Surveyor recommend 4 days
LTA Search :$2.00

Total : $2,729.50
Kindly acknowledge and revert on the possibility of direct settlement within 14 days.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

- -"_FF.-'—H_
g
Kee MuiHong




Authorisation fo Act

g b - ;
Ls Hge e B ENg ( the third party
claimant ) of RN WU, Yl ME L B(i-383 w8 N 49
( address ), owner of _ £EE LIF22WUL ( Vehicle no ) hereby

authorise Ah Lim Motor Company ( the workshop ) to act for me in

respect to my claim for repair costs and / or rental and /or 'loss of use
"( Claim ) for my vehicle No. SVF 231%hat was damaged pursuant to

the accident which occurred on ctleg “JL.E{ dite ) along
f'al;-_léﬂu' wast  Ywk

( location )

involving vehicle Nos SIL 60T ( the Accident )

[ further authorise the workshop to settle the above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorised to
receive the payment further to settlement of my claim with payment
cheque/s made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis
insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle is concerned.

_*"\ : s o~
Dated this | day of NG (month)20 | [ (year)

Signed by Third party claimant Signed byAhe workshop
Owner Veh No ; 0 Sr

Y R C

Personal data Protection Act 2012

I/ We acknowledge -and consent to Ah Lim Motor Company collecting , using and
disclosing and /or processing my/our personal data to Third Party service providers

and/or Insurance company my / our personal data for the purpose of processing the
claim and related insurance / claim matters. '

£

I -
“I':-"'.jl.'l'_."-' I._-’. |
l RTAY ATACA {

Owner Signature




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : [8/18/ 18/ VPOS/020819
DATE : 13/12/2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, KHOO CHOON BENG confirmed acceptance from Mfs LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner SJL 290Y the sum of Singapore Dollars TWO
THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED TWENTY NINE AND CENTS FIFTY
ONLY. ($2,729.5(00 in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of
property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become
manifest. arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SJF
23240C on 06 AUG 2018 along/at SELETAR WEST LINK.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (MAK YING LENG
/LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made

by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to
M/s AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY.

I'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

&
.'I.'I.,j."..:-'ﬁ. ? . Ii
W fjf**{

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

V~I'|'r'. 0 UHduw E N 3L\ G

Name of vehicle owner/Date



AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

Mo 10 Ang Mo Kie Ind. Park 24 #01-09 AME Awtopoim Singapore 368047
TEL: 6483 1244 4 lings ) FAX: 6483 6170 Email: ahlimme @ singnet. com, 5o
Ces T MU-0009639-E RUB NOGGETOI00R

M/S:  KHOO CHOON BENG Final No: AL1901430
BLK 419 YISHUN AVE 11 Claim No: MC0913336
#06-383 Date: 05 Aug 2019
SINGAPORE 760419 Policy No: PO663II36
TEL: 96969788 Veh Reg No: 5JF2324C
ATTN: Make/Model: HONDA CIVIC 1.8L M
Your Ref No: SIF2324C
Claim Type: Third Party

Accident Date:  06/08/2018
Tax Invoice-Final Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SJF2324C

PAGE:|

Description Quantity | List Price Amount
S8 5%

As agreed to proceed repair at Lump Sum Repair S% 2.250.00

Less Excess 5% (.00

Amount Before GST SE 2.250.00

Add GST @ ™o 157.50

Total Amount payvable S% 2.407.50

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED AND SEVEN AND CENTS
FIFTY ONLY

The above vehicle was surveyved by KENNETH KONG -LKK on 14/08/2018

For AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

i —-.__‘)
_,_,_:_—:r"-/_,.-

e i
E.& O.E. AUTHORISED SIGNATURE

-
o



Invoice

Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-122072
Date of Request: 0B/0B2018

Ah Lim Motor Company

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24
#01-09 AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Dear SirfMadam,

Your Ref No:

Online Purchase

Enguiry Date 0B/08/2018
Enquiry By kee Mui Hong
TP Vehicle Mo SJL290Y
Accident Date 08/08/2018
Enquiry Result - -

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
|SJL280Y Lonpac Insurance Bhd 12M11/2017-11/11/2018 +65 62507388
iiSJLEB{}Y Lonpac Insurance Bhd 19/05/2018-18/05/2019 +55 52507388
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapare and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no hability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connecticn with the reports or their images.

This is 8 computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 08/08/2018



Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
! GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
lNSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
i e e 5T Registration No: M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE et

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-122072

Date of Reguest: 08/08/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Ah Lim Motor Company

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A

#01-09 AMK Autopoint

Singapore 568047

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 08/08/2018

Enquiry By Kee Mui Haong

TP Vehicle No. SJLZaoy

Accident Date 06/08/2018
IDESCRIPTION - |AMOUNT (S$)
| TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) I 2.00
Thank Yaou,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[¥] GIRG [] Cash [ ] Cheqgue

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsasé& fuseaction=dsp ... 08/08/2018



