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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 5:27 PM

To: 'Boo seng yak'; SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee
Sing

Subject: AE: FINAL REVISION - SKET416G - OD AIG - SURVEYED B AUG 18

Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $ 5,750.00 before excess $2,000.00 & G5T and 4 repair days.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 7:03 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine leong@premiumauto.com.5g=; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg;
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SKE7416G - OD AIG - SURVEYED 8 AUG 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $5750.00 @ 4 days of repairs.

Your early closure is appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

s e S ———— /
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 August 2018 3:40 PM

To: Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: RE : OD claim for SKE 7416 G on 07/028/2018

Dear Phua,

Please be informed that the excess of above vehicle is $2,000.00.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: Claims <claims@ premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 10:29 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE : OD claim for SKE 7416 G on 07/028/2018

Good morning all,
Here is the attachments of GIA report and estimate for your kind reference . ZKindly assist the claim .
Thank you .

Best Regards,
Phua
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (kg no 133502271w)

55 LIbi Road 1 Road Singapore 408653

p. +55 6388 2323 d. 465 6768 5828 f. +65 6841 1183
e, claims@premiymauto.com.sg w. www.aud|.Com.sg
Aud] Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 1599

€115

The all-new Audi Q2

#tuntaggable __ T

38 p. +65 6B3E 2223
TERRIAE T A

Ll

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sa/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-g2-

Email Disclaimer
Thic email. including mry attachment, & confidentiai and may atso be privileged.
Fwou have received it inerror, please notity us immediately by reply ema | and then delete this message from your systam
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
2672C

SKE7416G

No

14 Aug 2018

AUDI

55 SPORTBACK 3.0 TFSI QU (FACELIFT)
White

2011

CGW029519
WAUZZZ8TOCA015982
245.0 kW (328 bhp)
$67,356.00

29 Mar 2012

29 Mar 2012

0

$67,356.00

Yes
28 Mar 2022
$43,781.00

28 Mar 2022

B - Car (1601cc & above)
10

$79,304.00

$28,715.00

$72,496.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Aug 2018
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 4086595
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRead 1

Contact No + 63662323

Fax No - BB411183
Reference +  PA/OD/D903/2018/K5
Date . 7-Aug-18

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIC Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  Paulina Hatta
Address + 101 Cairnhill Circle
#06-14
Singapore 229809
Telephone :  HP+65 96165001
Type of Claim :  Own Damage claims
Policy No. : 2100297180
Vehicle No : SKE7416 G
Model Code :  AudiSSSB3.0TFSIQU
Model / Year : Mar-12
Engine No :  CGW 029519
Chassis No . WAUZZZBTOCADLS55982
Mileage :
Date In :
Liability .
Excess Cost gL ES
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date :  7-Aug-1B

Place of Accident

Merchanr Rd (Outside Riverside Point Mext to CTE Exit



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

imate r Charges for Acci t Ve KE 7 5

Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges Recommedation

To remove and transfer front wire harness for
headllghts,hornsjfug lamps,outside temperature o, & 480.00 /
sensor and headlight washer assy and front

parking aid.
To dismantle and renew front bumper,rhs
, headlight and rhs front fender.Re-organise front ¢ 2 oo (DL
crash management components.Reinstall all parts : :
removed.,
3 To respray front burmper and rhs front fender s 150900 (/27

To renew rhs front rim and carry out wheel

: 5/N S 280.00 X.
alignment.

5 To carry out diagnostic checks. S/IN & 192.00 '/,

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : & 4,552.00



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SM 2030 E.

Da e Parts & Pric

S/N  Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS
1 FRONT BUMPER COVER e t—12 s 263500 —
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS S 222.00 &

3 FRONTBUMPER SECURING STRIPLH/RH | , 3 60.00 #
4  FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT 5 195.007
5 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT ADAPTOR 3 107.007°
6 AIRGUIDEGRILLERH /Mt = 5 307.00 *
7 WHEEL SPOILER RH FRONT < ™ S 50.00 ~
8  GUIDE PIECE RH AN 3 37.00
9  FRONT PARKING AID SENSOR A=t »~ S 211.00*
10 FRONT PARKING AID SENSOR SEAL RING Mt~ S 5.00 *
11 FRONTFENDERRH < 2itd 5 930.00 =
12 FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS RH Ust N S 49.00
13 FRONT FENDER BRACKET RH FRONT 3 50.00 ~~
14 FRONT FENDER BRACKETRHREAR N W $ 50.00 7
15  FRONT FENDER BRACKETLH &% S 34.00
16  FRONTFENDER BRACERH el JFOHY s 106.00 2
17  WHEEL HOUSING LINER RH Tl pos S 163.00
18  WHEEL HOUSING ATTACHMENT PARTS RH TR g 38.00
19 "V6T" CHROME EMBLEM alee 5 108.00 =~
20  HEADLIGHT MOUNTING RH € plen S 109.00 &
SUB- TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 5,466.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend - Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 4086399
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SKE 7416 G.

Damage Pa Pric
S/N  Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS

21  HEADLIGHT RH Pt S 2,341.00 ¥
22 HALOGEN FOG LAMPRH Mt <~ S 236.00 ¥
23 LIFTCYLINDERRH ~ AH ™ 5 241.00 ¢
24  ALUMINIUMRIMRH A€ M~ 5 965.00 X .
25  SUNDRIES ) adl 3 300.00

TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 9,549.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,552.00

GRAND TOTAL $ 14,101.00

All charges are not inclusive of G5T.

Legend :

Remarks (0K} = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett




Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408693
Tel: 63662323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

Adnaa “N_A_

Es'i’ aE[{g

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Morah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 Lbi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate +  Accident Repairs
Workshop +  UbiRoad 1

Contact No T 6386 2323

Fax No : 68411183
Reference . PA/OD/OS03/2018/KS
Date : 7-Aug-18

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  Paulina Hatta
Address + 101 Caimhill Circle
#0B-14
Singapore 229809
Telephone HP +65 96165001
Type of Claim Own Damage claims
Policy No. 2100297180
Vehicle No SKE 7416 G
Model Code Audi S5 SBE 3.0 TFSI QU
Model f Year Mar-12
Engine No CGW 029518
Chassis No WAUZZZBETOCAD155882
Mileage
Date In
Liability

Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
7-Aug-18
Merchanr Rd (Qutside Riverside Point Next to CTE Exit



Premium Automobiles
55 |bi Road 1, Singapore 408599
Tel ' G366 2323 Fax: 68411182

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SKE 7416 G.

Estimated Surveyor's
SIN Mature of Jobs Charges Recommedation
To remove and transfer front wire hamess for
1 headhghts,hums,fng lamps,outside temperature _ SN § 480,00 $ -
sensor and headlight washer assy and front parking
aid.

To dismantle and renew front bumper,rhs headlight
2 and rhs front fender.Re-organise front crash $ 2100.00 g 1,000.00
management components.Reinstall all parts removed.

3 To respray front bumper and rhs front fender 5 1,500.00 g 1,100.00
4 To renew rhs front rim and carry out whee! alignment. SN § 280.00
5 To carry out diagnostic checks. SN $ 192.00 5 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES ER 4,552.00 § 2,772.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Lbi Road 1, Singapore 408689
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SMC 2030 E.

Damage Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1 FRONT BUMPER COVER 3 2,635.00 2,108.00
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS 3 222.00
3 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP LH/RH % 60.00
4 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT $ 195.00
5 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT ADAPTOR 5 107.00
5] AIR GUIDE GRILLE RH ¥ 307.00
7 WHEEL SPOILER RH FRONT ¥ 50.00
8 GUIDE PIECE RH 3 37.00
9 FRONT PARKING AID SENSOR 5 211.00

10 FRONT PARKING AID SENSOR SEAL RING 3 5.00
11 FRONT FENDER RH $ 930.00 744.00
12 FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS RH 3 45,00
13 FRONT FENDER BRACKET RH FRONT 5 50.00 40.00
14 FRONT FENDER BRACKET RH REAR ¥ 50.00
15 FRONT FENDER BRACKET LH $ 34.00
16 FRONT FENDER BRACE RH 3 106.00
17 WHEEL HOUSING LINER RH 5 163.00
18 WHEEL HOUSING ATTACHMENT PARTS RH 5 38.00
19 "/6T" CHROME EMBLEM 5 108.00 8§6.00
20 HEADLIGHT MOUNTING RH ] 109.00
SUB- TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 5,466.00 2,978.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Mett.




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SKE 7416 G.

Damage Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
cif 5 2,978.00

21 HEADLIGHT RH g 2.341.00

22 HALOGEN FOG LAMP RH $ 236.00

23 LIFT CYLINDER RH - 241.00

24 ALUMINIUM RIM RH 5 8965.00

25 SUNDRIES ] 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 9,549.00 3 2,978.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,552.00 $ 2,772.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 14,101.00 $§ 5,750.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend - Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X} = Not approved

Spare parts are Spacial Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax . 68411183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note - This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected venhicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Litd MNorah Khai
78 Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AlG Building 0841 1183

Singapore 079120
Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Yr Ref: SKE 7416 G

Nora. khaif@premiumauto.com.sg
Body & Paint Dept
PA/OD/0903/2018/MAS
20 Nov 2018
Dear Sir,
RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SKE 7416 G, Audi S5 SB 3.0 TFSI Qu
With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SKE 7416 G, claimant,

Ms. Paulina Hatta, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 85013173 — §84.012.50

2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me al
6768 9911,

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

Norah Khai
Claims Dept

Encls

AIG - SKE 7416 G

from
Telephone +65-
Telefax +55-
EMail

Our department
Our Ref

Your Ref
Date

total pages

Premium Automobiles Pte Lic

Showroom

9 Leng Kea Road
Singapore 158080
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Parts Centres
55 Ubi Rd 1

Singapore 408699
Telephone (65) 6336 2323
Telefax [65) 684 11183



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

_..CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Notified Est Subrmitted .n"-d] P.st-lr_]ne-:t | Adj Rpt | Adj Submitted | ins Auth'ed | SEalus
12 Aug 2018 10 Aug 2008 545,750.00 E45,750.00 Pending for Survey
Main 11:36 Edit Estimates || View Rpt | Report
Edit Acdj Rpt I | Cancel Case

Ih!\‘eranﬂ Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS _ _ _ | [Created by insurer]
|| Insured: PAULINA HATTA, 1D: SH232672C, Tel: +6596165001, Email: PAULINA. HATTABGMAIL.COM
! 07,/08/2018 00:00 - :59
| Wehicle Reg, No.t SKE7416G Date of Loss: |[76 Months and 9 Days From LTA

| o | Reg Date (Man Yr)]
|| Claim Type: ob/ 55?65455945(3 Poliw.-'l:uver Mete No.: 11113029'?150 :Enmprehens1ue".|
| Excess: i '552 I:H:ID ﬂﬂl

| Repairer: Premium Automobiles Pte I.td (un} 55 Ubi Road 1, 609699 Lt -
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. {SE] Tal: 65 6419-3000 ..
| MimiZarina. DallyAmri@aig.com

Adjiister: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. . [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt
due 21,/08/2018]

|| Driver/Custodian: PAULINA HATTA (35 / Female}, NRIC: S8232672C, Tel: +6596165001 el ]

' Handling Insurer;

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view AN | Compose Cose Mail ||
|« AIG_SG (13/08/2018): SKE7416G / OD / 07/08/2018 / Coverage & Excess update B i 7]

= ’ == = = . _-i
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View Al |  Search Tasks Create New Task | _Complete ||

Due Date priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |
il Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm 2fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 4/12/2018



Merimen e-Claims
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Upload Fhatas |
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Claim Documents

*SKE7416G (55765465945G)
oD
Aug 7 2018 12:00AM
[PAULINA HATTA]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
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Documentation

Mo
1

2

F||1:|I-:'r_'-:l on

07/0B/186 12:50
07/08/18 12:50

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

General View

General View

General View

General View
General Wiew
General View
General 'H'bgw
General View
General View
Genaral View

General View

General View

General View

LEK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ)
Driver's Driving License

ESTIMATE
Singapore Accident Statement

| WORKSHOP INVOICE
DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Linked Accident Report Documents

Premium Automabiles Pre Lid {UBI)
Accident Statement

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)

Accident Photo

Accident Photo

Accident Photo

Accident Photo

Accident Photo

Accident Photo

Accident Photo

Accident Photo
Accident Photo

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd [I.JB:I_:
Sketch Plan

Sketch Plan #£2
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Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

- . Reset | save | PrlnHJ:

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

There are no document chocklists configured

[ B . — ] ]
Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ)

*

Show Remarks To: [ Handiing Insurer
Peste: Ramarks 308 privale Uriess you Show T 10 cllser partees

https://singapore.merimen.com/ claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 4/ 2/2018



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno9ssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel B256-3561 Fax: G844-8805 Email sur@lkkau’m.cr;:rn:assignments@lkkaum.mm

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Our File No:  CC3/AIG18014487/AQD3N2
AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #07-16

Singapore 079120 Date: 04/12/2018

REFERENCE

Insured/Claimant: PAULINA HATTA Policy No: 2100297180

Date of Loss: 07/08/2018 Nature of Claim: oD Claim No: 5576546584506

DESCRIPTIO IDENTIFICATION OF VEHIC

Reg No: SKET416G
Make & Model: AUDI S5 SPORTBACK, 3.0 TFSI QUATTRO (A) Engine No: CGW029518
Reg. Date: 28/03/2012 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: WAUZZZETOCAD15982
Colour: White Odometer: 39351 km
Engine Capacity: 2995 cc
;ﬂa‘rm‘at Value/Mew Car $$90,000.00
rice:
Sum Insured (53): Market Value/Mew Car Price
CONDIT HICLE AT THE TI E vl
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 255/35 R19 Rear Tyre Size: 255/35 R19
Front Left Side: Pirelli & mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli & mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 9,549.00 2,978.00 B,571.00 68.81
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4.552.00 2772.00 1,780.00 39.10
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5} 14,101.00 5,750.00 8,351.00 59.22
- Excess (S%) 2,000.00 2,000.00 0.00 0.00
(S%) 12,101.00 3,750.00 8,351.00 69.01
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) B47 .07 262.50 58457 69.01
Nett Amount (S5) 12,948.07 4,012.50 8,935.57 658.01
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 10/08/2018
Date Inspected: 0B/08/2018 Inspected At: Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408698
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager; SHIAU CHAN

NOTE: This raport represents oar findings at the time and place of inspection slafed herein. Such inspection has been carmed ouf lo the bes! of our
knowisdge and ability buf any ofher iabiity undar any olher circumsiances 15 hereby axpressly exciuded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
Mo. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER COVER Deformed 2 635.00FS *2,108.00F5
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS Mot Necessary 222 00FS *-FS
5 “FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP LH [ RH Mot Necessary B0.00FS ~FS
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT Not Necessary 195.00FS *-F5
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT ADAPTOR Not Mecessary 107.00FS “FS
B 1 “AlIR GUIDE GRILLE RH Mot Necessary 307.00FS *-F5
7 1 “WHEEL SPOILER RH FRONT Not Mecessary 50.00FS *-F8
B8 1 *GUIDE PIECE RH Mot Mecessary 37.00FS *-FS8
9 1 “FRONT PARKING AID SENSOR Mot Necessary 211.00F5 *FS5
M0 1 *FRONT PARKING AID SENSOR SEAL RING Mot Mecessary 500FS *~FS
1M1 1 *FROMNT FENDER RH Dented 930.00FS *744.00FS
12 1 *FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS RH Not Necessary 49.00FS *-FS
13 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACKET RH FRONT Bent 50.00FS  *40.00FS
14 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACKET RH REAR Not Necessary 50.00FS *-FS
15 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACKET LH Mot Necessary 34.00FS *FS
18 1 “FRONT FENDER BRACE RH Mot Necessary 106.00FS “-F5
i7 1 “WHEEL HOUSING LINER RH Mot Necessary 163.00FS *-FS
18 1 “WHEEL HOUSING ATTACHMENT PARTS RH Mot Necessary 38.00FS *FS
19 1 *y6T CHROME EMBLEM Necessary 108.00FS  “B6.00OFS
20 M *HEADLIGHT MOUNTING RH Mot Mecessary 108.00F3 *~FS
21 1 *HEADLIGHT RH Mot Necessary  2,341.00FS *F5
2 1 *HALOGEN FOG LAMP RH Mot Necessary 236.00FS *.FS
23 1 *LIFT CYLINDER RH Mot Mecessary 241.00FS *-FS5
24 1 *ALUMINIUM RIM RH Mot Necessary 965.00FS *-FS
25 1 *SUNDRIES Mot Necessary 300.00F5 *-F5
F=Franchise par S=Spchett. — —
Total Parts (S$) 9,549.00 2,478.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. =i
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS New 480.00 480,00
FOR HEADLIGHTS, HORNS, FOG LAMPS, OUTSIDE
TEMPERATURE SENSOR AND HEADLIGHT WASHER
ASSY AND FRONT PARKING AID.

2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER, RHS Mew 2.100.00 1,000.00
HEADLIGHT AND RHS FRONT FENDER. RE-ORGANISE
FRONT CRASH MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS.
REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED.

3 TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND RHS FRONT New 1,500.00 1,100.00
FENDER.
4 TO RENEW RHS FRONT RIM AND CARRY OUT WHEEL New 280.00 0.00
ALIGNMENT.
5 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECKS. Mew 192.00 192.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 4,552.00 2,772.00
r Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. _h
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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