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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date U6-08-2018 Our Ref No. D1B005925MFSH
Accident Dale 02-08-2018 Clalm Type. Third Party
Insurad Vehicle SHA1908A Third Party Vehicle. SKST421E
Survey Location BLK 1013 YISHUN IND. PARK A #01-374
Contact Person. DORLYN
Contact No. 6481200140 Fax No. 64821296
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appoigieg LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

CHENG HOE MOTOR .
Ce : Workshop PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assigrimant and 7 days for re-inspestian,

This is & computer gensrated letter, mo sigraturg regquirsd.
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 12:23 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005925MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already withdraw claim

We will close this file at our end without billing.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Ltd

Phone: 68411972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-47315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408934)

From: Nivitha [LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 10:53 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow Systemn’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; sur@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005925MESH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Tad

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@|kkavte.com | fax: G256-4315

Blle 51, Pava Ubl Industrinl Park, U Avende 1, #o2-25 | Slqo89:43)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sz]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 10:01 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTSELKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005925MFSH/1

Dear 5ir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey,
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.coma

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 12:23 PM

Ta: ‘Claim Workflow System’; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO COM
Ce EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005925MFSH/

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already withdraw claim.

We will close this file at our end without billing.

BEST HEGARDS,
G Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auta Consultants Pte Lid

Fhotie: 6841-1972 | email: amignments@lklguto.com, | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Payi Ui Tndustidal Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #08-25 | Sy 08933)

From: Nivitha [LKK Aute) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 10:53 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005925MFSH/1

Crear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehiclé not in' workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Adimin

KK Auto Consuoltants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: asslenmentsolkKauto com | fax; t2s6-4215
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-2% | S{408934)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sant: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 10:01 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Co: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @M SFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005925MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Flease find attached the necessary documents for survey,
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Hest Repards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.avg.com




