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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 5:53 PM

To: ‘Boo seng yak'; SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee
Sing

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SLW8036G - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 AUG 18

Dear Mr Boo,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $5,242.00 before excess $1,000.00 £ GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com fax: ba56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom:; Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 October 2018 4:25 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg=; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg;
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SLWB8036G - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 AUG 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $5242.00 @ 3 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 10:28 AM
To: Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: SLW 8036 G Own Damage Claims

Dear George,

Please be informed that the excess of above vehicle is 51,000.00.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: stewsc@lkkauto.com | fax; b25b-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims =claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

sent: Tuesday, 14 August 2018 8:14 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Subject: RE: SLW 8036 G Own Damage Claims

Dear Ms. Denise,
As spoken, attached is an addendum GIA report for your kind reference.
Besides, kindly advise on excess amount.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
George Wong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jneg ke tsssaziiw

55 Libi Road 1 Road Singapore 408659

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9818 f.+65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra fioad Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 22123

The all-new Audi Q2

#untaggable

T e



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

#

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 3:35 PM
To: Claims Dept; SUR

Subject: RE: 5LW B036 G Own Damage Claims
Dear Jeffrey,

Please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLW 8036G (excess STBA/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-9561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 12:55 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: SLW 8036 C Own Damage Claims

Dear all,
Kindly assist in the Own Damage Claims for the above mentioned vehicle.
Survey was carried out earlier this morning.

Many thanks!

Best regards,
leffery Tan

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jreg ne 1sasnzariw)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9511 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Foreign Identification Number
6592N

SLWB8036G

No

08 Aug 2018

AUDI

Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU STRONIC
Blue

2017

DAX027886
WAUZZZFY7)2102784
185.0 kW (248 bhp)
$44,949.00

01 Mar 2018

01 Mar 2018

0

$54,929.00

Yes
29 Feb 2028
$41,196.00

29 Feb 2028

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$39,000.00

$37,285.00

$78,481.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Aug 2018



MPA | 1ACE937T  Premium Autamabiles Pre Lid - LBI
EMTRY DATE & TIME 04082018 14:25
SLUEMITTED BY: Lim Kee Siang

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report comectly the details of the accident 1o speed up the claims process

2 This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Drives

1 nlormation provided musi be as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wilhsl misrepresentalan of witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies 1o
repudiate policy ability

4 The lstue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission of pelicy liability on the part of the insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Cenlre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GlA) for
archiving and that coples of this repart will, for a fee, be made available upan application by interested parties.

7. By the ladgement of this repart ta the insurers. you hereby consent to the archiving of this report 8l ine centre and Lo copies of the report being made avaiable
aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
Date Of Report 01/08/2018 14:25
Date Of Accident 31/07/2018 04:30
Exact Location Of Accident 100 JALAN MASHOR
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number SLW8036G
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner YOUNG MITCHELL PAUL
NRIC No GS5TE592N
Email Address TASH.YOUNG@ME.COM
Mobile Phone Mo (LOCAL) +65-98320400
Alternative Phone Mo OFFICE-98320400
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer ALUDI
Model (5-2.0 TFSI QUATTRO (180BHP) (A)
E;aecg r‘:égaaeen:ur which vehicle was being used at PRIVATE USE
Are you claiming under your own insurance policy o

for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please stale action to be taken
Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy MO

Policy Mumber 180009571

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver YOUNG NATASHA LUCK
NRIC No G5576592N

Date Of Birth 27/08M1969

Crccupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 13/05/2011

Driving Experience 7 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Maobile Number (LOCAL) +65-98320400
Fax Mumber

Contact Number OFFICE-98320400

EMail Address TASH.YOUNG@ME.COM

Page 1 of 21



Address
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle invelved in this accident?
Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

17 CHEE HOON AVE

MO
SPOUSE

HIT AND RUN / VANDALISM /| DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO

NO

MO

NO

NG

DROVE MY DAUGHTER TO NEC 100 JALAN MASHOR 299177, ARRIVED AT 4.45, SAW DAMAGE TO THE VEHICLE WHEN |
GOT OUT OF THE CAR. BEFORE THAT THE CAR HAD BEEN PARKED AT OUR HOUSE, 17 CHEE HOON AVE 299750
WHERE IT HAD BEEN PARKED IN OUR GARAGE FROM 12-4PM

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

YES
NO
NO
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Sketch Plan

IMPORTANT NOTICE
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Sketch Plan #2

SKETCH PLAN
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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(REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE  DRIVING LICENCE:

YOU ARE LICENSED TO DRIVE VEHICLES IN THE FOLLOWING CLASS(ES)

EFFECTIVE DATE

Claas 3 Motgr cars with unisden waight =< 3000kg with =<7 13 Apr 2011
passengars, axciusive of driver; and other mobor
wehioles with unaden waight =< 2500kg

NP 4784

REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE
FIN G5576594X

I..'}
L .
YOUNG MATASHA LUCY
= -

B Datw of B Bau
27-08-1969 F

- Mationsiity
' ] AUSTRALLAN
3

FA1870536

DEF ENDANT'S PASS
mmigration Regulations

AN GESTES84X

Dats of lamus Owte of Expiry
15122017 15122018

TOA) ARE TO LREIRDIR Teil SARD Wisii T I8 CARCELLED O SAR EXRED, D8 WHER & S8 GARD 15 SELED T0 04
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder . YOUMNG MITCHELL PAUL Vehicle No. . SLWBD3EG
Period of Insurance - 01 Mar 2018 To 28 Feb 2020 Policy No. : 1800019571
Engine No. - DAX027886 Endorsement No.

Chassis No. . WAUZZZFYT7J2102784 Issued Date - DB Mar 2018

ABOUT THE COVER

MakeModel . AUIDI Q5 Sport 2.0 TFSI qu
| Engine Capacity/Tonnage 1,884.00 CC sum Insured . Markel Value Eirst Year of Registration : 2018
| Driver Restriction MA Off Peak Car @ Mo Insuring with COE/PARF : Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive”
| a) Tha Policynalder
b} Ay ohar pefson wied
| T s Folicy will indemny

Fving on the Folicyholders ordes of with higMhar parmission
ve Poficyhoider or any suilhorised driver anly i hiedshe maels T

specified age condilion
| ¥ou have to pay an additioral sun of $3,000 a5 “Young andior |nexpanencad Driver Exchss” YIDR if Yo ane or Your auhonised Drve (named or uninamed) is under ha age of 23 arkiior ks ess
| than 2 yegre' driving expenance

Age Condition - Al Age Condition

Limitation as to use”

e oy for ancial, eramaeslic and =T PUFpGSES and for the Policyhokier = briminass

Thes Palicy dogs nol Cover g for hine or rgward, armang tuition, driving bast, racing, pace making., reliabiity trial of speed-tesing v carmage of goads athigr than samples in cannection wih any frada of
bisness or use for any pUpoSaE N eonnection wilh Mokor Trade

| Loss of LUise 18000 - 2000cc Dptional |
| = Limitations rendered inapsrateea By Eoction 8 of the Mator Vehickes (Third-Party Fisks and Compensation) Act (Cap 189 ard Section 95 of the Road Tranggon Acl, 1987 (Mataysia), are nal o be
ancluted undes nese hieadmgE

-

—_— — e —

Section 1
| Fire - 50 Crwn Damage - $1000 Theft - 50 Flood Cover - 50

Section 2
Property Damage - 2]

Windscreen : $100

| Named Driver and EXCESS {whes applcabic]

| woumG MITCHELL PAUL £4000 (Own Darrage)

_————

APPROV

RES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REPAIRS)

ED REPORTING CENT

1 Busdi Custamer Service Certer Add &% bl Road 4 Singapore 405688 BAREIIZD

For oiher Approved Reporting Cenkias ARG Authorised Repairers, plaase contacl our 54-hout socident emergency holline &1 +B5 G338 6200 Altematively, you may refar o AIG wabsite www.aig camm &g
e A0S S0 Mobile App. Simply sesrch and Sowrinad “AIG SG7 from iTunes of Google Fiay

IMPORTANT NOTES

- ,__________f__r________l

| Hire Purchase Compa ny/Employer's Loan: MayBank 3
- e e i e e e — E—— i
| haraby certify that the policy 1o which this Certificate of insurance falaies IS st in ACCOTdancR with the provisions o iFvp Mator Vehscies(Third Party Rrsks and Compensation) Act (Cap. 188), Part “fE
tha Road Trarspart Act, 1887 {Malaysia) and Watar Vehickes (Thind Party Risks) Rutes, 1959 (Malaysia) =
0504125210

PREMILIM LEASING - ¥l

281 ALEXANDRA ROAD AUDH CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE —————— ey
SINGAPORE 159938 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Underwritien by AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. AUTHORISED REF'REEENTAT'!"-"IE e

nisuranos Fle. Lid

T-+65 5419 3000 | F-+65 6415 4723 | Weann.2i5.C0M. 55



Premium Automobiles

55 Uhi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Ernail: Mora.khai@premiumauto.com. sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop : UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No :+  6B411183
Reference :  PA/TP/O88B8/2018/NK
Date ;. 4-Aug-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop.Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIGC Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No
Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

mm wm s =%

@8 w8 sm mwm

Mr. Young Mitchell Paul
17 Chee Hoon Avenue
Singapore 299750

HP +65 52270006
OWHN DAMAGE CLAIMS
180009571

SLW 8036 G
Audi Q5 2.0 TFSI
Mar-18

DAX 027886
WAUZZZFY7)2102784

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
31-Jul-18
100 jalan Mashaor



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estim Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLW 6G

Estimated Surveyors's

S/N Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation

To rermove and transfer front wire harness for
headlights ,hnrnsf. fog lamps, outside temperature ¢, ¢ 480.00
sensor and headlights washer assy and front

parking aid.
To dismantle front bumper and lhs headlight Re-
2 organise front crash management components. 5 I.Gyﬂﬁ 500
Reinstall all parts removed.
e Lef oo 5
3 To respray front bumper, front lower spoiler, both 5 ] 4
front wheel arc covers and rhs front fender B BIORA
- g /"“j - (S041: Ate Cores
3o0 =
4 To carry out diagnostic check. SIN 5 152.00 o r"f'“‘“LU
| ¥ 00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 1 5 4,422.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLW 8036 G

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS
1 FRONT BUMPER 3‘1&' u’e"""“""!‘ s 224800 %
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS M “— S 231.00%

3 SECURINGSTRIPLH/RH Mt = %5 64.00
4 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT % S 95.00 &
5 FRONT BUMPER SPOILER 5 652.00 +
6  CLOSING ELEMENT 3 147.00 +
7 AIR GUIDE GRILLE RH 5 498.00
8  ENDCAPRH Rlet S 78.00 =
9  REARSENSOR FRT po- S 211.00%
10  SEALRING 45 14.00 ¥
11 WHEEL SPOILER RH ) S 133.00 >
12 WHEEL COVER FRONTLHRH A new | 2 et 2 6§  1,090.00~
13 sunpries itirec S 400.00 7 7
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 5,861.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : S 4,422.00
GRAND TOTAL : $ 10,283.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend ; Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Mett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699 [ LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183 lhe Repaire :
AUy
& resurveyed and
Y8 Trom InSurance Ll-b!'!iﬂ‘.}

Name : Adaa L:Mé : ot

Surveyed Date : p‘t, o l % o

Authorised Date

Excess Cost

Liability .

Remarks : N hHeoned , ©°§ D““}/‘

Please Note :  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.
Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 |Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Email: Mora khai@premiumauto.com.sg { claims@premiumaute.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop LUbi Road 1

Contact No 6366 2323

Fax No g841 1183
Reference PATP/0BBE/2018/NK
Date 4-Aug-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop.Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-18 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name Mr. Young Mitchell Paul

Address 17 Chee Hoon Avenué
Singapore 299750

Telephone HP +65 92970006

Type of Claim OWN DAMAGE CLAIMS

Policy No. 180009571

Vehicle No SLW 8036 G

Model Code Audi Q5 2.0 TFSI

Model | Year Mar-18

Engine No DAX 027886

Chassis No WAUZZZFY7J2102784

Mileage

Date In

Liability 3

Excess Cost -

Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu

Accident Date 31-Jul-18

Place of Accident

100 Jalan Masher



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLW 8036 G

Estimated Surveyors's
SIN Mature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
To remove and transfer front wire harness for
1 headlights ,homns, fog lamps, outside temperature SIN § 480.00 s pror

sensor and headlights washer assy and front parking
aid.

To dismantle front bumper and Ihs headlight Re-
2 organise front crash management components. 5 1,050.00 L3 500.00
Reinstall all parts removed.

3 To respray front bumper, front lower spoiler, both front s 2 700.00 $ 1.400.00
wheel arc covers and rhs front fender.
4 To carry out diagnostic check, SIN 3% 192.00 s 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES S 4,422.00 -3 2,572.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Reqn No. SLW 8036 G

Damage Parts & Prices

S/IN  Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1 FRONT BUMPER 5 2,248.00 3 1,798.00
o FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 231.00
3 SECURING STRIP LH/RH $ 64.00
4 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT ¥ 95.00
5 FRONT BUMPER SPOILER $ 652.00
& CLOSING ELEMENT $ 147.00
7 AIR GUIDE GRILLE RH $ 498.00
8§ ENDCAPRH s 78.00
9  REAR SENSOR FRT $ 211.00

10  SEALRING 4 % 14.00

11 WHEEL SPOILER RH $ 133.00

12  WHEEL COVER FRONT LH RH 2% 1,090.00 § 8§72.00

13 SUNDRIES 3 400.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 5861.00 3§ 2,670.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,422.00 3 2,572.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 10,283.00 3 5,242.00

———

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks {%) = Mot approved
Spare parls are Special Neth.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note - This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we reguire further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Norah Khai
78 Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AIG Building 6841 1183
Singapore 079120 Nora khai(@ premiumauto.com.sg
Attn: Motor Claims Dept Body & Paint Dept
Yr Ref: SLW 8036 G PA/OD/OSER/2018/MAS

29 Nov 2018
Dear Sir,
RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SLW 8036 G, Audi Q5 SB 2.0 TFSI QU
With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SL'W 8036 G, claimant,
Mr. Young Mitchell Paul, please find the related document per attached.
1. A copy of the Oniginal invoice no. 85013187 — §84,538.94

2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification. please do not hesitate to contact me at
6768 9911.

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

MNorah Kha
Claims Dept

Encls

AlG —- SLW B036 G

from

Telephone +63-
Telefax  +65-
EMail

Qur department
Our Ref

Your Raf

Date

total pages

Pramium Automobiles Pte Lic
Showrcom

9 Leng Kee Road

Singapore 159080
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Parls Centres
55 Ubi Rd 1

Singapore 408699
Telephone (65) 6336 2323
Telefax  (65) 684 11183
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Lase Matitied Est Subsmitted Ad] Assigned | Adj Rt | Ag] Submetted | Ins Auth'ed | Sratus o |
06 Aug 2018 08 Aug 2018 §55,242.00 | 5%5,242.00 Pending for Survay |
Main 14:59 Edit Estimates || wiewRpt | | |Report
Edit Adj Rpt I

I Cancel Case ]

Reference Claim Details

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS _ | ICreated by insurer]
| Insured: YOUNG MITCHELL PAUL, 1D: G5576552N .
: | 31/07/2018 16:00 - :59

| | Wehicle Reg, Mo, SLWB036G Date of Loss: [4 Months and 320 Days From LTA
| | ——=— |Reg Date {Man Yr)]

| Claim Type: 0D / 378187396956 Policy/Cover Note No.: 1800019571 (Comprehensive)

‘ | Exgess: | 541,000.00

| Repairer; Premium Aummuhl:lu Pie Ltd {l.lll} 55 Ubi Road 1, 4086%9 Uki - Tel: 67689826/9827,/9911

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (SG) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ... [Handled by Dally Amri, Mimi zarina] |
| MimiZaring.DallyAmrif@aig.com o o
I ! LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) - Tel: 6256- -3561 . .. [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt
| Aduster due 20/08/2018] i o

Driver/Custedian: YOUNG NATASHA LUCK (48 / Mme:, NRIC: GS576592N, T_eg-.__af_ﬁigsazmn_q =

|| Handling Insurer:

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mail [|
| AIG_SG (15/08/2018); SLWBO3I6G / OD / 31/07/2018 / Coverage & Excess update = e

= e R ——
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View Al I Search Tasks | Create New Task E Complete J
Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |
|

| No results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 10/1 2/2018
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Upload Documants

Claim Documents

*SLWBD36G (37818739695G)
oD
Jul 31 2018 4:00PM
[YOUNG MITCHELL PAUL]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
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General View
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:Lll'.lﬁ Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)
 Singapore Accident Statement
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DISCHARGE VOUCHER
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10 01/08/18 14:56  Accident Photo ©  loadws | [J] |
11 01/08/18 14:56  Accident Photo - —I 0 Leirs | |
12 01/08/18 14:56  Accident Photo | €@ | Loadirs | [
13 D1/D8/18 14:56 Aceident Photo . (1] | LomarG | (@
14 | D1/06/16 14.56 | Accident Photo - l_l | Load PG | & .
15 D1/0B/1B 14:56  Accident Photo © learc ¥
16 01/08/18 14:56 Accidant Photo =—— & _Iza_dlm | &
17 01/08/1814:56  Accident Photo | 1] Load IPG ['F
Documentation -IDE; page - | L] .
No | Finalized On | Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI) ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 0I/0B/1B 15:02  Sketch Plan O acwc | [F
2 | D1/DB/18 15:02 Sketch Plan #2 | (1] | Load 376 | i .

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST - - Rts:'tl !:.iaw:.l F'.r|n't ||

There are no document chacklists configured

| Dur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ}

isnuw Remarks To: | | Handling Insurer
Waote: Bemarks gre private unless you show I to other parties

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 10/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (cores o 1sss07108R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Our File No:  CC3/AIG18014425/AQD3N2
AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16

Singapore 079120 Date: 10/12/2018

REFERENCE

Insured/Claimant:  YOUNG MITCHELL PALL Policy No: 1800019571

Date of Loss: 31/07/2018 Mature of Claim: QD Claim No: 378187398956
DESCRIPTI IDENTIFICA F VEHICLE

Reg No: SLW8036G

Make & Model: AUDI Q5, 2.0 TFSI Quattro (180BHP) (A) Engine No: DAXD27886

Reg. Date: 01/03/2018 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: WAUZZZFY7J2102784
Colour: Black Odometer: 4831 km

Engine Capacity: 1884 cc

Market Value/New Car $$215,000.00

Price:

Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price

CON ICLE F SUR
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235/55 R19 Rear Tyre Size: 235/55 R19
Front Left Side: Continental 6 mm Rear Left Side: Continental & mm
Front Right Side: Continental 6 mm Rear Right Side: Continental & mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre freeds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 5,861.00 2,670.00 3,191.00 54 44
Miscellaneous ems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4.422.00 2,572.00 1,850.00 41.84
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 10,283.00 5,242.00 5,041.00 43.02
- Excess (55) 1,000.00 1,000.00 0.00 0.00
(5%) 9.283.00 424200 5,041.00 54.30
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 54981 296.94 352.87 54.30
Nett Amount ($5) 9,932.81 4,538.94 5,393.87 54.30
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: Da/08/2018
Date Inspected: 07/08/2018 Inspected At: Premium Automobiles Pte Lid (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: SHIAU CHAN

NOTE: This report rapresents our findings al the time and place of inspection slated herein Such inspaction has been carmad ouf ho the best of our
knawledge and abifity but any other Wability under any ather circumsliances is hereby expressly exciuded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.c fm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 10/12/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo.

1 1
2 1
3 2
4 1
5 1
B 1
71
8 1
9 1
10 4
1M1 1
12 2
13 1

Particulars

‘FRONT BUMPER

*FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS
*SECURING STRIP LH/RH
*FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT
*FRONT BUMPER SPOILER
"CLOSING ELEMENT

*AIR GUIDE GRILLE RH

*END CAP RH

‘REAR SENSOR FRT

*SEAL RING

*“WHEEL SPOILER RH

“WHEEL COVER FRONT LH/RH
*SUNDRIES

F=Franchise par, S=SpcHett

Condition

Deformed

Mot Mecessary
Mot Mecessary
Mot Necessary
Mot Mecessary
Nol Mecessary
Mol Mecessary
Mot Mecessary
Mot Mecessary
Mot Necessary
Mot Necessary
N/s Necessary/O/s Cut
Mot Necessary

Total Parts (S$)

Page 2 of 3

Repairer's Amount

2,248 00FS *1.798 00FS

231,00FS *FS
64.00FS “FS
95.00FS . FS
652.00FS “FS
147.00F% *-F5
498 00FS *-F5
78.00F5 *-FS
211.00FS *“FS
14.00F5 *FS
133.00F5 *-FS
1,080.00FS *B72.00FS
400 00FS *-F3

5,861.00 2,670.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.ctfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 10/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS New 480.00 480.00
FOR HEADLIGHTS,HORNS, FOG LAMPS,OUTSIDE
TEMPERATURE SENSOR AND HEADLIGHTS WASHER
ASSY AND FRONT PARKING AID

2 TO DISMANTLE FRONT BUMPER AND LHS HEADLIGHT New 1,050.00 500.00
RE-ORGANISE FRONT CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS.REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED

3 TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER,FRONT LOWER New 2,700.00 1.400.00
SPOILER,BOTH FRONT WHEEL ARC COVERS AND RHS
FRONT FENDER
4 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK Mew 182.00 192.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 4,422.00 2,572.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 10/12/2018



