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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 11:50 AM

To: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation; ANG Yvonne

Cc: CHAN Sam; Vincent Ho; KKLau

Subject: RE: [AXA]: Assistance required: To effect MV for SKC6789Y

Dear Yvonne,

The market value of SKC 6789Y is $108K-$109K (Estimated) as at July 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 9:23 AM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>

Cc: CHAN Sam <sam.chan@axa.com.sg>; Vincent Ho <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: To effect MV for SKC6789Y

Hi Valuation Team,

Kindly get back to AXA Yvonne.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Olivia Lau
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: CHAN Sam <sam.chan@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 6, 2018 5:31 PM

To: motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; frankie @fta.com.sg; ricky@rta.com.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto);

nick@lbs-auto.com; KKLau; Jimmy Lee Priority Svc; elson@rta.com.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg;

collin.wong@a-pac.sg; Autoprobe - Mr Tay; benson@lbs-auto.com; AutoProbe Admin -surveyor

Cc: HO Vincent; ANG Yvonne
Subject: Assistance required: To effect MV for SKC6789Y



Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Yvonne Ang with the Market Value for this case.

DOA: 30/07/2018

Thanks in advance for your help.

————— Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views
or opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent
those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the

sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Typé:

OwnerID:

Vehicle Details

VehicleNo.:

Veﬁfcié to be Exported:
Intended De-re_g_istfation Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Priméry Col-our:
Mranrufacturing Year:

- EngineNo.:

Cﬁassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Orriginal RAeg.ist'ration Date:

Fri rsf Registration Date:
T.ransféerouhf:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
intended COE Rebate Details
COE Explry Date:

CDE Category:

COE Period{‘u’ears}:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The fnformétibh contained herein is correct as at 03 Aug 2018

Singapore NRIC TR gl 'S 7
2988A - .

SKC6789Y

Yes

31 Aug 2018

NISSAN

ELGRAND HIGHWAY STAR 2.5 MCVT 7AB HID SR
BI’OWn

2014

QR25112150L
JN1TBAE5220802362
125.0 kW (167 bhp)
$36,157.00

18 May 2015

18 May 2015

0

$42,620,00

‘{es
17 May 2025
$31,965.00

17 May 2025

B - Car above 1600c¢cc or 97kW {130bhp)
10

$77,600.00

$52,087.00

$84,052,00

I

el
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éNFsan Elgrand ‘ | 1
Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Nissan Elgrand 5 Any Any 2015 Any Any Any Availabie
Nissan Elgrand 2.5A Highway $112,000 $13,410 fyr 27-Jul-2015 2,488 cc 48,000 km MPV Available
Star
Graded B by S'f@
{Cheapest, Lowest Depre) 1 Owner, Low Mileage, (Fully Serviced By Agent Tan Chong Motor.) Flexible High Loan Package, Well Maintained By Previous .- i
Owner! High Trade In Are Welcome. Tip Top Condition! 10... b
Hamilton Autohub Pte Ltd
Pasted: 06-Aug-2018 Tags: 2015 Nissan Elgrand, Nissan Elgrand, Nissan, Elgrand, Used Nigsan
Nissan Elgrand 2.5A Highway $117,800 $13,590 /yr 15-Oct-2015 2,488 cc 35,000 km MPV Available
Star
Fully Serviced And Maintained By Tan Chong. Low Depreciation For A Super Luxurious MPV, Exterior/Interior Well Maintained By Careful Owner And Is
In Immaculate Condition, Ideal For Big Family, Twin Po,,.
Posted: D6-Aug-2018 Tags: 2015 Nissan Elgrand, Nissan Elgrand, Nissan, Elgrand, Used Nissan
Nissan Elgrand 2.54 Highway $109,800 $13,750 fyr 03-Mar-2015 2,488 cc 68,339 km MPV Avaitable
Star
Graded B by 57
1 Year Comprehensive Warranty Inclusivel $6K Down Payment! STA Certified Accident Free Quality Pre-Owned With Low Mileage And Agent Service
History For Peace Of Mind. 100% Loan Approval With Qur Flexi..,
Cosmo Automobiles
Posted: 04-Aug-2018 Tags: 2015 Nissan Elgrand, Nissan Elgrand, Nissan, Elgrand, Used Nissan
Nissan Elgrand 2.5 Highway $110,000 $13,110 fyr 13-May-2015 2,488 cc 63,275 km MPV Available

Star

1 Owner, 7 Seater Unit, Servicing Done Only In Agent, 3+2 Years Warranty With 3 More Free Servicing Left With Tan Chong, Relatively New Quiet
Yokohama DB Tires, Original Paintwork With Clean And Smoke...

Henly Enterprises Co
Posted: 03-Aug-2018 Tags: 2015 Nissan Elgrand, Nissan Elgrand, Nissan, Elgrand, Used Nissan

Car Buying Car Selling Car Ownership i i it
Car Aftermarket On The Move Lifestyle »0L STA Car Evaluation
Nissan Elgrand 2.54 Highway $113,800 $13,660 fyr 15-May-2015 2,488 cc 39,000 km MpV Available
Star
Highest Elgrand Model With 2 Sunroof And Electric Front Seats With Driver Memory, Super Low Mileage. One More Free Servicing. Full Leather Seats. e
Highest OMV. Just Did Major Servicing. New Amaron Batt, .,

Posted: 23-)ul-2018 Tags: 2015 Nissan Elgrand, Nissan Elgrand, Nissan, Elgrand, Used Nissan
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